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Lee County Board Of County Commissioners Blue Sheet No. 20061452
Agenda Item Summary

1. ACTION REQUESTED/PURPOSE: Award B-06-37 WESTERN ACRES PAVING to the lowest
responsive/responsible bidder, Better Roads, Inc., for a total not-to-exceed amount of $2,381,437.76, with a
project completion time of 180 calendar days. Also, authorize Chairwoman to execute Contract on behalf
of the Board. This project was anticipated and funds are available.

2. WHAT ACTION ACCOMPLISHES: Provides Lee County with a Contractor to construct and pave 3.53 miles
long and consists of regarding existing roadway and includes 20 feet wide 6 inch Marshal Mix Base and 1.5 inch
Marshal Mix Surface, rebuild driveways with culverts and signage and stripping.

3. MANAGEMENT RECOMMENDATION: Approval recommended.

4. Departmental Category: 06 INDEPENDENT C (ﬂ A 5. Meeting Date: {7) —| 7 'D(C;'
6. Agenda: 7. Requirement/Purpose: (specify) | 8. Request Initiated:
X  Consent Statute Commissioner

Administrative Ordinance Department Public Resourges |
Appeals X  Admin. Code AC-44 | Division MSTBY /], /
Public Other By: Libby Walker, Direcfoy//, /
Walk-On v

9. Background: /

The Public Resources Department submitted a request to Contracts Management to obtain bids for the Western
Acres Paving project. The anticipated cost required the use of the formal, sealed bid procedure.

On the bidding deadline of October 18, 2006, Contracts Management received four (4) bids. The bids have been
reviewed by the Public Resources Department, and it being recommended that award be made to the lowest
responsive/responsible bidder, Better Roads, Inc.

Attachments: 1) Bid Tabulation
2) Department Recommendation to Award
3) Consultant Recommendation to Award

Funds are available in the following account: 80503110400 and fund 352 as authorized per Bluesheet
#20041392. ()
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LEE COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
FOR
WESTERN ACRES PAVING

DATE: QOctober 18, 2006

]

TOTAL NOT—TO—
EXCEED AMOUNT
APAC Southeast, Inc. $40,350.00 * CORRECTED TOTAL ™ $3,235,303.70
Jim Stem

14299 Alico Road
Fort Myers, FL 33813
Phone: 239-267-T767
Fax 238-267-1 338

Gulf Paving Company, Inc. $40,350.00 $ 3,530,519.15
Tim Louse

PO Box 1584

Fort Myers, FL 33902

Phone: 239-334-3652

Fax: 239-334-0940

Better Roads, Inc. $40,350.00 $ 2,381,437.76
Drew Clark

1910 Seward Ave.

Naples, FL 34109

Phone: 239-597-2181

Fa: 238-597-1597

Ajax Paving Industries, inc. $40,350.00 $3,130,421.09
Michael A, Horan

510 Gene Green Road

Nokomis, FL 34275

Phone: 941-486-3600

Fa: 941-486-3500
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Hrycyk, Mark

From: lLogan, Cindy S.

Sent: Monday, October 23, 2006 10:.07 AM
To: Hrycyk, Mark

Subject: FW: Award Contract

Contacts: Logan, Cindy

From: Sabatini, Denise

Sent: Friday, October 20, 2006 1:38 PM
To: Logan, Cindy S.

Subject: Award Contract

Dear Cindy:

As | was thinking about my last e-mail, | thought that I may not have made it clear that we are awarding the
contract for Western Acres to Better Roads. So, please award the contract to the lowest bidder, $2,381,430.76,
Better Roads, Inc. for the Western Acre Road Paving Project.

If you need anything more, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Sincerely,
Denise

Denise Sabatini

MSTBU Coordinator

P. O. Box 398

Fort Myers, Florida -33902-0398
(239) 335-2186

(239) 335-2449 Fax
dsabatini@leegov.com

11/14/2006
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Oct. 25. 2006 10:33AM  IKK|LBFH INC 2399310456 No. 1513 7. 2

Ociober 25, 2006
Job # 03-7034

: INC. Lee County Board of County Commissions

MSTBU Coordinator
P.O. Box 398
Fort Myers, FL 33902
~ Am: Ms, Denise Sabatini
CvIL
AGRICULTURAL Re: Western Acres Paving Bid
WATER RESQURCES - Send Via Fax- 335-2449

WATER & WASTEWATER
TRANSPORTATION Dear'Ms. Sabatini:

SURVEYING & MAPPING
GiS|  As requested I have reviewed the low bid submitted by Better Roads.
Thelr bid appears to be correct and con'iplete.

I recommend that they be awarded the contract.

Sincerely, / |

Gordon Meiers, PE

“Partners for Results
vValue by Design”

GM/ip

1400 Colonial Bivd,, Suite 31
Fort Myers, FL 33907

(239 931-0455

Fax: (232) 531-0456

www.lbfth.com
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