FORMAL QUOTATION #1T170106

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 20,

2016 FOR
BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI DF SIGN BLANKS, POSTS, HARDWARE & MISC. SIGN
UNIVERSAL
SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
A. SIGNPOSTS - U TYPE
7' Lengths (1-1/4 Ibs/ft.)
Commaodity Code 8013006
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $8.30 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 101- 500) $7.85 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots over 500) $7.85 NO BID NO BID
7' Lengths (2 Ibs/ft.)
Commaodity Code 8013008
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $13.30 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 101- 500) $12.60 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots over 500) $12.60 NO BID NO BID
10" Lengths (2 Ibs/ft.)
Commaodity Code 8013010
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $19.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 101- 500) $18.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots over 500) $18.00 NO BID NO BID
12" Lengths (2 Ibs/ft.)
Commodity Code 8013012
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $22.80 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 101- 500) $21.60 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots over 500) $21.60 NO BID NO BID
12" Lengths (3 Ibs/ft.)
Commaodity Code 8013014
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $34.20 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 101- 500) $32.40 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots over 500) $32.40 NO BID NO BID
14" Lengths (2 Ibs/ft.)
Commodity Code 8013016
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $26.60 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 101- 500) $25.20 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots over 500) $25.20 NO BID NO BID
14" Lengths (3 Ibs/ft.)
Commodity Code 8013018
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $39.90 NO BID NO BID
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
Unit price (Lots 101- 500) $37.80 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots over 500) $37.80 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "A™: $475.00
LOTS1-100 $164.10 NO BID NO BID
LOTS 101 - 500 $155.45 NO BID NO BID
LOTS OVER 500 $155.45 NO BID NO BID
B. SIGN POSTS - ROUND
15" Lengths (4" 1.D.)
Commodity Code 8013020
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $90.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 101- 500) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots over 500) NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "B" :
LOTS1-100 $90.00 NO BID NO BID
LOTS 101 - 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LOTS OVER 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID
C. SQUARE FULL PUNCH POSTS
2" - 14 Gauge 10
Commaodity Code 8013044
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $20.52 $16.58 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) $18.81 $16.58 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) $18.81 $16.58 NO BID
2" - 14 Gauge 12'
Commodity Code 8013045
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $24.62 $19.69 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) $22.58 $19.69 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) $22.58 $19.69 NO BID
2.25" - 12 Gauge 10’
Commaodity Code 8013046
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $29.52 $23.50 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) $27.10 $23.50 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) $27.10 $23.50 NO BID
2.25- 12 Gauge 12"
Commodity Code 8013048
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $35.42 $28.03 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) $32.50 $28.03 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) $32.50 $28.03 NO BID
2""-14 Gauge 14' square posts
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $28.72 $22.69 NO BID
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) $26.35 $22.69 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) $26.35 $22.69 NO BID
2.25"-12 Gauge 2' square sleeves
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $7.80 $5.14 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) $7.49 $5.14 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) $7.49 $5.14 NO BID
2.25"-12 Gauge 3' square sleeves
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) $10.33 $7.38 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) $9.91 $7.38 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) $9.91 $7.38 NO BID
2.25"-12 Gauge 4' square sleeves
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) NO BID $9.71 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) NO BID $9.71 NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) NO BID $9.71 NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "C": $446.41 $398.16
LOTS1-100 $156.93 $132.72 NO BID
LOTS 101 - 500 $144.74 $132.72 NO BID
LOTS OVER 500 $144.74 $132.72 NO BID
D. ROAD DELINEATORS
Bi - directional
Commaodity Code 5500905
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) $1.50 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) $1.44 NO BID NO BID
Monodirectional
Commaodity Code 5500910
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) $1.20 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) $1.15 NO BID NO BID
Two color Bi - directional
Commodity Code 5500915
Unit price (Lots 1 - 100) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) $1.52 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) $1.46 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "D" : $8.27
LOTS1-100 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LOTS 101 - 500 $4.22 NO BID NO BID
LOTS OVER 500 $4.05 NO BID NO BID

E. TYPE I - 5052-H38 SIGN BLANKS

36" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013102
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $17.91 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $17.55 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $17.55 NO BID NO BID
30" X 30" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013104
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $12.44 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $12.19 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $12.19 NO BID NO BID
24" X 30" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013106
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $9.95 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $9.75 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $9.75 NO BID NO BID
18" X 24" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013108
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $6.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $5.85 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $5.85 NO BID NO BID
12" X 18" X 0.080""
Commodity Code 8013110
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $3.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $2.93 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $2.93 NO BID NO BID
6" X 24" X 0.080™
Commodity Code 8013112
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $2.05 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $2.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $2.00 NO BID NO BID
6" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013114
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $2.56 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $2.50 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $2.50 NO BID NO BID
9" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013116
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $3.08 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $3.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $3.00 NO BID NO BID
9" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013118
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $3.85 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $3.75 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $3.75 NO BID NO BID
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
9 X 36" X 0.080™"
Commaodity Code 8013120
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $4.60 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $4.50 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $4.50 NO BID NO BID
9" X 42" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013122
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $5.38 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $5.25 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $5.25 NO BID NO BID
24" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013124
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $7.96 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $7.80 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $7.80 NO BID NO BID
22" X 40" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013126
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $13.93 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $13.65 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $13.65 NO BID NO BID
24" X 48" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013128
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $15.92 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $15.60 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $15.60 NO BID NO BID
18" X 19" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013130
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $4.98 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $4.88 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $4.88 NO BID NO BID
8" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013132
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $2.73 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $2.59 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $2.59 NO BID NO BID
9" X 12" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013134
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $1.55 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $1.50 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $1.50 NO BID NO BID
48" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013136
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $23.88 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $23.40 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $23.40 NO BID NO BID

36" X 24" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013138
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $11.94 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $11.70 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $11.70 NO BID NO BID
18™ X 6™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013140
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $1.50 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $1.46 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $1.46 NO BID NO BID
12" X 6™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013142
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $1.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $0.75 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $0.75 NO BID NO BID
21" X 15" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013144
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $4.35 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $4.27 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $4.27 NO BID NO BID
24" X 12" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013146
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $4.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $3.90 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $3.90 NO BID NO BID
12" X 30" X 0.080""
Commaodity Code 8013148
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $4.98 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $4.88 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $4.88 NO BID NO BID
12" X 42" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013150
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $6.97 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $6.83 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $6.83 NO BID NO BID
12" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013152
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $7.96 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $7.80 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $7.80 NO BID NO BID
OCTAGONAL 36" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013154
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $16.72 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $16.38 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $16.38 NO BID NO BID
OCTAGONAL 30" X 30" X 0.080""
Commaodity Code 8013156
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $11.50 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $11.27 NO BID NO BID
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $11.27 NO BID NO BID
48" X 132" X 0.080""
Commodity Code 8013158
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $88.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $85.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $85.00 NO BID NO BID
PENTAGON 36" X 36™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013160
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $13.42 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $13.09 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $13.09 NO BID NO BID
ROUND 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013162
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $16.02 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $15.70 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $15.70 NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013164
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $31.84 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $31.20 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $31.20 NO BID NO BID
18" X 18" X 0.080""
Commaodity Code 8013166
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $4.48 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $4.39 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $4.39 NO BID NO BID
48" X 72" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013168
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $47.76 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $46.80 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $46.80 NO BID NO BID
30" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013170
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $14.93 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $14.63 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $14.63 NO BID NO BID
County Route Marker
24" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013172
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $7.90 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $7.75 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $7.75 NO BID NO BID
Hazard Marker Drilled 13/64 cat eye
holes & 5/16 mounting holes
18" X 18" X 0.080™"
Commaodity Code 8013174
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $5.06 NO BID NO BID
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $4.84 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $4.84 NO BID NO BID
24" X 0.080" Round
Commodity Code 8013176
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $7.52 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $7.31 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $7.31 NO BID NO BID
6" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013178
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $3.20 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $2.93 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $2.93 NO BID NO BID
Yield Blank
36" X 36" X 36" - 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013180
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $8.82 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $8.64 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $8.64 NO BID NO BID
24" X 24" X 24" - 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013182
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $5.56 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $5.42 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $5.42 NO BID NO BID
12" X 36" X 0.080""
Commaodity Code 8013184
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $6.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $5.85 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $5.85 NO BID NO BID
Pendant Blank
36" X 48" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013186
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $13.52 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $13.18 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $13.18 NO BID NO BID
4' X 86" X.125"
Commodity Code 8013188
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $68.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $66.30 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $66.30 NO BID NO BID
24" X 0.080" ISOSCELES TRIANGLE
Commaodity Code 8013190
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $9.68 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $9.50 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $9.50 NO BID NO BID
48" X 0.080" ISOSCELES TRIANGLE
Commaodity Code 8013192
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $18.00 NO BID NO BID
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $17.55 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $17.55 NO BID NO BID
60" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013194
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $30.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $29.25 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $29.25 NO BID NO BID
60" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013196
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $40.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $39.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $39.00 NO BID NO BID
62" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013198
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $31.00 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $30.22 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $30.22 NO BID NO BID
62" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013199
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) $41.35 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $40.30 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $40.30 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "E" : $2,138.31 NO BID NO BID
LOTS1-75 $724.75 NO BID NO BID
LOTS 76 - 125 $706.78 NO BID NO BID
LOTS OVER 125 $706.78 NO BID NO BID
F. TYPE Il - 6061-T6 SIGN BLANKS
36" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013202
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
30" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013204
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" X 30" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013206 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)
Unit Price (Lots over 125)
18" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013208 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 18" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013210

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

6" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013212

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

6" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013214

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

9" X 24" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013216

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

9" X 30™ X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013218

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

9" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013220

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

9" X 42" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013222

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24" X 24" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013224

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

22" X 40" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013226

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

Page 10




VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

24" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013228

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

18" X 19" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013230

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

8" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013232

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

9" X 12" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013234

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

48" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013236

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

36" X 24" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013238

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

18" X 6™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013240

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 6™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013242

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

21" X 15" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013244

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24" X 12" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013246

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 30" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013248

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 42" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013250

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 48" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013252

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

OCTAGONAL 36" X 36" X 0.080"

Commaodity Code 8013254

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

OCTAGONAL 30™ X 30™ X 0.080"

Commaodity Code 8013256

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

48" X 132" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013258

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

PENTAGON 36" X 36" X 0.080"

Commaodity Code 8013260

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

ROUND 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013262

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

48" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013264

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

18" X 18" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013266

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

48" X 72" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013268

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

30" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013270

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

County Route Marker
24" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013272

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

Hazard Marker Drilled 13/64 cat eye
holes & 5/16 mounting holes
18" X 18" X 0.080™"
Commodity Code 8013274

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24" X 0.080" Round
Commaodity Code 8013276

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

6" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013278

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

Yield Blank
36" X 36" X 36" - 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013280

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24" X 24" X 24" - 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013282

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013284

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

Pendant Blank
36" X 48" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013286

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

4' X 86" X.125"
Commaodity Code 8013288

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24" X 0.080" ISOSCELES TRIANGLE
Commaodity Code 8013290

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

48" X 0.080" ISOSCELES TRIANGLE
Commaodity Code 8013292

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

60" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013294

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
60" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013296 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)
Unit Price (Lots over 125)
62" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013298 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)
Unit Price (Lots over 125)
62" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013300 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "F": NO BID
LOTS1-75 NO BID
LOTS 76 - 125 NO BID
LOTS OVER 125 NO BID
G, H, 1,J, AND K - HARDWARE
G. HARDWARE - RIVETS
ALUMINUM RIVET - COST EACH
Commaodity Code 8013388 $0.55 $0.52 NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "G™ : $0.55 $0.52 NO BID
H. HARDWARE - BOLTS
5/16" X 1" Cost Per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013402 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5/16" X 1.25" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013404 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5/16" X 1.50" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013406 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5/16" X 2" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013408 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5/16" X 2.50" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013410 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5/16" X 3" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013412 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5/16" X 4" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013414 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5/16" X 4.50" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013416 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/4" X 1/2" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013418 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/4™ X 1" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013420 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/4™ X 2" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013422 NO BID NO BID NO BID
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
3/8" X 1" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013424 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8" X 1.50™ Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013426 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8" X 2" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013428 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8™ X 2.50" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013430 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8" X 3" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013432 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8' X 4™ Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013434 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8™ X 4.50" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013436 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/2" X 1" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013438 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/2" X 1.25" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013440 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/2" X 1.50" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013442 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/2" X 2" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013444 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/2" X 2.50" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013446 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/2" X 3" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013448 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/2" X 4" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013450 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/2" X 4.50" Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013452 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "H" NO BID NO BID
I. HARDWARE - NUTS
5/16" HEX Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013454 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5/16™ NYLON LOCK
Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013456 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/4™ HEX Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013458 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/4" Nylon Lock Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013460 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8" HEX Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013462 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8" NYLON LOCK
Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013464 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/2" HEX Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013466 NO BID NO BID NO BID
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
172" NYLON LOCK
Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013468 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "I"
J. HARDWARE - WASHERS
(APPROX. .050" THICK) NO BID
5/16™ X 1.25" FENDER
Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013470 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/4™ X 1.25" FENDER
Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013472 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3/8™ X 1.25" FENDER
Cost per Box of 100
Commaodity Code 8013474 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1/2"™ X 1.25" FENDER
Cost per Box of 100
Commodity Code 8013476 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "J" NO BID NO BID
K. HARDWARE - SPIKES
3/8™ X 8" GALVANIZED
Cost per 50 LB. Box
Commodity Code 8013478 $135.00 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "K" $135.00 NO BID NO BID
L. ALUMINUM CHANNEL
Aluminum Channel 1-1/2"* X 1/2",
1/8" thick, 20 foot lengths
Commodity Code 8013487
Unit Price (Lots 1 - 100) NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 101 - 500) NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 500) NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "L" NO BID NO BID NO BID
LOTS1-100 NO BID
LOTS 101 - 500 NO BID
LOTS OVER 500 NO BID
M. TYPE I - 5052-H38 (these are new
items added to Section E.)
30""x18"'x 0.080
Unit Price (Lots 1 - 75) $7.56 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $7.31 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $7.31 NO BID NO BID
36"'x20"'x 0.080"
Unit Price (Lots 1 - 75) $9.95 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) $9.75 NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) $9.75 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL SECTION "M" $51.53 NO BID NO BID
LOTS1-75 $17.41 NO BID NO BID
LOTS 76 - 125 $17.06 NO BID NO BID
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UNIVERSAL

SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
LOTS OVER 125 $17.06 NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL SECTIONS "A™
THROUGH "M™ $3,255.07 $398.68 NO BID
OPTION A SIGN BLANKS
TYPE I- 5052-H38 — ASTM B-921
COATED
36""x36''x0.080""
(Commodity Code 8013102)
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
30" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013104
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013106
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
18" X 24" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013108
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
12" X 18" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013110
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
6" X 24™ X 0.080™
Commodity Code 8013112
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
6" X 30" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013114
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
9" X 24™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013116
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
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SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
9" X 30" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013118
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
9" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013120
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
9" X 42" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013122
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013124
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
22" X 40" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013126
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" X 48™ X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013128
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
18" X 19" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013130
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
8™ X 24™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013132
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
9" X 12" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013134
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
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SIGNS & ALLIED TUBE & CUSTOM
VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
48" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013136
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
36" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013138
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
18" X 6™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013140
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
12" X 6" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013142
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
21" X 15" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013144
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" X 12" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013146
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
12" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013148
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
12" X 42™ X 0.080™
Commodity Code 8013150
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
12" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013152
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID

OCTAGONAL 36" X 36" X 0.080"

Commodity Code 8013154
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VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
OCTAGONAL 30" X 30" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013156
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 132" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013158
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
PENTAGON 36" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013160
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
ROUND 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013162
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013164
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
18™ X 18™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013166
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 72" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013168
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
30" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013170
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
County Route Marker
24" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013172
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
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VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hazard Marker Drilled 13/64 cat eye
holes & 5/16 mounting holes
18" X 18" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013174
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" X 0.080" Round
Commodity Code 8013176
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
6" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013178
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Yield Blank
36" X 36" X 36" - 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013180
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
24" X 24 X 24™ - 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013182
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
12" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013184
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pendant Blank
36" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013186
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
4' X 8'6" X.125"
Commodity Code 8013188
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
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VENDORS ACCESSORIES | CONDUIT CORP |PRODUCTS CORP
24" X 0.080" ISOSCELES TRIANGLE
Commaodity Code 8013190
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
48" X 0.080" ISOSCELES TRIANGLE
Commaodity Code 8013192
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
60" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013194
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
60" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013196
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
62" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013198
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price (Lots over 125) NO BID NO BID NO BID
62" X 48™ X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013199
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)
Unit Price (Lots over 125)
TOTAL OPTION "A™ NO BID NO BID NO BID
LOTS1-75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LOTS 76 - 125 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LOTS OVER 125 NO BID
OPTION B-SIGN BLANKS
TYPE Il - 6061-T6-ASTM B-921
COATED
36" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013202 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)
Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)
Unit Price (Lots over 125)
30" X 30" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013204 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

24" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013206

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

18" X 24" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013208

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 18" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013210

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

6" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013212

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

6" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013214

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

9" X 24" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013216

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

9" X 30™ X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013218

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

9" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013220

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

9" X 42" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013222

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013224

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

22" X 40" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013226

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013228

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

18" X 19" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013230

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

8" X 24" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013232

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

9" X 12" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013234

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

48" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013236

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

36" X 24" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013238

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

18" X 6™ X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013240

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 6™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013242

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

21" X 15" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013244

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24" X 12" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013246

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013248

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 42" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013250

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013252

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

OCTAGONAL 36" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013254

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

OCTAGONAL 30" X 30" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013256

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

48" X 132" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013258

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

PENTAGON 36" X 36™ X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013260

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

ROUND 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013262

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

48" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013264

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

18" X 18" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013266

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

48" X 72" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013268

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

30" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013270

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

County Route Marker
24" X 24" X 0.080""
Commaodity Code 8013272

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

Hazard Marker Drilled 13/64 cat eye

holes & 5/16 mounting holes
18" X 18" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013274

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24" X 0.080" Round
Commodity Code 8013276

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

6" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013278

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

Yield Blank
36" X 36" X 36" - 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013280

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24 X 24" X 24" - 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013282

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

12" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013284

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

Pendant Blank
36" X 48" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013286

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

4" X 8'6" X .125"
Commaodity Code 8013288

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

24" X 0.080" ISOSCELES TRIANGLE
Commaodity Code 8013290

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

48" X 0.080" ISOSCELES TRIANGLE
Commodity Code 8013292

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

60" X 36" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013294

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

60" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013296

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

62" X 36" X 0.080"
Commaodity Code 8013298

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

62" X 48" X 0.080"
Commodity Code 8013300

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unit price (Lots 1 - 75)

Unit Price (Lots 76 - 125)

Unit Price (Lots over 125)

TOTAL OPTION "B :

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

LOTS1-75

LOTS 76 - 125

LOTS OVER 125
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
CONDUIT CORP

CUSTOM
PRODUCTS CORP
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
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CUSTOM
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VENDORS
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ACCESSORIES
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
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ACCESSORIES
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VENDORS
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VENDORS
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CUSTOM
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES
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PRODUCTS CORP

Page 37




VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
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ACCESSORIES
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
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ACCESSORIES
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VENDORS

UNIVERSAL
SIGNS &
ACCESSORIES

ALLIED TUBE &
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