
FORMAL SOLICITATION #B-150133     LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET 
OPENING DATE:  FEBRUARY 24, 2015       FOR
ANALYST: BOB FRANCESCHINI                         ROCK, AGGREGATE, SCREENINGS, BASE MATERIAL, SAND AND RIP RAP

VENDORS M.J.S. Trucking Vulcan Materials
Grippo Pavement 
Maintenance

Addenda Acknowedged NA NA NA
COPIES YES YES YES
SECTION 1: PEA ROCK COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED 11.50 14.50 9.65
PLANT LOCATION Bonita Grande Alico Road Bonita Grande
SECTION 2: #57 COARSE AGGREGATE COST PER 
TON
PLANT LOADED 11.50 14.50 9.65
PLANT LOCATION Bonita Grande Alico Road Bonita Grande
SECTION 3: LIMEROCK BASE MATERIAL COST PER 
TON
PLANT LOADED 8.50 9.00 7.97
PLANT LOCATION Bonita Grande Alico Road Bonita Grande
SECTION 4: 3/8" SCREENINGS COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED 9.00 11.50 7.97
PLANT LOCATION Bonita Grande Alico Road Bonita Grande
SECTION 5: CONCRETE SAND COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED 10.50 11.00 11.72
PLANT LOCATION Stewart Mining Moore Haven Stewart Mining
SECTION 5A: TOP DRESSING SAND COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED 10.50 11.00 11.72
PLANT LOCATION Stewart Mining Moore Haven Stewart Mining

SECTION 6: RIP RAP - 4 - 6" COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED 18.50 NA 17.48
PLANT LOCATION Bonita Grande Bonita Grande

SECTION 7: RIP RAP - 6 - 12" COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED 18.50 NA 17.74
PLANT LOCATION Bonita Grande Bonita Grande

SECTION 8: RIP RAP 12 24" COST PER TON

PLANT LOADED 20.50 NA 18.95
PLANT LOCATION Bonita Grande Bonita Grande
OPTION A: DELIVERY CHARGES (FOR ALL 
PRODUCT)

MINIMUM REQUIRED FOR DELIVERY 23 Tons 22 Tons
22 Tons for Sections 

1, 2, 3, 4
22 Tons for Sections 5 
& 5A

22 Tons for Sections 
6,7,8



VENDORS M.J.S. Trucking Vulcan Materials
Grippo Pavement 
Maintenance

NORTH OF RIVER 5.50
Stone-6.60 -             

Sand 7.40 10.54 10.24 12.29

PINE ISLAND 7.00
Stone-6.60 -             

Sand 8.50 13.95 14.89 15.69

SOUTH OF RIVER 5.00
Stone-5.90 -             

Sand 7.15 6.95 9.98 9.98

BOCA GRANDE 8.50
Stone-9.00 -             
Sand 11.30 15.95 15.95 17.69

CAPTIVA 7.00
Stone-7.50 -             
Sand 10.00 13.89 14.89 15.63

SANIBEL 7.00
Stone-7.00 -             
Sand 10.25 11.67 13.25 13.41

TO BE STARTED WITHIN____CALENDAR DAYS 1 1 2
DELIVER WITH OWN VEHICLE YES YES YES
LOCATION IN LEE COUNTY YES YES YES
MODIFICATIONS NO NO YES
SIGNED YES YES YES
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX 0606788 0000709 083454319
DISADVANTAGED BUSINESS ENTERPRISE YES NO NO
LOCAL VENDOR PRFERENCE QUESTIONNAIRE YES YES YES
AFFIDAVIT PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS YES YES YES
IMMIGRATION AFFIDAVIT YES YES YES
MEETS SPECIFICATIONS

No Bids



FORMAL SOLICITATION #B-150133     LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET 
OPENING DATE:  FEBRUARY 24, 2015       FOR
ANALYST: BOB FRANCESCHINI                         ROCK, AGGREGATE, SCREENINGS, BASE MATERIAL, SAND AND RIP RAP

VENDORS Clary's Sitework

Addenda Acknowedged NA
COPIES
SECTION 1: PEA ROCK COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED NO BID
PLANT LOCATION
SECTION 2: #57 COARSE AGGREGATE COST PER 
TON
PLANT LOADED NO BID
PLANT LOCATION
SECTION 3: LIMEROCK BASE MATERIAL COST PER 
TON
PLANT LOADED NO BID
PLANT LOCATION
SECTION 4: 3/8" SCREENINGS COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED NO BID
PLANT LOCATION
SECTION 5: CONCRETE SAND COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED NO BID
PLANT LOCATION
SECTION 5A: TOP DRESSING SAND COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED NO BID
PLANT LOCATION

SECTION 6: RIP RAP - 4 - 6" COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED NO BID
PLANT LOCATION

SECTION 7: RIP RAP - 6 - 12" COST PER TON
PLANT LOADED NO BID
PLANT LOCATION

SECTION 8: RIP RAP 12 24" COST PER TON

PLANT LOADED NO BID
PLANT LOCATION
OPTION A: DELIVERY CHARGES (FOR ALL 
PRODUCT)
MINIMUM REQUIRED FOR DELIVERY 20 Tons



VENDORS Clary's Sitework

NORTH OF RIVER 10.00
PINE ISLAND 15.00
SOUTH OF RIVER 10.00
BOCA GRANDE 25.00
CAPTIVA 25.00
SANIBEL 20.00

TO BE STARTED WITHIN____CALENDAR DAYS 5
DELIVER WITH OWN VEHICLE YES
LOCATION IN LEE COUNTY YES
MODIFICATIONS NO
SIGNED YES
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX 604157255
DISADVANTAGED BUSINESS ENTERPRISE NO
LOCAL VENDOR PRFERENCE QUESTIONNAIRE YES
AFFIDAVIT PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS YES
IMMIGRATION AFFIDAVIT YES
MEETS SPECIFICATIONS

No Bids
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