B200270MIF El Contract #_N/A
Purchase of Fungicides, Herbicides & Pesticides Board Approval Date:_9/15/2020
Nutrien Ag Solutlons, Inc.

AGREEMENT FOR
PURCHASE OF FUNGICIDES, HERBICIDES & PESTICIDES

THIS AGREEMENT (“"Agreement”) is made and entered into by and between Lee
County, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, hereinafter referred to as the
"County" and Nutrien Ag Solutions, Inc., a Delaware corporation authorized to do
business in the State of Florida, whose address Is 3005 Rocky Mountain Avenue,
Loveland, CO 80538 and whose federal tax Identification number is 04-3769161,
hereinafter referred to as “Vendor."

WITNESSETH

WHEREAS, the County intends to purchase Fungicides, Herbicides & Pesticides from
the Vendor in connection with “Purchase of Fungicides, Herbicides & Pesticides” (the
“Purchase”); and,

WHEREAS, the County issued Solicitation No. B200270MIF on April 28, 2020 (the
"Solicitation™); and,

WHEREAS, the County evaluated the responses received and found the Vendor
qualified to provide the necessary products; and,

WHEREAS, the County posted a Notice of Intended Decision on July 27, 2020; and,

WHEREAS, the Vendor has reviewed the products and services to be supplied
pursuant to this Agreement and is qualified, willing and able to provide all such
products and services in accordance with Its terms.

NOW, THEREFORE, the County and the Vendor, In consideration of the mutual
covenants contained herein, do agree as follows:

I. PRODUCTS AND SERVICES

The Vendor agrees to diligently provide all products and services for the
Purchase, a more specific description of the Project Scope of Services Is set
forth in the Scope of Work and Specifications and Special Conditions Sections
of B200270MIF, a photocopy of said section(s) being attached hereto and
incorporated by reference as Exhibit A. Vendor shall comply strictly with all of
the terms and conditlons of Solicitation No. B200270MIF as modified by its
addenda, copies of which are on fille with the County’s Department of
Procurement Management and are deemed incorporated into this Agreement.
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II. TERM AND DELIVERY

A. This Agreement shall commence immediately upon the effective date and
shall continue through the delivery of the Purchase and the associated
warranty period as further described In this Agreement on an as needed
basis for one (1) year period. There may be an option renew this Agreement
based upon the written approval of both the County and Vendor for a
renewal term or terms not to execeed the initial Agreement term of one (1)
year. The increments of the renewal shall be at the sole discretion of the
County as deemed in its best interest. The effective date shall be the date
the Lee County Board of County Commissioners awarded the Soliciatation
to the Vendor,

B. A purchase order must be Issued by the County before commencement of
any work or purchase of any goods related to this Agreement,

III. COMPENSATION AND PAYMENT

A. The County shall pay the Vendor In accordance with the terms and
conditions of this Agreement for providing all products and services as set
forth in Exhibit A, and further described in Exhibit B, Fee Schedule, attached
hereto and incorporated herein. Sald total amount to be all inclusive of
costs necessary to provide all products and services as outlined in this
Agreement, and as supported by the Vendor’s submittal in response to the
Solicitation, a copy of which Is on file with the County’s Department of
Procurement Management and is deemed incorporated into this Agreement.

B. Notwithstanding the preceding, Vendor shail not make any deliveries or
perform any services under this Agreement until receipt of written
authorization from the County. Vendor acknowledges and agrees that no
minimum order or amount of product or service is guaranteed under this
Agreement and County may elect to request no products or services. If the
County authorizes delivery of products or performance of services, the
County reserves the right to amend, reduce, or cancel the authorization In
Its sole discretion.

C. All funds for payment by the County under this Agreement are subject to
the avallability of an annual appropriation for this purpose by the County.
In the event of non-appropriation of funds by the County for the services
provided under this Agreement, the County will terminate the contract,
without termination charge or other liability, on the last day of the then
current fiscal year or when the appropriation made for the then-current
year for the services covered by this Agreement is spent, whichever event
occurs first, If at any time funds are not appropriated for the continuance
of this Agreement, cancellation shall be accepted by the Vendor on thirty
(30) days’ prior written notice, but failure to give such notice shall be of no
effect and the County shall not be obligated under this Agreement beyond
the date of termination.
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Iv. T F PA

A. The County shall pay the Vendor in accordance with the Local Government
Prompt Payment Act, Section 218.70, Florida Statutes, upon receipt of the
Vendor’s invoice and written approval of same by the County indicating that
the products and services have been provided in conformity with this
Agreement.

B. The Vendor shall submit an invoice for payment to the County on a monthly
basis for those specific products and services as described in Exhibit A (and
the corresponding fees as described In Exhibit B) that were provided during
that Invoicing period.

C. For partial shipments or deliveries, progress payments shall be paid
monthly in proportion to the percentage of products and services delivered
on those specific line items as approved In writing by the County.

V. ADDITIONAL PURCHASES

A. No changes to this Agreement or the performance contemplated hereunder
shall be made unless the same are in writing and signed by both the Vendor
and the County.

B. If the County requires the Vendor to perform additional services or provide
additional product(s) related to this Agreement, then the Vendor shall be
entitled to additional compensation based on the Fee Schedule as amended
to the extent necessary to accommodate such additional work or
product(s). The additional compensation shall be agreed upon before
commencement of any additional services or provision of additional
product(s) and shall be Iincorporated into this Agreement by written
amendment. The County shall not pay for any additional service, work
performed or product provided before a written amendment to this
Agreement.

Notwithstanding the preceding, in the event additional services are required
as a result of error, omission or negligence of the Vendor, the Vendor shall
not be entitled to additional compensation.

VI. LIABILITY OF VENDOR

A. The Vendor shall save, defend, indemnify and hold harmless the County
from and agalnst any and all claims, actlons, damages, fees, fines,
penalties, defense costs, suits or liabllities which may arise out of any act,
neglect, error, omission or default of the Vendor arising out of or in any
way connected with the Vendor or subcontractor’s performance or failure
to perform under the terms of this Agreement.
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B.

This section shall survive the termination or expiration of this Agreement.

VII. VENDOR'S INSURANCE

A. Vendor shall procure and maintain insurance as specified in Exhibit C,
Insurance Requirements, attached hereto and made a part of this
Agreement.

B. Vendor shall, on a primary basis and at its sole expense, maintain In full
force and effect, at all times during the life of this Agreement, insurance
coverage (including endorsements) and limits as described in Exhibit C.
These requirements, as well as the County's review or acceptance of
insurance maintained by Vendor, are not intended to and shall not in
any manner limit or qualify the liabilities or obligations assumed by
Vendor under this Agreement. Insurance carriers providing coverage
required herein must be licensed to conduct business in the State of
Florida and must possess a current A.M. Best's Financial Strength Rating
of "B or better.” No changes are to be made to these specifications
without prior written specific approval by County Risk Management. To
the extent multiple insurance coverages and/or County's self-insured
retention may apply, any and all insurance coverage purchased by
Vendor and its subcontractors Identifying the County as an additional
named insured shall be primary.

VIII. RESPONSIBILITIES OF THE VENDOR

A.

The Vendor shall be responsible for the quality and functionality of all
products supplied and services performed by or at the behest of the Vendor
under this Agreement. The Vendor shall, without additional compensation,
correct any errors or deficiencies in its products, or if directed by County,
supply a comparable replacement product or service.

. The Vendor warrants that it has not employed or retained any company or

person (other than a bona fide employee working solely for the Vendor), to
solicit or secure this Agreement and that it has not paid or agreed to pay
any person, company, corporation, Individual, or firm other than a bona
fide employee working solely for the Vendor, any fee, commission,
percentage, gift, or any other consideration, contingent upon or resulting
from the award of this Agreement.

The Vendor shall comply with all federal, state, and local laws, regulations
and ordinances applicable to the work or payment for work thereof, and
shall not discriminate on the grounds of race, color, religion, sex, or national
origin in the performance of work under this Agreement.

Vendor specifically acknowledges its obligations to comply with Section
119.0701, Florida Statutes, with regard to public records, and shall:
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1) keep and maintain public records that ordinarily and necessarily
would be required by the County In order to perform the services
required under this Agreement;

2) upon request from the County, provide the County with a copy of the
requested records or allow the records to be inspected or copied
within a reasonable time at a cost that does not exceed the cost
provided in Chapter 119, Florida Statutes, or as otherwise provided
by law;

3) ensure that public records that are exempt or confidential and
exempt from public records disclosure requirements are not
disclosed, except as authorized by law; and

4) meet all requirements for retaining public records and transfer, at no
cost to the County, all public records in possession of Vendor upon
termination of this Agreement and destroy any duplicate public
records that are exempt or confidential and exempt from public
records disclosure requirements. All records stored electronically
must be provided to the County in a format that is compatible with
the information technology system of the County.

IF THE VENDOR HAS QUESTIONS REGARDING THE
APPLICATION OF CHAPTER 119, FLORIDA STATUTES,
TO THE VENDOR’'S DUTY TO PROVIDE PUBLIC
RECORDS RELATING TO THE CONTRACT, CONTACT
THE CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC RECORDS AT 239-533-
2221, 2115 SECOND STREET, FORT MYERS, FL 33901,
PRRCustodian@leegov.com;
http://www.leegov.com/publicrecords.

E. The Vendor Is, and shall be, in the performance of all work, services and
activities under this Agreement, an independent contractor. Vendor is not
an employee, agent or servant of the County and shall not represent Itself
as such. All persons engaged in any work or services performed pursuant
to this Agreement shall at all times, and in all places, be subject to the
Vendor's sole directlon, supervision and control. The Vendor shall exercise
control over the means and manner In which it and its employees perform
the work, and In all respects the Vendor’s relationship and the relationship
of its employees to the County shall be that of an independent contractor
and not as employees of the County. The Vendor shall be solely responsible
for providing benefits and insurance to Iits employees.

F. The Vendor shall comply with the Vendor Background Screening Affidavit
attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit D.
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IX. OWNERSHIP

It is understood and agreed that all products provided under this Agreement
shall become the property of the County upon acceptance by the County.

X. Y PRODU RF! F SERVI

A. The Vendor shall ensure that all of its staff, contractors and suppliers
involved in the production or delivery of the products are fully qualified and
capable to perform their assigned tasks.

B. The personnel assigned by the Vendor to perform the services pursuant to
this Agreement shall comply with the terms set forth in this Agreement. If
the services provided require use of specific key personnel, the personnel
shall be agreed to by the County and Vendor. If the Vendor's key personnel
have been predetermined and approved, through the Solicitation process
or otherwise, any subsequent change or substitution to the personnel must
receive the County’s written approval before said changes or substitution
can become effective.

C. The Vendor specifically agrees that all products shall be delivered within
the time limits as set forth in this Agreement, subject only to delays caused
by force majeure, or as otherwise defined herein. “Force majeure” shall be
deemed to be any unforeseeable and unavoidable cause affecting the
performance of this Agreement arising from or attributable to acts, events,
omissions or accidents beyond the control of the parties.

XI. NCE W P AW

This Agreement shall be governed by the laws of the State of Florida. Vendor
shall promptly comply with all applicable federal, state, county and municipal
laws, ordinances, regulations, and rules relating to the services to be
performed hereunder and In effect at the time of performance. Vendor shall
conduct no activity or provide any service that is unlawful or offensive.

XI1I. TERM TI

A. The County shall have the right at any time upon thirty (30) days’ written
notice to the Vendor to terminate this Agreement in whole or in part for
any reason whatsoever. In the event of such termination, the County shall
be responsible to Vendor only for fees and compensation earned by the
Vendor, in accordance with Section III, prior to the effective date of said
termination. In no event shall the County be responsible for lost profits of
Vendor or any other elements of breach of contract.

B. After receipt of a notice of termination, except as otherwise directed, the
Vendor shall stop work on the date of receipt of the notice of termination
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XIII.

or other date specified in the notice; place no further orders or sub-
contracts for materials, services, or facilities except as necessary for
completion of such portion of the work not terminated; terminate all
vendors and subcontracts; and settle all outstanding liabilities and claims.

ISPUT S TION

A. In the event of a dispute or claim arising out of this Agreement, the parties

agree first to try in good faith to settle the dispute by direct discussion. If
this is unsuccessful, the parties may enter into mediation in Lee County,
Florida, with the parties sharing equally in the cost of such mediation.

. In the event mediation, if attempted, is unsuccessful in resolving a dispute,

the partles may proceed to litigation as set forth below.

. Any dispute, action or proceeding arising out of or related to this Agreement

will be exclusively commenced In the state courts of Lee County, Florida, or
where proper subject matter jurisdiction exists, in the United States District
Court for the Middle District of Florida. Each party irrevocably submits and
walves any objections to the exclusive personal jurisdiction and venue of
such courts, Including any objection based on forum non conveniens.

D. This Agreement and the rights and obligations of the parties shall be

governed by the laws of the State of Florida without regard to its conflict of
laws principles.

. Unless otherwise agreed in writing, the Vendor shall be required to continue

all obligations under this Agreement during the pendency of a claim or
dispute including, but not limited to, actual periods of mediation or judicial
proceedings.

XI1V. VENDOR WARRANTY

A. All products provided under this Agreement shall be new (unless specifically

identified otherwise In Exhibit B) and of the most sultable grade for the
purpose intended.

. If any product delivered does not meet performance representations or

other quality assurance representations as published by manufacturers,
producers or distributors of the products or the specifications listed in this
Agreement, the Vendor shall pick up the product from the County at no
expense to the County. The County reserves the right to reject any or all
materials if, in its judgment, the item reflects unsatisfactory workmanship
or manufacturing or shipping damage. In such case, the Vendor shall
refund to the County any money which has been paid for same.
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XV. MISCELLANEOUS

A. This Agreement constitutes the sole and complete understanding between
the parties and supersedes all other contracts between them, whether oral
or written, with respect to the subject matter. No amendment, change or
addendum to this Agreement is enforceable unless agreed to in writing by
both parties and incorporated into this Agreement.

B. The provisions of this Agreement shall Inure to the benefit of and be binding
upon the respective successors and assignees of the parties hereto. A party
to this Agreement shall not sell, transfer, assign, license, franchise,
restructure, alter, or change its corporate structure or otherwise part with
possession or mortgage, charge or encumber any right or obligation under
this Agreement without the proposed assignee and/or party restructuring,
altering or changing its corporate structure agreeing In writing with the
non-assigning party to observe and perform the terms, conditions and
restrictions on the part of the assigning party to this Agreement, whether
express or implied, as If the proposed assignee and/or party restructuring,
altering or changing its corporate structure was an original contracting
party to this Agreement. Notwithstanding the foregoing provision, the
Vendor may assign its rights if given written authorization by the County
and claims for the money due or to become due to the Vendor from the
County under this Agreement may be assigned to a financial institution or
to a trustee in bankruptcy without such approval from the County. Notice
of any such transfer or assignment due to bankruptcy shall be promptly
given to the County.

C. The exercise by either party of any rights or remedies provided herein shall
not constitute a walver of any other rights or remedies available under this
Agreement or any applicable law.

D. The failure of the County to enforce one or more of the provisions of the
Agreement shall not be construed to be and shall not be a waiver of any
such provision or provisions or of its right thereafter to enforce each and
every such provision,

E. The parties covenant and agree that each is duly authorized to enter Into
and perform this Agreement and those executing this Agreement have all
requisite power and authority to bind the parties.

F. Neither the County’s review, approval or acceptance of, nor payment for,
the products and services required under this Agreement shall be construed
to operate as a waiver of any rights under this Agreement or of any cause
of action arising out of the performance of this Agreement.

G. If the Vendor is comprised of more than one legal entity, each entity shall
be jointly and severally liable hereunder.
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H. When any period of time is referred to by days herein, it shall be computed
to exclude the first day and include the last day of such period. When the
period of time is fewer than three (3) days, it shall mean business days as
defined by Lee County. If the perlod of time is greater than three (3) days,
then it shall mean calendar days. For any period of time greater than seven
(7) days, where the deadline falls on a Saturday, Sunday, or Lee County
recognized holiday, the deadline will then fall to the next Monday or non-
Lee County recognized holiday

I. Any notices of default or termination shall be sufficient if sent by the parties
via United States certified mail, postage paid, or via a nationally recognized
delivery service, to the addresses listed below:

Vendor’s Representative: County’s Representatives:

Name: Tim Smith Names: Roger Desjarlais Mary Tucker
Director of

Title: Region Manager Titles: County Manager Procurement
Management

’ 3005 Rocky .
Address: Matiptaliv Averite Address: P.O. Box 398
Loveland, CO 80538 Fort Myers, FL 33902
Telephone:  727-348-7569 Telephone: 239-533-2221 239-533-8881
Facsimile:  N/A Facsimile:  239-485-2262 239-485-8383
. . troy.knowlton@nutri s .
Exna: en.com E-Mail: i vV ker@|

J. Any change in the County’s or the Vendor’s Representative will be promptly
communicated by the party making the change.

K. Paragraph headings are for the convenience of the parties and for reference
purposes only and shall be given no legal effect.

L. In the event of conflicts or inconsistencies, the documents shall be given
precedence in the following order:

1. Agreement

2. County’s Purchase Order

3. Solicitation

4. Vendor's Submittal in Response to the Solicitation
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this Agreement as of the date
last below written.

WITNESS: Nutrien Ag Solutions, Inc.

Signed By: B%M‘“? H"@*‘”‘-‘” Signed By:w

Print Name: 212 o ‘f"f""il‘_':-ban Print Name: Shtvn Fuh launa
Tie:__V-P + Cuond Gounsy
J

Date: < \9.2.0

LEE COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIPA
BY:@“—ZK-——

CHAIR

DATE: 9'// ZZZQE_

APPROVED AS TO FORM FOR THE

RELIANCE, OF LEE COU ONL
BY: (\

OFFICE OF THE COUNTY ATTORNEY
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EXHIBIT A
SPECIFICATIONS OR SCOPE OF SERVICES

SCOPE OF WORK AND SPECIFICATIONS

1. SCOPE

LL

The Lee County Board of County Commussioners seeks io coniract with qualified Vendor(s) to purchase
Herhicides & Pesticides on an “as-needed” basis. The products listed on the Bid Form shall be

Fungicides,
delivered to County facilities by the requesting department as directed.

2. DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS

21

Shipments shall be Free oo Board (FOB) Destination delivered and unloaded by the Vendor's delivery dnver
between the hours of 8:00 AM 10 4:00 PM Eastem Time, Monday through Friday, withi three (3) calendar days
after verbal, electronic, or fax receipt of an order placed by an anthorized member of the Conaty.

2.2, “Emergency” deliveries shall be within 24 honrs from the ime when the Couuty places an order. An emergency

23.

15

26.

delivery is defined as a delivery which i5 necessary in crder to prevent the County from maning out of chemicals
listed in the scope in less than 24 hours. The County will endeavor to minimize the mmber of “emergency”

The County reserves the right to refuse delivery if that delivery is not in the proper timeframe;, the Vendor has
wmp@boﬂﬂhmwuvmum;mmmpwnhm and/or the Vendor
has malfanctioning equipment.

. In the event a delivery ticket 15 not provided duning the time the Vender 13 on site, the delivery may be rejected.

The Product Name, Unit Price bid by the Vendor, Unite of Measure, and Quantity delivered shall be cleasly
denoted on delivery documentation and invoicing to ensure efficient and effective product and price verification.
Faiture to clearly indicate such detnils on delivery and invoice documeniation may result in payment delays or
oon-payment.

The County reserves the right to add or delete delivery sites at its discretion at agy time thronghout the term of
the Agreement.

. The Vendor's delivery driver shall present a photo LD. de.lwuy‘nzm shall show that the driver is an

employee of either the trocking company or the Vi personoel maldng deliveries shall wear the
Wuwmﬂmm@?ﬁumwh&fuymmmmdﬂmu
subject fo inspection prior to acceptance by oo authorized member of the Counnty.

4 mvmmuw&mmmnmdmwmmm s delivery equipment or

from faiture of attendant delivery personne! in the proper performance of their duties.

. Proper perfosmance shall require attendant delivery personnei(s) constant inspection and observation of unloading

operations and kuowledgeable response to problems or emergencies, which would most commenly be expected
o occur, The County reserves to right to refuse any and all delivenies made with equipment that is poorly
i

2.10.The tanks or trailers shall be clean and free of residue that may contaminate the Veador's product or impede the

unloading process. The Veador shall verify the cleankness of the transporting equipment before loading.

2.11Emmhmdmdmmcmmm:mmmmmMmeMw

and the cost of such service shall be charged to the Vendor and deducted from the amount due to the
V for materinls,

3. SAFETY DATA SHEETS (SDS)

3L

The Vendor shall fully comply with all federal, state, mmmmmmm
and safety including providing material safety data sheets with each slupment herennder.

m B200270\IF - Parchase of Fungicides, Herbicides & Pesticides
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VER B8

4. COMPARABLE UNITS

4.1. Where Brand Name and products details provided through specifications, bid schedule or other associated
contract documents, Vendor shell utilize such product matching listed Brand Name or County approved
compatnble unif(s). Determination of comparable unit(s) shall be at the sole discretion of the Coualy suthorized

ive. Vendor shall seek authonzed i af me of c ble unit(s) pri
i YAunE al e gemR iy of et et B o o podoc i REgaeid by Eonaty
authorized representative. Comparable prodncts nait price shall not exceed unit price of line items as kisted
within Contractor's agreement, Invoicing of comparable unit shafl clemly indicste original line jtem

&m&wub&gmmm Frilure to provide clear invoicing may reslt in delays or non-payment
invoices

4.2. Vendor recommending “Comparable Unit” in response to any group line item set forth with the Bid Form shall
provide Product Literature for each such item recommended. Failure may be cause for rejection as noa-
compliant.
2.1.Sample: The County, at its sole option and without cost to the County, may also require the Vendor within

five (9) business days following verbal request to provide and deliver samples to cpe or more participating
departments to allow for application analysis consideration as an acceptable “Comparuble Unit™ product.

4.2.2 Demonstration: The Couaty, at its sale option and without cost to the Couaty, may also require the Vendor to
mkammmmmmwmpmﬂmgdepum:mﬂmﬁw (3) business days
following verbal request of “Comparable Unit” product.

5. ADDITIONAL PRODUCTS
5.1. The County reserves the right to add or delete, at eny trme, and or all material, tasks or services associated with
this Agreement/Contract rod in the manner that is in the best interest of the County.

End of Scope of Work and Specifications Section

B200270MIF - Purchase of Fungicides, Herbicides & Pesticides

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF Page 12 of 37



SPECIAL CONDITIONS
These are conditions thet are in relstion to this solicitation caoly and have not been included in the Covnty's standard Terms
and Conditicns or the Scope of Work

1. CONTRACT TERM
1.1, The Vendor shall be responsible for fiurnishing and delivering to the Lee County requesting Department(s) the
commodity or services on an “as needed basis™ " for a one (1) year period. Upon omitual written agreement of
both parties, the pasties may renew the Agreement, in whole or in part, for o renewal term or terns oot to exceed
the initia] Agreement term of one (3) year.

1.2, Ths is an anonal Agreement and wock will be authorized, scheduled, funded, and acconnted for by issuance of a
Purchase Order, by the requesting department. No guarantee is expressed or implied as to the quantity or
commodities and/or services o be procured uuder this Invitation to Bid (TTB); no work is guaranteed,

2. BASIS OF AWARD
2.1. It is the County’s infent to award to a pool of Vendors that nre responsive, responsible, and mwet the Connty
requirements rod specifications. Vendors are encouraged to bid on all line items listed on the Bid Schedule that
they can supply. Vendors are not required to bid on all line items to be considered eligible for award and items
oot available via Vendor may be listed as No Bid. No Bid items may not be purchased at any time through Vendor
unless added via amendment by the County at sts sole discretion.

22. This will allow individual departments and divisions to use the Vendor that has the needed product that best

supports the department’s need. The County reserves the right to purchase the product or service listed in this bid
elsewhere in an emergency.

End of Special Conditions Section

_/Bllﬂﬂﬂlﬂr-!iﬂ:hn of Fungicides, Herbicides & Pesticides
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Procurement Management
2115 Second Floor, 1¥ !'Ioor

= LEE COUNTY e M L S50

SOUTHWLST FLORIDA FaxLine: (239) 485-8383

Posted Dote: May 11,2020

Solicitation No.: B200270MIF

Solicitntion Nnme: Purchase of Fungicides, Herbicides & Pesticides
Subject: Addendum Number 1

The

clarification, additions, deletions, and/or modificstions to the above referenced bid. This

addendum shall hereafier be regarded as part of the solicitation. Items not referenced herein remnin unchanged, including

the response date. Words, phrases or sentences with a strilethsough represent deletions to the original solicitation.
Underlined words and bolded, phrases or sentences represent additions to the oniginal solicitation.

1. ATTACHMENT: Tabsheet.pdf
3, QUESTIONS/ANSWERS

1.

We are interested in the volumes used and previous year tabulations for the
solicitation referenced in the subject line - B200270MIF - Purchase of
Fungicides, Hetbicides & Pesticides.

Please see the attached Bid Tabulation Sheet as requested. This is n Countywide
contract and products are purchased on nn as-needed basis by various County
departments. Additional documents related to the current contract B-150352 —
I:'un.giddes. Herliddu. Pesddlles, Ete. can be found on the Coumy’s -\nnual

BIDDER/PROPOSER IS ADVISED, YOU ARE REQUIRED TO ACKNOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF THIS
ADDENDUM WHEN SUBMITITING A BID/PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO COMPLY WITH THIS
REQUIREMENT MAY RESULT IN THE BIDDER/PROPOSER BEING CONSIDERED NON-RESPONSIVE.

ALL OTHER TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE SOLICITATION DOCUMENTS ARE AND SHALL

REMAIN THE SAME,

— MiguelFloves
Procurement Anslyst: Migoel Flores
Procurement Anslyst Direct Line: 239.533-8835
Lee County Procurement Management

Pagelofl
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0N #B-150362
OFENTYG DATE: JUNE S8, 3016

VER RATHY CICCARE

REDRIVER  [HELENA SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION

VENDORS SPECIALTIES, INC. [CHEMICALCO.  |ADVANCEMENTS |[DYNAMICS
L._..;_;L..a;gh_ﬁ._w_.._k._—*__r_,_..,mf ———— — @:m&
|:.Accmuc.u.|.on.gum NOBID NOBID NO B =
ACCORD 16 GALLON . _QUANTITY(COST NO BID BID NOBD
2. ACEFHATE 1 LB ENVELOPE - EACH NOBID NO BID| NOBID
[QUANTITY/COST : NOBID)  XNO NOBID i

. AQUA STARRODEQ CALLON - EACH
AQUA STARRODEO GALLOYN -

QUANTITY/COST
4. AQUATHOL SUPER K 251B-EACH S47480 NOBID N0 BID
[CANTITYICOST S47480] NO - KO —
|5, ARENA 50 GALLOY - EACH NOBID) NO NOBID

ARENA B0 CALLON - QUANTITY/COST NO N

BANDIT JOLB BAG-EACH NOBID NO BID NOBID

NDIT 30 LB BAC - QUANTITY:COST 92] ¥o NO
7. BLUE DYE QUART - EACH ND BID NOBID NOBID
BLUE DYE QUART - QUANTITY/COST NOBID NOBID NOBID
8. CELSIUS 10 OZ - EA N0 BID| _XNO NOBID| _
[CELSIUS 10 OZ - QUANTITY'CQ NOBD NO BID ~oBm|

e 35 * i M L1 Lol B
GALLON - FACH NOBID! mnm] NO BID)
[CLEARY'S 336 FOR SURFACE FUNGIS %6 _1
CALLON . QUANTITY/COST NOBID NOBID, NOBID

- soual xosm| ]
JANTITYICOST NO BID| NOBID NOBID) _

11. CCTRINE(KILLS ALGAE) 35 GALLON - l
EACH O BID NOBID NOBI|

Solicltation No. #B200270MIF
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ATE: JUNE 39, 2015
: " CICCARELLY

o e o T N '
EUTANT AL, AL S CALLON - -
QUANTITY/COST NO] mg} NO BID
13, CUTHINE PLUS GR J0 LB -EACH _$63.00 NoBm| ¥oED)|
CCIRINE PLUS GR 30 LB - QUANTITY/COST 363.00 NOBID NO
13, DACNIL 15 GALLONS - EACH OB sognl ¥o
IDACNIL 1.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST so_ml ______» -
EACE NO BID NO BID) NO
DILUENT BLUE OIL 1138 GALLONS - I

QUANTITITCOST O BID NOBID NO

15, DISMISS SOUTH | PT - EACH 19080 184,09 eyl
DISAMSS SOUTH 1 FT - QGANTITY'COST , _

16. DLZ - 2.5 GALLONS - EACH NO BID

| DLZ- 15 GALLONS - GUANTITY COST NO BID]

17. DRIVE XLRS .5 CALLOY - EACH $68.00

DRIVE XLRS .5 GALLON - QUANTITY/COST $68.00]

18 ELEMENT 3 A 2.5 GALLONS - EACH 10895

ELEMENT 3 A 2.5 GALLONS -

DUANTITV/COST S1089E

19. ELEMENT 426 GALLONS - EACH sugsl

ELEMENT 4 2.8 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST s123.63|

0. ESPLANADE 204 5C 2.6 GALLONS -EACH w6120 "
ESPLANADE 300 5C 28 GALLONS -

QUANTITRICOST

Solicitation No. #B8200270MIF Page 16 of 37



SFECTALTIES, INC, [CHEMICAL CO.

3170,

26 HORTICULTURAL OfL 1.5 GALLONS - EAC

HOKTICULTURAL OIL 3.5 GALLONS -
TANTITY/COST

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF Page 17 of 37



RED RIVER

HELENA
SPECTALTIES, INC. |CHEMICAL CO.

Nogg] 1) :m NO 51

soggl

%o sosm)
NO 51400 x0
NO BID 51400 NO B
32 JLB OIL 11.35 GALLONS - EACE NOBID NO EID 50
JLS OIL 1138 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NOBID NOBI|
33, KAVAMO -WET AGENT 3.5 GALLONS - l ol
EACH i NO BID NOBID NOBW _

RADMO -WET AGENT =5 GALLONS -

QL "COST N

34, KEAMDIO -FLUS 3.8 GALLONS - EACH NO
AAMMO -PLUS 2.6 CALLONS -

[QUANTITY/COST NO

35, KERB 3.6 GALLONS - EACH

KERB 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST

16 RROVARDE 6 L8 - EACH N0
RROVAR DF 6 LB - QUANTITY'COST NO BID

37, AIANOR 2 OZ - EACE -

MANOR 2 OZ - QUANTITY ICOST NOBID

IO MERITWSP 7% L6 OZ-FACH NO BID

MERIT W5P 75 L6 OZ- QUANTITY/COST

35. AL FSTONE CALILONS - E

AMLESTONE 2.6 CALLONS - QUANTITY/COST |

40, MONUMENT PER BOX ($ X § CRAM
PACEETS) - EACH

So!lcltaﬂon No. #8200270MIF
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LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

Ammmm |DS'N.-“IICS

R

‘*-.A

oanmmmcusm:
ANTITYICOST

—

NO ml
NO BID
ARIS (CPLAND DMAZPYR) 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITYICOST ND BID!
43, POLARIS (ARSENAL) 1 CALLON- EACH NO BID
3} -
QUANTITYICOST NOBID

. mrcm PRO 1 GALLON - E.lCB

mrcmmmwm GLYPHOSATE) 2. —l
GALLOX - NOBD
cH BID woEm|

RAZOR FRO GALLOY . QUANTITS/COST NO 81D o g@l No8m|
48, RAZOR PRO 3.6 GALLONS - EACH s NOBID soEm|
RAZORPRO 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST s2991] NOBID NO B/
|15, RAZOR PRO 30 GALLOX DRUN - EACH s329.70] NO BID NoBm|
n.unnmncmusnnu- ] T
ICOST $329.70 NO B NOBID

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF
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YOR
3 CIDES, FESTICIDES, EIC.
TREECARE
REDRIVER c APPLICATION
‘IVENDORS SPECIALTIES, INC. [CHEMICALCO.  |ADVANCEMENTS [DYNAMICS
i FE S—
lu. RENOVATEJ 2.5 GALLONS - EACH ¥0 nml NOBID NOBD
RENOVATES 15 GALLONS - L
UANTITVICOST . XOED NOBID 5O Bm)|
51 RESOLUTE 65 WG §LB - EACH NOBID NOBID NOED
RESOLUTE 65 WG § LB - QUANTITY/COST NOBID O BID| N0 BID|
NO B _NOBID sl
ANTITY/COST NOBD NO B NO BID
5. REWARD (AQUATIC) 1.6 GALLONS - EACH wg[ NOBID NOBD
mlpl NOBID .\1:&
130
s.msl .\'oml NO BID
74 N0 BID NOBD
NO O BID NOBM
ROUND UP 1 GALLON - QUANTITY'COST NO 50 51| NOED
56, ROUND UP PRO | CALLON - EACH NOBID Nos_x_gl NO BID
ROUND CP PRO 1 GALLON -
QUANTITVICOST NOBID NOBID KO BD)
57, ROUND UF 3.5 GALLONS - EACH mnm' NOBID NOBD
ROUND UP 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY COST NO BID NOBID NOBD)
58. ROUND UP QUIK PRO 6.3 LB- EACH 383 Nog_ml ~o B
QUANTITYICOST $53.00 ~osm) NOED)|
{59 sAmARA 4 COTNT - 10 18 BACS .EACH $137. NO b

Solicitation No, #B200270MIF
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REDRIVER
VENDORS SPECTALTIES, INC. |CHEMICAL CO.

T == e —

SAHARA 4 COUNT -10 LB BACS -
Lf

Solicitation No, #B200270MIF Page 21 of 37



A RCH I HERBICIDE® i1
|'I'IEICAII
RED RIVER HELENA SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION
VENDORS SPECTALTIES, NC, [CHEMICAL CO. |ADVANCEMENTS |DYNAMICS

G AR

68, TAL STAR (CONCENTRATE) 1 GALLON -

N0 $33.48
SOBM $32.48
ND NO BID|
TALSTAR (CRANULAR) 35 LBBAGS -
QUASTITYICOST _Nosm| o L
70, TOP CHOICE FOLB - EACH NOBI| NOBID
Tor cHOICE 418 - QUANTITY COST

7L VLTRA FINE OIL 1 GALLON -EACH

éEE
1

QUANTITY'COST NOBID NOBID| -
73. VELPAR 3.5 GALLONS - EACH. s187.30] xomm|

VELPAR 2.5 CALLONS - ggm\'m'\'-cosr $187.50 NOBID

T4 VISTA1 QUART - EACH N0 NOBID

VISTA 3 QUART - QUANTITY/COST NO NO l_ﬂi{ _

78. VISTA 1 CGALLON -EACH mg iL‘n-ll

VISTA 1 GALLOY - QUANTITY COST % $172.43|

|76, VISTA 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $4 NO B

ITT.WEEDART4D - BROADLEAF HERBICIDE

g
g
%
o
g

2.5 GALLONS - EACH 1
'EEDAR?24D - EROADLEAF HERBICIDE 2.5
AL = QUANTITY'COST NOBID ]

]
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ANNUAL

VENDORS

POHE STAR(EFVITEIN CALENDAN
IDAYS

DELIVER WITH OWN VEHICLE

LOCATION INLEE COUNTY

[ODIFICATIONS WERE MADE TO THE EID
OR SPECIFICATIONS. COMDMENTS HAVE
BEEN INSERTED TO CLEARLY SHOW
WHERE SUBSTITUTE ITEMS/SIZES ARE
BEING BID. Tha "COST (INDIVIDUAL)"

EACH $19.87]
ACCORD XRT 1 2.5 GALLONS - EACH 9.9
L (ACEPHATE) ACEPHATE M PRILL B X #

ILB) - PERLB $8.95
JACEPHATE) ACEFHATE 90 PRILL (8 X6 LB) -

|PER5LBS 29.7

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF
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DRALAL QUOTATION #B-150083

(OPERING DATE: JUNE ]

“STNE 35, 501
UYER: Y CICCARELLY

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABLLATION SHEET

- ANNUAL PURCHAGE OF FUNGUCIDES, BERBICIIES, PESTI
e e e
TREECARE
REDRIVER = [HELENA SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION
VENDORS SPECIALTIES, INC. |[CHEMICALCO,  |ADVANCEMENTS |DYNAMICS

) (AQUA STAR RODEO) AQUANEAT -1
N

$18.00
QUA STAR/RODED) AQUANEAT - 2.5
CALLONS L " . $3750
9, (CLEARY"S 3336 FOR SURTACE FUNGIS)
TAL45 -1 GALLON
(CLEARY™S 3336 FOR SURFACE FUNGTS) TAL
_ _ $120.00

L1, (CUTRINE (KILLS ALGAE) CUTRINE PLUS [

G i i 51598

CUTRINE (KILLS ALGAE) CUTRINE PLUS - ]
2.5 CALLONS 83995 e
14, (DILLVENT BLUE OIL) ELITE FREMIER
BLUE- 1 GALLOS $12.33
(D PREMIER BLLE -
15 GALLON DRUM FILLED TO 11,28
CALLONS - 13871
16. DLZ) ELITE VELOCTTY - LGALLON _ 530.60
(DLZ) ELITE VELOCITY - 2.8 GALLONS ML
12, (GLYPHOSATE 4 PLUS) ALECTO 41 5.1
GALLON §12.30 .
(CLYFHOSATE 4 FLUS) ALECTO 415 . 28
GALLONS $30£0 _
23, EABITAT (WETLAND IMAZYPYR)
ARSENAL HERBEICIDE - 1 GALLON £49.90
(HABITAT (WETLAND DMAZYPYR) ARSENAL
HERBICIDE - 3.5 CALLONS $134.78
38, (MPEL RED OIL) ELITE PREMIER RED - 1

o'

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF
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I'?

REDRIVER  [HELENA
VENDORS SPECIALTIES, INC. [CHEAICAL CO. VANCEMENTS [DVNAMICS
s13871
18 1
$40.00
INDICATOR - MARKING DYE) RRSI VAL I
AARKING DYE . § GALLON $16.00
smol S—
1229
S1383
33, (KASDMO - WET AGENT) ELITE
PLATINUM - 1 GALLON ] sl
(KAMDMO - WET AGENT) ELITE PLATINUM -
*.5 CALLONS 440,
(53) TINCM -1
. 31600
(RAMAO PLUS) ELITE PLATINUM - 15
NS $40.00
19, AMERIT WSP 78) RODACLOPRID 78 W5P
oz
(MERIT WSP 75) DIDACLOPRID 75 WSP 1§
0z — s
£, (REWARD (AQUATIC) DIQUAT SPC2L-1 [
CALLON $4£.00 -
¥, }-§ & {
suuol

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF
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ATION MB-150351
PEN 015
FA

RED RIVER
SPECTIALTIES, INC.

APPLICATION
DYNAMICS

VENDORS

o

e

(ROUND UF) ROUND UP PRO CONCENTRATE
15 GALLONS

$45.00

|62, (SINEER - DRIFT AGENT) ELITE SECURE
ULTRA -1 GALLON

520.00

70, (TAL STAR (CONCENTRATE) BIFENLT - 1

(ULTRA FINE OIL) ELITE PACER ULTRA- 3.5
GALLONS

79. (WEEDAR'2D - BROADLEAF HERBICIDE)
WEEDESTROY AM-0 - PER GALLON

(WEEDARZ4D - BROADLEAF HERBICIDE)
WEEDESTROY AM-40 - 2.5 GALLONS
e A s e

¢ RELENA CEEAICAL CO. & AQUATHOL
SUPER KIS IV 30 LB CONTAINER; #8 ARENA
16 IN A 40 OZ BOTTLE, w7 SPEC SPRAY
INDICATOR; 426 OFFERING RANGER FRO;
926 OFFERING OMNI SUPREN(E OfL; w9
OFFERING ROUND UP CUSTOM AS WELL AS
THE FOLLOWING:

|1. ACCORD - 1.5 GALLONS

$19.00 CALLON|

4, AQUATHOL SUPER K - 35 LBS

$140L8

6. ARENA §0 - CALLON

S218.TOBOTTLE(H
o)

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF
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7. BLUE DVE - QUART 1.00°GALLON
s, CELSIUS - 10 0Z i $9340/BOTTLE
GALLONS . $74. 80 GALLON
16, COHERE . 35 CALLONS $3695CALLON
1L CUTRINE -15 CALLONS S15.50/GALLON
12. CUTRINE PLUS GR - 30 LBS $17.4118
13. DACNTL 3N - 1 GALLOKS $4100 GALLOX
16. DLZ . 25 GALLONS $30.00'CALLON
17.DRIVE XLRS - .§ GALLON $86.99 GALLON
18, ELEMENT 3 A - 1.6 GALLONS $34.04/GALLON
19. ELEMENT 4 - 2.6 GALLONS $HLICALLON
20. ESPLANADE 260 5C - 3.6 GALLONS SI0HABGALLON
$77S0'CALLON

$11.3BGALLON|

195,90 CALLON]

snavGALLON|

$11.00/GALLON]
$0.I0CALLON
$7.8RCALLON

32, JLB OIL . 11.25 GALLONS $10.96:GALLON]

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF
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T 38, 2018 . — FOR__

ASSTALVCRCHSE OF FUSCUCIDES. HERBICIDES, PESTICIDES EYC. |

$3236GALLON

SAF/GALLON

$18.590/0Z

$88.62'BOTTLE

$309.00/CALLON

$4300 GALLON

$5348.GALLON

$13.45 GALLON

$13.08 GALLON|

wowoaion

susuis|

mmrmml
$79.80'GALLON

$17.88 GALLON

$11.7 GALLON

$62.90;
$10.361L8

$35.9818(

$1329.60 PAILL
mﬂwml

5.65 PERLB
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AN

Fl

TEECOUNTY, FLOKIDA YABULATION (HIET

"NCUCIDES,

RED RIVER

SPECIALTIES, INC.

SCIENTIFIC
VANCEMENTS

AFFLICATION
DYNAMICS

- e
f = . ot
(et

L
70, TOF CHOKCE 50 LB

{
- .

&

|emsaci co.

7,

73ULTRA FINE OIL 2.5 GALLONS

$1L.00/GALLON

73, VELPAR 1.5 GALLONS

$36.45 GALLON|

I'!l. VISTA L8 GALLONS

S172.48/CALLON|

77. WEEDAR'D - BROADLEAF HERBICIDE
2.5 CALLONS

SILOW/CALLON

*6+RAINBOW TREECARE SCIENTIFIC
ADVANCEMENTS: ACEPHATE IS
AVAILABLE IN TWO FORAL LEPITECT OR
ORTHENE. COHERE 1§ PRICED AS AUDIBLE;

HRAND; MERIT 1S PRICED AS XNTECT, TEL
STAR IS PRICED AS UPSTAR GOLD.

1. ACEPHATE - AVAILAHLE IN TWWO FORALS;
LEPITECT OR ORTHENE

$26.90 OR 51720

ILIQ. COHERE 15 PRICED AS AUDIELE

$19.99'CALLON|
L
= MCALLON=]

$192.00 +SHIV)

13, DACIL 1S PRICED AS DOCKET WS

$449
8+ =590.00= 5720,

21 GARLON 4 ULTRA IS PRICED AS

S&lﬂl

SICHTLIN
26 L. 15 FRICED AS RBA
BRAND

9

38, MERIT WSP 75 IS PRICED AS X\NTECT

SITEORCZPE 3=
$54.0072225252.00

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF
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SPECIALTIES, INC, [CHEMICAL CO.

VENDORS

j J B e— . - — - < ~
68, TAL STAR (CONCENTRATE) IS PRICED AS uuo-mu-l
UPSTAR GOLD == 1y

ALL ORDERS WILL BE BILLED A SHIPPING
BASED ON THE TOTAL OF THE

50 - SE0.99 5999
551-$10L99 1289
$101 - S180.99 1838
$151 - $250.99 17.60
$351.- $R0099 31950
$501- $THO.99 2436
5751 - §1,00099 §2937
51,001 - $1500.99 710
51,601 - $2,000.99 $43.50
52,000 - §4,249.99 5000
ORDERS OVER $3250 ARE NO CHARCE
SHIPPING,

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF
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Procurement Management Departiment
2115 Second Floor, 1¥ Floor

ELEE COUNTY oA L 3000

SOUTUWEST FLORIDA FaxLine: (235) 4858383

Swwleegov.com/procurement
Posted Date: Jone 12, 2020

Solicitation No,: B200270MIF

Solicitation Name: Purchase of Fungicides, Herbicides & Pesticides

Subject: Addendum Number 2

The following represents clarification, additions, deletions, and/or modifications to the above referenced bid. This

addendum shall hereafier be regarded as part of the solicitation. Items not referenced berein remmin unchanged, mcloding

the response date. Wonds, phrases or sentences with a strikelhrough represent deletions to the onginal solicitation

Uandedlined words and bolded, phrases or senfences represent additions to the oniginal solicitation.
LQUESTIONS/ANSWERS

Herbicades
1. @40 15 that supposed to ba Resokte?

Yer, Resolute 651 is the correct speling. The Bid Schedule will remmain a3 written and scrivener
arcver shall be consldered corrected by way of this addendum,
5 #54 Can you proviude more informatios or i3 that the correct spelling?

Answer | Tigr is the correet spelling, it is o Herbicide.
3 Otber Products

: #7 15 that supposed to be Daconil?
Yes, Daconil is the correct spelling. The Bid Schedule will remain as written and serivener ervor
shall be considered corrected by way of thiy addendusm.
We are prepanng to submit owr bid fer conuideration on Soliestation B200270MIF. We mamnfaciure
and distribute products contammy the same Active Ingredient assime of the products temized m the
Wd. For example we have a 7.9% bifenthrin product called MasxThor SC that 15 equvalent to Talstar
concenirate. What i3 the proper way to submut our products and make reference to them on the Bid
Proposal Form?

We would actually like to tnd the followmg
MaxxThar SC as an alternative to Talstar (Concentrate)
MaxxThor SG as an alternative to Talstar (Granular)
TurfTher WSP 25 an allenative to Ment WSP 75

1 have attached the SDS for each of those products below a3 well a3 2 copy of thair product labels.
County will nccept a product of equal or better quality ai the diseretion of the Conngy

Antwer | Keprezentative, Please bid per the solicitation speciBications and detailed Bid Schedule, Plense tee
page 17 for details to comparable Htem: and ndditlenal produets.

BIDDER/PROPOSER IS ADVISED, YOU ABRE REQUIRED TO ACENOWLEDGE RECEIPT OF THIS ADDENDUAI WHEN
SUBAOITING A BIDPROPOSAL. FAILURE TO COMPLY WITH THIS REQUIREMENT MAY RESULT IN THE
BIDDER/FROPOSER BEING CONSIDERED NON-RESPONSIVE.

ALL OTHER TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE SOLICITATION DOCUMENTS ARE AND SHALL REMAIN THE SAME,

Procurement Analyst: Miguel Flores
Procorement Analyst Direct Line: 239-533-8835
Lee County Procurement Mamagement

Pagelof1l
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EXHIBIT B
DELIVERY/PROJECT SCHEDULE

B IOCUREMENT MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT
LEE COUNTY BIDPROPOSAL FORM

SOUTHWEST FLORIDA

WAME:  Nuirden A Solulions Ing.
SOUCITATION: EIPTICIF - Prseiuns of Pungirides, Herbiciriss & Pestcites
ey GLstTRad Y Commrny Datusertn, CONTatnaTy Rty [T 12 RN M fSlewtsg whieh Mersng Owed spemiestions

shiedd b inclisive of ol labot, pqupment, suppfies, Dvestend, profil. matwial, and iy oiher Inclderisl cocts soquined I partarn & esmplofn off work
8 spetind in the Contrect Documents Al Una Prices will be bed i the nssrest wiole penty. Lea County i nt responsibie for amvor bn Gymutes or

withn Excel dotumenti(e)
Tha Counly wil anly acoep] kids sobmdted on bid loma provided by he County  Bads sudmeitad on other fomma, otber than those provided by the Courly. wil
bu dewnsd nonsesponaive ard ineligbile for awerd.
PLEASE ENEURE you have providsd s printed copy of the Bld Schedule with yaur hard copy submission pestages and provided the sxssl voralon
mmdwmmm
) = - S
Purchase of Fungicides, Herbicldes & Pesticldes
Fungieldos
Unit of
flam Description Mossure Unit Prica
1 Arana 50 Gallon $ 209.00
2 Cleary's 3338 For Surface Fungis ller NB
3 |Hedtage ] Pound | $ 3300
4 |Horicuftural O Gallon_ NE
Haorblcides
Unit of
ltom Description Hhatteirs Unit Prico
9 2.4-D Amine (Plaloon) o Gallon 3 10.20
2 L—lwntd __ Gallon | 8 10.30
3 {Aqua Star {Clnco) Gallon 3 16.10
4 Aqusthol Super K Pound | $ 74.75
3 | Armanal | Gallon ] £1,50
@ |Catalus Qunon ] 102.00
7 |Clearcast Gallon 5 20207
8 Clippat_ Pound | $ 3941
[} ~ [Clippar SC Galon $ 32000
10 |Camet Gallan 3 72.00
11 [DiquataL Gallon NB
12 |Dismiss South (Dismiss NXT agency 60 oz botta) Pint $ 849.00
13 |Drive XLR 8 42 88/half gaion Galion |8 8572 |
14 [Element 3A Gallon S 3770
15 {Element 4 Gollon |3 4440
16 Escarl XP (granutar) __Pound |S 51.20
17 Esplanade 200 8C i Quort $ 32704
18 Esplanade 200 5C Gotlon _ |38 1,189.12
18 Garion 4 Ultra Gallon $ 88,90
20 Glyphosate 4 Plus ___Gallon $ 1170
Page1ot3

Solicitation No. #B200270MIF Page 32 of 37



Solicitation No. #B200270MIF

21 |Hahitat (Wetland imazypyr) Gallon |§ 62.00
z |Hencho Gation NB
23 }m Ballon 3 280.00
24 Krover DF Pound |$ 10.50
26 LI 700 Galon |$ 32,00
26 Manor Ounce (8 21.23
27 Method 24081 Gallon  |$ 32256
28 Méestons Gallon [ § 300.00
28 Monument 25grem bax Box $ 250.00
30 Oust Extra (granule) o Pound | $ 30.40
3 Pathfinder |l Galon | § 48.00
32 |Poast Gaion | $ 88.00
33 [Polaris (Upland imazpyr) Galon | § 50.08
E2) [Polaria (Arsenal) Gallon | § 48.50
35 |Procetia Cor §C Gallon NB
36 |Procelia COR SC 12PDU/Unk Csse |$ 2,808.00
37 |Ranger Pro {Upisnd Glyphosate) (Mad Dog Plus) Qallon 3 11.70
38 |Rezor Pro_(Mad Dog Plus) Gallon |3 11.70
39 Renovats 3 Gallon | § 105.84
40 Resoluge 85 W (Rasoluts) Pound |3 11.38
# Ravoiver $595./87c2 bottia Ouncs |8 884
42 |Reward (Aguatic) (Diquat SPC) Galion $ 37.50
43 {Rodeo (Wotiand Giyphosala) Gollon [ § 18.78
44 |Round Up Pro Cancontrate Gollon |8 18.00
45 |Round Up Pro (Mad Dog Plus) Gallon |3 11.70
46 Round Up Quick Pro _Pound  |[$ 10.90
47 Bshara (Immxzuron) Pound $ 940
48 Solicsm OF Pound [$ 31.10
49 Sonar AS Gallon |$ 1,689.12
50 Boner Ona 20mPan |3 643 13
81 Sonar SRP i Pound |$ 325
62 Sonar Q Pound |$ 33.99
53 Surflan (Pre-Emergent) Galion NB
B4 Tigr __Gallon |3 267.23
85 Trycer Gallon N/B
3 Velossa Gallon NB
&7 Velpar | - Gatlon $ 72.00
58 Vista Quart NB
58 Vista Qallon | $ 178,00
80 |Woedsr B4 (Pisioon) Gollon _ [S 10.20
Pestickie-Insocticide
ftan Description !I“"““ Unit Price
1 Acaphste Pound |[$ ___ 6ss
2 Bandk Pound N/B
3 Morit WSP 75 Ounce |5 8.60
4 TaiStar (Concentrate) (Bisect) Gallon |$ 43.50
5 TelStar (Granulsr) Nurssry Pound $ 0.48
8 Top Cholos Pound $ 253
T Uitra Fine O _Gallon_ NB
Pege2eld
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Other Products
Unit of

itom | Description bdons Unit Price
i Antihoamer/dofoamar Gaflon S 2360
2 |Bhia Dye Spray Indicator Dyw (Aquamark 85 qt) Quant $ 0.80
3 |Butter Extrs Strangth Gallon NB
4 |Cohere_(Spreader 90) Gallon |[$ 19.00
3 |Custrine (Kl Aiges) (Cutrine FL 909) Gallen |$ 14.40
8 |Cutrine Plus GR Pound |$ 207
7 |Danei | Gollon NB
8 |Diuent Biue Ol (Bark O Bluo) Gallon |9 10.00
[ {DLZ (MSO Concentrats) Galion $10.00

10 | Hydrothal 191 __Galion $77.80

11 Impel Red O (Bark Ol Red) Gallen  |[$ 10.00
12 Indicator {Marking Dys) (Aquamark SS gt Quart [ 9.80
13 Indicsior (Marking Oys) (Aquamerk 1 pal) Galion | S 24.00
14 'Vod Gaton |S 19.80
15 JLB Ol Galon |S 16.50
18 Kammo-Wa Agenl (CidaKick) Galon | $ 16.00
17 Kammo Plus_(CldaKick Il) Gallon |[$ 16.50
18 Kinstic (Slnet 200) Quart s 3650
19 Performance Wetter (Spreader ) Gaflon  |$ 1900
20 Sinker-Drift Ageni_(Poly Control 1l) Gallon | S 2080
21 Stenner (Injection) gl _Each NB

2 TopFim Gallon |3 88.00
2 Wipeout X5 (cleanar) _Gallon N8

Pegadedd
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EXHIBIT C
INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS

INSURANCE GUIDE

ﬁLEB COUNTY Le_e- ::ounty Insurance Requiremen_ts ﬂ

VEL %420

BSOUTHWEST FLORIDA

Minimum Insurance Requirements: Risk Management in no way represents that the insurance required is
sufficient or adeguatie to protect the Yendor’s interest or labilifies. The following are the reguired minimums
the Vendor must maintain thronghont the duration of this Contract. The Conniy reserves the right to request
additional documentation regarding insurance provided.

a. Commercial General Linbilitv - Coverage shall apply to premises and/or operations, products and

completed operations, independent contractors, and contractual liability exposures with mintmum limits
of:

$1,000,000 per occurrence

$2,000,000 general aggregate

$1,000,000 products and completed operations
$1,000,000 personal and advertising injury

b. Business Auto Liability - The following Automobile Liability will be required and coverage shall apply
to all owned, hired and non-owned vehicles use with minimmm limits of:

$1,000,000 combined single limit (CSL) or
$500,000 bodily injury per person
$1,000,000 bodily injury per accident
$500,000 property damage per accident

¢. Workers' Compensation - Statutory benefits as defined by Chapter 440, Florida Statutes, encompassing
all operations contemplated by this Contract or Agreement to apply to all owners, officers, and employees
regardiess of the oumber of employees. Workers' Compensation exemptions may be accepted with
written proof of the State of Florida's approval of such exemption. Employers' liability will have

mininum limits of:
$500,000 per accident
$500,000 disease limit
$500,000 disease — policy limit
*The required minimum limit of liability shown in a. and b. may be provided in the form of “Excess Insurance”™
or “Commercial Umbrella Policies,” in which case, a “Following Form Fndorsement™ will be required on the

“Excess Insurance Policy”™ or “Commercial Umbrella Policy.”

B200L70MMIF - Purckase of Fungicides, Herbicides & Posticides
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TR bl

ﬁLEE COUNTY

SOUTHNWEST FLORIDA

Yerification of Coverage:
1. Coverage shall be in place prior fo the commencement of any work and throughout the duration of the

Contract. A certificate of insurance will be provided to the Risk Manager for review and approval. The
certificate shall provide for the following:

a. The certificate holder shall read as follows:

Lee County Board of County Commissioners
P.0. Box 398
Fort Myers, Florida 33902

b. “Lee Comnty, a political subdivision and Charter County of the State of Florida, its agents, employeas,

and public officials” will be named as mmmm_onthe&nuﬂhabﬂnypohcy, including
Products and Completed Operations coverage.

Special Requirements:
1. Anappropriate "Indemnification” clause shall be made a provision of the Contract.

2. Ifapplicable, it is the responsibility of the general contractor to ensure that all subcontractors comply with
all insurance requirements.

End of Insurance Guida Section

- BI00270MIF - Purchase of Fungicldes, Herbicides & Pesticides
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EXHIBITD

VENDOR BACKGROUND SCREENING AFFIDAVIT

Q LEE COUNTY VENDOR BACKGROUND
SOUTHWEST FLORIDA SCREENING AFFIDAVIT

Florida Statutes Chapter 435 governs required background screenings for any employees,
contractors, subcontractors, or agents of the Vendor who will have contact with any vulnerable
person, as defined by statute, or who otherwise are required to undergo a Level 1 or Level 2
background screening in accordance with Florida law.

The Vendor is responsible for ensuring that such required background screenings are conducted
in accordance with Florida Statutes Chapter 435, Documentation of such completed background
screenings must be maintained for a period of no less than five (5) years and are subject to audit
by Lee County at any time during such five (5) year period.

Under penalty of perjury, I declare that I have read and understand the requirements stated
above, and that all required background screenings shall be conducted in accordance with
this affidavit. I further understand that there may be additional local, state, and federal
regulations that may require background screening, and that the Vendor will be solely
responsible for complying with such legal requirements. Furthermore, the Vendor shall
indemnify and hold Lee County harmless from any and all claims or actions resulting from failure
to comply with this affidavit.

Date: _S.19.2.0

Signature
STATE OF Colwado Shiryi Kuhlwawn V04 (ftatnd Corunsel
COUNTY OF Lowimir Namer/Titie

The foregoing instrument was swom to (or affirmed) and subscribed before me by means of J physical

presence or OJ online notarization, this _|’ !4‘“ day of Awau?'ﬁ‘ , 220, by the above-named person
and in their stated capacity, and is either personally known to me or who has produce the following as

identification: Qfars.amm.’ kv
Ad {4 ~tr~ [EN Vs
Ignat @, Notary Pu
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NOTARY PUBLIC - STATE OF COLORADO

Notary ID #20184034211
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