

# MANATEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT

## REVISED INTENT TO AWARD

<b>IFB NO. / TITLE</b>	IFB 21-R077463JH / EMS Medical Supplies	<b>DATE POSTED</b>	MC _____ DS _____	<b>CC</b> _____ <b>BIDSYNC</b> _____
<b>PROCUREMENT REPRESENTATIVE</b>	Jeb Hayter	<b>PROJECTED AWARD DATE</b>	November 01, 2021	
<b>DEPARTMENT/DIVISION</b>	Manatee County EMS / Support Services	<b>AUTHORIZED BY DATE</b>	Jacob Erickson, Procurement Official	

### NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

The Manatee County Procurement Division provides notice of its intent to award a contract with Agni Enterprises, LLC, Bound Tree Medical, LLC, Henry Schein Inc., Nashville Medical & EMS Products Inc., Life-Assist, Inc., Quadmed Inc., for the provision of EMS Medical Supplies.

### ENABLING/REGULATING AUTHORITY

Manatee County Procurement Ordinance, Sec 2-26.

### BACKGROUND/EVALUATION

It is the intent of the Manatee County to establish an annual agreement(s) to procure on an "as required" basis EMS medical supplies.

The solicitation was advertised on August 27, 2021 on the Manatee County website and Periscope S2G. It was also provided to the Manatee County Chamber of Commerce, the Manasota Black Chamber of Commerce, Gulf Coast Builders Exchange and Gulf Coast Latin Chamber of Commerce for release to their members. Responses were received from the following firms:

- |  |   |
|--|---|
| <ol style="list-style-type: none"> <li>1. Agni Enterprises, LLC, Miami Lakes, FL</li> <li>2. Bound Tree Medical, LLC, Dublin, OH</li> <li>3. W.W. Grainger, Inc., Clearwater, FL</li> <li>4. Medline Industries, LP., Northfield, IL</li> <li>5. Mini Wing USA Inc., Palos Verdes Estates, CA</li> <li>6. Nashville Medical &amp; EMS Products, Inc., Springfield, TN</li> </ol> | <ol style="list-style-type: none"> <li>7. Henry Schein, Inc., Melville, NY</li> <li>8. Life-Assist, Inc., Rancho Cordova, CA</li> <li>9. Strong Medical Partners, LLC, Pineville, NC</li> <li>10. Quadmed, Inc., Jacksonville, FL</li> <li>11. Stryker Sales, LLC, Kalamazoo, MI</li> </ol> |
|--|---|

The following firms were deemed non-responsive: W.W. Grainger, Inc., Strong Medical Partners LLC, Medaserv dba, Stryker Sales, LLC.

#### **EVALUATION SUMMARY:**

Agni Enterprises, LLC, Bound Tree Medical, LLC, Henry Schein Inc., Nashville Medical & EMS Products Inc., Life-Assist, Inc., Quadmed Inc were the lowest responsible, responsive bidder(s). A bid tabulation of the results is attached to this Notice of Intent to Award.

**RECOMMENDATION**

The Procurement Division and the Manatee County EMS / Support Services recommend award to Agni Enterprises, LLC, Group D, Bound Tree Medical, LLC, Groups A, B, C, E, I, K, Henry Schein Inc., Groups G, Nashville Medical & EMS Products Inc., Group H, Life-Assist, Inc., Group I, Quadmed Inc., Group J.

<b>ATTACHMENTS</b> (List in order of attached)	Bid Tabulation	<b>NAME AND NUMBER OF FUNDING SOURCE</b>	Various Based on Project and Requesting Department
<b>COST</b>	\$1,043,355.20	<b>FUNDS VERIFIED</b>	Yes

BID TABULATION SUMMARY  
 IFB No. 21-R077463JH  
 EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Group	AGNI ENTERPRISES LLC	BOUND TREE MEDICAL LLC	HENRY SCHEIN INC	LIFE-ASSIST INC	MEDLINE INDUSTRIES LP	MING WING USA	NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS INC	QUADMED INC
A	Non Responsive	\$61,646.85	Non Responsive	\$75,231.10	\$1,406,338.35	Non Responsive	\$79,088.55	\$80,859.31
B	\$252,149.42	\$156,227.05	\$198,593.70	\$192,864.91	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive
C	Non Responsive	\$37,365.00	\$49,302.00	\$60,104.00	Non Responsive	\$126,350.00	\$50,438.00	\$65,010.00
D	\$135,252.05	\$183,578.50	\$151,720.00	\$160,727.75	Non Responsive	\$139,102.50	Non Responsive	Non Responsive
E	Non Responsive	\$16,022.90	\$20,798.28	\$21,927.60	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	\$20,461.60
F	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive
G	Non Responsive	\$6,766.44	\$6,738.00	\$7,176.49	\$8,977.85	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	\$9,045.68
H	\$53,246.02	\$5,491.29	\$5,734.38	\$6,880.60	\$102,261.72	Non Responsive	\$4,944.04	\$5,608.48
I	Non Responsive	\$223,715.55	Non Responsive	\$249,347.00	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive
J	Non Responsive	\$2,558.00	\$2,289.50	\$4,300.00	\$51,621.65	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	\$2,289.26
K	\$8,333,022.00	\$399,154.50	Non Responsive	\$3,056,413.50	Non Responsive	non responsive	\$844,770.50	\$4,300,686.20
L	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive	Non Responsive
M	10.00%	20.00%	34.00%		20.00%			18.00%
Proposed Awarded Groups	D	A, B, C, E, I, K	G	I			H	J

Non-Responsive means bidder did not bid on all items in the group

**BID TABULATION**  
**RF# No. 21-R07643H**  
**FMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES**

				AGRI ENTERPRISES LLC			ROUND TREE MEDICAL LLC			HENRY SHEPHERD			LIFE-ASSIST INC			MERIDIAN INSTRUMENTS LP			MING WING LINA			NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS INC.			OJ ADDARONE				
Item	Description	Unit/Measure	Brand/Model Number	Substitution	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific/FDA approved/Quote/Brand Name and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific/FDA approved/Quote/Brand Name and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific/FDA approved/Quote/Brand Name and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific/FDA approved/Quote/Brand Name and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific/FDA approved/Quote/Brand Name and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific/FDA approved/Quote/Brand Name and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific/FDA approved/Quote/Brand Name and Quantity/Unit of Measure			
<b>GROUP A: OXYGEN AND AIRWAY CONTROL, BASIC AIRWAY MANAGEMENT</b>																													
1	Adult Size II	each	Anesth 5262-211-0900	No Substitution	1662	\$93.33	\$33,928.00	EA Evox Anesth 4991304	\$9.49	\$14,474.00	EA Evox Anesth 4991304	\$9.41	\$14,474.00	EA Evox Anesth 4991304	\$12.14	\$19,974.00	No Substitution	\$9.89	\$1,624.00	As Specified	\$9.88	\$14,424.00	As Specified	\$9.88	\$173.20	As Specified	\$9.88	\$1,624.00	Anesth 5262-211-0900
2	Pull Size II	each	Anesth 526-211-2000	No Substitution	60	\$22.00	\$1,320.00	E.A 12 ea Anesth 499611	\$11.00	\$660.00	E.A 12 ea Anesth 499611	\$12.65	\$759.00	E.A 12 ea Anesth 499611	\$10.31	\$618.60	No Substitution	\$9.19	\$551.40	As Specified	\$9.19	\$551.40	As Specified	\$9.19	\$551.40	As Specified	\$9.19	\$551.40	Anesth 544-323-2000
3	Infant Size II	each	Anesth 546-323-2000	No Substitution	60	\$30.67	\$1,840.20	E.A Evox Anesth 499951	\$11.90	\$714.00	E.A Evox Anesth 499951	\$12.65	\$799.00	E.A Evox Anesth 499951	\$10.31	\$618.60	No Substitution	\$9.19	\$551.40	As Specified	\$9.19	\$551.40	As Specified	\$9.19	\$551.40	As Specified	\$9.19	\$551.40	Anesth 544-323-2000
4	Hemofiltr, Hudson carb-di-oxide stream, latex free	each	Hudson 137	No Substitution	34	\$176	\$5,984.00	Std 48lbs Hudson 137L	\$14.51	\$492.34	Std 48lbs Hudson 137L	\$8.95	\$272.50	Std 48lbs Hudson 137L	\$14.51	\$492.34	No Substitution	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	Hudson 1177 (in)
5	60mm, small child, Hudson carb-di-oxide stream, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	25	\$176	\$5,984.00	Std 48lbs Hudson 137O	\$8.92	\$223.00	Std 48lbs Hudson 137O	\$8.92	\$223.00	Std 48lbs Hudson 137O	\$8.92	\$223.00	No Substitution	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	Hudson 1177 (in)
6	70mm, child, Hudson carb-di-oxide stream, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	25	\$176	\$5,984.00	Std 48lbs Hudson 137O	\$8.92	\$223.00	Std 48lbs Hudson 137O	\$8.92	\$223.00	Std 48lbs Hudson 137O	\$8.92	\$223.00	No Substitution	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	Hudson 1177 (in)
7	90mm, small adult, Hudson carb-di-oxide stream, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	150	\$82.29	\$12,343.50	EA 48 lbs Hudson 1260077	\$1.02	\$153.45	EA 48 lbs Hudson 1260077	\$1.02	\$153.45	EA 48 lbs Hudson 1260077	\$1.02	\$153.45	No Substitution	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	Hudson 1177 (in)
8	100mm, medium adult, Hudson carb-di-oxide stream, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	75	\$130.99	\$9,824.25	EA 48 lbs Hudson 1527475	\$1.02	\$153.45	EA 48 lbs Hudson 1527475	\$1.02	\$153.45	EA 48 lbs Hudson 1527475	\$1.02	\$153.45	No Substitution	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	Hudson 1177 (in)
9	110mm, adult, Hudson carb-di-oxide stream, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	25	\$286	\$7,150.00	EA 48 lbs Hudson 1527475	\$1.02	\$153.45	EA 48 lbs Hudson 1527475	\$1.02	\$153.45	EA 48 lbs Hudson 1527475	\$1.02	\$153.45	No Substitution	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	Hudson 1177 (in)
10	120mm, large adult, Hudson carb-di-oxide stream, latex free	each	Hudson	No Substitution	150	\$73.72	\$11,058.00	EA 48 lbs Hudson 4901518	\$1.02	\$153.45	EA 48 lbs Hudson 4901518	\$1.02	\$153.45	EA 48 lbs Hudson 4901518	\$1.02	\$153.45	No Substitution	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	As Specified	\$48.96	\$1,652.64	Hudson 1177 (in)
11	size 12 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	44	\$9.22	\$405.68	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
12	size 14 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	38	\$9.22	\$350.36	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
13	size 16 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	40	\$9.22	\$368.80	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
14	size 18 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	42	\$9.22	\$387.24	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
15	size 20 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	28	\$8.96	\$250.88	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
16	size 22 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	25	\$8.96	\$224.00	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
17	size 24 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	15	\$8.96	\$134.40	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
18	size 26 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	15	\$8.96	\$134.40	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
19	size 28 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	10	\$8.96	\$89.60	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
20	size 30 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	10	\$8.96	\$89.60	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
21	size 32 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	10	\$8.96	\$89.60	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
22	size 34 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	10	\$8.96	\$89.60	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
23	size 36 G, Nasopharyngeal airway, substituted, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	10	\$8.96	\$89.60	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$1.87	\$82.48	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	Sold Hqs. Stained 1206712	\$2.24	\$98.56	No Substitution	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	As Specified	\$33.87	\$1,490.48	Kentex 23312 (in)
24	Infant, medium concentration oxygen mask, latex free, w/78 tubing	each	Beuch	No Substitution	25	\$178	\$4,450.00	Beuch 36370	\$86.69	\$2,167.25	SM USA United Med 7020567	\$8.81	\$562.76	SM USA United Med 7020567	\$14.14	\$353.50	No Substitution	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	Kentex 0999105
25	Infant, non-breath, high concentration oxygen mask, latex free, elongated w/78 tubing	each	Beuch	No Substitution	20	\$189	\$3,780.00	Beuch 32240	\$124.00	\$2,480.00	SM USA United Med 7020568	\$8.81	\$562.76	SM USA United Med 7020568	\$14.14	\$353.50	No Substitution	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	Kentex 0999105
26	Infant Nasal cannula, latex free, w/78 tubing	each	Beuch	No Substitution	30	\$178	\$5,340.00	Beuch 32210	\$178	\$5,340.00	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$8.81	\$562.76	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$14.14	\$353.50	No Substitution	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	Kentex 0999105
27	Infant Nasal cannula, latex free, w/78 tubing	each	Beuch	No Substitution	30	\$178	\$5,340.00	Beuch 32210	\$178	\$5,340.00	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$8.81	\$562.76	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$14.14	\$353.50	No Substitution	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	Kentex 0999105
28	Infant Nasal Cannula, latex free, w/78 tubing	each	Beuch	No Substitution	25	\$186	\$4,650.00	Beuch 36650	\$82.21	\$2,055.25	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$8.81	\$562.76	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$14.14	\$353.50	No Substitution	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	Kentex 0999105
29	Adult, small, cannot cover the ear while face exposed, latex free, w/78 tubing	each	Beuch	No Substitution	90	\$21	\$1,890.00	Beuch 32310	\$19.00	\$1,710.00	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$8.81	\$562.76	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$14.14	\$353.50	No Substitution	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	Kentex 0999105
30	Kentex Safety Nebulizer, small-volume, hand held, 1 ppm, Mouthpiece, Disposable, 7.5	each	Beuch	No Substitution	50	\$1.43	\$71.50	Beuch 32370	\$8.71	\$435.50	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$8.81	\$562.76	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$14.14	\$353.50	No Substitution	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	Kentex 0999105
31	Verde Nebulizer with Peak Demand Mask, latex free, Disposable 400L 4	each	Beuch	No Substitution	77	\$1.66	\$127.82	Beuch 32370	\$9.21	\$708.57	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$8.81	\$562.76	SM USA United Med 7020569	\$14.14	\$353.50	No Substitution	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	Kentex 0999105
32	8" Oxygen supply tube, latex free	each	Beuch	No Substitution	20	\$4.90	\$98.00	Beuch 3810	\$8.21	\$164.20	SM USA United Med 7020567	\$8.81	\$562.76	SM USA United Med 7020567	\$14.14	\$353.50	No Substitution	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	As Specified	\$67.73	\$1,693.25	Kentex 0999105
33	Nonbreath, small Brand Medical	each	Beuch 3122600	No Substitution	125	\$16.60	\$2,075.00	Beuch 31220	\$16.60																				



EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item	Description	Unit	Brand/Model Number	Substitution	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approved Equivalent Brand, Model, and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approved Equivalent Brand, Model, and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approved Equivalent Brand, Model, and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approved Equivalent Brand, Model, and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approved Equivalent Brand, Model, and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	
<b>GROUP C: IMMOBILIZATION SUPPLIES</b>																							
1	Multi-Layer Head Immobilizer Adult	each	000000	No Substitution	400	55.25	\$35,000.00	EA 1321 (65x104x12)	54.24	\$17,696.00	EA 1321 (65x104x12)	54.24	\$17,696.00	EA 1321 (65x104x12)	54.24	\$17,696.00	EA 1321 (65x104x12)	54.24	\$17,696.00	EA 1321 (65x104x12)	54.24	\$17,696.00	
2	Multi-Layer Head Immobilizer Child	each	000000	No Substitution	400	45.25	\$25,000.00	EA 1322 (55x104x12)	44.24	\$15,696.00	EA 1322 (55x104x12)	44.24	\$15,696.00	EA 1322 (55x104x12)	44.24	\$15,696.00	EA 1322 (55x104x12)	44.24	\$15,696.00	EA 1322 (55x104x12)	44.24	\$15,696.00	
3	Mega Mouse Portable Transport Unit	each	06157828	No Substitution	100	\$165.45	\$16,545.00	06157828	\$165.45	\$16,545.00	06157828	\$165.45	\$16,545.00	06157828	\$165.45	\$16,545.00	06157828	\$165.45	\$16,545.00	06157828	\$165.45	\$16,545.00	
4	Maximus Extension Collar Adult	each	1151-01313	No Substitution	400	\$3.90	\$1,560.00	30 to Ambu 7006327	\$5.90	\$2,360.00	30 to Ambu 7006327	\$5.90	\$2,360.00	30 to Ambu 7006327	\$5.90	\$2,360.00	30 to Ambu 7006327	\$5.90	\$2,360.00	30 to Ambu 7006327	\$5.90	\$2,360.00	
5	Maximus Extension Collar Child	each	1151-01313	No Substitution	200	\$3.90	\$780.00	30 to Ambu 7006327	\$5.90	\$1,180.00	30 to Ambu 7006327	\$5.90	\$1,180.00	30 to Ambu 7006327	\$5.90	\$1,180.00	30 to Ambu 7006327	\$5.90	\$1,180.00	30 to Ambu 7006327	\$5.90	\$1,180.00	
<b>SUB TOTAL, GROUP C</b>						\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
<b>GROUP D: PPE / PERSONAL PROTECTION EQUIPMENT</b>																							
1	Disposable nitrile glove, 9.5" x 4.5" non-sterile, cut resistant, textured finger, nitrile, 3 mil, 100 per box	box	All Items	No Equivalent	520	\$17.40	\$9,008.00	ANSI111110 BX	\$16.40	\$8,508.00	SM 100's Maxflex	\$24.25	\$12,610.00	Maxflex Brand 100's BX	\$17.00	\$8,840.00	Maxflex Brand 100's BX	\$17.00	\$8,840.00	Maxflex Brand 100's BX	\$17.00	\$8,840.00	
2	Infection Control Kit	each		No Equivalent	100	\$41.85	\$4,185.00		\$21.71	\$2,171.00		\$3.00	\$300.00		\$9.00	\$900.00		\$6.50	\$650.00		\$6.50	\$650.00	
3	Infino Goggles Shield X2 with Clear Lens	each		No Equivalent	250	\$3.14	\$785.00		\$2.71	\$677.50		\$2.53	\$632.50		\$29.57	\$7,392.50		\$6.75	\$1,687.50		\$6.75	\$1,687.50	
4	Infino Goggles Shield X2 with Gray Lens	each		No Equivalent	250	\$3.14	\$785.00		\$2.71	\$677.50		\$2.53	\$632.50		\$29.57	\$7,392.50		\$6.75	\$1,687.50		\$6.75	\$1,687.50	
5	Shower Cover, White, 18"	roll		No Equivalent	2	\$22.40	\$44.80		\$20.00	\$40.00		\$10.00	\$20.00		\$102.00	\$204.00		\$50.00	\$100.00		\$50.00	\$100.00	
6	Respirator with exhalation valve (N95 NIOSH Certified)	10/box	MS9211 / N9521	No Substitution	250	\$17.67	\$4,417.50	5ER, INC. / 1 EA	\$8.82	\$2,205.00	5ER, INC. / 1 EA	\$8.82	\$2,205.00	5ER, INC. / 1 EA	\$8.82	\$2,205.00	5ER, INC. / 1 EA	\$8.82	\$2,205.00	5ER, INC. / 1 EA	\$8.82	\$2,205.00	
7	Infino Red / 2-Fold Self-Sealing Powder-Free Glove	each	941101	No Substitution	25	\$7.80	\$1,950.00		\$4.38	\$1,095.00		\$5.81	\$1,452.50		\$49.23	\$1,230.75		\$30.00	\$750.00		\$30.00	\$750.00	
8	Surgical Goggles	each		No Equivalent	1000	\$1.50	\$1,500.00		\$2.84	\$2,840.00		\$2.65	\$2,650.00		\$1.00	\$1,000.00		\$0.99	\$990.00		\$0.99	\$990.00	
9	Disposable Coveralls Small	each		No Equivalent	50	\$1.90	\$950.00		\$4.90	\$2,450.00		\$4.65	\$2,325.00		\$1.50	\$75.00		\$1.48	\$74.00		\$1.48	\$74.00	
10	Disposable Coveralls Medium	each		No Equivalent	500	\$3.50	\$1,750.00		\$6.95	\$3,475.00		\$6.65	\$3,325.00		\$3.00	\$1,500.00		\$2.95	\$1,475.00		\$2.95	\$1,475.00	
11	Disposable Coveralls Large	each		No Equivalent	500	\$3.50	\$1,750.00		\$6.95	\$3,475.00		\$6.65	\$3,325.00		\$3.00	\$1,500.00		\$2.95	\$1,475.00		\$2.95	\$1,475.00	
12	Disposable Coveralls XL Large	each		No Equivalent	200	\$3.50	\$700.00		\$6.95	\$1,390.00		\$6.65	\$1,330.00		\$3.00	\$600.00		\$2.95	\$590.00		\$2.95	\$590.00	
13	Disposable Coveralls 2XL Large	each		No Equivalent	100	\$3.50	\$350.00		\$6.95	\$695.00		\$6.65	\$665.00		\$3.00	\$300.00		\$2.95	\$290.00		\$2.95	\$290.00	
14	Disposable Coveralls 3XL Large	each		No Equivalent	50	\$3.50	\$175.00		\$6.95	\$347.50		\$6.65	\$332.50		\$3.00	\$150.00		\$2.95	\$147.50		\$2.95	\$147.50	
15	Disposable Coveralls 4XL Large	each		No Equivalent	50	\$3.50	\$175.00		\$6.95	\$347.50		\$6.65	\$332.50		\$3.00	\$150.00		\$2.95	\$147.50		\$2.95	\$147.50	
16	Disposable Coveralls 5XL Large	each		No Equivalent	50	\$3.50	\$175.00		\$6.95	\$347.50		\$6.65	\$332.50		\$3.00	\$150.00		\$2.95	\$147.50		\$2.95	\$147.50	
17	Disposable Coveralls 6XL Large	each		No Equivalent	50	\$4.81	\$240.50		\$14.99	\$749.50		\$5.88	\$294.00		\$5.82	\$291.00		\$4.55	\$227.50		\$4.55	\$227.50	
<b>SUB TOTAL, GROUP D</b>						\$183,476.30	\$183,476.30	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00	\$131,720.00
<b>GROUP E: PLASTIC PRODUCTS/LINENS/STRAPS AND FASTENERS</b>																							
1	Quang Star Storage Container 10"x7.25"x10.5"	each	Star Product	No Substitution	200	\$8.75	\$1,750.00		\$10.87	\$2,174.00		\$4.25	\$850.00		\$7.25	\$1,450.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
2	Shelfpaper 24x36x4	roll	Carroll's 3035SA	No Substitution	10	\$18.24	\$182.40		\$18.00	\$180.00		\$3.77	\$37.70		\$14.20	\$142.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
3	Plastic disposable bedpan, adult size	each		No Equivalent	10	\$8.90	\$89.00		\$9.90	\$99.00		\$1.00	\$10.00		\$7.30	\$73.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Plastic disposable urinal, adult size	each		No Equivalent	10	\$14.41	\$144.10		\$8.40	\$84.00		\$6.50	\$65.00		\$14.54	\$145.40		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
5	32" X 40" general purpose M4 "90wound 30% non-stick theory	roll		No Equivalent	25	\$32.86	\$821.50		\$38.25	\$956.25		\$45.25	\$1,131.25		\$25.50	\$637.50		\$4.46	\$111.50		\$4.46	\$111.50	
6	Pillow, Disposable Medium Weight 18"X24"	each		No Equivalent	750	\$1.28	\$960.00		\$2.30	\$1,725.00		\$2.51	\$1,882.50		\$2.11	\$1,582.50		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
7	30" X 50" Disposable diaper sheet, adults backed, Tall Rise	roll	Bona Brand #909029	No Equivalent	650	\$34.80	\$22,620.00	CURAPLEX / 100'S	\$37.00	\$31,050.00	Sto. Sig. Vol. 1201077	\$32.00	\$25,800.00		\$25.10	\$16,317.50		\$29.10	\$18,915.00		\$29.10	\$18,915.00	
8	Disposable pillow case, full size, plastic backed	roll		No Equivalent	1000	\$34.71	\$34,710.00		\$34.00	\$34,000.00		\$17.24	\$17,240.00		\$21.81	\$21,810.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
9	Bed Disposable Bag, 4 Gal., 1 Gal.	roll		No Equivalent	100	\$25.24	\$2,524.00		\$36.00	\$3,600.00		\$36.00	\$3,600.00		\$36.00	\$3,600.00		\$36.00	\$3,600.00		\$36.00	\$3,600.00	
10	Yellow BioHazard Bags, 5 gal., 1 mil	roll		No Equivalent	10	\$47.43	\$474.30		\$42.50	\$425.00		\$37.24	\$372.40		\$39.00	\$390.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
11	Rolls, Disposable	roll		No Equivalent	100	\$7.80	\$780.00		\$8.00	\$800.00		\$7.50	\$750.00		\$8.25	\$825.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
12	Chemotherapy Field Kit	each	01512	No Substitution	10	\$24.24	\$242.40		\$18.84	\$188.40		\$14.70	\$147.00		\$16.80	\$168.00		\$16.30	\$163.00		\$16.30	\$163.00	
13	Emergency Blanket Drawers	roll	070THBMB	No Substitution	10	\$2.12	\$21.20		\$4.21	\$42.10		\$11.91	\$119.10		\$5.75	\$57.50		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
14	EMAT Transporter	each		No Equivalent	25	\$16.49	\$412.25		\$23.25	\$581.25		\$23.43	\$585.75		\$24.40	\$610.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
<b>SUB TOTAL, GROUP E</b>						\$38,772.70	\$38,772.70	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25	\$28,798.25
<b>GROUP F: STRYKER STRETCHER PARTS/REPAIR/REPLACEMENT</b>																							
1	Roller casters	each	06960-041-010	No Substitution	40	\$29.60	\$1,184.00		\$29.60	\$1,184.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$39.14	\$1,565.60		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
2	Roller casters set	each	06962-200-010	No Substitution	40	\$185.50	\$7,420.00		\$185.50	\$7,420.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$238.78	\$9,551.20		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
3	Roller casters set	each	06960-200-040	No Substitution	25	\$79.40	\$1,985.00		\$79.40	\$1,985.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$104.79	\$2,619.75		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Shower pan	each	06960-200-045	No Substitution	10	\$183.50	\$1,835.00		\$183.50	\$1,835.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$232.50	\$2,325.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
5	Simple restraint belt	each	06960-160-044	No Substitution	20	\$31.10	\$622.00		\$31.10	\$622.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$40.57	\$811.40		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
6	Roller casters set	each	06960-170-000	No Substitution	25	\$23.54	\$588.50		\$23.54	\$588.50		No Bid	No Bid		\$30.67	\$766.75		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
7	Roller casters set	each	06960-170-000	No Substitution	25	\$23.54	\$588.50		\$23.54	\$588.50		No Bid	No Bid		\$30.67	\$766.75		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
8	Roller casters set	each	06960-160-009	No Substitution	25	\$29.28	\$732.00		\$29.28	\$732.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$38.10	\$952.50		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
9	Restraint	each	06960-200-040	No Substitution	20	\$87.90	\$1,758.00		\$87.90	\$1,758.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$113.64	\$2,272.80		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
10	Restraint chair	each	06960-201-100	No Substitution	20	\$85.70	\$1,714.00		\$85.70	\$1,714.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$110.84	\$2,216.80		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
11	13" X 15" X 3" Child Ankle Rest	each	06960-201-147	No Substitution	20	\$30.41	\$608.20		\$30.41	\$608.20		No Bid	No Bid		\$39.47	\$789.40		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
12	EMR1 Power Roll-Up XCR, Disposable	each	06960-700-000	No Substitution	20	\$53.94	\$1,078.80		\$53.94	\$1,078.80		No Bid	No Bid		\$69.84	\$1,396.80		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
13	Health Hazards Cover	each	06960-101-000	No Substitution	20	\$24.45	\$489.00		\$24.45	\$489.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$31.19	\$623.80		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
14	Health Hazards Cover	each	06960-101-000	No Substitution	20	\$24.45	\$489.00		\$24.45	\$489.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$31.19	\$623.80		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
15	Health Hazards Cover	each	06960-101-262	No Substitution	20	\$6.83	\$136.60		\$6.83	\$136.60		No Bid	No Bid		\$8.87	\$177.40		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
16	Roller Casters, Large	each	1175-000011	No Substitution	100	\$8.84	\$884.00		\$8.84	\$884.00		\$10.00	\$1,000.00		\$10.00	\$1,000.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
17	Roller Casters, Large	each	1175-000014	No Substitution	100	\$33.73	\$3,373.00		\$33.73	\$3,373.00		\$37.50	\$3,750.00		\$37.50	\$3,750.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
18	Power Cord, Large Device	each	1175-000017	No Substitution	100	\$3.00	\$300.00		\$3.00	\$300.00		\$3.00	\$300.00		\$3.00	\$300.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
19	Sideline Neck Strap, Large Device	each	1175-000015	No Substitution	20	\$15.83	\$316.60		\$15.83	\$316.60		No Bid	No Bid		\$15.83	\$316.60		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
20	Strap, Can, Large Device	each	1175-000014	No Substitution	100	\$15.83	\$1,583.00		\$15.83	\$1,583.00		No Bid	No Bid		\$15.83	\$1,583.00		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
21	Strap, Compression System, Large	each	9975-000003	No Substitution	20	\$309																	

EEMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES			MCN ENTERPRISES LLC				ROUND TREE MEDICAL LLC				HENS BYRON INC.				101-ANSSI INC.				MEDLINE INDUSTRIES LP				MING WING USA				NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS INC				QUAMBER INC.						
Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Brand/Model Number	Substitute	Estimated Annual Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approval/Estimate/Brand Mfg. and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approval/Estimate/Brand Mfg. and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approval/Estimate/Brand Mfg. and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approval/Estimate/Brand Mfg. and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approval/Estimate/Brand Mfg. and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approval/Estimate/Brand Mfg. and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approval/Estimate/Brand Mfg. and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approval/Estimate/Brand Mfg. and Quantity/Unit of Measure	Unit Price	Extended Pricing	Specific FDA Approval/Estimate/Brand Mfg. and Quantity/Unit of Measure					
GROUP I: MEDICATION LIST																																					
1	2-Way Stomach With Sterile Male Low Lock	each		Equivalent	100	No Bid			No Bid						No Bid																						
2	Acetaminophen 500 mg Tab	each	1850-01	Equivalent	1000	\$8.84	\$884.00	Acetaminophen 500mg Tablets	\$8.84	\$884.00		\$8.84	\$884.00	Acetaminophen 500mg Tablets	\$8.84	\$884.00	Acetaminophen 500mg Tablets	\$8.84	\$884.00		\$8.84	\$884.00	Acetaminophen 500mg Tablets	\$8.84	\$884.00		\$8.84	\$884.00		\$8.84	\$884.00		\$8.84	\$884.00		\$8.84	\$884.00
3	Acetaminophen Cherry Flavor	each	1850-00	Equivalent	1000	No Bid			No Bid						No Bid																						
4	Acetaminophen Suspension 120mg	each	1850-00	Equivalent	1000	\$8.24	\$824.00	Acetaminophen Suspension 120mg	\$8.24	\$824.00		\$8.24	\$824.00	Acetaminophen Suspension 120mg	\$8.24	\$824.00	Acetaminophen Suspension 120mg	\$8.24	\$824.00		\$8.24	\$824.00	Acetaminophen Suspension 120mg	\$8.24	\$824.00		\$8.24	\$824.00		\$8.24	\$824.00		\$8.24	\$824.00		\$8.24	\$824.00
5	Advantree 500 mg 2ml vial	each		Equivalent	220	\$23.33	\$797.00	Advantree 500mg 2ml vial	\$23.33	\$797.00		\$23.33	\$797.00	Advantree 500mg 2ml vial	\$23.33	\$797.00	Advantree 500mg 2ml vial	\$23.33	\$797.00		\$23.33	\$797.00	Advantree 500mg 2ml vial	\$23.33	\$797.00		\$23.33	\$797.00		\$23.33	\$797.00		\$23.33	\$797.00		\$23.33	\$797.00
6	Albuterol (for inhalation) unit dose vial - 2.5mg	each		Equivalent	250	No Bid			No Bid						No Bid																						
7	Amikacin, Sterile, 25mg 1.5FL OZ. vial	each		Equivalent	120	No Bid			No Bid						No Bid																						
8	Amoxicillin 150mg 1ml vial	each		Equivalent	104	\$1.86	\$194.64	Amoxicillin 150mg 1ml vial	\$1.86	\$194.64		\$1.86	\$194.64	Amoxicillin 150mg 1ml vial	\$1.86	\$194.64	Amoxicillin 150mg 1ml vial	\$1.86	\$194.64		\$1.86	\$194.64	Amoxicillin 150mg 1ml vial	\$1.86	\$194.64		\$1.86	\$194.64		\$1.86	\$194.64		\$1.86	\$194.64		\$1.86	\$194.64
9	Amoxicillin (Suspension), Sterile 1ml Vial *** OVERNIGHT COLD SHIPPING REQUIRED ***	each		Equivalent	40	No Bid		unit price includes overnight cold shipping charges - Yes or No	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid																						
10	Amoxicillin 400mg 0.1oz vial	each		Equivalent	60	\$11.49	\$689.40	Amoxicillin 400mg 0.1oz vial	\$11.49	\$689.40		\$11.49	\$689.40	Amoxicillin 400mg 0.1oz vial	\$11.49	\$689.40	Amoxicillin 400mg 0.1oz vial	\$11.49	\$689.40		\$11.49	\$689.40	Amoxicillin 400mg 0.1oz vial	\$11.49	\$689.40		\$11.49	\$689.40		\$11.49	\$689.40		\$11.49	\$689.40		\$11.49	\$689.40
11	Amoxicillin 400mg 0.5oz 8.5 FL OZ	each		Equivalent	200	No Bid			No Bid						No Bid																						
12	BBraun Disposing Pin with one way valve	each	412023	No Substitute	400	\$3.37	\$1,348.00	BBraun Disposing Pin with one way valve	\$3.37	\$1,348.00		\$3.37	\$1,348.00	BBraun Disposing Pin with one way valve	\$3.37	\$1,348.00	BBraun Disposing Pin with one way valve	\$3.37	\$1,348.00		\$3.37	\$1,348.00	BBraun Disposing Pin with one way valve	\$3.37	\$1,348.00		\$3.37	\$1,348.00		\$3.37	\$1,348.00		\$3.37	\$1,348.00		\$3.37	\$1,348.00
13	BBraun Infusion Space Pump IV Set	each	000136	No Substitute	1000	No Bid			No Bid						No Bid																						
14	Benzalkonium Chloride 0.1% 50mg 5ml	each		Equivalent	1000	\$1.28	\$1,280.00	Benzalkonium Chloride 0.1% 50mg 5ml	\$1.28	\$1,280.00		\$1.28	\$1,280.00	Benzalkonium Chloride 0.1% 50mg 5ml	\$1.28	\$1,280.00	Benzalkonium Chloride 0.1% 50mg 5ml	\$1.28	\$1,280.00		\$1.28	\$1,280.00	Benzalkonium Chloride 0.1% 50mg 5ml	\$1.28	\$1,280.00		\$1.28	\$1,280.00		\$1.28	\$1,280.00		\$1.28	\$1,280.00		\$1.28	\$1,280.00
15	Bismuth subsalicylate (Pepto Bismol) 250mg 10ml vial	each		Equivalent	250	\$3.22	\$805.00	Bismuth subsalicylate (Pepto Bismol) 250mg 10ml vial	\$3.22	\$805.00		\$3.22	\$805.00	Bismuth subsalicylate (Pepto Bismol) 250mg 10ml vial	\$3.22	\$805.00	Bismuth subsalicylate (Pepto Bismol) 250mg 10ml vial	\$3.22	\$805.00		\$3.22	\$805.00	Bismuth subsalicylate (Pepto Bismol) 250mg 10ml vial	\$3.22	\$805.00		\$3.22	\$805.00		\$3.22	\$805.00		\$3.22	\$805.00		\$3.22	\$805.00
16	Bivoxin 500 mg 2ml vial	each		Equivalent	420	\$11.45	\$7,447.50	Bivoxin 500mg 2ml vial	\$11.45	\$7,447.50		\$11.45	\$7,447.50	Bivoxin 500mg 2ml vial	\$11.45	\$7,447.50	Bivoxin 500mg 2ml vial	\$11.45	\$7,447.50		\$11.45	\$7,447.50	Bivoxin 500mg 2ml vial	\$11.45	\$7,447.50		\$11.45	\$7,447.50		\$11.45	\$7,447.50		\$11.45	\$7,447.50		\$11.45	\$7,447.50
17	Decadron 5% 100mg 1mg	each		Equivalent	400	\$2.83	\$1,132.00	Decadron 5% 100mg 1mg	\$2.83	\$1,132.00		\$2.83	\$1,132.00	Decadron 5% 100mg 1mg	\$2.83	\$1,132.00	Decadron 5% 100mg 1mg	\$2.83	\$1,132.00		\$2.83	\$1,132.00	Decadron 5% 100mg 1mg	\$2.83	\$1,132.00		\$2.83	\$1,132.00		\$2.83	\$1,132.00		\$2.83	\$1,132.00		\$2.83	\$1,132.00
18	Decadron 5% 250mg 1mg	each		Equivalent	220	\$2.52	\$554.40	Decadron 5% 250mg 1mg	\$2.52	\$554.40		\$2.52	\$554.40	Decadron 5% 250mg 1mg	\$2.52	\$554.40	Decadron 5% 250mg 1mg	\$2.52	\$554.40		\$2.52	\$554.40	Decadron 5% 250mg 1mg	\$2.52	\$554.40		\$2.52	\$554.40		\$2.52	\$554.40		\$2.52	\$554.40		\$2.52	\$554.40
19	Difenhydramine 50mg 25 mg	each	0011-10	Equivalent	250	\$3.77	\$1,141.50	Difenhydramine 50mg 25 mg	\$3.77	\$1,141.50		\$3.77	\$1,141.50	Difenhydramine 50mg 25 mg	\$3.77	\$1,141.50	Difenhydramine 50mg 25 mg	\$3.77	\$1,141.50		\$3.77	\$1,141.50	Difenhydramine 50mg 25 mg	\$3.77	\$1,141.50		\$3.77	\$1,141.50		\$3.77	\$1,141.50		\$3.77	\$1,141.50		\$3.77	\$1,141.50
20	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	each		Equivalent	60	\$9.95	\$597.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$9.95	\$597.00		\$9.95	\$597.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$9.95	\$597.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$9.95	\$597.00		\$9.95	\$597.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$9.95	\$597.00		\$9.95	\$597.00		\$9.95	\$597.00		\$9.95	\$597.00		\$9.95	\$597.00
21	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	each		Equivalent	200	\$4.62	\$924.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$4.62	\$924.00		\$4.62	\$924.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$4.62	\$924.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$4.62	\$924.00		\$4.62	\$924.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$4.62	\$924.00		\$4.62	\$924.00		\$4.62	\$924.00		\$4.62	\$924.00		\$4.62	\$924.00
22	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	each		Equivalent	100	\$2.64	\$264.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$2.64	\$264.00		\$2.64	\$264.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$2.64	\$264.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$2.64	\$264.00		\$2.64	\$264.00	Diphtheria, Tetanus, and Pertussis (DTaP) Vaccine	\$2.64	\$264.00		\$2.64	\$264.00		\$2.64	\$264.00		\$2.64	\$264.00		\$2.64	\$264.00
23	Diphenhydramine 50mg 25 mg	each		Equivalent	200	\$3.67	\$734.00	Diphenhydramine 50mg 25 mg	\$3.67	\$734.00		\$3.67	\$734.00	Diphenhydramine 50mg 25 mg	\$3.67	\$734.00	Diphenhydramine 50mg 25 mg	\$3.67	\$734.00		\$3.67	\$734.00	Diphenhydramine 50mg 25 mg	\$3.67	\$734.00		\$3.67	\$734.00		\$3.67	\$734.00		\$3.67	\$734.00		\$3.67	\$734.00
24	Diphenhydramine 25mg 25 mg	each	118-200842EA	Equivalent	100	\$12.67	\$1,267.00	Diphenhydramine 25mg 25 mg	\$12.67	\$1,267.00		\$12.67	\$1,267.00	Diphenhydramine 25mg 25 mg	\$12.67	\$1,267.00	Diphenhydramine 25mg 25 mg	\$12.67	\$1,267.00		\$12.67	\$1,267.00	Diphenhydramine 25mg 25 mg	\$12.67	\$1,267.00		\$12.67	\$1,267.00		\$12.67	\$1,267.00		\$12.67	\$1,267.00		\$12.67	\$1,267.00
25	Epenine 1100mg 0.1oz 10ml	each		Equivalent	100	\$6.78	\$678.00	Epenine 1100mg 0.1oz 10ml	\$6.78	\$678.00		\$6.78	\$678.00	Epenine 1100mg 0.1oz 10ml	\$6.78	\$678.00	Epenine 1100mg 0.1oz 10ml	\$6.78	\$678.00		\$6.78	\$678.00	Epenine 1100mg 0.1oz 10ml	\$6.78	\$678.00		\$6.78	\$678.00		\$6.78	\$678.00		\$6.78	\$678.00		\$6.78	\$678.00
26	Epenine 1100mg 0.1oz 10ml	each		Equivalent	200	\$13.63	\$2,726.00	Epenine 1100mg 0.1oz 10ml	\$13.63	\$2,726.00		\$13.63	\$2,726.00	Epenine 1100mg 0.1oz 10ml	\$13.63	\$2,726.00	Epenine 1100mg 0.1oz 10ml	\$13.63	\$2,726.00		\$13.63	\$2,726.00	Epenine 1100mg 0.1oz 10ml	\$13.63	\$2,726.00		\$13.63	\$2,726.00		\$13.63	\$2,726.00		\$13.63	\$2,726.00		\$13.63	\$2,726.00
27	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	each		Equivalent	100	\$9.97	\$997.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$9.97	\$997.00		\$9.97	\$997.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$9.97	\$997.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$9.97	\$997.00		\$9.97	\$997.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$9.97	\$997.00		\$9.97	\$997.00		\$9.97	\$997.00		\$9.97	\$997.00		\$9.97	\$997.00
28	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	each		Equivalent	100	\$9.95	\$995.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$9.95	\$995.00		\$9.95	\$995.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$9.95	\$995.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$9.95	\$995.00		\$9.95	\$995.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$9.95	\$995.00		\$9.95	\$995.00		\$9.95	\$995.00		\$9.95	\$995.00		\$9.95	\$995.00
29	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	each		Equivalent	100	\$14.30	\$1,430.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$14.30	\$1,430.00		\$14.30	\$1,430.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$14.30	\$1,430.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$14.30	\$1,430.00		\$14.30	\$1,430.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$14.30	\$1,430.00		\$14.30	\$1,430.00		\$14.30	\$1,430.00		\$14.30	\$1,430.00		\$14.30	\$1,430.00
30	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	each		Equivalent	100	\$12.23	\$1,223.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$12.23	\$1,223.00		\$12.23	\$1,223.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$12.23	\$1,223.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$12.23	\$1,223.00		\$12.23	\$1,223.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$12.23	\$1,223.00		\$12.23	\$1,223.00		\$12.23	\$1,223.00		\$12.23	\$1,223.00		\$12.23	\$1,223.00
31	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	each		Equivalent	100	\$14.49	\$1,449.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$14.49	\$1,449.00		\$14.49	\$1,449.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$14.49	\$1,449.00	Erasolone 100mg 2ml MDV	\$14.49	\$1,449.00																		

EMS MEDICAL SUPPLIES AGS ENTERPRISES LLC, BOUND TREE MEDICAL LLC, HENRY SCHEIN INC, LIFE-ASSETS INC, MEDLINE INDUSTRIES LP, MING-WING USA, NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS INC, QUAMMED INC

Bill Default Non-Responsive
1) W.W. Grainger Inc.
2) Strong Medical Partners LLC, Medsource dba
3) Straker Sales, LLC

Please Note: All item weights are an estimate. \*\* Item to item basis point out at the end of invoice requested but are sold in full box or case.