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FINANCE & ADMIN. SERVICES DEPARTMENT SCITY OF e —m

Purchasing Division UNm S I E

Phone: 954-572-2274
Fax: 954-578-4809
FLORIDA

December 28, 2017 Sent Via Email: kcornelius@spisafety.com

Ms. Karen Cornelius
Safety Products, Inc.
3517 Craftsman Blvd
Lakeland, Florida 33803

Subject: First Renewal — Bid Title: Safety Supplies and Equipment
Bid No. 17-46-09-HR

Dear Ms, Comelius:

The above referenced Contract shall expire December 31, 2019. Pursuant to the terms and
conditions of the Bid, the City reserves the right to renew the Contract for two (2) additional
one (1) year periods providing all terms and conditions remain the same. The City wishes to
exercise the first renewal option for the period of January 1, 2020 through December 31, 2020
for the following items:

Safety Equipment 20% Discount off Catalog Prices
Traffic Control 15% Discount off Catalog Prices
Essentials 20% Discount off Catalog Prices

BEC16 Master Catalog 20% Discount off Catalog Prices

Please sign, date and return this acknowledgement and fax to number 954-578-4809 or email
to hraphaelson(@sunrisefl.gov

Best Regards,

Qq\étcj lu Dhae Byor—_

Holly Raphaelson, C.P.M., CPPO, CPSM
Contracts Administrator

We hereby acknowledge that the above contract is renewed for one year, of January 1, 2020
through December 31, 2020.

3 (Y0 e shefzer

Karen Cornelius

10770 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Sunrise, FL 33351



October 4, 2019

City of Sunrise

Purchasing Division

10770 West Oakland Park Blvd.
Sunrise, FL. 33351

Attention: Holly Raphaelson

hraphaelson@sunrisefl.gov

Account #136390

Bid Number: 17-46-09-HR Safety Supplies & Equipment

School Specialty, Inc. is proud to offer a wide assortment of items including our Premier, Frey, CPO
and Delta brands. This expanded product offering ensures that all educator needs are satisfied by our
wide selection of categories. We are pleased to offer the following catalog discount.

List Price Less 34% on Supply items.

List Price Less 10% on Furniture and Equipment items (includes AV Tech).

All discounts apply to the current year catalogs which are located on the School Specialty website at:

http://catalogs.schoolspecialty.com. If you have not received your catalog, you can request a copy on
the site as well.

*(All catalogs may contain a limited number of items that are listed as “Net Price” and not eligible for any
discounts. These items are indicated by an “N" prefix in the item number. Also excluded is any catalog
that bears notation: no other discounts apply)

Exclusions: No discount on SSI, Delta, CPO, FOSS or Frey Scientific Exclusive
Products with a prefix of “N” or “LN". Discount does not apply to any
other School Specialty Catalogs, Flyers, or customized products.

Please contact your Territory Sales Manager for Premier custom planner
pricing.

Contract Period:
Valid from October 7, 2019 through December 31, 2020. Pricing for contract period effective upon
notification of award referencing our Bid # 7791076349 to bidwestnotices@schoolspecialty.com.

Freight Terms:
Parcel ltem Orders ship free of charge. (9 and 5 prefix items)
Truck/Freight ltems ship free of charge. (6 prefix items).

**Live specimens (prefix L) and hazardous materials (prefix H) may incur additional charges.
Please refer to www.schoolspecialty.com for more information.

-

Singerely,
athy Skibba
Contract Cloordinator

, { ' c a Nad Delta Education
ﬁ PRGMIER w pscience " & tvinrese cBilidrem fearn by doing

School Specialty - Bid Department - W6316 Design Drive, Greenville, Wl 54942 - Ph: 888-388-3224 - Fax: 800-675-1775
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T UNms

Phone: 954-572-2274
Fax: 954-578-4809
FLORIDA

September 19, 2019 Sent Via Email kathy.skibbatschoolspecialty.com
Ms. Kathy Skibba, Bid Coordinator

School Specialty, Inc.

W6316 Design Drive

Greenville, WI 54942

Subject: First Renewal - Bid Title: Safety Supplies and Equipment
Bid No. 17-46-09-HR

Ms. Skibba,

The above refercnced Contract shall expire December 31, 2019. Pursuant to the
terms and conditions of the Bid, the City reserves the right to renew the Contract
for two (2) additional one (1) year periods providing all terms and conditions
rcmain the same. The City wishes to exercise the first renewal option for the period
of January 1, 2020 through December 31, 2020 for the following items:

Supply Items 34% Discount off Catalog Prices
Furniture 10% Discount off Catalog Prices

21 Century Safety and Security Solutions & School Specialty Education
Essentials Catalogs

Please sign, date and return this acknowledgement and fax to number 954-578-
4809 or email to hraphaelson @ sunvisefl.gov

Best Regards,
%LLB/EMN

Holly Raphaelson, C.P.M., CPPO, CPSM
Contracts Administrator

We hereby acknowledge that the above contract is renewed for one year, of

January 1, 2020 through December 31,2020. +pjgase reference Bid #7791076349 on all
purchase orders*

Signature; J1i ]” ‘m Date: _10/4/2019

Knth Amy M. Fuss

10770 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Sunrise, FL 33351



FINANCE & ADMIN, SERVICES DEPARTMENT

Purchasing Division -
Phone: 954-572-2274
Fax: 954-578-4809 .

FLORIDA

September 19, 2019 Sent Via Email: andy.goldy@hénryschein.com

Henry Schein, Inc.
PO Box 3227
Irmo, S.C. 29063

Subject: First Renewal — Bid Title: Safety Supplies and Equipment
Bid No. 17-46-09-HR

Dear Mr. Goldy:

The above referenced Contract shall expire December 31, 2019. Pursuant to the terms and
conditions of the Bid, the City reserves the right to renew the Contract for two (2) additional
one (1) year periods providing all terms and conditions remain the same. The City wishes to
exercise the first renewal option for the period of January 1, 2020 through December 31, 2020
for the following items:

15% Discount off Catalog Prices
(www.henryschein.com; www.defibtech.com; www.fernogms.com; www.microflex.com)

Please sign, date and return this acknowledgement and fax to number 954-578-4809 or email
to hraphaelson@isunrisefl. gov -

Best Regards,
«g\é L(j/I_Q o}&u&.ww

Holly Raphaelson, C.P.M., CPPO, CPSM
Contracts Administrator

We hereby acknowledge that the above contract is renewed for one year, of January 1, 2020
through December 31, 2020.
5

Signature; ‘ aa iuﬁ@/ Date: qé 9// .«q

7

Seey; L2 vwel
Errs /%/Wt)d(’{/&

10770 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Sunrise, FL 33351
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FINANCE & ADMIN. SERVICES DEPARTMENT CITY OF ~ o st

Purchasing Division
Phone: 954-572.2274
Fax: 954-578-4809

FLORIDA

September 19, 2019 Sent Via Email ¢s.quotesiaithermolisher.com

Mr. Jody Beck

Fisher Scientific Co. LL.C.
4500 Turnberry Dr
Hanover Park, IL 60133

Subject: First Renewal — Bid Title: Safety Supplies and Equipment
Bid No. 17-46-09-HR

Mr. Beck,

The above referenced Contract shall expire December 31, 2019. Pursuant to the
terms and conditions of the Bid, the City reserves the right to renew the Contract
for two (2) additional one (1) year periods providing all terms and conditions
remain the same. The City wishes to exercise the first renewal option for the period
of January 1, 2020 through December 31, 2020.

Please sign, date and return this acknowledgement and fax to number 954-578-
4809 or email to hraphaelsoni@sunrisefl.eov

Best Regards,

Holly Raphaelson, C.P.M., CPPO, CPSM
Contracts Administrator

We hereby acknowledge that the above contract is renewed for one year, of
January 1, 2020 through December 31, 2020.

,./"4"4‘;?' K 3 -
Signature:rg”_’:ifzﬁ;fl'éé Tésff ____Date: ;/Z)_*;(Z//‘/ j

Jody/Beck ,/~

10770 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Sunrise, FL 33351



Fisher Scientific

- Part of Thermo Fisher Scientific

To HOLLY RAPHAELSON

Date 10/21/2019

Message: RENEWAL FOR JAN. 12020 - DEC. 31, 2020



Sales Quotation

"Quote Nbr Creation Date Due Date Page
9294-1969-75 101212019 10f19
Payment Terms Delivery Terms
NET 30 DAYS CONTRACT
Vald To Prepared By
12/31/2019 BECK. JODY A.
Customer Reference Sales Representative
RFQ 2ND YR RENEWAL 17-46-09-HR FRANCESCA SCAPPE

To place an order | Ph' 800-766-7000

Fx 800-926-1166

Submitted To Customer Account,  811444-001
HOLLY RAPHAELSON CITY OF SUNRISE
JODY BECK@ THERMOFISHER.COM 10770 W OAKLAND PARK BLVD

912-344-3314

SUNRISE FL 33351-6899

| Fisher Scientific

Part of Thermo Fisher Scient (¢

FISHER SCIENTIFIC COMPANY LLC
4500 TURNBERRY DRIVE
HANOVER PARK IL 60133-5491

Click here or go through your purchasing system to
fishersci.com guotes

*Please reference this Quote Number on
all correspondence.

Don't have a profie? Register on fishersci.com

For complete Terms and Conditions please click here.

Nbr Qty UN

Catalog Number

Description

Unit Extended
Price Price

19 502 008

2690 HEADSUP LED FLASHLIGHT 1282 12 82

cloth strap, Heavy duty rubber strap
Vendor Catalog # 2690-033-110

This item is being sold as

18 999 2441

o

1 per each

Flashlight, LED, Pelican, HeadsUp Lite. 10 hr battery burn time, 4.1
0z, 60 [umens, chem:cal-res stant ABS Water resistant ; Adjustable

SPEC FLSHBCK BK FR GRY LEN 1PR . 3.31 3N
Safety Glasses Uvex, Flashback. Single-lens design, duoflex

Vendor Catalog # S4001

This itern is being sold as

1 per each

cushions, Impact-resistant polycarbonate lens, Lens Tint Gray UD,
Frame Color Black Frame

COMMENTS LIMITED SUPPLY ITEM MAYBE BE DISCONTINUED

19 003 336D

BANDIT BL ESPRES UD DUOFLX1PR 7.39 739
Safety Glasses, Uvex, Bandit, Single polycarbonate lens, Sideshields

Vendor Catalog # $1603

This iter is being sold as

19 040 144

R

1 per each

and browguards; LensTint Espresso UD, Frame Color Black

GENESIS BLACK FR CLEAR XTR 9.08 908
Glasses, Safety, Uvex, Genesis; Black frame, Clear lens UV exireme

anti-fog coating. Dual 9-base wrap-around lens, Meets ANSI Z87+ and

CSA 294 3 standards, Quick and easy ‘ens removal
Vendor Catalog # 83200X

This item 1s being sold as

1 per each



Sales Quotation

Part of Therme Fisher Sciont fic

Fisher Scientific

Quote Nbr Customer Reference

Page

RFQ 2ND YR RENEWAL
9294-1969-75 17-48-09-HR

20f19

Nor Qty UN

Catalog Number Description Hnit

Price

Extended

Price

5 NOBID

6 1 EA

10 NOBID

11 1 EA

—

(‘“\

It

~I\

"--NO BID--* NO BID

19817 359 SFTY SPEC ZTEK /0 LENS 243

[

Glasses, Safety, Pyramex Ztek, Wraparound single lens with panoramic
view; Soft rubber temple tips provide comfort without slipping

Clear Frames, Lens tint Indoor/Qutdoor Mirror

Vendor Catalog # S25803

This itern 1s being sold as 1 per each

19151 320 SFTY SPEC AZTEC BMR LENS 288

Glasses, Safety, Pyramex Ztek, Wraparound single lens with panoramic
view, Soft, rubber temple tips provide comfort without slipping,

Black Frames; Lens tint Blue Mirror

Vendor Catalog # $2575S

This item 1s being sold as 1 per each

19151 317 SFTY SPEC AZTEC AMB LENS 226

>

Glasses, Safety, Pyramex Ztek, Wraparound single lens with panoramic
view; Soft rubber temple tips provide comfort without shipping

Amber Frames; Lens tint’ Amber

Vendor Catalog # S2530S

This item is being sold as 1 per each

19151 316 SFTY SPEC AZTEC GRY LENS 241

4

Glasses, Safety, Pyramex Ztek, Wraparound single lens with panoramic
view; Soft, rubber temple tips provide comfort without slipping

Black Frames, Lens tint Gray

Vendor Catalog # S2520S

This item is being sold as 1 pereach

*-NO BID--* NO BID

19817 374 SFTY SPEC BLK FRM I/O LNS V2 s

-

Spectacle, Pyramex Venture tl Lightweight integrated sidestueld,
1/0 Mirror polycarbanate lens High-curve (9.75) dual-lens provide
greater than180 deg coverage, Filter 99%) harmful UV light, Temples
adjust, pillow-soft nose-bud

Vendor Catalog # SB1880S

This item is being sold as 1 per each

243

288

226

241

381



Sales Quotation

Part of Thetmo Fishar Sciorufin

Fisher Scientific

Quote Nbr Customer Reference

Page

9294-1969-75

RFQ 2ND YR RENEWAL
17-46-09-HR

30f19

Nbr

Qty

UN

Catalog Number Description

Unit
Price

Extended
Price

12

13

14

15

16

(RY4

PR

EA

EA

bz

19121 936 SFTYGLS/PYRMEX/ZONEI/12(PR)

i

N

Eyewear, Safety, Pyramex, Zone |l, Straight back Rubber coaled
temple tips, Gray, 100 percent polycarbonate, scratch-resistant
lenses; Blocks 99% UVA, UVB, Silver mirror coating lens w/ silver
frame

Vendor Catalog # SS3370E

This itemn is being sold as 12 pairs per 12

19121 007 SFTY SPEC RNDZVS BLK FR/S MIR

—

Glasses, Safety, Pyramex Rendezvous, Ratcheting lens pitch
adjustment, Flexible nylon temples, Adjustable nose pad.
Polycarbonate frame 9.5 base-curved polycarbonate lens, Black,
Silver Mirror Lenses

Vendor Catalog # SB2870S

This item is being sold as 1 per pairs

19 181 504 FB INDIR VEND ANTI-FOG LENS

qéj;fﬁkﬁ

" .
«‘4‘_;‘!} N

Goggles, Chemical Splash, Fisher Scientific, Soft, green PVC frame
Elastic strap w/adjustable fit High-impact Polycarbonate lens
w/Antifog, antiscratch coating. Four indirect vents, Meet
requirements of ANSI Z87 1

Vendor Catalog # 19181504

This item is being sold as 1 per each

19 130 0480 REVOLUTION GOGGLE

Gogales, Safety, Kimberly-Clark Professional Jackson Safety,
Revolution V80; Clear lens, Blue frame, Meet ANSI 287 1 2010, Cross
Vent Technology keeps air flowing in and moisture or chemical
splashes out Lighiweight foam cushion

Vendor Catalog # 14399

This itern is being sold as 1 per each

19817 377 SFT SPC BILK FRM GRY LNS DZ

e

Glasses, Safety, Pyramex GT2000; Le ghtweight. Polycarbonate lens,
Scratch resistant, 99% UVA/B absorption, Gray lens, Black frame
Vendor Calalog # SB2020S

This item is being sold as 12 each per 12

52.23

428

547

8.65

42 09

5223

428

547

865

42 09



Sales Quotation

Bart of Thermo Fisher Scwentific

Fisher Scientific

Quote Nbr Customer Reference

Page

\ RFQ 2ND YR RENEWAL
9294-1969-75 17-46-09-HR

4 0f 19

Nbr

Qty

Unit

UN Catalog Number Description Price

Extended
Price

17

18

19

20

21

22

Dz 19151 341 SFTY SPEC FASTRAC GRY DZ 17.27
Glasses, Safety Pyramex Fastrac Clear polycarbonate lens 99% UVA/B

absorption, Dual-lens look Gray frameilens

Vendor Catalog # S1420S5

Thus item is being sold as 12 each per 12

FR 19 019492 BOOT PVC STEEL TOE 6 1PRBQOT 1828
Boots, Knee, Servus, PVC, Safe-Toe steel toe cap. Tracid outsole and
2 ] heel, Waterproof 16 n , Size 6
} Vendor Catalog # 18821C/&
This item is being sold as 1 per pairs

PR 19 068969 BOOT PVC STEEL TOE 13 1PR 1828
Boots, Knee, Servus. PVC, Safe-Toe sleel toe cap, Trac1{ outsole and
z heel, Waterproof, 16 in , Sze 13
; j Vendor Catalog # 18821-BLM-130
) This item is being sold as 1 per pairs

*--NO BID--"
*-NO BID--"

PK 11462 67C GLV DIAMOND GRIP PF M 100/PK 1282
X Gloves, Exam. Microflex, Diamond Grip; Thin wall, Latex, Tapered

fingers, Textured grip, Beaded cuffs, Powder-free, Chlorinated,

Ambidextrous, Color: natural, Nonsterile; Single-use. Medium

Vendor Catalog # MF-300-M

Shelf Life 2Y

This tem is being sold as 100 each per pack

Original Catalog Number 2TEKS

PK 11 462 67E GLV DIAMOND GRIP PF XL 100/PK 1282
: 7 Gloves, Exam, Microflex; Diamond Gnp; Thin wail, Latex, Tapered

fingers, Textured grip, Beaded cuffs, Powder-free, Chlorinated

Ambidexirous, Color natural Nonsterile; Single-use, X-Large

Vendor Catalog # MF-300-XL.

Shelf Life 2Y

This item is being sold as 100 each per pack

Med:cal Device

1727

1828

1828

1282

12.82



Sales Quotation Fisher Scientific

Pact of Thermo Fishet Scieng (e

Quote Nbr Customer Reference Page
RFQ 2ND YR RENEWAL
9294.1969-75 17-46-09-HR 5 of 19
Nbr Qty UN Catalog Number Description éjr';'éte Ex;iillcled
24 1 PK 11462 67B GLV DIAMOND GRIP PF S 100/PK 12.82 12 82

i Gloves, Exam, Microflex; Diamond Grip. Thin wall, Lalex, Tapered
fingers, Textured grip, Beaded cuffs, Powder-free, Chlorinated,
Ambidextrous, Color: natural, Nonsterile; Single-use; Small
Vendor Catalog # MF-300-S

Shelf Life 2Y

This item is being sold as 100 each per pack

Medical Device

25 NOBID *--NO BID--

26 1 CS 19 050 570 GLVS NEOP/RUB 526 72CS 390 01 390 01
Glove, MAPA, Technic/NS-450, Neoprene/Natural rubber, Superior
flexibility. tear strength, Mechanical, chemical protection, Length
16 in., Grip. Diamond, Color. Black, Cuff Flat, Thickness 30mil,
Lining flock-lined, Size Small, 72/Cs
Vendor Catalog # 450446
This item is being so'd as 72 each per case

27 1 DZ 19071375 GLV GRAIN DRIVR SPLTBK LG 12PR 3899 3899

Gloves, Leather Drivers; Fisherbrand, Regular Grade Top Grain Palm,
'ﬁs ldeal for construction, machine operation, utility work, farming,
§ '2, roping, and other general apphcations, Launderable, Keystone Thumb,
e $plit Elastic Back. Large
Vendor Catalog # 68-161SB/L
This item 's being sold as 12 pairs per 12

28 1 Dz 19 816 858 LTHR GLV GRN W/PNK STRIPE XXL 2962 2962
Gloves Work Leather Palm, PIP Bronze; B Grade Shoulder Split
Cowhide. Leather Knucklestrap and Finger Tips; Elastic Closure,
Cotton Lined Palm. Rubberized Safety Cuff, Green and Pink Striped
" Fabric. XX-Large
Vendor Catalog # 83-6563/XXL
This item is being sold as 12 pairs per 12

sl

29 1 DZ 19 055 405 GLV MUSTANG COWHDE DRIVRS LRG 46.83 46 83
, Gloves, Mustang. MCR Safety, Cow leather, Cotton backs, Gunn leather
@y palm, Fleece lining 2 5in rubbenzed cuff, Shirred elastic, Wing

thumb; Sewn with Polyester thread; Cream; Size Large
Vendor Catalog # 1930L
This item is being so!d as 12 pairs per 12

,.ﬂp‘i i



Sales Quotation

Fisher Scientific

- Part of Thermo Fisher Sciontific

Quote Nbr

Customer Reference

Page

9294-1969-75

RFQ 2ND YR RENEWAL
17-46-09-HR

60719

Nbr

Qty UN Catalog Number Description

Unit
Price

Extended
Price

30 NOBID

31 NOBID

32

33

34

35

36

1 bZ

1 CS

1 EA

i
Le

‘;ltb’

*--NO BID--*

*--NO BID--*

19 014906 GLV PVC/NITRL RH 14 GAUN 12PR
Size: Large (9)

Vendor Catalog # 04-414 9211229
This item is being sold as 12 pairs per 12

19 067568 GLV MSTNG MIG-TIG WELD L 12PR

Gloves, Chemical Resistant, Ansell, Snorkel, PVC-Nitnle blend.
Gauntlets, Style 4-412; Fully coated; 14 in. (36cm); Jersey-lined,

Glove, Leather; MCR Safety, Mustang Mig/Tig welder, Premium. Sewn

wilh KEVLAR, Wing thumb, 4 in. Split leather cuff; Large
Vendor Catalog # 4950L
This item is being sold as 12 pairs per 12

50 200 4639 PURELL HND SANITIZER/ALOE 1/CS

Help keep your family and those you care for healthy with PURELL

Advanced Hand Sanitizer Soothing Gel with moistunzers

including aloe

and Vitamin E Washing with soap and water is not always an aption

and can be harsh on skn Using PURELL hand sanitizer
convenient and gentler way to kill germs and stay healthi
Vendor Catalog # GOJ9631CT

Hazardous Material

This item is being sold as 1 per case

is a more
er.

19 084744 KNEE PAD HNG HRD CVR VLCR 1/PK

Vendor Catalog # 40GAV82500
This item is being sold as 1 per pack
Medical Device

19088 711A RAINCT PVC 491N W/DTCHBL HOOD

Pad, Knee, Impacto, Hinged, Hard-cover One size fits all

Coat, Rain, MCR Safety, Wizard. 0.28mm PVC/Nylon/PVC. Flame
retardant; Rip-stop material, 49 in L, With detachable hood, Yellow,

Large

Vendor Catalog # 300CL

Shelf Life 2Y

This item is being sold as 1 per each

5179

185,99

69 86

17.70

17.82

5179

18599

69 86

17.70

17.82



Sales Quotation . Fisher Scientific

Part of Thirmo Fisher Scient fic

Quote Nbr Customer Reference

Page

RFQ 2ND YR RENEWAL
9294-1969-75 17-46-09-HR

70f19

Nbr

Qty

UN Catalog Number Description

Unit
Price

Extended

Pri

ce

37

38

39

40

41

42

EA 19 168 350C RAINSUIT PVC YEL EA LG
; Raincoat, Three-piece, Neese; Coat with detachable hood and bib
trouser, Yellow heavy 35mm vinyl-on-polyester, Size lLarge
Vendor Catalog # 1600SLG
This item is being sold as 1 per each

EA 19 168 350E RAINSUIT PVC YEL EA 2X
, Raincoat Three-piece; Neese; Coat with detachable hood and bib
' trouser. Yellow heavy 35mm vinyl-on-polyester. Size 2X-Large
Vendor Catalog # 160082X
This item is being sold as 1 per each

CS 19 088 348C CVRL SRNX WRST/HD/BT WHLG 6/CS

Coveralls, DuPont Tychem SL Attached Hood and Boots; Elastic Wrists,
Taped Seams; White, Size Large

Vendor Catalog # SL122TWHLG000600

This item is being sold as = 6 each per case

W

cs 19 088 348D CVRL SRNX WRST/HD/BT WHXL 6/CS

YT Coveralls, DuPont Tychem SL, Attached Hood and Boots, Elastic Wrists
Taped Seams, White, Size' X-Large

Vendor Catalog # SL122TWHXL000600

This item is being sold as 6 each per case

CcS 19 088 348E CVRL SRNX WRST/HD/BT WH2X 6/CS

Attached hood w/elastic face, Elastic wrists and ankles; Front zippet
closure w/storm flap, Attached boots, Taped seams’ White; Size:
2X-Large

Vendor Catalog # SL122TWH2X000600

This item is being sold as 6 each per case

CS 19 088 348F CVRL SRNX WRST/HD/BT WH3X 6/CS

5 Coveralls. DuPont Tychem SL. Laminated w/Saranex, Chemical-resistant
Attached hood w/elastic face, Elaslic wrists and ankles, Front zipper
closure wistorm flap, Attached boots Taped seams, White, Size
3X-Large

Vendor Catalog # SL122TWH3X000800

This item is being sold as 6 each per case

Coveralls, DuPont Tychem SL Laminated w/Saranex; Chemical-resistant,

9.12

594

254.65

257.70

272.58

289 44

912

594

254 65

25770

272.58

289 44



Sales Quotation = Fisher Scientific

g Part of Thormo Fisher Sciontiliz

Quote Nbr Customer Reference

Page

RFQ 2ND YR RENEWAL
9294-1969-75 17-46-09-HR

8oi19

Nbr Qty UN Catalog Number Description

Unit
Price

Extended
Price

44 1

45 1

46 1

47 1

48 NOBID

cS 19 088 348G CVRL SRNX WRST/HD/BT WH4X 6/CS

Coveralls; DuPont Tychem SL., Laminated w/Saranex, Chemical-resistant,
Attached hood w/elastic face, Elastic wrists and ankles, Front zipper
closure w/storm flap Attached boots; Taped seams. White, Size
4X-Large

Vendor Catalog # SL122TWH4X000600

This item 1s being sold as 6 each per case

CS 19162 771 CVRL SL HOOD W/BOOT 5X 6/CS

Coverall. Chemical Resistant, DuPont, Tychem SL. Rugged and durable,
Style. 120, Taped seams, Attached hood, Front zipper closure, Storm
flap with tape closure; Elastic wrsts; Attached socks, Standard

offering. White, 5X-Large. 6/Cs

Vendor Catalog # SL122TWH5X000600

Shelf Life 5Y

This item is being sold as 6 each per case

CS 19162 773 CVRL SL HOOD W/BQOT 6X 6/CS

Coverall, Chemical Resistant DuPont Tychem SL; Rugged and durable
Style 120, Taped seams, Attached hood, Front zipper closure, Storm
flap with tape closure, Elastic wrists: Attached socks; Standard

offering; White, 6X-Large, 6/Cs

Vendor Catalog # SL122TWHE6X000600

Shelf Life 5Y

This item is being sold as 6 each per case

CS 19 059 239 HOOD WAISTLNGTH FACESHLD 6/CS
Hood, CPF 3, Multi-Layer Film Barrier; Laminated 2 oz. Polypropylene
Substrate, Waist Length Dickey-Style, PVC Faceshield, Hook/Loop
5 Closures; Elastic at Shoulders Taped Seams, Tan
Vendor Catalog # C3651TTNCO000600
This item is being sold as & each per case

EA 19 145 465 FACESHLD TUFFMSR H8A_W96 EA

, System, Safety, 3M, Combination of ratchet headgear and WP96
faceshield, Five position crown strap, Molded faceshield provides
impact protection, Adjustable ratchet suspension; Color clear,
Propionate, Size 9x 14 25in
Vendor Catatog # 82782-00000
This item is being sold as 1 per each

“-NO BID--~

312.83

332.45

360 63

32110

2529

31283

33245

36063 w

32110

2529



Sales Quotation

Part of Thermo Fisher Scient i

Fisher Scientific

Quote Nbr Customer Reference

Page

9294-1969-75

RFQ 2ND YR RENEWAL
17-46-09-HR

9of19

Nbr

Qty

UN

Catalog Number

Description

Unit
Price

Extended
Price

49

50

51

52

53

EA

EA

EA

EA

PK

19 145 465

|\

19 811 296

19 130 4580

17 98

e

18 999 4547

FACESHLD TUFFMSR HBA_WQ6 EA

System, Safety 3M, Combination of ratchet headgear and WP96
faceshield Five position crown strap. Molded faceshield provides
impact protection Adjustable ratchet suspension, Color clear
Propionate Size 9x 14 25 n,

Vendor Catalog # 82782-00000

This item is being sold as 1 per each

HD HAT SUSP W/THYSSEN DOVER

Hard Hal; ERB, Omega Il. Cap style; High density polyethylene
6-point nylon suspension; Easily adjusts to head sizes 6 5to 8
Made in USA, Meets ANSI 289 1-2009, Type 1, Class C E& G
requirements, Quantity, 12. Color: white

Vendor Catalog # 19131

This item is being sold as 1 per each

HL EAR MUFF THUNDER T3 EA

Earmuff, Headband Thunder T3 Howard Leight, Air flow control
technology, Dielectric plastic construct.on, Non deforming outer
headband, w/height adjustment. For safe use in electrical
environments; Black color

Vendor Catalog # 1010970-H5

This item is being sold as 1 per each

593 FIT TEST KIT

Kit, Fit Test, 3M, Qualitative, Used 1o check face-to-respirator seal
on any particulate respirator or gasivapor respirator with a
particulale prefilter; Sweet test

Vendor Catalog # FT-10

This item 1s being so!d as 1 per each

FILTER 5000/6000 N95 PART 10PK
Respirators air punifying, fiters 3M, N85 particulate filter
Approved for use with 3M 5000 series (inc'uded with paint
spray/pesticide respirator) 954 efficient against solid and liquid
non-oil-based aerosols, Nussance level organic vapor refers to

2529

795

2543

27075

15.03

concentrations not exceeding OSHA PEL or applicable exposure imits,

whichever is lower
Vendor Catalog # 5N 11
This item is being sold as 10 each per pack

2529

2385

2543

27075

1603



Sales Quotation @ Fisher Scientific

= Part ol Thermo Fisher Sciontfie

Quote Nbr Customer Reference Page
RFQ 2ND YR RENEWAL
9294-1969.75 AT TR 10 0f 19
Nbr Qty UN Catalog Number Description il Eatended

54 1 EA 17 6768 RESPIRATOR ORG VPR/ACID GAS MD 1821 1821
v Respirator, Half-Facepiece; Disposable, Medium; With Organic

VaporfAcid Cartridges For intermittent respirator use, plant

shutdowns or turnarounds, and applications where respirators wear out

or become difficult to clean in a short tme

Vendor Catalog # 5203

Shelf Life 18M

This itemn Is being sold as 1 per each

55 1 EA 17 676C RESPIRATOR ORG VPR/ACID GAS LG 1821 18 21
Respirator, Half-Facepiece, Disposable, Large, With Organic
Vapor/Acid Cartridges, For intermittent respirator use, plant
i Vo f:? shutdowns or turnarounds, and applications where respirators wear out
w e or become difficult to clean in a short time
Vendor Catalog # 5303
Shelf Life 18M
This item is being sold as 1 per each

56 1 PK 18002 717 FILTER P95 PARTICULATE 10/PK 18.32 18 32
o Respirators. air punifying, fiters, 3M, P95 particulate filter, Used

7 & in spray painting, pesticide spraying, petrochemica!, other chemical

' ___.‘,# manufacturing. NIOSH approved 95% efficient protection against

' certain oil, non-oil-based particles, Nuisance level organic vapor

refers to concentrations not exceeding OSHA PEL or applicable

exposure limits, whichever is lower

Vendor Catalog # 5P71

This item is being sold as 10 each per pack

57 1 PK 17 986 11C CART OV/AG 3M 6000 1PR/PK 12.60 1260
Cartridge, Air Purifying Respirator, 3M, For 3M 6000 and 7000 senes
B respirators, Organic vapor/acid gas cartridge, Approved far certain
“ N organic vapors, chlorine, hydrogen chloride, and sulfur dioxide
hydrogen sulfide or hydrogen fluoride
Vendor Catalog # 6003
This itern is being sold as 1 per pack

58 NOBID *--NO BID-- NO BID
59 NOBID *-NO BID-- NO BID

60 NOBID *--NO BID--* NO 8ID
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61 NOBID *-.NO BID--* NO BID
62 NOBID *-NQ BID--* NO BID
63 1 EA 19 804 780 CTN TRIP HAZ FOLD-UP 35.24 3524
Sign, Free-standing. Accuform Signs; Fold-Ups, Legend CAUTION
aen TRIPPING HAZARD, w/Graph cs Double-sided, w/handte cut-out, Rough
'@q handling. 0.125 in (0.32¢m) thick high impact plastic made. 12W x 20
thzano in H (30.5 x 51cm)
Vendor Catalog # MF118
This item is being so'd as 1 per each
64 1 EA 19804 780 CTN TRIP HAZ FOLD-UP 3524 3524
Sign. Free-standing, Accuform Signs Fold-Ups, Legend CAUTION
TRIPPING HAZARD, w/Graphics, Double-s ded w/handle cut-out Rough
'@u handling, 0 125 in. (0 32cm) thick high impact plastic made, 12W x 20
fazane in.H (30.5 x 51cm)
Vendor Catalog # MF118
This item is being sold as 1 per each
65 1 EA 19 807 373 CHANGEABLE ARROW SIGN 18 69 1869
Sign, Fire, Brady, Legend FIRE EXTINGUISHER (w/changeable arrow)
1o Aluminum. For indicating location of fire extinguishers, White on
S red, WxH 3556 x2540cm (14 x 101n)
Vendor Catalog # 43355
This item is being so'd as 1 per each
66 3 19110179 SIGN 124565 1/SGN 14 53 43 59
Sign, Fire Extinguisher, Brady-40 deg F to 230 deg F. 1/Each,
Non-adhesive, Corner holes Rectangle, Black/white on red. 4in to
18in. to 0 035 in , Aluminum
Vendor Catalog # 124565
This item is being sold as 1 per each
67 1 EA 19 000 439 SIGN,EXIT, 10 HX14 W 51.01 51.01

254cmH (14 x 10in))
Vendor Catalog # 80282
This item is being sold as 1 per each

Sign, Exit and Birectional, Brady, Legend EXIT; Glow-In-The-Dark
Plastic (B-347), Language English, Red on Green, Size 35 5W x
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Nbe Qty UN Catalog Number Description F",‘:.?éz Ex,;?;::c;ed
68 1 PK 19040 387 TG EY WSH STN INP 5 3/4X3 10PK 21.24 2124
' . Tag, Inspection and matenal control; Brady, Textured, Front/Back
- legend REPLACE WATER/6 MOS/INITIAL/DATE/H20 CHANGED/YES/NO:;
language; Heavy duty polyester; 5.75H x 3in W
Vendor Catalog # 86437
This item is be ng sold as 10 each per pack
69 1 EA 19 104 296 BARRICADE TAPE 58352 1/RL 323 323
Tape, Flagging, Brady, Non-adresive. Color. Fluorescent orange L x
] W 457m x 3cm (150 ft x 1 187 in)
Vendor Catalog # 58352
This item is being sold as 1 per each
70 1 PR NC1483634 ELE GLV CLASS O 11 BLK $Z8 59.10 59 10
Vendor Catalog # E011B/8
D Hazardous Material
Original Cata‘og Number E011B8
71 1 PR 11 395 408 GLV INSUL LOW VOLT $Z9 1PR 78 86 7886
[ L l‘g:’a Gloves, Lineman's; Salisbury, Insulating Rubber, Class 0 Max_ use
Ly TR lf' 1000VAC (1500VDC), Black. Flare cuff 11in , Size 9
i “~ Vendor Catalog # E0118/9
BEaa !l Thisiemis being sold as 1 per pairs
72 1 PR 11 395 40C GLV INSU LOW VOLT $Z9 5 1PR 71.76 7176
B | &,ﬂn Gloves, Lineman's. Salisbury, Insulating Rubber Class 0, Max use
‘;', 7 \]Lﬂl 1000VAC (1500VDC), Black, Flare cuff, 11in , Size 95
bﬂ‘" =" < Vendor Catalog # E011B/9H
WLs 1 Thisitem is being sold as 1 per pairs
73 1 PR 11 395 40D GLV INSUL LOW VOLT SZ10 1PR 81.37 8137
" l'g?‘.:-i Gloves, Lineman's: Salisbury, Insulating Rubber, Class 0, Max use
oo &{ 1000VAC (1500VDC), Black, Flare cuff, 11in Sze 10
="~  Vendor Catalog # E011B/10
L | This item is being sold as 1 per pairs
74 1 11 395 40F GLV INSUL LOW VOLT $Z11 1PR 82.19 8219
M rsa Gloves, Lineman's, Salisbury, Insulating Rubber; Class 0 Max use.
. f[ 1000VAC (1500VDC), Black, Flare cuff 11in. Size 11
"<  Vendor Catalog # E011B/11
B )
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75 1 PR 11 395 406G GLV INS LOWVOLT 8211 5 1PR 7176 7176
h l f r.;.; Gloves, Lineman's, Salisbury, insulating Rubber, Class 0 Max use
ki 7 h' 1000VAC (1500VDC), Black, Flare cuff, 11 in., Size 115
Es-" 2 Vendor Catalog # EQU1BL/M
' This item is being sold as 1 per pars
76 1 PR 19 828 352 GLV LNEMN CL3 18 RB SZ8 PRGLV 326 71 326 71
Gloves, Linemen, Salisbury Class 3 High voltage Straght cuif,
45 7cm (18 in.), Easier inspecting for cuts and lears Red/black,
Size 8
Vendor Catalog # E318RB/8
This item is being so'd as 1 per pairs
77 1 PR 19 828 353 GLV LNEMN CL3 18 RB SZ8H PRGL 326 71 326 71
Gloves, Linemen Salisbury, Class 3, High voltage, Straight cuff,
45 7cm (18 in ), Easier inspecting for cuts and tears, Red/black
Size 85
Vendor Catalog # E318RB/8H
This item is being sold as 1 per pairs
78 1 PR 19 828 354 GLV LNEMN CL3 18 RB 829 PRGLV 326.71 326 71
T Gloves, Linemen, Salsbury, Class 3, High voltage, Straight cuff
‘ ¥ 45 7cm (18 in ), Easier inspecting for cuts and tears, Red/black;,
@@ Size: 9
Vendor Catalog # E318RB/9
This item is being sold as 1 per pairs
79 1 PR 19 828 355 GLV LNEMN CL3 18 RB SZ9H PRGL 32671 326 71
Gloves, Linemen Salisbury, Class 3. High voltage, Straight cuff,
45 7cm (18 in.), Easler inspecting for cuts and tears, Rediblack
Size 95
Vendor Catalog # £318RB/9H
This item is being sold as 1 per pairs
Origina! Catalog Number E318RB9H
80 1 PR 19 828 357 GLV LNEMN CL3 18 RB 8Z10H PRG 326.71 326 71

Gloves, Linemen, Salisbury, Class 3, High voltage, Straight cuff,
45.7¢m (18in ), Easier inspecting for cuts and tears, Red/black,
Size. 105

Vendor Catalog # £318RB/10H

This item is being sold as 1 per pairs

i
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81

82

a3

84

g5

86

PR

PR

EA

EA

Ea

EA

19 828 358 GLV LNEMN CL3 18 RB SZ11 PRGL

Gloves, Linemen, Salisbury, Class 3, High voltage. Straight cuff,
45.7cm (18 in ), Easier inspecting for cuts and tears, Red/lack,
Size. 11

Vendor Catalog # E318RB/11

This item is being sold as 1 per pairs

19 828 359 GLV LNEMN CL3 18 RB SZ12 PRGL

|

Gloves, Linemen, Salsbury, Class 3, High voltage. Straight cuff
45 7em (18 in.), Easier inspecting for cuts and tears, Red/black,
Size; 12

Vendor Catalog # E318RB/12

This item is being sold as 1 per pairs

19 220 844 HEAVY DUTY VEST L ORN

NC1270478

N Eine At

Vest, Heavy Duty, ML Kistugo, Brilliant Series; Ultra-Cool 100%
polyester mesh, Brilliant Trim reflective edging, Orange, Largs
Vendor Catalog # 1511-L

This item is being sold as 1 per each

HIGHWAY TRIANGLE KITS 3/PK SET
Vendor Catalog # ORRTB3TRI
Hazardous Material

15 811 847 TALATE HZARD FLG 16X 16 1000/RL

TR 4T

Flags. Highway. Harris Industries, Bright red polyethylene, Nail or
tie to overhanging load For fast, highly-visible warning of a
potential hazard, Rol' contains 1000 16 in x 16 in. red flags
Perforated for dispensing

Vendor Catalog # THF-1

This item is being sold as 1 per each

19000 272 SMALL LOCKOUT STATION

e b

Small Lockout Station; Brady, Station Only
Vendor Catalog # 50997
This item is being sold as 1 per each

326 71

32983

10 81

44 63

G992

1797

326 71

32983

1081

4463

g3 82
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87

88

89

90

9

EA 19000 050

)

PRINZING ECONOMY LOCKOUT KIT
Kit, Lockout, Brady. Pnnzing. Economy, Includes Steel Lockout Hasps,

g’ .«* Prinzing Padlock, Padlock Identifier Stickers, Pack Lockout Tags
-«“4'.'_' osow  WiTies, Single/Multi-Pole Breaker Lockouts, Large Plug Lockout,

Lockout Training Booklet PE Carrying Cs
Vendor Catalog # LKX
This item is being sold as 1 per each

PK 19 000 287

e

O

Y
e .

38Wx4.06cmH (075x15x 1.6in.), 6/Pk
Vendor Catalog # 51376
This item is being sold as 6 each per pack

PK 19 000 311

ALUM PADLOCK, 156 KD GRN 6PK

¢ .~ Padlock Aluminum, Brady, Keyed different. Chrome-plated steel
i} r‘ shackle, Lightweight Rugged Resistant to chemical, corrosion
- w/B-pin cylinders, Shackle dia : 0.63cm (0.25in.), Green 19D x

SFTY PADLOCK.15 KD YLW 6PK
i Padlock, Safety, Brady, Plastic, Keyed d fferent, Lightweight
. Non-conductive body, Include 3 labels/ lock 1 English 1 French, 1

=o e Spanish label, Yellow, Shackle dia : 0.63cm (0 25in }, 203D x 3 81W

il

x444cmH (08x15%x 175in ), 6/Pk
Vendor Catalog # 51346
This item is being sold as 6 each per pack

PK 19 036 62

-~
-~

1-3/4iN BRS PDLOCK KEY DIF 6PK
Padlock; Master Lock: No 6840; 1.75in wide solid brass body,

Hardened steel shackle. & pin W6000 cylinder, Removable cylinder:

Corrosion resistant, Keyed different Commercia! boxed 6/shelf pk

Vendor Catalog # 6840
This item is being sold as 6 each per pack

EA 18 999 1326

its use until repairs have been completed
Vendor Catalog # 65289
This item is being sold as 1 per each

TOOL BOX LOCKOUT WICOMPONENTS
Kit, Lockout, Toolbox, 17L x 5W x 4-1/2 in H, Plastic toolbox
conlains necessary supplies to lock and mark equipment and prevent

113.04

87.33

81.64

2278

13578

113 04

87 33

8164

2278

13578
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92

93

94

95

96

97

a8

99

NOBID

NOBID

EA

EA

17 987 275)

ELEC LOCK QUT STARTER KIT

298.10

Kit, Starler; Brady, Electrical Lockout Protect from electr.cal
hazards, Includes 6 ea. Single Pole Breaker, 227V No Hole Breaker,
Universal Multi-Pole Breaker, Wall Switch Lockouts; Large, Small

Brady Plug Lockout, Hasps,
Vendor Catalog # 65777
This item 1s being sold as

*--NO BID--* 24401

17 985 5B

Padlocks. tags

1 per each

PLATE POLYCARB SH 10 4 5X5 25

697

Plate. Filter, Sellstrom, Provides For welding purpose, UV/IR
Protection for eyes, Polycarbonate, Heal rasistant IR/IPC, 45x 5 25
in . Meets ANSI Z87 1, Shade 10

Vendor Catalog # 16710
This item is being so'd as

*--NO BID--* 19037878

*--NO BID-- 516605

18 999 566

7

v

!

18813 786

19 073207

RS

e g

1 per each

SPILL KIT CHEMICAL 31GAL

20570

Kit, Spill, 3M, Chemroll, Chemical sorbent, Folded, Conformable; For

use on mosl aggressive non-aggressive liquids, 31 gal

Vendor Catalog # CSKFL31
This item is being s0'd as

1 per each

PETRLM SRBENT SPLKT 31 GAL DRM 165 86

Kit, Spill, 3M, For petroleum sorbert spill responses, 31 gal

Vendor Catalog # PSKFL31
This item is being sold as

1 per each

RESPONSE PACK-CHEMICAL 1/PK

123 42

Spill Kit, Chemical, 3M, Inc'udes ten 9-1/4 x 14-1/2 in pads and
three 3in x 4 ft booms. Total kit sorbing capacity. 3-3/4 gal.
Vendor Catalog # SRPCHEM

This item is being sold as

1 per pack

298 10

697

20570

165 86

12342
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100 1 EA 19813 786 PETRLM SRBENT SPLKT 31 GAL DRM 165 86 165 86
Kit, Spili. 3M, For petraleun sorbent spill responses, 31 gal

Vendor Catalog # PSKFL31
This item is being sold as 1 per each

101 1 EA 18 999 4470 PALLET LOW PROFILE CONT 4DRUM 294 16 294 16
Pallet, Drum, Eagle, Spill-contanment. Polyethylene construction
Low profile, Square, Spill Capacity 66 ga' (250L). 4-drum 51 5L x
WSS 51.5Wx 10in H(131 x 131 x 25¢m)
Vendor Catalog # 1645
This item is being sold as 1 per each

102 1 EA 19 804 473 NE LANE CLSED AHD 48 MESH VNL 121.73 12173
; Sign. Traffic; Accuform Signs Roll up, Legend One Lane Closed

Ahead, Color Orange, Black, Mes# vinyl. 121.9 x 121 9cm (48 x 48

in.) diamond

Vendor Catalog # FRC423MV

This tem 1s being sold as 1 per each

103 NOBID *--NO BID--" NC1360828

104 NOBID *--NO BID--* NO BID

105 NOBID *-NO BID--* NO BID

106 NOBID *--NO BID~" NO BID

107 NOBID --NO BID-- NO BID

108 NOBID *--NO BID-- NO BID

102 NOBID *--NO BID--" NQO BID

110 NOBID *--NO BID--" NO BID

111 1 EA 19038 302 8§ 14X10 CAUTION SLIPPERY FLR 1078 1078

X Signs. ANSI Z535, CAUTION Slippery Floor (with Picto), Blackiyellow
L on white, Self-sticking po'yester, H x W' 35 56 x 25 4cm {14 x 10 in )
[ Vendor Catalog # 45178

Shelf Life 1Y

This item 1s being sold as 1 per each
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112 1 EA 19 042 680

B

BIB APRON W/STRAPS LTHR 24X48

Apron, Bib, Revcon For welding Quality. Side spht Cowhide
leather. Durable, Wide adjustable shoulder straps with quick, Front
bib utility pocket, Stitched with flame-resistant Kevlar; Size 48

in (121.92cm)
Vendor Catalog # 48A
This item 1s being sold as

113 1 EA 19 088 029 APRON
Bib Apron, Welding Side split cowhide, Reveo, 42 in. L. Wide

114 NOBID “-NO
115 NOBID *-NO
116 NOBID *~NO

117 1 EA 19041

NOTES:

shoulder straps, Front bb ulility pocket; Stitched with

flame-resistant Kevlar
Vendor Catalog # 42A
Shelf Life 1Y

This item is being sold as

BID--~ NO BID
8ID--+ NO BID

BID--* NOQ BID

1 pereach

LEATHER 24X42

1 per each

572 BELT STNDRD ELST W/SUSPEND MD
Belt, Elastic, Valeo, Medium 8 in e'astic power net with 4
non-conductive stays, Adjustable two-stage hook and loop closure
system, Removable 1 5in elastc suspenders with hook and loop tabs

for safety

Vendor Catalog # VES MED .

This item is being sold as

MERCHANDISE

1 per each

TOTAL

Returns are subject to manufacturer terms and conditions.

We now offer highly competitive financing with low monthly payments. Please contact your local sales

representative for more information.

Tell us about your recent customer service experience by completng a short survey This should take no
fonger than three minutes Enter the link into your browser and enter the passcode: USA-PGH-CS2

3985

1405

3985

14 05

9,171.61
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