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May 14, 2019

Mr. Mark West

Forestry Resources, LLC
4353 Michigan Link
Fort Myers, FL 33916

SUBJECT: Renewal of Annual Contract No. B-150271
The Purchase of Mulch

Dear Mr. West:

This is to inform you that Lee County agrees to renew the above subject contract for an
additional one (1) year period, from 8/5/2019 through 8/4/2020.

We are hereby extending the annual contract for an additional one year period under the
same terms and conditions as the original award.

If you have any questions regarding this letter, please contact me at (239) 533-8871.

Sincerely,

K’Lmbertg Urban

Kimberly Urban
Contracts Analyst
Procurement Management Division

C: Project File

P.O. Box 398, Fort Myers, Florida 33902-0398 (239) 533-2111
Internet address http://www.lee-county.com
AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER
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March 12,2019

Mr. Mark West

Forestry Resources LL.C
4353 Michigan Link
Fort Myers, FL 33916

|

Renewal of Annual ;Contract B-150271
The Purchase of ML;ICh

Subject:

Dear Mr. West:

o \

239-533-8871

The above-referenced annual contract will expire on August 4, 2019, unless renewed. Lee

County is requesting that this annual contract be rene
(8/4/2019 — 8/4/2020). Therefqre, we are requesting

options and return this letter to Lee County Procurem
Urban, P.O. Box 398, Ft. Myers, FL. 33902-0398, (F
kurban@leegov.com ), within 15 calendar days from
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As a condition of this renewal, the vendor agrees
updated insurance certificate upon expiration of|
the County.
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B-150271 The Purchase of Mulch

Vendor

Forestry Resources LLC

Rate Changes

Please see attached request sheet

Original Term

8/5/15 - 8/4/16

Renewal

4

Department

Countywide

Please return to Procurement

Approved: W

Date: q| -||-£0




B-150271 The Purchase of Mulch

4/2/19

Forestry

Forestry Resources  |Resources with |Express Mulch
Item Description 2018 pricing increase 2016 Pricing Increase Percentage
Section A - Flori Mulch
Flori Mulch Price Per Yard- picked up $17.75
Flori Mulch Price Per Yard- delivered $20.25
Minumum Number of Yards for Delivery 70 70
Bags of Flori Mulch
Cost Per Bag - picked up $1.65 $1.69 2%
Cost Per Bag - delivered $1.85 $1.89 2%
Delivery Charge for Partial truckload $90.00
Section B - Vita Mulch
Vita Mulch Price Per Yard - picked up $14.50
Vita Mulch -Price Per Yard - delivered $16.50
Bags of Vita Mulch
picked up $1.49
delivered $1.69
Delivery Charge for Partial truckload $90.00
Section C - Speciality Red/Gold Mulch
Specialty Red Mulch Price Per Yard - Picked Up $20.00 $21.00 5%
Specialty Red Mulch Price Per Yard - Delivered $20.00 $21.50 8%
Speciality Red Mulch -Price Per 80 CU YD Picked
Up $20.00 $21.00 5%
Speciality Red Mulch - Price per 80 CU TY
Delivered $22.50 $23.50 4%
Speciality Gold Mulch -Price Per 80 CU YD Picked
Up $20.00 $21.50 8%
Speciality Gold Mulch - Price per 80 CU TY
Delivered $22.50 $24.50 9%
Cost per Bag - Red Mulch - picked up $2.05 $2.15 5%
Cost per Bag - Red Mulch - delivered $2.29 $2.35 3%

i+
Approved ( \



B-150271 The Purchase of Mulch

4/2/19

Forestry

Forestry Resources  |Resources with |Express Mulch
Item Description 2018 pricing increase 2016 Pricing Increase Percentage
Cost per Bag - Gold Mulch - picked up $2.05 $2.25 10%
Cost per Bag - Gold Mulch - delivered $2.29 $2.50 9%
Delivery Charge for Partial truckload $90.00
Section D - Playsafe Plus - TT material
Playsafe Plus - TT material - picked up $24.76
Playsafe Plus - TT material - delivered $25.76
Bags of Playsafe Plus - TT material
picked up $2.35
delivered $2.59
Section E - Pro Euc Mulch Discontinued Discontinued
Section F - Pine Bark
Pine Bark Price Per Yard- picked up Discontinued
Pine Bark Cost per Bag - delivered Discontinued
Pine Bark - Cost Per Bag - Picked Up $3.33 $3.40 2%
Pine Bark - Cost per Bag - Delivered $3.59 $3.65 2%
Delivery Charge for Partial truckload $90.00
Additional Fork Lift Fee - will be added for direct
delivery and for partial truck loads requiring
forklift) $75.00 100%
Section G - Pine Straw
Pine Straw - picked up $3.90 $4.05 4%
Pine Straw - delivered $4.45 $4.60 3%
Section H - Washed Shell
1/2 size small - picked up $45.00
1/2 size small - delivered $50.00

Approved




B-150271 The Purchase of Mulch

4/2/19

Forestry

Forestry Resources  [Resources with |Express Mulch
Item Description 2018 pricing increase 2016 Pricing Increase Percentage
1- 11/2 size large - picked up $45.00
1-11/2 size large - delivered $50.00
Section | - Brown River Rock
1/2 - 1 size small - picked up $120.00 $130.00 8%
1/2 - 1 size small - delivered $126.00 $135.00 7%
1-11/2 size large - picked up $170.00 $180.00 6%
1-11/2 size large - delivered $176.00 $190.00 8%
Section J - Crushed Shell
1/4 - 1/2 picked up $45.00
1/4 - 1/2 delivered $50.00
1-11/2 picked up $45.00
1-11/2 delivered $50.00
Section K - Blown in Mulch No Bid No Bid
Flora Mulch No Bid No Bid $17.75
Labor to Install No Bid No Bid $16.00
Vita Mulch No Bid No Bid $14.50
Labor to Install No Bid No Bid $16.00
Speciality Red or Gold Mulch No Bid No Bid $20.00
Labor to Install No Bid No Bid $16.00
Enigneered Wood Fiber (EWF) No Bid No Bid $24.76
Labor to Install No Bid No Bid $15.00
Pro Euc Mulch No Bid No Bid $20.00
Labor to Install No Bid No Bid $16.00
Medium Rustic Pine Bark Nuggets No Bid No Bid $23.25

Approved




B-150271 The Purchase of Mulch

4/2/19

Forestry

Forestry Resources  |Resources with |Express Mulch
Iltem Description 2018 pricing increase 2016 Pricing Increase Percentage
Labor to Install No Bid No Bid $18.00
Playsafe Material
picked up $20.50
delivered $22.25
Bags of Playsafe Material
picked up $1.75
delivered $2.00
Delivery Charge for Partial truckload $90.00

Approved




