INFORMAL QUOTATION # IW100084

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: MARCH 11, 2010 FOR
BUYER: CHRIS JEFFCOAT CONTAINER LUBRICANTS
EVANS OIL J.H. WILLIAMS LUBRICATION NAPA AUTO PALMDALE ON-SITE
VENDORS CO.LLC OIL CO. ENGINEERS PARTS OIL COMPANY ANTIFREEZE
INC. INC. RECYCLING, LLC

1. ENGINE OIL SAE 30
a. Quart x 200 qts = $2.07/gt  ($414.00) $2.50/gt  ($500.00) $6.17/qt  ($1,234.00) $2.15/gt  ($430.00) $1.99/qt  ($398.00) THIS VENDOR

ENGINE OIL SAE 40 DID NOT

a. Quart x 50qts =

2. ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40 CJ4
a. Quart x 1500 gts =

b. 5 gallon pail (gal. x 50 gal =)

. 55 gallon drum (gal. x 6600 =)

3. AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID
a. Dexron Il1, quart (gt x 520 qgts =)

b. Dexron Il1, 55 gallon drum (gal. x 1863 =)
¢. Mercon v, quart (gt x 210 gts =)

d. Mercon V, 55 gallon drum (gal. x 500 gal.)

e. Transynd Synthetic Transmission Fluid 55 gallon drum (gal. x 1210 gal. =)
f. Transynd Synthetic Transmission Fluid gallon ( gal. x 200 gal. =)

4. CHASSIS GREASE
a. tubes (Ib x 1245 lbs =)

b. 120 Ib drum (Ib x 520 Ibs =)
d. 400 Ib drum (Ib x 1200 lbs =)

5. GEAR LUBRICANT

a. Quart (qt x 80 gts =)

b. 120 Ib. drum (Ib x 600 Ibs =)
c. 400 Ib drum (Ib x 2400 Ibs =)

6.TRACTOR HYDRAULIC FLUID
a. 5 gallon pail ( gal x 500 gal =)
b. 55 gallon drum (gal x 330 gal. =)

$2.07/qt ($103.50)

$2.12/qt  ($3,180.00)
$6.69/gal ($334.50)
$6.19/gal  ($40,854.00)

$2.17/qt  ($1,128.40)

$6.23/gal  ($11,606.49)
N.A.

$12.36/gal  ($6,180.00)

$12.36/gal  ($14,955.60)
N.A.

$1.63/b  ($2,029.35)
$155/b  ($806.00)
$1.49/b  ($1,788.00)

$4.24/qt  ($339.20)
$1.17/1b ($702.00)
$1.16/Ib ($2,784.00)

$7.28/gal  ($3,640.00)
$6.99/gal  ($2,306.70)

$2.50/qt  ($125.00) $6.17/gt  ($308.50)  $2.15/qt  ($107.50)  $1.99/gt  ($99.50)

$2.80/qt  ($4,200.00)  $6.76/qt  ($10,140.00) $2.42/qt ($3,630.00) $2.25/qt ($3,375.00)
$8.20/gal ($410.00) $23.70/gal ($1,185.00)  $8.89/gal ($444.50) $7.50/gal  ($375.00)

$6.40/gal ($42,240.00) $21.39/gal ($141,174.00) $8.38/gal ($55,308.00) $6.50/gal ($42,900.00)

$2.10/qt  ($1,092.00) $8.06/qt ($4,191.20)  $2.31/qt ($1,201.20) $2.04/gt ($1,060.80)
$4.80/gal ($8,942.40)  $26.31/gal ($49,015.53) $7.60/gal ($14,158.50) $6.99/gal ($13,022.37)
$3.38/qt  ($709.80)  $8.06/qt ($1,692.60)  $3.69/qt ($774.90) NO BID

$8.35/gal ($4,175.00)  $26.31/gal ($13,155.00) $16.33/gal ($8,165.00) $9.05/gal  ($4525.00)

$30.00/gal ($36,300.00) $26.31/gal ($$31,835.10) NO BID $16.26/gal  ($19,674.60)
$35.00/gal ($7,000.00)  $27.86/gal ($5,572.00) NO BID $16.26/gal  ($3,252.00)
$2.52/lb  ($3,137.40) NA. $2.69/b  ($3,349.05) $1.79/b  ($2,228.55)
$1.96/b  ($1,019.20) $6.10/b  ($3,172.00) NO BID $1.70/b  ($884.00)
$1.90/b  ($2,280.00) $5.95/b  ($7,140.00) NO BID $1.66/b  ($1,992.00)
$3.50/gt  ($280.00) NA. $5.99/gt  ($479.20) NO BID

$1.39/lb  ($834.00) $4.94/lb  ($2,964.00) $2.45/lb  ($1,470.00) $1.197/lb  ($718.20)
$1.42/Ib  ($3,408.00) $4.76/lb ($11,424.00) $2.42/lb  ($5,808.00) $1.039/Ib ($2,493.60)

$8.50/gal  ($4,250.00) $26.19/gal ($13,095.00) $9.34/gal ($4,670.00) $6.88/gal  ($3,440.00)
$5.30/gal  ($1,749.00) $24.48/lb ($8,078.40) $9.53/gal ($3,144.90) $6.51/gal  ($2,148.30)

QUOTE ON ITEMS
1 THROUGH 11
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INFORMAL QUOTATION #I1wW100084

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: MARCH 11, 2010 FOR
BUYER: CHRISJEFFCOAT CONTAINER LUBRICANTS
EVANS OIL J.H. WILLIAMS LUBRICATION NAPA AUTO PALMDALE ON-SITE

VENDORS CO.LLC OIL CO. ENGINEERS PARTS OIL COMPANY ANTIFREEZE

INC. INC. RECYCLING
7. HYDRAULIC OIL-AW-ISO 68
a. 5 gallon pail (gal. x 300 gal. =) $5.93/gal  ($1,779.00) $5.80/gal  ($1,740.00) $23.08/gal ($6,924.00) $7.06/gal  ($2118.00) $6.13/gal ($1,839.00) THIS VENDOR
b. 55 gallon drum (gal. x 650 gal. =) $5.42/gal  ($3,523.00) $4.72/gal ($3,068.00) $22.09/gal ($14,579.40) $7.03/gal  ($4,569.50' $5.11/gal ($3,321.50) DID NOT QUOTE

ON ITEMS

8. HYDRAULIC OIL AW-ISO 32 1 THROUGH 11
a. 55 gallon drum ( gal. x 650 gal. =) $5.42/gal  ($3,523.00) $4.80/gal  ($3,120.00) $22.09/gal ($14,358.50) NO BID $7.15/gal  ($4,647.50)
9. WHEEL BEARING GREASE-HIGH TEMP
a. tubes (Ib x 750 Ibs =) $1.63/lb  ($1,222.50) $2.52/b  ($1,890.00) N.A. $2.69/lb  ($2,017.50) $1.79/b  ($1,342.50)
b. 35 gallon pail ( Ib. x 70 Ibs =) $158/lb  ($110.60)  $2.00/b  ($140.00) $6.17/b  ($431.90) NO BID $1.74/lb  ($121.80)
10. TWO CYCLE ENGINE OIL-TC/W3
a. Quart (qt. x 200 gts =) $2.32/qt  ($464.00)  $2.80/lb  ($560.00) NO BID $5.19/qt  ($1,038.00 $2.46/qt  ($492.00)
11. ANTIFREEZE 100%
a. Antifreeze (gal. x 495 gal. =) $12.30/gal ($6,088.50) $6.00/gal  ($2,970.00) NO BID $8.89/gal  ($4,400.55) $7.67/gal  ($3,796.65)
GRAND TOTAL COST ITEMS 1-11 $109,862.34 $136,139.80 $356,257.39 $117,284.60 $118,147.87
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INFORMAL QUOTATION # IW100084

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: MARCH 11, 2010 FOR
BUYER: CHRIS JEFFCOAT CONTAINER LUBRICANTS

EVANS OIL J.H. WILLIAMS LUBRICATION NAPA AUTO PALMDALE ON-SITE
VENDORS CO, LLC OIL CO. ENGINEERS PARTS OIL COMPANY ANTIFREEZE

INC. INC. RECYCLING, LLC

Addenda Acknowedged YES YES NO YES YES NO
COPIES PROVIDED YES YES YES YES YES YES
GRAND TOTAL COST FOR ITEMS (1-11) $109,862.34 $136,139.80 $356,257.39 $117,284.60 $118,147.87 DID NOT QUOTE
OPTION A: ENGINE OIL SAE 30 NON-DETERGENT QT COST $1.72 $1.60 NO BID $2.15 $1.47
OPTION B; CAN PROVIDE OTHER PRODUCT LINE YES/NO YES YES YES YES YES YES
DELIVER WITH OWN VEHICLE YES YES NO YES YES YES
Delivered within calendar days 1 PER BID 5-Mar 1 1 1
Modifications YES NO YES NO NO BLANK
Signed YES YES YES YES YES YES
Local Business Tax Account Number N.A. N.A. N.A. 8702821 N.A. 9600642
Immigration Affidavit YES YES YES NO YES YES
Meets Specifications YES YES *No YES YES *No

NO BIDS

HYDRAULIC SERVICES
JACK LYONS TRUCK PARTS

POSTING TIME/DATE
FROM: /

UNTIL: /

BY:

*VENDOR DID NOT

INSERT NEW PAGES
PER ADDENDUM

*VENDOR DID NOT

INSERT NEW PAGES
PER ADDENDUM



lewinke
Highlight

lewinke
Highlight

lewinke
Highlight

lewinke
Highlight

lewinke
Highlight


