FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120079

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 18, 2012

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS - STEP ONE

VALLEY CREST

HANNULA

D.M. RATERMANN
& ASSOCIATESLLC
DBA GREENWERX

LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPING P&TLAWN & GROUNDSKEEPIN

MAINTENANCE, |GRANDSCAPES AND IRRIGATION, |TRACTOR G DBA ABETTER
VENDORS INC. LLC EXCAVATION ETC. |INC. SERVICE, INC. BUGMAN
Addenda Acknowedged NA NA NA NA NA NA
SIGNED YES YES YES YES YES YES
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 9400901 1103652 NA 9301429 0905016 1002099
1. CRITERIA ONE - COMPANY HISTORY YES YES YES YES YES YES
2. CRITERIA TWO - LICENSING &
CERTIFIICATE REQUIREMENTS NO* NO** YES YES YES NO***
3. CRITERIA THREE - INSURANCE YES YES YES YES YES YES
4. CRITERIA FOUR - PERFORMANCE BOND YES NO YES YES YES YES
5. CRITERIA FIVE - EXPERIENCE &
REFERENCES YES YES YES
6. CRITERIA SIX - EQUIPMENT YES YES YES
7.STEP TWO YES YES YES YES YES YES
IMMIGRATION AFFIDAVIT NO YES YES YES YES YES
MEETS SPECIFICATIONS NO NO YES YES YES NO***

* NO COMMERCIAL PESTICIDE LICENSE

** NO COMMERCIAL PESTICIDE LICENSE
OR IMOT

***NO COMMERCIAL PESTICIDE LICENSE

NO BIDS

POSTING TIME/DATE

FROM: /

UNTIL: /

BY:




FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120079 LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: JANUARY 18, 2012 FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS - STEP ONE

AMERA-TECH,
SUPERIOR INC. DBA FLORIDA

LANDSCAPING & |EVERGREEN

LAWN SERVICE, |LANDSCAPE AND

VENDORS INC LAWNCARE
Addenda Acknowedged NA NA
SIGNED YES YES
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 0803984 1100617
1. CRITERIA ONE - COMPANY HISTORY YES YES
2. CRITERIA TWO - LICENSING &

CERTIFIICATE REQUIREMENTS NO**** YES
3. CRITERIA THREE - INSURANCE YES YES
4. CRITERIA FOUR - PERFORMANCE BOND YES YES
5. CRITERIA FIVE - EXPERIENCE &

REFERENCES YES
6. CRITERIA SIX - EQUIPMENT YES
7.STEP TWO YES YES
IMMIGRATION AFFIDAVIT YES YES
MEETS SPECIFICATIONS NO YES

***NO COMMERCIAL PESTICIDE LICENSE

NO BIDS

POSTING TIME/DATE

FROM: /

UNTIL: /

BY:




FORMAL QUOTATION #(-120079

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: TFEBRUARY 15,2012

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS - STEP TWO

AMERA-TECH,
HANNULA INC.DBA FLORIDA
LANDSCAPING P& TLAWN &  [EVERGREEN
EXCAVATION ETC |AND IRRIGATION, [TRACTOR LANDSCAPE &
VENDORS INC. INC. SERVICE, INC. - ILAWNCARE
Addenda Acknowedged NA NA  NA NA
COPIES YES YES YES YES
SECTION 1: ESTERO PARKWAY
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $3,000.00 $3,216.00 $2,100.00 52,868.00
MOWING: TOTAL 24,840.00 3,744.00 8,640.00 $,544.00
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL 5,600.00 6,512.00 3,860.00 4,620.00
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 2,800.00 1,324.00 1,920.00 4,916.00
TOTAL SECTION 1: $36,240.00 ¢ $14,796.00 > $16,520.00 $20,948.00
SECTION 2: IMPERIAL PARKWAY
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $2,700.00 $3,480.00 $3,000.00 $2,352.00|
MOWING: TOTAL 12,606.00 3,120.00 9,600.00 7,032.00
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL 3,000.00 2,558.00 1,700.60 3,300.00
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 1,500.00 1,324.00 1,480.00 3,512.00
TOTAL SECTION 2: $19,800.00 7 $10,482.007 $15,780.00 $16,196.00
SECTION 3: FOWLER EXTENTION —T
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $5,400.00 $5,580.00 $3,000.00 $4,668.00
MOWING: TOTAL 15,120.00 5,040.00 12,960.00 3,120.00
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL £,000.00 1,848.00 1,780.00 1,320.00 -
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 4,000.00 1,324.00 1,280.00 1,404.00
TOTAL SECTION 3: $32,520.00 $13,792.00 $19,020.00 (st 2,007




FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-126079

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 15, 2612

FOR

|BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS - STEP TWO

AMERA-TECH,

HANNULA INC.DBA FLORIDA
LANDSCAPING P&TLAWN & EVERGREEN
EXCAVATION ETC|AND IRRIGATION, [TRACTOR LANDSCAPE &

VENDORS INC. INC. SERVICE, INC. LAWNCARE
SECTION 4: BAYSHORE RIVNE PINE ISLAND
RD .
A. NE PINE ISLAND RD.(FDOT ACCESS RD
TO N TAMIAMI TRAIL(BUSINESS 41)
LANDSCAPL MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $1,500.00 $5,076.00 $1,200.00 $2,472.00
MOWING: TOTAL 12,600.00 6,384.00 7,200.00 7,416.00
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL 1,000.00 4,290.00 1,484.00 1,156.00
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 560.00 1,324.00 486.00 908.00
TOTAL PART A: $15,300.06 $17.074.00 $16,364.00 \§' $11,952.00
B. BAYSHORE RD/NEWPOST BR.(N i
TAMIAMI TRAIL (B41) TO HART RIVNEW
POST DR) )
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $3,000.00 $6,396.00 £1,200.00 $2,964.00
MOWING: TOQTAL 18,000.00 13,728.00 14,160.00 6,936.00
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL 2,800.00 8,880.00 1,780.00 1,848.00
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 1,400.00 2,644.00 520,60 1,452.60
TOTAL PART B: 525,200,060 $31,648.00 817,660.00 { §13,200.00| ™

| —_
C. BAYSHORE RD EAST(HART RIVNEWPOST
DR TO PRITCHETT PKWY)
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $3,000.00 $8,340.60 $3,600.00 $8,076.00
MOWING: TOTAL 33,600.00 16,488.00 39,600.00 24,216.00
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL 2,800.00 11,130.00 4,748.00 2,640.00
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 1,460.00 2.644.00 2,560.00 2,074.00

o

TOTAL PART C: $40,800.00 $38.602.00 £50,508.00 m37,006.00 M




FORMAL QUOTATION #0Q-120679

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 15,2012

FOR

BUYER: KATRY CICCARELLI

LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS - STEP TWO

AMERA-TECH,
HANNULA INC.DBA FLORIDA
LANDSCAPING |P&TLAWN &  |EVERGREEN
EXCAVATION ETC |AND IRRIGATION, |TRACTOR LANDSCAPE &
VENDORS INC. INC. SERVICE, INC.  |LAWNCARE
D. BAYSHORE AT 175 ("CLOVERLEAF"
AREAS ADJACENT TO ENTRY AND EXIT
RAMPS)
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $5,100.00 $6,120.00 $3,600.00 $1,356.00
MOWING: TOTAL 6,960.00 9,504.00 4,800.00 5,424.00
IMULCH ONLY: TOTAL 4,500,00 $,308.00 2,100.00 2,310.00
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 2,120.00 2,644.00 1,280.00] 1,816.00
TOTAL PART D: $18,680.00 $26,576.00 $11,780.00 $10,906.00
TOTAL SECTION 4 (PARTS A - D): 599,980.00 $113,900.00 $90,312.00. $73,064.00 >
SECTION 5: LEE BLVD T ——
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $14,400.00 $13,680.00 $2,400.001 NO BID
MOWING: TOTAL 60,000.00 17,976.00 37,200.00 NO BID
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL 4,600,00 5,930.00 6,840.00 NO BID
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 2,300.00 1,244.00 3,200.00 NO BID
TOTAL SECTION 5: $81,300.00 $38.830.00 % $49,640.00 NO BID
SECTION 6: SIX MILE CYPRESS
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $7,200.00 $7,020.00 $4,800.00 $3,816.60
MOWING: TOTAL 10,800.00 7,488.00 11,760.00 8,880.00
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL 6,300.00 30,250.00 3,560.00 3,300.00
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 3,400.00 6,610.00 2,960.00 3,512.00
TOTAL SECTION 6: ] $28,200.00 $51,368.00 $23,080.00 {$19,508.90]
SECTION 7: HANCOCK BRIDGE PARKWAY
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $16,800.00 $9,240.00 $8,400.00 NO BID
MOWING: TOTAL 18,000.00 9,984.00 15,000.00 NO BID
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL 10,600.00 10,160.00 4,450.00 NO BID
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 5,200.00 2,644.00 2,760.00 NO BID
TOTAL SECTION 7: ' $50,600,00 $32,028.00 ¢ $30,610.00] 3 NO BID




FORMAL QUOTATION #0Q-120079

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 15, 2012 FOR
BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS - STEP TWO
AMERA-TECH,
HANNULA INC.DBA FLORIDA
LANDSCAPING |[P& TLAWN & EVERGREEN
EXCAVATION ETC |AND IRRIGATION, |TRACTOR LANDSCAPE &
VENDORS INC. INC. SERVICE, INC. LAWNCARE
SECTION 8: DANIELS PARKWAY
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $7,200.00 $3,924.00 $1,800.00 $3,504.00
MOWING: TOTAL 21,000.00 9,000.00 6,480.00 8,160.00
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL 12,000.00 6,524.00 3,900,00 2,3190.00
" IMULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 6,600.00 - 1,986,00 1,920.00 2,438.00
TOTAL SECTION 8: $46,200.00 $21,434.00 ¢ §14,100.001) $16,432.00
SECTION 9: US41 (JAMAICA BAY TO SAN ' ———————
CARLOS)
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL NO BID $8,892.00 $16,800.00 NO BID
MOWING: TOTAL NO BID 38,544.00 2,040.00 NO BID
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL NO BID 42,216.00 20,400,00 NO BID
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL NO BID 9,800.00 7,760.80 NO BID
PALM FROND PICK-UP NO BID 1,032.20 2,600.60 NO BID
TOTAL SECEION 9: NO BID $100,484.20 ¢ 545,600.00 ]y NO BID
SECTION 10: GUNNERY RD S
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE: TOTAL $6,000.00 $7,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,780,00
MOWING: TOTAL 21,960.00 12,480.00 36,000.00 15,120.00
MULCH ONLY: TOTAL 15,600.00 30,388.00 6,980.00 2,6460.00
MULCH - LABOR ONLY - TOTAL 7,500.00 6,610.00 3,600.00 2,810.00
|ToTAL SECTION 10: $50,460.00 $57,278.00 $49,580.00 532,350,001
h S ———
SECTION 11: SAN MARCOS AVE./VIETNAM
VETERANS PARK
MOWING: TOTAL $8,880.00 NO BID $11,760.00 $11,568.00
TOTAL SECTION 11: " $8,880.00 NO BID $11,760,00 $11,568.60
GRAND TOTAL (SECTIONS 1 -11) $454,180.00 $454,392.20 $370,002.00 $192,578.00
TO BE STARTED WITHIN ___ CALENDAR
DAYS 10 7 15
LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE NO YES YES VES
MODIFICATIONS NO NO NO NO
SIGNED YES YES YES YES
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX NA 9301429 0905016 1100617
POSTING TEME/DATE
IFROM: /
UNTIL: i
BY:




