FORMAL QUOTATION #B-140094 LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: , 2014 FOR
BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS STEP TWO
HANNULA
P &TLAWN & LANDSCAPING
ANDREWJ.  TRACTOR AND IRRIGATION,
MURRAY INC. SERVICE, INC. INC.

Addenda Acknowedged (1) YES YES YES
GRAND TOTAL - SECTIONS 1 - 8 $287,758.00 $471,973.73 $1,639,538.00

SECTION 1: DANIELS PARKWAY
A. DANIELS PARKWAY WEST OF 175

LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE | 18,000.00 11,070.00 67,176.00
MOWING 10,500.00 28,413.00 89,565.00
B. DANIELS PARKWAY EAST OF 1-75

LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE 9,000.00) 11,070.00 35,040.00 o
MOWING 8,400.00 21,095.13 47,250.00
SECTION 1: TOTAL 545,900.00 (: §71,648.13 ) $239,031.00
3% LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE APPLIED $69,498.69

SECTION 2: EDISON BRIDGE (BUS.41)

LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE 3,600.00 8,425.44 20,460.00
MOWING . 6,300.00| 17,758.02 27,300.00
SECTION 2: TOTAL L 59.900.00 D $26,183.46 $47,760.00
3% LOCAL VENDOR. PREFEREN CE APPLIED $25,397.96

SECTION 3: SR80 (PALM BEACIH BLVD)
A. 175 TO HICKEY CREEK (COOK RD)
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE 13,200.00 6,150.00 122,580.00
MOWING 31,458.00| 50,368.50 163,401.00

B. PROSPECT TO 175 ‘
ROADSIDES AND MEDIANS 12,000.00| 15,436.44 ' 24,540.00
MOWING 10,500.00] 19,372.50 32,718.00




LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

FORMAL QUOTATION #B-140094
OPENING DATE: , 2014

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS STEP TWO

HANNULA
P&TLAWNS& LANDSCAPING

ANDREWJ. | TRACTOR AND IRRIGATION,

VENDORS MURRAY INC.  |SERVICE, INC. INC. :
SR ~
SECTION 3: TOTAL (_ $67,158.00.. $91,327.44 343,239.00
3% LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE APPLIED $8$8,587.62
SECTION 4: VETERANS PARKWAY(TO
INCLUDE THE RETENTION POND WHICH
GETS MOWED ONCE A MONTH)
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE AND MOWING 36,000.00 28,474.44 122,580.00
MOWING: ROADSIDES AND MEDIANS 73,500.00 159,650.82 163,401.00
SECTION 4: TOTAL $109500.00 | __ §188,125.26 $285,981.00
3% LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE APPLIED $182,481.50
SECTION 5: COLLEGE PARKWAY
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE 3,600.00 7,134.00 46,488.00
MOWING 6,300.00 7,749.00 61,992.00
SECTION 5: TOTAL ¢ 5590000 ) $14,883.00 $108,480.00
3% LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE APPLIED $14,436.51
SECTION 6: MICHAEL J RIPPE PKWY
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE 6,000.00 4,120.44 35,760.00
=

SECTION 6: TOTAL $6,000.00 | ¢ $4,120.44 3 $35,760.00
SECTION 7: MCGREGGOR BLVD. AND SAN
CARLOS BLVD.
PALM FROND PICK UP 20,800.00 30,914.00 165,100.00
SECTION 7: TOTAL ¢ $20800.00 ) $30,914.00 $165,100.00
— g ——————
3% LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE APPLIED $29,986.58
SECTION §: THREE OAKS PARKWAY(WILL
BE COMPLETED IN JUNE)




FORMAL QUOTATION #B-140094

LEE COQUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: , 2014

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLIL

LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS STEP TWO

HANNULA
P& TLAWN & LANDSCAPING

ANDREWJ. |TRACTOR AND IRRIGATION,
VENDORS MURRAY INC, [SERVICE, INC. INC.
LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE 6,000.00 $,610.00 §2,200.00
MOWING  12,600.00 36,162.00 110,985.00
SECTION §: TOTAL ¢ $18,600.00 ) $44,772.00 $193,185.00
3% LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE APPLIED $43,428.84
GRAND TOTAL - SECTIONS 1 - § $287,758.00 $471,973.73 $1,418,536.00
3% LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE, APPLIED $457,814.52
OPTION A: LABOR RATE PER HOUR
REMOVE AND REPLACE TREES $45.00 $125.00 $47.50
REMOVE AND REPLACE SHRUBS $30.00 $75.00 $42.50
CPTION B: SECTION 1
AREA A
MULCH ONLY-FOR ONE TIME NO BID $2,100.00 11,730.00
LABOR ONLY-FOR ONE TIME $2,500.00 $1,875.00 9,625.00
TOTAL: ARFA A $2,500.00 $3,975.00 $21,355.00
AREA B
MULCI ONLY-FOR ONE TIME NO BID 3,387.00 9,150.00
LABOR ONLY-FOR ONE TIME 2,000.00 3,120.00 7,500.00
TOTAL: AREA B $2,000.00 $6,507.00 $16,650.00
OPTION C: SECTION 2 |
MULCH ONLY-FOR ONE TIME NO BID 1,699.00 1,287.00
LABOR ONLY-FOR ONE TIME 2,000.00 1,800.00 970.00
TOTAL: SECTION 2 $2,000.00 $3,490.00 $2,257.00

OPTION D: SECTION 3




FORMAL QUOTATION #B-140094

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: , 2014

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS STEP TWO

HANNULA
P & T LAWN & LANDSCAPING

ANDREWJ.  |[TRACTOR AND IRRIGATION,
VENDORS MURRAY INC.  |SERVICE, INC, INC.
ARFEA A .
MULCH ONLY-FOR ONE TIME NO BID 1,895.00 12,375.00 -
LABOR ONLY 6,000.00 850.00 10,150.00
TOTAL: AREA A $6,000.00 $2,745.00 $22,525.00
AREA B o
MULCH ONLY-FOR ONE TIME NO BID 3,750.00 5,864.00
LABOR ONLY-FOR ONE TIME 3,000.00 4,890.00 3,874.00
TOTAL: AREA B $3,000.00 $8,640.00 -~ §9,738.00
OPTION E: SECTION 4
MULCH ONLY-FOR ONE TIME NO BID 4,425.00 5,930.00
LABOR ONLY-FOR ONE TIME 12,000.00 3,000.00 2,178.00
TOTAL: SECTION 4 $12,000.00 §7,425.00 $8,108.00
OPTION F: SECTION 5
MULCH ONLY-FOR ONE TIME NO BID 1,590.00 2,730.00
LABOR ONLY-FOR ONE TIME 1,000.00 900.00 1,361.00
TOTAL: SECTION 5 $1,000.00 $2,490.00 $4,091.00
OPTION G: SECTION 6
MULCH ONLY-FOR ONE TIME NO BID 2,385.00 2,358.00
LABOR ONLY-FOR ONE TIME 1,000.00 2,400.00 1,479.00
TOTAL: SECTION 6 $1,000.00 $4,785.00 $3,837.00
OPTION H: SECTION 8
MULCH ONLY-FOR ONE TIME NO BID 4,300.00 12,150.00
LABOR ONLY-FOR ONE TIME 3,500.00 4,490.00 9,790.00
TOTAL: SECTION 8 $3,500.00 $8,790.00 $21,940.00




FORMAL QUOTATION #B-140094 LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: , 2014 _ FOR
BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR DOT ROADWAYS STEP TWO
HANNULA
P&TLAWN & LANDSCAPING
ANDREW J, TRACTOR AND IRRIGATION,

MURRAY INC. [SERVICE, INC. INC.

STARTED WITHIN CALENDAR DAYS 5 7 45
LOCATION IN LEE COUNTY NO YES YES
MODIFICATIONS NO NO NO
SIGNED YES YES YES
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX NUMBER NA 0905016 9301429
MEETS SPECIFICATIONS YES YES YES

POSTING TIME/DATE

FROM: /

UNTIL: /

BY:




