
SOLICITATION NO. Q-160299KC

OPENING DATE: MAY 25, 2016           

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI                          

 

GOLF & ELECTRIC 

VEHICLES, INC.

239-334-4000

AFFORDABLE CARTS

239-731-9500

GATOR GOLF CARS AND 

UTILITY VEHICLES, LLC

239-267-8555

ADDENDA ACKNOWEDGED NA NA NA

SIGNED YES YES YES

DISADVANTAGE BUSINESS 

ENTERPRISE (DBE) NO NO NO

MODIFICATIONS NO NO NO

RENTAL AGREEMENT YES YES YES

LEASE AGREEMENT YES YES YES

2/PASSENGER $75.00 $250.00 $125.00

4/PASSENGER $90.00 $350.00 $135.00

6/PASSENGER $135.00 $425.00 $150.00

8/PASSENGER $160.00 NA $225.00

UTILITY VEHICLE GAS $150.00 $350.00 $225.00

UTILITY VEHICLE ELECTRIC $90.00 $350.00 $150.00

2/PASSENGER $105.00 $250.00 $250.00

4/PASSENGER $130.00 $350.00 $265.00

6/PASSENGER $200.00 $425.00 $300.00

8/PASSENGER $230.00 NA $375.00

UTILITY VEHICLE GAS $200.00 $350.00 $375.00

UTILITY VEHICLE ELECTRIC $130.00 $350.00 $275.00

2/PASSENGER $125.00 $250.00 $275.00

4/PASSENGER $145.00 $350.00 $300.00

6/PASSENGER $210.00 $425.00 $350.00

8/PASSENGER $245.00 NA $400.00

UTILITY VEHICLE GAS $215.00 $350.00 $400.00

UTILITY VEHICLE ELECTRIC $145.00 $350.00 $300.00

2/PASSENGER $215.00 $250.00 $335.00

4/PASSENGER $250.00 $350.00 $375.00

6/PASSENGER $310.00 $425.00 $475.00

8/PASSENGER $340.00 NA $575.00

UTILITY VEHICLE GAS $290.00 $350.00 $525.00

UTILITY VEHICLE ELECTRIC $250.00 $350.00 $425.00

2/PASSENGER $175.00/MONTH $2,400.00 $3,100.00

4/PASSENGER $195.00/MONTH $3,600.00 $3,500.00

6/PASSENGER $260.00/MONTH $4,500.00 $4,500.00

8/PASSENGER $310.00/MONTH NA $5,300.00

UTILITY VEHICLE GAS $210.00/MONTH $3,600.00 $4,300.00

UTILITY VEHICLE ELECTRIC $195.00/MONTH $3,600.00 $3,600.00

2/PASSENGER $215.00 $250.00 $335.00

4/PASSENGER $250.00 $350.00 $375.00

6/PASSENGER $310.00 $425.00 $475.00

8/PASSENGER $340.00 NA $575.00

UTILITY VEHICLE GAS $290.00 $350.00 $525.00

UTILITY VEHICLE ELECTRIC $250.00 $350.00 $425.00

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET  

FOR 

GOLF CART LEASING AND RENTAL

SOLICITATION RESPONSE FORM

PROPOSAL FORM

DAILY RENTAL

WEEKEND RENTAL

WEEKLY RENTAL

MONTHLY RENTAL

ONE-YEAR RENTAL

LEASE PER MONTH



2/PASSENGER $175.00/MONTH $2,400.00 $3,100.00

4/PASSENGER $195.00/MONTH $3,600.00 $3,500.00

6/PASSENGER $260.00/MONTH $4,500.00 $4,500.00

8/PASSENGER $310.00/MONTH NA $5,300.00

UTILITY VEHICLE GAS $210.00/MONTH $3,600.00 $4,800.00

UTILITY VEHICLE ELECTRIC $195.00/MONTH $3,600.00 $3,600.00

2/PASSENGER $75.00 N/C $200.00(1-4)

4/PASSENGER $75.00 N/C $200.00(1-4)

6/PASSENGER $115.00 N/C $200.00(1-2)

8/PASSENGER $115.00 N/C $200.00(1-2)

UTILITY VEHICLE GAS $75.00 N/C NO BID

UTILITY VEHICLE ELECTRIC $75.00 N/C NO BID

2/PASSENGER $95.00 $60.00 $400.00(1-4)

4/PASSENGER $95.00 $60.00 $400.00(1-4)

6/PASSENGER $135.00 $60.00 $400.00(1-2)

8/PASSENGER $135.00 NA $400.00(1-2)

UTILITY VEHICLE GAS $95.00 $60.00 NO BID

UTILITY VEHICLE ELECTRIC $95.00 $60.00 NO BID

2/PASSENGER N/C N/C N/C

4/PASSENGER N/C N/C N/C

6/PASSENGER N/C N/C N/C

8/PASSENGER N/C N/C N/C

UTILITY VEHICLE GAS N/C N/C NO BID

UTILITY VEHICLE ELECTRIC N/C N/C NO BID

ANY ADDITIONAL CHARGES N/C * N/C

REFERENCE SURVEY(S) N/A N/A N/A

AFFIDAVIT CERTIFICATION 

IMMIGRATION LAWS YES YES YES

NEGLIGENCE/BREACH 

DISCLOSURE FORM YES YES YES

AFFIDAVIT PRINCIPAL PLACE 

OF BUSINESS YES YES YES

LOCATION IN LEE COUNTY YES YES YES

LOCAL BUSINESS TAX ACCOUNT 

NUMBER 7803095 0302243 1203404

SUBCONTRACTOR LIST NONE NONE NONE

INSURANCE YES YES YES

MEETS SPECIFICATIONS YES YES YES

*SEE LEASE OR RENTAL 

AGREEMENT Agreement required for each 

rental/lease completed.

Agreement required for each 

rental or lease completed.

Agreement completed once for 

records purposes and subsequent 

lease/rentals completed via delivery 

memo issued by vendor  at delivery.

PICK UP & DELIVERY (LOCAL)

ADDITIONAL CHARGE FOR CANOPY TOP, WINDSHIELD & LIGHTS

ADDITIONAL SUBMITTALS

PICK UP & DELIVERY (OUT OF AREA)

LEASE PER YEAR


