FORMAL QUOTATION #B-150352

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: JUNE 30, 2015

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

ANNUAL PURCHASE OF FUNGUCIDES, HERBICIDES, PESTICIDES, ETC.

RAINBOW
TREECARE
RED RIVER HELENA SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION

VENDORS SPECIALTIES, INC. |CHEMICAL CO. ADVANCEMENTS |DYNAMICS
Addenda Acknowedged NA NA NA NA
1. ACCORD 2.5 GALLON - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
ACCORD 2.5 GALLON - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. ACEPHATE 1 LB ENVELOPE - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. AQUA STAR/RODEO GALLON - EACH NO BID $18.00 NO BID
AQUA STAR/RODEO GALLON -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID $18.00 NO BID
4. AQUATHOL SUPER K 25LB - EACH $474.50 NO BID NO BID
QUANTITY/COST $474.50 NO BID NO BID
5. ARENA 50 GALLON - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
ARENA 50 GALLON - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
6. BANDIT 30 LB BAG - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
BANDIT 30 LB BAG - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
7. BLUE DYE QUART - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
BLUE DYE QUART - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
8. CELSIUS 10 OZ. - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
CELSIUS 10 OZ. - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
9. CLEARY'S 336 FOR SURFACE FUNGIS 2.5
GALLON - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
CLEARY'S 336 FOR SURFACE FUNGIS 2.5
GALLON - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
10. COHERE 2.5 GALLON - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
COHERE 2.5 GALLON - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
11. CUTRINE(KILLS ALGAE) 2.5 GALLON -
EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID




FORMAL QUOTATION #B-150352 LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET
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RAINBOW
TREECARE
RED RIVER HELENA SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION
VENDORS SPECIALTIES, INC. |[CHEMICAL CO. ADVANCEMENTS |DYNAMICS
CUTRINE(KILLS ALGAE) 2.5 GALLON -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
12. CUTRINE PLUS GR 30 LB - EACH $63.00 NO BID NO BID
CUTRINE PLUS GR 30 LB - QUANTITY/COST $63.00 NO BID NO BID
13. DACNIL 2.5 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
DACNIL 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
DILUENT BLUE OIL 11.25 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
15. DISMISS SOUTH 1 PT - EACH $190.00 $154.00 NO BID
DISMISS SOUTH 1 PT - QUANTITY/COST $190.00 $154.00 NO BID
16. DLZ - 2.5 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
DLZ - 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
17. DRIVE XLR8 .5 GALLON - EACH $68.00 NO BID NO BID
DRIVE XLR8 .5 GALLON - QUANTITY/COST $68.00 NO BID NO BID
18. ELEMENT 3 A 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $108.95 NO BID NO BID
ELEMENT 3 A 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST $108.95 NO BID NO BID
19. ELEMENT 4 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $123.63 NO BID NO BID
ELEMENT 4 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST $123.63 NO BID NO BID
20. ESPLANADE 200 SC 2.5 GALLONS -EACH $2,611.20 NO BID NO BID
ESPLANADE 200 SC 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST $2,611.20 NO BID NO BID
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21. GARLON 4 ULTRA 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $170.00 NO BID NO BID
GARLON 4 ULTRA 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST $170.00 NO BID NO BID
22. GLYPHOSATE 4 PLUS 2.5 GALLONS -
EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLYPHOSATE 4 PLUS 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
23. HABITAT(WETLAND IMAZYPYR) 2.5
GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
HABITAT(WETLAND IMAZYPYR) 2.5
GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
24. HERITAGE 1LB - EACH NO BID $1.55 NO BID
HERITAGE 1 LB - QUANTITY/COST NO BID $1.55 NO BID
25. HONCHO 2.5 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
HONCHO 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
26. HORTICULTURAL OIL 2.5 GALLONS - EAC NO BID NO BID NO BID
HORTICULTURAL OIL 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
27. HYDROTHAL 191 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $197.50 NO BID NO BID
HYDROTHAL 191 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST $197.50 NO BID NO BID
28. IMPEL RED OIL 11.25 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
IMPEL RED OIL 11.25 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
29. INDICATOR -MARKING DYE 1 QUART -
EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
INDICATOR -MARKING DYE 1 QUART -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID




FORMAL QUOTATION #B-150352 LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: JUNE 30, 2015 FOR
BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI ANNUAL PURCHASE OF FUNGUCIDES, HERBICIDES, PESTICIDES, ETC.
RAINBOW
TREECARE
RED RIVER HELENA SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION
VENDORS SPECIALTIES, INC. |[CHEMICAL CO. ADVANCEMENTS |[DYNAMICS

30. INDICATOR -MARKING DYE 2.5

GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
INDICATOR -MARKING DYE 2.5 GALLONS -

QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
31. INDICATOR DYE 1 GALLON - EACH NO BID $14.00 NO BID
QUANTITY/COST NO BID $14.00 NO BID
32. JLB OIL 11.25 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
JLB OIL 11.25 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
33. KAMMO -WET AGENT 2.5 GALLONS -

EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
KAMMO -WET AGENT 2.5 GALLONS -

QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
34. KAMMO - PLUS 2.5 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
KAMMO -PLUS 2.5 GALLONS -

QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
35. KERB 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $747.50 NO BID NO BID
KERB 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST $747.50 NO BID NO BID
36. KROVAR DF 6 LB - EACH $60.00 NO BID NO BID
KROVAR DF 6 LB - QUANTITY/COST $60.00 NO BID NO BID
37. MANOR 2 OZ - EACH $29.00 NO BID NO BID
MANOR 2 OZ - QUANTITY/COST $29.00 NO BID NO BID
38. MERIT WSP 75 1.6 OZ - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
MERIT WSP 75 1.6 OZ - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
39. MILESTONE 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $772.50 NO BID NO BID
MILESTONE 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST $772.50 NO BID NO BID

40. MONUMENT PER BOX (5 X5 GRAM
PACKETS) - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
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MONUMENT PER BOX (5 X 5 GRAM
PACKETS) - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
41. PATHFINDER I1 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $95.00 NO BID NO BID
PATHFINDER 11 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST $95.00 NO BID NO BID
42. POLARIS (UPLAND IMAZPYR) 2.5
GALLONS - EACH $187.50 NO BID NO BID
POLARIS (UPLAND IMAZPYR) 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST $187.50 NO BID NO BID
43. POLARIS (ARSENAL) 1 GALLON - EACH $49.90 NO BID NO BID
POLARIS (ARSENAL) 1 GALLON -
QUANTITY/COST $49.90 NO BID NO BID
44. RANGER PRO 1 GALLON - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
RANGER PRO 1 GALLON - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
45. RANGER PRO 30 GALLON DRUM - EACH $329.70 NO BID NO BID
RANGER PRO 30 GALLON DRUM -
QUANTITY/COST $329.70 NO BID NO BID
46. RANGER PRO (UPLAND GLYPHOSATE) 2.5
GALLON - EACH $29.98 NO BID NO BID
RANGER PRO (UPLAND GLYPHOSATE) 2.5
GALLON - QUANTITY/COST $29.98 NO BID NO BID
47. RAZOR PRO GALLON - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
RAZOR PRO GALLON - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
48. RAZOR PRO 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $29.98 NO BID NO BID
RAZOR PRO 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST $29.98 NO BID NO BID
49. RAZOR PRO 30 GALLON DRUM - EACH $329.70 NO BID NO BID
RAZOR PRO 30 GALLON DRUM -
QUANTITY/COST $329.70 NO BID NO BID
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50. RENOVATE 3 2.5 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
RENOVATE 3 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
51. RESOLUTE 65 WG 5 LB - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
RESOLUTE 65 WG 5 LB - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
52. REVOLVER 87 QZ. - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
REVOLVER 87 QZ. - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
53. REWARD (AQUATIC) 2.5 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
REWARD (AQUATIC) 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
54. RODEO (WETLAND GLYPHOSATE) -
EACH $47.45 NO BID NO BID
RODEO (WETLAND GLYPHOSATE) -
QUANTITY/COST $47.45 NO BID NO BID
55. ROUND UP 1 GALLON - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
ROUND UP 1 GALLON - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
56. ROUND UP PRO 1 GALLON - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
ROUND UP PRO 1 GALLON -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
57. ROUND UP 2.5 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
ROUND UP 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
58. ROUND UP QUIK PRO 6.8 LB - EACH $53.00 NO BID NO BID
ROUND UP QUIK PRO 6.8 LB -
QUANTITY/COST $53.00 NO BID NO BID
59. SAHARA 4 COUNT - 10 LB BAGS -EACH $127.90 NO BID NO BID
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SAHARA 4 COUNT - 10 LB BAGS -
QUANTITY/COST 511.60/CASE(40 LBS) NO BID NO BID
60. SINKER - DRIFT AGENT 1 GALLON -
EACH NO BID $21.98 NO BID
SINKER - DRIFT AGENT 1 GALLON -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID $21.98 NO BID
61. SOLICAM DF 10 LBS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOLICAM DF 10 LBS - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
62. SONAR AS 1 GALLON - EACH NO BID $1,940.41 NO BID
SONAR AS 1 GALLON - QUANTITY/COST NO BID $1,940.41 NO BID
63. SONAR SRP 25 LB BUCKET - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
SONAR SRP 25 LB BUCKET -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
64. SONAR Q 8 LBS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
SONAR Q 8 LBS - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
65. SONAR Q 40 LBS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
SONAR Q40 LBS - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
66. STINNER (INJECTION) - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
STINNER (INJECTION) -QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
67. SURFLAN (PRE-EMERGENT) 2.5 GALLONS
-EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
SURFLAN (PRE-EMERGENT) 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
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68. TAL STAR (CONCENTRATE) 1 GALLON -
EACH NO BID $32.45 NO BID
TAL STAR (CONCENTRATE) 1 GALLON -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID $32.45 NO BID
69. TALSTAR (GRANULAR) 25 LB BAGS -
EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
TALSTAR (GRANULAR) 25 LB BAGS -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
70. TOP CHOICE 50 LB - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOP CHOICE 50 LB - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
71. ULTRA FINE OIL 1 GALLON - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
ULTRAFINE OIL 1 GALLON -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
72. ULTRA FINE OIL 2.5 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
ULTRA FINE OIL 2.5 GALLONS -
QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID $45.20
73. VELPAR 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $187.50 NO BID NO BID
VELPAR 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST $187.50 NO BID NO BID
74. VISTA 1 QUART - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
VISTA 1 QUART - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NOBID
75. VISTA'1 GALLON - EACH NO BID $172.45 NO BID
VISTA 1 GALLON - QUANTITY/COST NO BID $172.45 NO BID
76. VISTA 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $415.88 NO BID NO BID
VISTA 2.5 GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST $415.88 NO BID NO BID
77.WEEDAR/24D - BROADLEAF HERBICIDE
2.5 GALLONS - EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID
WEEDAR/24D - BROADLEAF HERBICIDE 2.5
GALLONS - QUANTITY/COST NO BID NO BID NO BID
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TOBE STARTED WITHIN ___ CALENDAR
DAYS 5 2 TO4 DAYS 10
DELIVER WITH OWN VEHICLE NO YES NO
LOCATION IN LEE COUNTY NO NO NO
MODIFICATIONS YES* YES** YES***
SIGNED YES YES YES NO
LOCAL BISINESS TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER NA NA NA
DBE NO NO NO
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE YES
LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE NO NO NO
AFFIDAVIT PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS NO YES YES
AFFIDAVIT CERTIFICATION IMMIGRATION
LAWS YES YES YES
* RED RIVER SPECIALTIES:NO
MODIFICATIONS WERE MADE TO THE BID
OR SPECIFICATIONS. COMMENTS HAVE
BEEN INSERTED TO CLEARLY SHOW
WHERE SUBSTITUTE ITEMS/SIZES ARE
BEING BID. The "COST (INDIVIDUAL)"
COLUMN SHOWS OUR BID PRICE PER UNIT,
THE "QUANTITY" COLUMN SHOWS THE
MINIMUM ORDER AMOUNT, AND THE
"COST" COLUMN SHOWS THE COST PER
1. (ACCORD) ACCORD XRT Il 1 GALLON -
EACH $19.57
ACCORD XRT 11 2.5 GALLONS - EACH $49.98
2. (ACEPHATE) ACEPHATE 90 PRILL (8 X5
LB) - PER LB $5.95

ACEPHATE) ACEPHATE 90 PRILL (8 X5LB) -
PER 5 LBS

$29.75
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3. (AQUA STAR /RODEO) AQUANEAT -1

GALLON $15.00
(AQUA STAR /RODEO) AQUANEAT - 2.5

GALLONS $37.50
9. (CLEARY'S 3336 FOR SURFACE FUNGIS)

TM 4.5-1GALLON $48.00
(CLEARY'S 3336 FOR SURFACE FUNGIS) TM

45-25GALLON $120.00
11. (CUTRINE (KILLS ALGAE) CUTRINE PLUS

- GALLON $15.98
(CUTRINE (KILLS ALGAE) CUTRINE PLUS -

2.5 GALLONS $39.95
14. (DILUENT BLUE OIL) ELITE PREMIER

BLUE -1 GALLON $12.33

(DILUENT BLUE OIL) ELITE PREMIER BLUE -
15 GALLON DRUM FILLED TO 11.25

GALLONS $138.71
16. (DLZ) ELITE VELOCITY -1 GALLON $30.60
(DLZ) ELITE VELOCITY - 2.5 GALLONS $76.50
22. (GLYPHOSATE 4 PLUS) ALECTO 41S-1

GALLON $12.20
(GLYPHOSATE 4 PLUS) ALECTO 41S-25

GALLONS $30.50
23. (HABITAT (WETLAND IMAZYPYR)

ARSENAL HERBICIDE - 1 GALLON $49.90
(HABITAT (WETLAND IMAZYPYR) ARSENAL

HERBICIDE - 2.5 GALLONS $124.75

28. (IMPEL RED OIL) ELITE PREMIER RED - 1
GALLON $12.33
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(IMPEL RED OIL) ELITE PREMIER RED - 15

GALLON DRUM FILLED TO 11.25 GALLONS $138.71
29. (INDICATOR - MARKING DYE) RRSI IVM

MARKING DYE - QUART $8.00
30. (INDICATOR - MARKING DYE) RRSI IVM

MARKING DYE - 2.5 GALLONS $40.00
(INDICATOR - MARKING DYE) RRSI IVM

MARKING DYE - 1 GALLON $16.00
31. (INDICATOR DYE) RRSI IVM MARKING

DYE -1 GALLON $17.00
32.(JLB OIL) JLB OIL PLUS - 1 GALLON $12.29
JLB OIL) JLB OIL PLUS - 15 GALLON DRUM

FILLED TO 11.25 GALLONS $138.26
33. (KAMMO - WET AGENT) ELITE

PLATINUM - 1 GALLON $16.00
(KAMMO - WET AGENT) ELITE PLATINUM -

2.5 GALLONS $40.00
34. (KAMMO PLUS) ELITE PLATINUM - 1

GALLON $16.00
(KAMMO PLUS) ELITE PLATINUM - 2.5

GALLONS $40.00
39. (MERIT WSP 75) IMIDACLOPRID 75 WSP

PER OZ $2.98
(MERIT WSP 75) IMIDACLOPRID 75 WSP 1.6

oz $4.77
55. (REWARD (AQUATIC) DIQUAT SPC2L -1

GALLON $45.00
(REWARD (AQUATIC) DIQUAT SPC2L-25

GALLONS $112.50

59. (ROUND UP) ROUND UP PRO
CONCENTRATE - 1 GALLON

$18.00
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(ROUND UP) ROUND UP PRO CONCENTRATE

- 2.5 GALLONS $45.00
62. (SINKER - DRIFT AGENT) ELITE SECURE

ULTRA -1 GALLON $28.00
70. (TAL STAR (CONCENTRATE) BIFEN I/T -1

GALLON $31.00
71.. (TAL STAR (GRANULAR) BIFEN L/P - PER

LB $0.64
(TAL STAR (GRANULAR) BIFEN L/P - PER 25

LB BAG $16.00
74. (ULTRA FINE OIL) ELITE PACER ULTRA -

PER GALLON $14.00
(ULTRA FINE OIL) ELITE PACER ULTRA-25

GALLONS $35.00
79. (WEEDAR/24D - BROADLEAF HERBICIDE)

WEEDESTROY AM-40 - PER GALLON $14.98
(WEEDAR/24D - BROADLEAF HERBICIDE)

WEEDESTROY AM-40 - 2.5 GALLONS $37.45

** HELENA CHEMICAL CO.: #4 AQUATHOL
SUPER KIS IN 20 LB CONTAINER; #5 ARENA
ISIN A 40 OZ BOTTLE; #7 SPEC SPRAY
INDICATOR; #25 OFFERING RANGER PRO;
#26 OFFERING OMNI SUPREME OIL; #59
OFFERING ROUND UP CUSTOM AS WELL AS
THE FOLLOWING:

1. ACCORD - 2.5 GALLONS $18.00/GALLON
4. AQUATHOL SUPER K - 25 LBS $16.50/LB
$218.70/BOTTLE(40

5. ARENA 50 - GALLON 0Z7)
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7. BLUE DYE - QUART $14.00/GALLON
8. CELSIUS - 10 0Z $93.40/BOTTLE
9. CLEARY'S 3336 FOR SURFACE FUNGIS -25
GALLONS $74.50/GALLON
10. COHERE - 2.5 GALLONS $36.95/GALLON
11. CUTRINE (KILLS ALGAE) - 2.5 GALLONS $15.50/GALLON
12. CUTRINE PLUS GR - 30 LBS $17.41/LB
13. DACNIL 2N - 2.5 GALLONS $48.00/GALLON
16. DLZ - 2.5 GALLONS $30.00/GALLON
17.DRIVE XLR8 - .5 GALLON $56.73/GALLON
18. ELEMENT 3 A - 2.5 GALLONS $34.14/GALLON
19. ELEMENT 4 - 2.5 GALLONS $42.14/GALLON
20. ESPLANADE 200 SC - 2.5 GALLONS $1044.48/GALLON
21. GARLON 4 ULTRA - 2.5 GALLONS $77.50/GALLON
22 GLYPHOSATE 4 PLUS (RANGER PRO) - 25
GALLONS $11.25/GALLON
23 HABTTAT (WETLAND IMAZYPYR) - 25
GALLONS $95.00/GALLON
25. HONCHO - 2.5 GALLONS $11.25/GALLON
26. HORTICULTURAL OIL - 2.5 GALLONS $11.00/GALLON
27. HYDROTHAL 191 - 2.5 GALLONS $63.20/GALLON
28. IMPEL RED OIL - 11.25 GALLONS $7.05/GALLON
32. JLB OIL - 11.25 GALLONS $10.76/GALLON




FORMAL QUOTATION #B-150352

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: JUNE 30, 2015

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

ANNUAL PURCHASE OF FUNGUCIDES, HERBICIDES, PESTICIDES, ETC.

RAINBOW
TREECARE
RED RIVER HELENA SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION
VENDORS SPECIALTIES, INC. |CHEMICAL CO.  |ADVANCEMENTS |DYNAMICS
34. KAMMO PLUS - 2.5 GALLON $22.75/GALLON
35. KERB - 2.5 GALLON $258.30/GALLON
36. KROVAR DF - 6 LBS $13.15/LB
37. MANOR - 2 0ZS $18.90/0Z
38. MERIT WSP 75 - 1.6 OZS $58.62/BOTTLE
39. MILESTONE - 2.5 GALLONS $309.00/GALLON
41. PATHFINDER 11 - 2.5 GALLONS $42.00/GALLON
47 POLARIS (UPLAND IMAZPYR) - 2.5
GALLONS $52.45/GALLON
48. RANGER PRO - 2.5 GALLONS $13.45 GALLON
49. RANGER PRO - 30 GALLON DRUM $13.05 GALLON
50. RENOVATE 3 - 2.5 GALLONS $99.74/GALLON
51. RESOLUTE 65 WG - 5 LBS $8.93/LB
52. REVOLVER - 87 0ZS $540.00/BOTTLE
53. REWARD (AQUATIC) - 2.5 GALLONS $79.00/GALLON
54. RODEO (WETLAND GLYPHOSATE) - 2.5
GALLON $17.85 GALLON
57. ROUND UP - 2.5 GALLONS $17.75 GALLON
58. ROUND UP QUIK PRO $62.90/0Z
59. SAHARA - (4 COUNT - 10 LB BAGS) $10.25/LB
61. SOLICAM DF 10 LBS $25.75/LB
63. SONAR SRP 25 LB BUCKET $1229.60 PAIL
67. SURFLAN (PRE-EMERGENT) 2.5 GALLONS $40.55/GALLON
69. TALSTAR (GRANULAR) 25L B BAGS $.65 PER LB




FORMAL QUOTATION #B-150352

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: JUNE 30, 2015

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

ANNUAL PURCHASE OF FUNGUCIDES, HERBICIDES, PESTICIDES, ETC.

RAINBOW
TREECARE
RED RIVER HELENA SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION

VENDORS SPECIALTIES, INC. |[CHEMICAL CO. ADVANCEMENTS |[DYNAMICS
70. TOP CHOICE 50 LB $2.75 PER LB
72.ULTRA FINE OIL 2.5 GALLONS $11.00/GALLON
73. VELPAR 2.5 GALLONS $86.45/GALLON
76. VISTA 2.5 GALLONS $172.45/GALLON
77. WEEDAR/24D - BROADLEAF HERBICIDE
2.5 GALLONS $18.00/GALLON

***RAINBOW TREECARE SCIENTIFIC
ADVANCEMENTS: ACEPHATE IS
AVAILABLE IN TWO FORM; LEPITECT OR
ORTHENE. COHERE IS PRICED AS AUDIBLE;
DACNIL IS PRICED AS DOCKET WS;
GARLON 4 ULTRA IS PRICED AS SIGHTLINE;
HORICULTURE OIL IS PRICED AS RBA
BRAND; MERIT IS PRICED AS XYTECT; TEL
STAR IS PRICED AS UPSTAR GOLD.

2. ACEPHATE - AVAILABLE IN TWO FORMS;
LEPITECT OR ORTHENE

$56.90 OR $17.20

$29.90/GALLON

8+

=$24.00/GALLON=

10. COHERE IS PRICED AS AUDIBLE $192.00 +SHIP

$448.50

8+ =3$90.00= $720.00

13. DACNIL IS PRICED AS DOCKET WS + SHIP

21. GARLON 4 ULTRA IS PRICED AS

SIGHTLINE $44.84
26. HORTICULTURAL OIL ISPRICED AS RBA

BRAND $45.20

$175.00/22PK 3+

38. MERIT WSP 75 IS PRICED AS XYTECT

$94.00/22=$282.00 +
SHIP




FORMAL QUOTATION #B-150352 LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: JUNE 30, 2015 FOR
BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI ANNUAL PURCHASE OF FUNGUCIDES, HERBICIDES, PESTICIDES, ETC.
RAINBOW
TREECARE
RED RIVER HELENA SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION
VENDORS SPECIALTIES, INC. |[CHEMICAL CO. ADVANCEMENTS |[DYNAMICS

$62.62 EACH 8+
68. TAL STAR (CONCENTRATE) IS PRICED AS $46.00 = $368.00 +
UPSTAR GOLD SHIP

ALL ORDERS WILL BE BILLED A SHIPPING
CHARGE BASED ON THE TOTAL OF THE

SALES ORDER:

$0 - $50.99 $9.99
$51 - $101.99 $12.89
$101 - $150.99 $15.55
$151 - $250.99 $17.60
$251 - $500.99 $19.50
$501 - $750.99 $24.25
$751 - $1,000.99 $29.37
$1,001 - $1500.99 $37.10
$1,501 - $2,000.99 $43.50
$2,001 - $2,249.99 $50.00
ALL ORDERS OVER $2250 ARE NO CHARGE
FOR SHIPPING.

POSTING TIME/DATE

FROM: /

UNTIL: /

BY:




