

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA
PROPOSAL QUOTE FORM
FOR

ANNUAL PURCHASE OF FUNGUCIDES, HERBICIDES, PESTICIDES, ETC.

DATE SUBMITTED: 6/26/15

VENDOR NAME: Helena Chemical Co

TO: The Board of County Commissioners
Lee County
Fort Myers, Florida

Having carefully examined the "General Conditions", and the "Detailed Specifications", all of which are contained herein, the Undersigned proposes to furnish the following which meet these specifications:

NOTE REQUIREMENT: IT IS THE SOLE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE VENDOR TO CHECK LEE COUNTY PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT WEB SITE FOR ANY PROJECT ADDENDA ISSUED FOR THIS PROJECT. THE COUNTY WILL POST ADDENDA TO THIS WEB PAGE, BUT WILL NOT NOTIFY.

The undersigned acknowledges receipt of Addenda numbers: _____

PLEASE GIVE US A PRICE ON THE FOLLOWING:

If your firm can offer quantity price breaks to Lee County on any items listed, specify quantity breaks and pricing under the specified column.

NO.	ITEM	SIZE	COST (INDIVIDUAL)	QUANTITY	COST
1.	ACCORD	2.5 GALLON	18.00/gal	•	18.00 1 gallon
2.	ACEPHATE	1 POUND ENVELOPES	No Bid	—	—
3.	AQUA STAF/RODEC	GALLON	18.00/gal		18.00/gallon
4.	AQUATHOL SUPER K	25 LB	16.50/lb	20 lb.	16.50 1 pound
5.	ARENA 50	GALLON	218.70/bottle	40 gals	218.70 1 bottle
6.	BANDIT	30 LB BAG	No Bid	—	—
7.	BLUE DYE	QUART	14.00/gal		14.00 1 gallon
8.	CELSIUS	10 OZ	93.40/bottle		93.40 1 bottle
9.	CLEARY'S 3336 FOR SURFACE FUNGIS	2.5 GALLON	74.50/gal		74.50/gallon
10.	COHERE	2.5 GALLONS	30.95/gal		30.95 1 gallon
11.	CUTRINE (KILLS ALGAE)	2.5 GALLONS	15.50/gal		15.50 1 gallon
12.	CUTRINE PLUS GR	30 LB	1.74/lb		1.74 1 pound
13.	DACNIL 2N	2.5 GALLONS	48.00/gal		48.00 1 gallon
14.	DILUENT BLUE OIL	11.25 GALLONS	No Bid	—	—
15.	DISMISS SOUTH	1 PT	154.00/pt		154.00 1 pt

Helena Chemical Co

16.	DLZ	2.5 GALLONS	30.00/gal		30.00/gallon
17.	DRIVE XLR8	.5 GALLON	56.73/gal		56.73/gallon
18.	ELEMENT 3 A	2.5 GALLONS	34.14/gal		34.14/gallon
19.	ELEMENT 4	2.5 GALLONS	42.14/gal		42.14/gallon
20.	ESPLANADE 200 SC	2.5 GALLONS	1044.48/gal		1044.48/gallon
21.	GARLON 4 ULTRA	2.5 GALLONS	77.50/gal		77.50/gallon
22.	GLYPHOSATE 4 PLUS	2.5 GALLONS	11.25/gal	Rings	11.25/gallon
23.	HABITAT (WETLAND IMAZYPYR)	2.5 GALLONS	95.00/gal		95.00/gallon
24.	HERITAGE	1 LB	1.55/lb		1.55/lb
25.	HONCHO	2.5 GALLONS	11.25/gal		11.25/gallon
26.	HORTICULTURAL OIL	2.5 GALLONS	11.00/gal		11.00/gallon
27.	HYDROTHAL 191	2.5 GALLONS	63.20/gal		63.20/gal
28.	IMPEL RED OIL	11.25 GALLONS	7.05/gal		7.05/gallon
29.	INDICATOR - MARKING DYE	1 QUART	NO Bid	-	-
30.	INDICATOR (MARKING DYE)	2.5 GALLONS	NO Bid	-	-
31.	INDICATOR DYE	1 GALLONS	14.00/gal		14.00/gal
32.	JLB OIL	11.25 GALLONS	10.76/gal		10.76/gal
33.	KAMMO - WET AGENT	2.5 GALLONS	NO Bid	-	-
34.	KAMMO PLUS	2.5 GALLONS	22.75/gal		22.75/gal
35.	KERB	2.5 GALLONS	258.30/gal		258.30/gal
36.	KROVAR DF	6 LB	13.15/lb		13.15/lb
37.	MANOR	2 OZ	18.90/lb		18.90/lb
38.	MANOR	2 OZ	18.90/lb		18.90/lb
39.	MERIT WSP 75	1.6 OZ	58.62/bottle		58.62/bottle
40.	MILESTONE	2.5 GALLONS	309.00/gal		309.00/gal
41.	MONUMENT	PER BOX (5 X 5 GRAM PACKETS)			
42.					
43.	PATHFINDER II	2.5 GALLONS	42.00/gal		42.00/gal
44.	POLARIS (UPLAND IMAZPYR)	2.5 GALLONS	52.45/gal		52.45/gal
45.	POLARIS (ARSENAL)	1 GALLON	NO Bid	=	=
46.	RANGER PRO	1 GALLON	NO Bid	=	=
47.	RANGER PRO	30 GALLONS DRUM	11.00/gal		11.00/gal
48.	RANGER PRO (UPLAND GLYPHOSATE)	2.5 GALLONS	11.25/gal		11.25/gal
49.	RAZOR PRO	GALLON	NO Bid	-	-
50.	RAZOR PRO	2.5 GALLONS	13.45/gal		13.45/gal
51.	RAZOR PRO	30 GALLON DRUM	13.05/gal		13.05/gal
52.	RENOVATE 3	2.5 GALLONS	99.74/gal		99.74/gal
53.	RESOLUTE 65 WG	5 LB	8.93/lb		8.93/lb

*
*

Helena Chemical Co

54.	REVOLVER	87 OZ.	540.00/bottle	540.00/bottle
55.	REWARD (AQUATIC)	2.5 GALLONS	78.00/gal	78.00/gal
56.	RODEO (WETLAND GLYPHOSATE)	2.5 GALLONS	17.85/gal	17.85/gal
57.	ROUND UP	1 GALLON	No bid	-
58.	ROUND UP PRO	1 GALLON	No bid	-
59.	ROUND UP	2.5 GALLONS	17.75/gal	17.75/gal
60.	ROUNDUP QUIK PRO	6.8 LB	62.90/gal	62.90/gal
61.	SAHARA	4 COUNT - 10 LB BAGS	10.25/lb	10.25/lb
62.	SINKER - DRIFT AGENT	1 GALLON	21.98/gal	21.98/gal
63.	SOLICAM DF	10 LBS	25.75/lb	25.75/lb
64.	SONAR AS	1 GALLON	1940.41/gal	1940.41/gal
65.	SONAR SRP	25 LB BUCKET	1229.60/gal	1229.60/gal
66.	SONAR Q	8 LBS	No bid	-
67.	SONAR Q	40 LBS	1176.00/gal	1176.00/gal
68.	STINNER (INJECTION)	EACH	No bid	-
69.	SURFLAN (PRE-EMERGENT)	2.5 GALLONS	40.55/gal	40.55/gal
70.	TAL STAR (CONCENTRATE)	1 GALLON	32.45/gal	32.45/gal
71.	TAL STAR (GRANULAR)	25 POUND BAGS	.65/lb	.65/lb
72.	TOP CHOICE	50 LB	2.75/lb	2.75/lb
73.	ULTRA FINE OIL	1 GALLON	No bid	-
74.	ULTRA FINE OIL	2.5 GALLONS	11.00/gal	11.00/gal
75.	VELPAR	2.5 GALLONS	86.45/gal	86.45/gal
76.	VISTA	1 QUART	No bid	-
77.	VISTA	1 GALLON	No bid	-
78.	VISTA	2.5 GALLONS	172.45/gal	172.45/gal
79.	WEEDAR/24D - BROADLEAF HERBICIDE	2.5 GALLONS	18.00/gal	18.00/gal

Helena Chemical Co

TO BE STARTED WITHIN 2-4 CALENDAR DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF AWARD AND PURCHASE ORDER.

WILL YOU DELIVER WITH YOUR OWN VEHICLE AS OPPOSED TO COMMON CARRIER?
 YES NO

Does your firm have a location/office/facility in Lee County?
 YES NO

Address:

Bidders should carefully read all the terms and conditions of the specifications. Any representation of deviation or modification to the bid may be grounds to reject the

Are there any modifications to the bid or specifications:

YES X NO _____

Failure to clearly identify any modifications in the space below or on a separate page may be grounds for the bidder being declared nonresponsive or to have the award of the bid rescinded by the County.

MODIFICATIONS:

- # 4 Aquatrol Super K is in 20lb container
- # 5 Arena is in 40oz bottle
- # 7 Spec Spray Indicator
- # 25 offering Ranger Pro
- # 26 offering Omni Supreme air
- # 57 offering Roundup Custom

Bidder shall submit his/her bid on the County's Proposal Quote Form, including the firm name and authorized signature. Any blank spaces on the Proposal Quote Form, qualifying notes or exceptions, counter offers, lack of required submittals, or signatures, on County's Form may result in the Bidder/Bid being declared non-responsive by the County.

ANTI-COLLUSION STATEMENT

THE BELOW SIGNED BIDDER HAS NOT DIVULGED TO, DISCUSSED OR COMPARED HIS BID WITH OTHER BIDDERS AND HAS NOT COLLUDED WITH ANY OTHER BIDDER OR PARTIES TO A BID WHATSOEVER. NOTE: NO PREMIUMS, REBATES OR GRATUITIES TO ANY EMPLOYEE OR AGENT ARE PERMITTED EITHER WITH, PRIOR TO, OR AFTER ANY DELIVERY OF MATERIALS. ANY SUCH VIOLATION WILL RESULT IN THE CANCELLATION AND/OR RETURN OF MATERIAL (AS APPLICABLE).

FIRM NAME Helena Chemical Co

BY (Printed): Tim McDuffie

BY (Signature): Tim McDuffie

TITLE: Account Manager

FEDERAL ID # OR S.S. # 71-0293688

ADDRESS: P.O. Box 1758

Dade City, FL 33526

PHONE NO.: (352) 521-3538

FAX NO.: (352) 521-2083

CELLULAR PHONE/PAGER NO.: (352) 206-5087

DUNS #: 00-703-6759

LEE COUNTY LOCAL BUSINESS TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER:

E-MAIL ADDRESS: hurd@m@helenachemical.com

DISADVANTAGED BUSINESS ENTERPRISE (DBE): _____ Yes No