Lee County Procurement Management
BID TABULATION FORM - B220065LLP - Equipment Rental, Countywide

AHERN RENTALS, INC ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIP! HERC RENTAL, INC. H&E EQUIPMENT SERVICES SUNBELT RENTALS, INC.

Item Equipment Description/Specifications Min HP D‘"‘"‘Kjﬁ:"‘"' Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | Weekiy Rental Rate | Montily Rental Rate | Deivery Fee | Pickup Fee | ""';V‘z:""" Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | ""’;V(z:""” Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | Daily Rental Rate W"’"l:{‘ :;"’"" M"""g’f"""" Delivery Fee Pick-up Fee | Daily Rental Rate W""‘,’;‘;z""‘"’ & "”"2’:::"’"" Delivery Fee Pick-up Fee

Rubber Tire Skid Steer 25HP [$  247.00 | $ 678.00 | $ 1,652.00 [$ 12000 [$ 12000 f § - |8 - s - |8 - |s 23000 |8 561.00 | S 132600 |$ 10000 [$  100.00 | §  197.60 | § 561.60 | $ 1,729.52 |$ 15000 [$  150.00 | § - |8 - |8 - |8 - s - s 233.00 | $ 572.00 |§  1,324.00 | S 125.00 | $ 125.00
101

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Bobeat $70, Mustang 2012 NO BID MTI00 or equivalent BOBCAT S70 or equivalent NO BID Bobeat s 70
. Rubber Tire Skid Steer | 7‘5‘15_I'P 280.00 | $ 829.00 | § 1,787.00 |$ 120.00 | S 12000 [ $ - | - |$ - |$ - |s 18800 |$ 514.00 | s 1,256.00 | S 100.00 | S 10000 [$ 20488 |s 513.76 | $ 132600 |$  150.00 |$ 15000 |8 350.00 |$ 775.00 |$ 1,895.00 |$ 100.00 |$ 100.00 [$  242.00 |$ 585.00 1,353.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: John Deere 318, Kubota SSV65 NO BID CASE SVI185 or equivalent BOBCAT S570 or equivalent Gehl R220 Bobeat s 550

Skid Steer Attachment: Hydraulic | - s 79.00 |s 241.00 | $ 521.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 | $ - - |$ - |$ - |s 189.00 |$ 404.00 | $ 987.00 | $  100.00 | $  100.00 [ $ - |$ - |$ - |8 - |$ - s - - |8 - |$ - |$ - s 95.00 |$ 250.00 500.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
1.03

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Lowe A-220, Case S1975H200 NO BID Various (except Planers) NO BID Varies by Type/Call for pricing

Skid Steer Attachment: Non-Hydraulic | - |$  219.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 1,563.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 f S - - |$ - |$ - |s 5100 |s 110.00 | $ 269.00 [$  50.00 | $ 50.00 | $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - s 75.00 |$ 150.00 450.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
1.04

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Arrowhead S40 NO BID Forks NO BID Varies by Type/Call for pricing

Track Loader (Walk Behind) | E - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - ls 495.00| 1,485.00 |$ 500.00 | $ 50000 [ $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 24732 |$ 741.52 | $ 1,729.52 |$ 150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ - |$ - |8 - |$ - |$ B 204.00 |s 518.00 | 1,295.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
1.05

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID Toro TX525 NO BID TORO TX525 or equivalent NO BID Toro 22321

Compact Track Loader | 41HP [$ 41500 | $  1,081.00 | s 2,571.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 s 1,085.00| 3,255.00 |$ 500.00 | S 50000 | $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 33500 |$ 964.00 |$ 2.282.00 |$ 100.00 |$ 100.00 [$  352.00 |s $91.00 2,190.00 |$ 150.00 |$ 150.00
1.06

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Kubota SLV75, John Deere 323D Takeuchi TL6 NO BID NO BID Takeuchi TL6 Bobcat T550

Compact Track Loader | 74HP |§  443.00 | $  1,120.00 | s 2,660.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 | $ 1,1xs,oo| 3,555.00 |$ 500.00 | $ 50000 [$ 36800 |$ 955.00 | $ 2,100.00 [$  100.00 | $ 10000 [$  319.28 |s 825.76 | s 2,132.00 (S 150.00 |$ 15000 |8 344.00 |$ 979.00 |$ 2,302.00 |$ 100.00 |$ 100.00 [$  447.00 |$ 1.211.00 | 2,929.00 |$ 150.00 |$ 150.00
1.07

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Kubota SKV75, John Deere 319E Takeuchi TL CASE TR310 or equivalent BOBCAT T590 or equivalent Takeuchi TL8 Bobeat T630

Compact Track Loader | 78HP | $  454.00 | $  1232.00 | s 2,772.00 | $ 12000 | $ 12000 S 131000 | $ 3,930.00 |$ 500.00 | $ 50000 [$  460.00 |$ 1,175.00 | $ 2,600.00 [$  100.00 | S 10000 [$ 41496 |s 1,089.92 | $ 2,600.00 [$  150.00 |$ 15000 |§  350.00 | $  1,126.00 |s 2,465.00 | $ 100.00 |$ 100.00 [$  499.00 |$ 1,404.00 | $ 321800 |$ 150.00 | $ 150.00
1.08

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Kubota SVL 90, Kubota SVL95 Takeuchi TL10 CASE TV370 or equivalent BOBCAT T740 or equivalent Takeuchi TL10 Bobcat T595

Compact Loader Attachments | - s 7900 | $ 24100 | $ 521.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 s - | - s - |$ - s 18900 |$ 404.00 | $ 987.00 | 100.00 | s 10000 | $ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - s - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - s 95.00 |s 225.00 | 400.00 |$ 150.00 |$ 150.00
1.09

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Star Industries 175-66 Please call for quote Various (except Planers) NO BID Varies by Type/Call for pricing

Front End Wheel Loader w/ up to 7-Cubic Yard Bucket | - $ - | $ - |8 - | $ - | $ - s 3,800.00 | 11,400.00 | $  600.00 | $  600.00 S 882.00 | s 2,601.00 | $ 5,508.00 | $  250.00 | $ 25000 S - | $ - | $ - | $ - | $ - s - | $ - |3 - | $ - | $ - s - | $ - | - | $ - | $ -
110

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID Volvo L150H CASE (up to 4cuyd) or equal NO BID NO BID NO BID

Front End Crawler Loader w/ up to 4-Cubic Yard Bucket | - |s  779.00 | $ 2,464.00 | $ 6,714.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 f S - | - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 85488 |$ 2,163.20 | $ 6,604.00 | $  275.00 |$ 275.00 | $ - - |$ - |$ - |$ - |8 625.00 |s 2,150.00 | 5,995.00 |$ 175.00 |$ 175.00
111

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: John Deere 644K, Case 821E NO BID NO BID VOLVO L110H or equivalent NO BID John Deere 644P

Mini Excavator - Minimum 2 TON | - |s 28000 | $ 818.00 | s 1,686.00 | $ 12000 | S 12000 | § 420.00| 1,250.00 |$ 600.00 | $ 60000 [s  214.00 |$ 639.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $  100.00 | S 10000 [$  264.16 |$ 724.88 | $ 1,508.00 | $  150.00 |$ 15000 |8 267.00 | $ 59000 |$ 1,652.00 | $ 100.00 |$ 100.00 [$  223.00 |$ 608.00 | 1,122.00 |$ 125.00 | $ 125.00
112

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Kubota U17 Takeuchi TB216 CASE CX26 or equivalent TAKEUCHI TB216R or equivalent Yanmar Viol 7 Bobcat 418

Mini Excavator - Minimum 3.5 TON | - s 33600 | $ 902.00 | $ 191000 | $ 120,00 | $ 12000 s 670.00 | 2,000.00 |$ 600.00 | $ 60000 [$ 25500 |$ 730.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $  100.00 | s 10000 [$  289.12 |$ 786.24 | $ 1,690.00 | $  150.00 |$ 15000 |$  284.00 | $ 64700 |$ 1,685.00 | $ 100.00 |$ 10000 | $  242.00 |s 612.00 | 1,460.00 |$ 125.00 | $ 125.00
113

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Kubota KX033, Kubota KX91 Takeuchi TB240 CASE CX37 or equivalent BOBCAT E351 or equivalent Yanmar Vio3s Bobeat E26

Mini Excavator - Minimum 5-6 TON | - |s 36400 | $ 1,064.00 | $ 2,240.00 | $  120.00 | $ 12000 | § 750.00| 2,250.00 |$ 600.00 | $  600.00 | $  383.00 |$ 1,010.00 | $ 1,995.00 | S 100.00 | $ 10000 | 32032 |$ 895.44 | $ 2,106.00 |$ 150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 412.00 | $ 996.00 |$ 2,408.00 | $ 100.00 |$ 100.00 | $ 371.00 |$ 977.00 2,223.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 150.00
114

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Kubota KX040 Takeuchi TB250 CASE CX57 or equivalent BOBCAT ES0 or equivalent Yanmar Vio50 Bobeat E45

Compact Excavtor - 8-9 TON (14'-15") | - |s 42000 |s 1,148.00 | s 2,481.00 | S  120.00 | $ 12000 | $ 1,250.00| 3,750.00 |$ 600.00 | $ 60000 | $  460.00 |$ 1,281.00 | $ 2,800.00 [$  125.00 | $ 12500 | S 468.00 |$ 1,196.00 | $ 3,130.40 |$ 150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 538.00 |$ 1,337.00 |$ 3,173.00 |$ 120.00 |$ 12000 | $ 451.00 |$ 1,314.00 3,028.00 |$ 175.00 |$ 175.00
115

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Kubota KX057, John Deere 60G Takeuchi TB290 CASE CX80 or equivalent BOBCAT ES5 or equivalent Yanmar Vio80 Bobeat E85

Mini Excavator - 12000 13999 Ibs DSL ROPS | - $  516.00 | $ 1,344.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $  120.00 | $ 12000 S 795.00 | $ 2,375.00 |$ 600.00 | $  600.00 [$ 383.00 |$ 1,010.00 | $ 1,995.00 [ $  100.00 | $  100.00 | $  400.40 |$ 1,014.00 | $ 2,501.20 | $  150.00 |$ 150.00 | § 572.00 | $  1,595.00 |$ 3,737.00 | $ 120.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 560.00 |$ 1,585.00 | $  2,760.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 150.00
116

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Kubota KX080 Takeuchi TB260 CASE CXS57 or equivalent TAKEUCHI TB260R or equivalent Yanmar SV100 John Deere 60G

Mini Excavator - 14000 - 19000 Ibs DSL CAB | - |s 80100 | $ 201100 | $ 4,648.00 | $  120.00 | $ 12000 | $ 1,250.00 | 3,750.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 60000 | $  460.00 | $ 1,281.00 | $ 2,800.00 [$  125.00 | $ 12500 | S  468.00 | S 1,196.00 | $ 3,13040 [ $  150.00 | $ 15000 |'$ 700.00 | $  1,675.00 | $  4763.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 560.00 | S 1,585.00 2,760.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 150.00
117

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: John Deere 130G Takeuchi TB290 CASE CX80 or equivalent BOBCAT ESS or equivalent Linkbelt 145x4

Mini Excavator Attachments | - |s 21900 | $ 863.00 | $ 2,072.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 | $ - | - |8 - |$ - |s 18400 |$ 404.00 | $ 987.00 | $  100.00 | $  100.00 [ $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |8 - |$ - |$ - s 75.00 |s 200.00 500.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
118

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Please call for quote Breakers or Mini's NO BID Varies by Type/Call for pricing

Excavator - Steel Track - Minimum 14 TON | - s 200 | $ 203100 | s 4,760.00 | $ 12000 | $ 12000 S 167000 | 5,000.00 | 600.00 | $ 60000 [$  678.00 |$ 1,836.00 | 3 3,995.00 (S 250.00 | s 25000 s 699.92 |s 1,687.92 | $ 457600 [$  200.00 |$ 20000 |$  700.00 | $  1673.00 S 4763.00 | $ 150.00 |$ 15000 [$  885.00 |$ 2,430.00 | 5,195.00 |$ 175.00 | $ 175.00
119

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: John Deere 135G Volvo ECI40E CASE CX145SR or equivalent VOLVO ECI40EL or equivalent John Deere 130LC Takeuchi TB1140

Excavator - Steel Track - Minimum 25 TON | - s 90200 | $  2.352.00 | s 5,259.00 | $ 12000 | $ 12000 |$ 247000 | 7.400.00 |$ 600.00 | S 60000 [s  995.00 |$ 2,570.00 | $ 5.400.00 [$  250.00 | $ 25000 [$ 88712 |$ 2,145.52 | $ 572000 [$  200.00 |$ 20000 |$  924.00 |s 2,023.00 |$ 6,245.00 | $ 175.00 |$ 175.00 [$  900.00 |$ 3,090.00 | 7.875.00 |$ 175.00 | $ 175.00
120

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Hitachi 160LC, John Deere 160GLC Volvo EC220E CASE CX250 or equivalent VOLVO EC220EL or equivalent John Deere 210LC Licbherr R 926

Excavator - Steel Track - Minimum 30 TON | - s 95200 |s 2,688.00 | s 6,104.00 | $  120.00 | $ 12000 S 2,900.00 | 8,700.00 |$ 600.00 | $ 60000 | $ 1,122.00 |$ 2,791.00 | $ 6.400.00 [ $  300.00 | $ 30000 [$ - |$ - | $ - |8 - |$ - s 143300 | $  3,069.00 |$ 8,450.00 | $ 550.00 |$ 550.00 [$ 143000 |$  3,375.00 8,119.00 |$ 225.00 | $ 225.00
121

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: John Deere 210 Volvo EC250E CASE CX300 or equivalent NO BID John Deere 300LC John Deere 300 GLC

Excavator - Steel Track - Minimum 35 TON | - |s  980.00 |s 2,828.00 | s 6,222.00 | $  120.00 | $ 12000 S 3,070.00 | 9.200.00 |$ 600.00 | $ 60000 | $ 1,321.00 |$ 3,121.00 | $ 8,078.00 [$  300.00 | $ 30000 | $ 1.461.20 |$ 3,653.52 | $ 8,840.00 | $  475.00 |$ 47500 |8 1,562.00 | $  3,269.00 |$ 9,317.00 | $ 550.00 |$ 55000 | $  1.430.00 [$  3.430.00 9.450.00 |$ 225.00 | $ 225.00
122

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: XCMG XE210CU Volvo EC300E CASE CX350 or equivalent VOLVO EC350EL or equivalent John Deere 350LC Licbherr R936

Excavator Attachments | $ 30800 | $ 1,143.00 | s 2,576.00 | $ 12000 | $ 12000 | § - | - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - | $ - s - |$ - s - |$ - | $ - s - |$ - s - | $ - s - | $ - |$ - |s  100.00 |s 225.00 | 400.00 |$ 125.00 | $ 125.00
123

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Please call for quote NO BID NO BID Varies by Type/Call for pricing




Lee County Procurement Management

BID TABULATION FORM - B220065LLP - Equipment Rental, Countywide

AHERN RENTALS, INC ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIP! EQUIPMENT SHARE HERC RENTAL, INC. H&E EQUIPMENT SERVICES SUNBELT RENTALS, INC.

Item Equipment Description/Specifications Min HP D"i"‘l(jﬁ:"‘"' Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | ™ ""';V‘z:""" Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | 2 ""';z:""" Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | Daily Rental Rate W"”‘z‘ :’”’"" ’""""l'z’f""‘"l Delivery Fee Pick-up Fee | Daily Rental Rate W""‘I'E‘;::""‘"' & "”"2‘:::"’"" Delivery Fee Pick-up Fee

Backhoe $ 36400 |$ 986.00 | § 2,072.00 [ $ 12000 [$ 12000 | § - s - |s - s - |s 30100 (s 73400 | § 169500 | $ 12500 [$ 12500 | S  309.92 |$ 832.00 | § 2,02800 [$ 15000 |$ 15000 [$ 37000 |S 85000 |$  2,025.00 |$ 100.00 | $ 100.00 [$ 44000 |$ 71100 |$  1,609.00 | S 125.00 | $ 125.00
124

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Case 580, John Deere 310 NO BID 580/SN STD or Ext; or equivalent DEERE 310LEP or equivalent JCB 3CX/ Johyn Deere 310 JCB3CX

Backhoe Attachments | $ 33100 | $  1L176.00 [ $ 2,688.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 [ $ - | - |$ - |$ - |s 28100 |$ 673.00 | § 1,481.00 | S 100.00 | s 10000 | $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - s - s - |$ - s 14000 |s 250.00 | 440.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
125

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Arrowhead S60 NO BID Breakers or Backhoe NO BID Varies by Type/Call for pricing

Dozer | S0HP | $  611.00 | $  1,820.00 | s 4,592.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 | $ - |$ - |$ - |s ss7.00 |$ 1,862.00 | $ 4,075.00 [ 250.00 | $ 25000 [s 58552 |s 1,492.40 | s 370552 (S 150.00 |$ 15000 |8 595.00 |$ 1,500.00 | $  3,792.00 |$ 450.00 |$ 45000 | $  595.00 |$ 1,825.00 4,695.00 |$ 225.00 |$ 225.00
126

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: John Deere 550K NO BID CASE 750/JD550 or equivalent DEERE 450K or equivalent John Deere 450LGP John Deere 550 Kxlt

Dozer | 99HP [$  611.00 | $  1,820.00 | s 4,592.00 | $ 12000 | s 12000 | § 1,400.00| 4,200.00 |$ 600.00 | S 60000 [$ 74200 |$ 2,193.00 | $ 4300.00 [ 250.00 | $ 25000 [$ 72696 |$ 1,813.76 | $ 4439.76 [$  150.00 |$ 150.00 |8 700.00 | $ 175000 |S  4875.00 | $ 45000 |$ 45000 |'$  705.00 |$ 2,095.00 495000 [$  225.00 | $ 22500
127

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: John Deere 550K Cat D3 CASE 850/JD 650 or equivalent DEERE 650K or equivalent John Deere 650LGP John Deere 650 Kxlt

Dozer | 1ISHP | S 790.00 | $  2,134.00 | s 6267.00 | $ 12000 | s 12000 | § z,uuu.qm| 6,000.00 |$ 600.00 | S 600.00 [$  969.00 |$ 2,616.00 | $ 5,700.00 [$  300.00 | $ 30000 [$ 1,109.68 |$ 2,700.88 | $ 7.033.52 |$ 200.00 |$ 200.00 |$  1,000.00 | $ 325000 |$  7,583.00 | $ 45000 |$ 45000 |'$  715.00 |$ 2,680.00 7.650.00 [$  225.00 | $ 22500
128

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Cat D5 CASE 1150 or equivalent JOHN DEER 650K or equivalent John Deer 750LGP John Deere 700k

Single Drum Vibratory Roller, 54" Drum Width | E - | $ - |$ - | $ - | $ - ls 875.00 | $ 2,625.00 |$ 600.00 | S 600.00 | S  340.00 |$ 1,122.00 | § 2,100.00 [ $  150.00 | $ 15000 | S 417.04 |$ 1,020.24 | $ 232648 [$  150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 375.00 | $  1,00000 |$  2,762.00 | $ 100.00 |$ 100.00 | $ 356.00 |s 869.00 |s 1,844.00 |$ 150.00 | H 150.00
129

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID Volvo SD45 Bomag BW145 or equivalent VOLVO SD45 or equivalent HammH5I/BomagBW145D-5 HAMM H51

Single Drum Vibratory Roller, 66" Drum Width | - s - | $ - |$ - | $ - | $ - |s 1,910.00 | 5,725.00 |$ 600.00 | $  600.00 | $  398.00 |$ 1,183.00 [ § 2,500.00 [$  150.00 | $ 15000 | $ 501.28 |$ 1,254.24 | $ 2751.84 [$  150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 475.00 | $ 137500 |$  3,521.00 | $ 100.00 |$ 100.00 | 375.00 |s 878.00 | 2,157.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 150.00
130

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID Volvo SD75 CASE SV208 or equivalent 'VOLVO SD75B or equivalent HammH71/BomagBW147D-5 HAMM H71

Double Drum Vibratory Roller, 36" | E - | $ - |$ - | $ - | $ - s 420.00| 1,250.00 |$ 600.00 | $ 60000 | S 179.00 |$ 490.00 | $ 1,050.00 | S 100.00 | $ 10000 | S  182.00 |$ 514.80 | $ 122720 |$  150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 610.00 |$ 1,511.00 | $ 100.00 |$ 100.00 | $ 200.00 |$ 450.00 | 1,068.00 |$ 125.00 | $ 125.00
131

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID Volvo D015 AR90/BWI00 or equivalent WACKER RD12A-90 or equivalent Bomag 900-5 Wacker RDI12A

Double Drum Vibratory Roller, 48" | - s - - |$ - - | $ - |s 625.00 | 1,875.00 |$ 600.00 | $  600.00 | S  199.00 |s 592.00 | $ 1,275.00 | S 100.00 | $ 10000 | $  262.08 |$ 639.60 | S 1,638.00 | $  150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 925.00 |$ 2,437.00 | $ 100.00 |$ 100.00 | $ 261.00 |$ 761.00 | 1,774.00 |$ 125.00 | $ 125.00
132

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID Volvo DD25 CASE DV26 or equivalent VOLVO DD25BW or equivalent Bomag 1120SL5 HAMM HD12VV

Brush Chipper, 15' Maximum Branch Diameter | N - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s - | - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |8 428.00 |s 1,080.00| 2,628.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
133

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Vermeer BC1500

Stump Grinder | - $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - qs - | - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 24440 |s 639.60|S 1,404.00 |$ 115.00 |$ 115.00 | § - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 300.00 |$ 900.00 | 2,195.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
134

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID TORO STX-26 or equivalent NO BID Vermeer SC292

Mowing Tractor | N -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s | - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |8 540.00|s z,100.00| 6,‘!00.00|$ 200.00|$ 200.00
135

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID John Deere 6120E
. Boom Mower, 22' - 25' boom with Rotary Mower Head | - s -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ - s | - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ -|$ - s -|$ - |$ -|$ - |$ - s - |$ | - |$ -|$ -

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hydro Seeder (towable) | E -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - ls -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ B 300.uu|s 800.00|$ z,m.uu|$ 125.00|$ 125.00
137

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Finn T60T

Trencher (Walk Behind) - 24" | - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ -1 750.00 |$ 400.00 | $  400.00 | S 230.00 |$ 485.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $  100.00 | $  100.00 |$ 185.12 |$ 510.64 | $ 930.80 |$ 115.00 |$ 115.00 | $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 194.00 |$ 544.00 | 1,388.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
138

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID Toro TRX16 RTX130 or equivalent TORO TRX-20 or equivalent NO BID Vermeer RTX130
Lao Paver, 8' - 16' Screed Track Propelled | - $ -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ - s | - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - s - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ -|$ - Is -|$ - |$ -|$ - |$ - s - |$ | - |$ -|$ -

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Broom Tractor | - s - -|$ - - |$ -1 | - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 213.00|$ 612.00| 1,544.00|$ 125.oo|$ 125.00
140

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Lay-Mor SM300-6

Grader Nubunyn 10' Blade | - $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ -Is 5,000.00 |$ 000.00|$ 600.00 | $  634.00 |$ 1,744.00|s 4,050.00 |$ 250.00|$ 250.00 | $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - Is - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - | - |$ - |$ -
141

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID Noram 65E CASE 836 or equivalent NO BID NO BID NO BID

Grader Minimum 14' Blade | - $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - qs - |$ - |$ - |'s 1,148.00 |s 2,917.00 | $ 6,500.00 |$ 250.00 | $ 25000 |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$  1.568.00 |$ 3,850.00 |$ 10,291.00 |$ 550.00 |$ 550.00 | $ - |$ - | - |$ - |$ -
1.42

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID CASE 865 or equivalent NO BID Sany SMG200C-8 NO BID

Sweeper, Minimum 8' Sweeping Surface (Mechanical) | N - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |s  266.00 |$ 822.00 | § 1,400.00 [ $  100.00 | $  100.00 |'$  290.16 |s 690.56 | $ 1,575.60 | S 115.00 |$ 115.00 | § 300.00 |$ 800.00 |$ 1,760.00 |$ 75.00 |$ 75.00 | $ 318.00 |$ 891.00 | 2,082.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
143

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID Leymor Master300 or equivalent LAYMOR SM300 or equivalent Laymor 300 Lay-Mor Sm 300
™ 9 Wheel Traffic Roller - 5,000 Ibs Operating Weight | - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ -1 | - |$ - |$ - |s -|$ - s - s - |$ - |s -|$ -|$ - s - |$ - |s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - | - |$ - |$ -

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
B ?e\r/nvsi?lTrafficRoller—13,100IbsOperatingWeight | s _|$ _|S _|$ _|$ BB _|$ _|s i |S s _|S _|$ _|s i |S s _|S _|$ _|s _|S s _|$ _|s _|$ _|s s _|s _|$ _|s _|S i

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Road Widener, widens up to 10 | - $ -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ - qs | - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ -|$ - s -|$ - |$ -|$ - |$ - s - |$ | - |$ -|$ -
1.46

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Road Widener, widens up to 14 | N -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ - s | - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ -|$ - s -|$ - |$ -|$ - |$ - s - |$ | - |$ -|$ -
147

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

facushlerainlioiit (4'Whee! driv?)’ D ls i | - s - - |$ - - |$ - s - | - |$ - |$ - |s 43400 |$ 1,224.00 | $ 230000 [$  125.00 | $ 12500 S 405.60 |$ 1,086.80 | $ 2386.80 [$  150.00 |$ 150.00 | - - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s  s00.00 |s 1,050.00 | 2,020.00 |$ 150.00 |$ 150.00
148 |capacitv. mast heiaht ranae 10' - 21

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID CASE 588H or equivalent GENIE GTH-844 or equivalent NO BID ICB 940

Shooting Boom Forklift - 5500 Ibs, 19' | - |s 38100 | $ 947.00 | $ 1,932.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 | $ - |$ - |$ - |s 3100 |s 719.00 | $ 1,450.00 | S 125.00 | $ 12500 |S 31512 |$ 821.60 | $ 1,846.00 |8 150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 350.00 |$ 853.00 |$ 1,996.00 |$ 100.00 |$ 100.00 | $ 435.00 |$ 1,055.00 | 2,020.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
1.49

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Genie GTH-5519 EC NO BID Genie 5519 or equivalent GENIE GTH-5519 or equivalent JCB 520-50 JLG GS518A




Lee County Procurement Management
BID TABULATION FORM - B220065LLP - Equipment Rental, Countywide

AHERN RENTALS, INC ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIP! EQUIPMENT SHARE HERC RENTAL, INC. H&E EQUIPMENT SERVICES SUNBELT RENTALS, INC.

Item Equipment Description/Specifications Min HP D"i"‘l(jﬁ:"‘"' Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | ™ ""';V‘z:""" Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | 2 ""';z:""" Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | Daily Rental Rate W"”‘z‘ :’”’"" ’""""l'z’f""‘"l Delivery Fee Pick-up Fee | Daily Rental Rate W""‘I'E‘;::""‘"' & "”"2‘:::"’"" Delivery Fee Pick-up Fee

Shotting Boom Forklift - 10000 Ibs, 55' - $  616.00 |$ 1,652.00 | $ 3,584.00 [ $ 12000 [$ 12000 | $ -1 - | - s - |s$ s61.00|$ 1,474.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 150.00 [$  150.00 | $ 514.80 | S 1,440.40 | $ 3,380.00 | $  150.00 | $  150.00 | $ 561.00 | $  1,497.00 [$  3,696.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 700.00 |$  1,925.00 |$  4,005.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 150.00
1.50

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Xtreme XR1055ECAC NO BID CASE 10054 or equivalent GENIE GTH-1056 or equivalent JCB 510-56 Skytrak 10054
B g;)lijlﬂl;llixer/Reclaimer,maximum96"cutwidth/18"cut | s i |$ i |$ . |$ . |$ s | i |$ i |$ s . |$ _|$ s i |$ s . |$ _|$ s i |$ s . |$ i |$ . |$ i |$ s i |$ . | i |$ . |$ i

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Crane - 20 TON | - s -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ - s | -|$ -|$ - |s -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ - s -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ - s -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ - s -|$ | -|$ -|$ =
e MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Crane - 40 TON | - $ - |8 -|$ - -|$ - s -| -|$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ - s - |8 -|$ -|$ -|$ - s -|$ -| -|$ -|$ -
153

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

On-Road Water Truck w/ Cannon Sprayer, 2000 gal

minimum - Equipped w/ arrow board, 4-corner strobe - $ - s - [s - s - |8 - s - |$ - |8 - |8 - |s  469.00 | S 1,224.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $  300.00 |$  300.00 | $ -8 -1 - |8 - |8 - |8 - s - |8 - s - |8 - s - |8 - s - |8 - s -
201 |lights

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID F550 NO BID NO BID NO BID
. %‘rﬁ;’fﬁ ngﬁzggﬁa‘ﬁ:’xﬁ)‘x%’;g‘r’(;:“’féo‘:gg? sgf::)be | - s . | $ . |s - | $ - | $ s - | - |s - |s - |s  ste00 |s 2,040.00 | S 420000 |$ 30000 | s 30000 |'$ - |s - | $ . |s . |s s - | $ . |s - | $ . |s s - |s - | - |s - | $ -

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID F9000 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Off-Road Water Truck, 2500 gal minimum | - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 3,550,00| 10,625.00 [ $  600.00 | $  600.00 [ $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 63232 |$ 2,012.40 | $ 4,797.52 |$ 200.00 |$ 200.00 | § - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 328.00 |s 891.00 | 2,063.00 |$ = |$ -
2.03

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID Volvo A25G Water WAgon NO BID FREIGHTLIN M2 - 106 or equivalent NO BID 328 PETERBUILT

Dump Truck — up to 17 Yard Capacity | E -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ - ls - |8 - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ -|$ - s -|$ - |$ -|$ - |$ - s - |$ - - |$ -|$ -
2.04

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dump Truck — up to 28 Yard Capacity | - s -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ -|$ - s -|$ - |$ -|$ - |$ - s - |$ - - |$ -|$ -
2.05

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bucket Truck, 60’ working height | E -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ - ls -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ -|$ - s -|$ - |$ -|$ - |$ - s - |$ -|$ - |$ -|$ -
2.06

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Street Sweeper (Vacuum) | - s -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ -1 - |$ - |$ - |s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - |s -|$ -|$ - |$ -|$ - |s -|$ - |$ -|$ - |$ - |s 660.00|$ 4,‘!85.00|$ -|$ -
2.07

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID TENNANT M20

Towable Light Tower, 25’ electric powered mast | - s %0.00 |s 219.00 | s 398.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 | $ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 10816 |$ 256.88 | $ 430.56 |$ 115.00 |$ 115.00 | $ 105.00 |$ 250.00 |$ 460.00 |$ 75.00 |$ 75.00 | $ 124.00 |$ 374.00 | 652.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
3.01

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Allmand NL5000 NO BID NO BID WACKER LTN6KVS or equivalent Wacker LTV6K WACKER LTV6K

Towable Air Compressor, 80-128 PSI | 80HP | $  163.00 | $ 342.00 | $ 605.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 12000 fs - |$ - |$ - s - |$ = |$ = |$ = |$ - |s 12688 |s 243.36 | $ 624.00 [$  115.00 |$ 115.00 | 8 130.00 |$ 295.00 | $ 772.00 |$ 75.00 |$ 75.00 | $ 128.00 |$ 338.00 | 611.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
3.02

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Atlas Copco XAS 185 NO BID NO BID DOOSAN C185WDO-T4F or equivalent Atlas Copco XAS110PE DOOSAN C185

Portable Generator Sets, 480/208 voltage, minimum 140 | 6OkW [$  538.00 | $  1.288.00 | s 2,688.00 | $ 12000 | $ 12000 [ $ - |$ - |$ - |s 39500 (s 725.00 | s 1,480.00 |$ 100.00 | S 10000 [$ 38688 |$ 975.52 | $ 254800 [$  200.00 |$ 200.00 | § - - s - | $ - - |s  269.00 640.00 | 1,761.00 |$ 125.00 | $ 125.00
303 |aal fuel capacitv

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Multiquip DCA70, Atlas Copco QAS70 NO BID 56Kw (Single shift hrs) MULTIQUIP DCA125SSIU4F or equivalent NO BID ICB G7O0RST4F

PortablelGeneratonSets|1480/208[voltagelminimum|E50, - | s - s - | $ - - | s | s s - | s - | $ - | s - | s - |'s 224640 | 5,790.72 | S 17.160.00 [§  600.00 | S 600.00 - | s - | $ - s 11400 2,561.00 | 7,044.00 | s 50000 | S 50000
304 |aal fuel capacitv

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID CUMMINS C1000D6R or equivalent NO BID DOOSAN G570

Boom Lift - 40" | 924.00 | s 1,787.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 120,00 - |$ |$ - |s 32500 |$ 750.00 | $ 1,475.00 |$ 200.00 | $ 20000 s 32240 | 681.20 | $ 1,664.00 | $  150.00 |$ 150.00 795.00 |$ 1,728.00 |$ 100.00 |$ 100.00 [$  333.00 797.00 | 1,609.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
3.05

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: JLG 4008, Genie S40 NO BID JLG 450 or equivalent GENIE $-45 or equivalent Genie S40 JLG400S

Boom Lift - 60" 1,092.00 | s 2.352.00 | $ - | $ - - |$ |$ - |s 43500 |$ 925.00 | s 1,995.00 S 200.00 | $ 20000 [s  374.40 | 842,40 | $ 2,120.56 [$  150.00 |$ 150.00 1.250.00 |$ 2,545.00 |$ 100.00 | 100.00 [$  523.00 1,440.00 3,135.00 |$ 150.00 | 150.00
3.06

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Snorkel TB60, JLG 600S, Genie S60 NO BID JLG 600 or equivalent GENIE $-65 or equivalent Genie S60 JLG600S

Articulating Boom Lift — 40’ 924.00 | $ 1,804.00 [ $  120.00 | $ 120,00 - |$ - |$ |$ - |s 32500 |$ 750.00 | $ 1,475.00 | S 200.00 | $ 20000 [$ 32240 | 681.20 | $ 1,664.00 | $  150.00 |$ 150.00 795.00 |$ 1,728.00 |$ 100.00 | 100.00 [$ 37500 896.00 |$ 1,893.00 |$ 125.00 | 125.00
3.07

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: Snorkel A46IRT, JLG 450AJ NO BID JLG 450 or equivalent JLG 450AJ or equivalent Genie Z45 XC JLG450A)

Articulating Boom Lift — 60" 1,014.00 | $ 2,408.00 | $  120.00 | S 120.00 - |$ |$ - |s 43500 |$ 925.00 | $ 1,995.00 | $  200.00 | $ 20000 | S 355.68 |s 819.52 | $ 2,059.20 (S 150.00 |$ 150.00 1,250.00 |$ 2,556.00 | $ 100.00 | 100.00 | $ 523.00 1,440.00 3,135.00 |$ 150.00 | 150.00
3.08

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Snorkel AB60J, JLG 600AT NO BID JLG 600 or equivalent JLG 600AJ or equivalent Genie Z60/34 JLG600AT

Articulating Boom Lift - 80" 1,787.00 | s 4,088.00 | $ 12000 | $ 120,00 - |$ |$ - |s 67500 |$ 1,548.00 | s 320000 (S 250.00 | $ 25000 [S  688.48 |s 1,577.68 | $ 3739.84 [$  150.00 |$ 150.00 | 1,850.00 |$ 3,895.00 | $ 120.00 | 12000 [$  850.00 2,250.00 | 4,950.00 |$ 175.00 | 175.00
3.09

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: JLG 800AI, Genie Z80/60 NO BID JLG 800 or equivalent JLG 800AJ or equivalent Genie Z80/60 JLGS00AJ

Articulating Boom Lift - 120" 3,584.00 | s 7.835.00 | $ 12000 | $ 120,00 - |$ |$ - |'s 1.295.00 |$ 3,495.00 | s 6,200.00 [ S 300.00 | $ 30000 [$ 1,244.88 |s 3,144.96 | $ 7,072.00 [$  200.00 |$ 200.00 | 3,900.00 |$ 9,208.00 | $ 35000 | 35000 | $  2.361.00 5,774.00 11,963.00 |$ 200.00 | 200.00
3.10

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: JLG 1250ATP NO BID JLG 1250 or equivalent JLG 1250A1P or equivalent JLG 1250A1P JLGI1250A]

Articulating Man Lift with Jib - 45' 924.00 | $ 1,804.00 | $  120.00 | S 120.00 - | $ | $ - |s 32500 | $ 750.00 | $ 147500 | $  200.00 | $ 20000 | $ 32240 | $ 68120 | $ 1,664.00 | $  150.00 | $  150.00 795.00 | $ 172800 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 375.00 896.00 1,893.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00
311

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Snorkel A46IRT, JLG 450AJ NO BID JLG 450 or equivalent JLG 450AJ or equivalent Genie Z45 XC JLG450AT

Articulating Man Lift with Jib - 80' 1,787.00 | $ 4,088.00 | $ 12000 | $ 120,00 - |$ |$ - |s 67500 |s 1,548.00 | s 320000 [ 250.00 | $ 25000 [$ 68848 |$ 1,577.68 | $ 3739.84 [$  150.00 |$ 150.00 | 1,850.00 |$ 3,895.00 | $ 30000 | 30000 |'$  850.00 2.250.00 4,950.00 |$ 175.00 | $ 175.00
3.12

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: JLG 800AL, Genie Z80/60 NO BID JLG 800 or equivalent JLG 800AJ or equivalent Genie Z80/60 JLG800AT

Straight Man Lift with Jib - 60" 1,014.00 | $ 2,408.00 | $  120.00 | $  120.00 - |$ |$ - |s 43500 |$ 925.00 | $ 1,995.00 |$ 200.00 | $ 20000 | S  374.40 |s 842.40 | $ 2,120.56 [ $  150.00 |$ 150.00 | 1,375.00 |$ 2,703.00 | $ 100.00 | 100.00 | $ 523.00 1,440.00 | 3,135.00 |$ 150.00 | 150.00
313

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Snorkel AB60J, JLG 600AT NO BID JLG 600s or equivalent GENIE S-65 or equivalent Genie S65 JLG600S]

Straight Man Lift with Jib - 80" - |$ - | $ - | $ - - |$ |$ - |$ 67500 |$ 1,548.00 | $ 3,200.00 |$ 250.00 | $ 25000 S 72176 |$ 1,633.84 | $ 3,83344 |$  150.00 |$ 150.00 | 1,995.00 |$ 4,062.00 | $ 120.00 | 120.00 | $ 850.00 2,250.00 4,950.00 |$ 175.00 | 175.00
3.14

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID JLG 800s or equivalent GENIE S-85XC or equivalent Genie S85 JLG860S]

Straight Man Lift with Jib - 120" 3,584.00 | $ 7,835.00 | $  120.00 | $  120.00 - | $ - |$ |$ - |'s 1,125.00 |s 2,925.00 | $ 6,100.00 | S 300.00 | $  300.00 | $ 1,244.88 |$ 3,144.96 | $ 7,072.00 [$  200.00 |$ 200.00 | 3,200.00 |$ 7,042.00 | $ 200.00 | 20000 | $  1,387.00 [$  3,605.00 | $ 783800 |$ 200.00 | 200.00
3.15

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: JLG 1250ATP NO BID JLG 1200SP or equivalent JLG 1200SJP or equivalent Genie SX-125 XC JLG1250S]




Lee County Procurement Management
BID TABULATION FORM - B220065LLP - Equipment Rental, Countywide

AHERN RENTALS, INC ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIP! HERC RENTAL, INC. H&E EQUIPMENT SERVICES SUNBELT RENTALS, INC.

Item Equipment Description/Specifications Min HP D‘"‘"‘Kjﬁ:"‘"' Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | Weekiy Rental Rate | Montily Rental Rate | Deivery Fee | Pickup Fee | ""';V‘z:""" Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | ""’;V(z:""” Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | Daily Rental Rate W"’"l:{‘ :;"’"" M"""g’f"""" Delivery Fee Pick-up Fee | Daily Rental Rate W""‘,’;‘;z""‘"’ & "”"2’:::"’"" Delivery Fee Pick-up Fee

Straight Man Lift with Jib - 150" - $ 3,640.00 | $ 8,916.00 [ $ 19,942.00 | $ 12000 |$  120.00 -1 - | - s - |'S 1,995.00 | 5,275.00 | $ 15,000.00 [$  350.00 [$  350.00 | § 2,246.40 | $ 6,832.00 | $ 16,848.00 | $  400.00 | $  400.00 | $  4,050.00 | $  8,000.00 [$ 22,533.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 | $  2.850.00 [$  7.920.00 [$ 15,593.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
3.16

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: JLG 150HAX NO BID JLG 1500SJ or equivalent JLG 1500SJ or equivalent Genie SX-150 JLG1500S]

Telescoping Boom Lifts | N -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ - - -|$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - s - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |8 -|$ - s -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ - s -|$ - -|$ -|$ -
3.17

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Forklift Lull | - $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - |s 31100 |s 719.00 | $ 1,450.00 [ S 125.00 | $ 12500 S - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 481.00 |$ 1,138.00 |$ 2,339.00 |$ - |$ - s 385.00 |$ 990.00 2,228.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
3.18

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID Genie 5519 or equivalent NO BID ICB 507-42 6K42

Scissor Lift - 19" | - |s 12500 | $ 250.00 | s 385.00 |$ 120.00 | $ 120,00 - - |$ - |$ - |s 12500 |$ 250.00 | § 350.00 | 100.00 | $ 10000 [$  104.00 |s 202.80 | $ 34632 (S 150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 150.00 |$ 276.00 |$ 497.00 |$ 150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 157.00 |$ 324.00 656.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
3.19

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: SNORKEL $3219E, SKYJACK SIIII3219 NO BID JIG ES1932 or equivalent GENIE GS-1930 or equivalent Genie GS 1930 JLG1930

Scissor Lift - 26" | - |s  180.00 | $ 359.00 | $ 622.00 | $  120.00 | $  120.00 - - |$ - |$ - |s 15500 |$ 295.00 | $ 525.00 | $  100.00 | $  100.00 | S 132.08 |s 254.80 | $ 51480 [$  150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 195.00 | $ 302.00 |$ 644.00 | $ 150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 209.00 |$ 378.00 784.00 |$ 125.00 | $ 125.00
3.20

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Snorkel $3226E, Skyjack JI113226 NO BID JLG ES2532 or equivalent JLG 2632ES or equivalent Genie GS 2632 JLG2632

Scissor Lift - 30'-33' | - IS 21900 | $ 471.00 | $ 840.00 | $  120.00 | $  120.00 - | $ - |$ - |$ - |s 19500 |$ 425.00 | $ 695.00 | 100.00 | $ 10000 | S  154.96 |s 34320 | $ 702.00 [$  150.00 |$ 150.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 450.00 |$ 861.00 | $ 100.00 |$ 100.00 | $ 266.00 |$ 585.00 | $  1,097.00 |$ 125.00 | $ 125.00
321

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: Genie GS-3232 NO BID JLG ES3246 or equivalent GENIE GS-3246 or equivalent Genie GS 3246 JLG3246

Power Snake | - s -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |8 - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |8 -|$ - s -|$ - |$ -|$ - |$ - s 66.00|$ 159.00| 481.00|$ 125.00|$ 125.00
3.22

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID EEL EKR1/21C

Pallet Jack | - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - s 6500 |$ 125.00 | $ 275.00 |$ 50.00 | s 5000[s 3328 |$ 119.60 | 3 25272 (S 115.00 |$ 115.00 | $ 46.00 |s 111.00 |$ 276.00 | $ 50.00 |$ 50.00 | $ 54.00 |$ 162.00 | 330.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
3.23

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID 5.5001bs Manual DAYTON 2ZE57 or equivalent Manual 5,000lbs GRAINGER 490

Duct Jack/Material 24'-26" | - s - |8 - |$ - - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 8424 |$ 338.00 | $ 72072 |8 115.00 |$ 115.00 | $ 101.00 |$ 267.00 |$ 636.00 | $ 50.00 |$ 50.00 | $ 87.00 |s 230.00 | 540.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
3.24

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID SUMNER 2124 or equivalent Genie SLC24 GENIE SLC24

Load Bank | E -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - s - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ B 140.uu|s 239.00| 721.uu|$ 125.00|$ 125.00
3.25

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MOSEBACH X60SB

Eco Blaster | = $ -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ = = -|$ -|$ - |8 -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ - |8 -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ - |8 -|$ -|$ -|$ -|$ - s -|$ -| -|$ -|$ -
3.26

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2" Trash Pump | - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - s 15000 |$ 315.00 | $ 63500 S 100.00 | s 10000 [$  46.80 |s 174.72 | $ 39416 | 115.00 |$ 115.00 | § 76.00 |$ 211.00 |$ 441.00 |$ 50.00 |$ 50.00 | $ 64.00 |$ 347.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
327

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID 3" Trash Pump 40/50'h's MULTIQUIP QP2TH or equivalent Wacker PT2A

4" Trash Pump | - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - |s 25500 |$ 625.00 | $ 1,480.00 | $  100.00 | s 10000 [s 7592 |s 286.00 | s 568.88 [$  115.00 |$ 115.00 | § 124.00 |$ 385.00 |$ 676.00 |$ 60.00 |$ 60.00 | § 119.00 |$ 664.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
3.28

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID 4 Trash Pump 40/50'h's MULTIQUIP QP4TH or equivalent Wacker PTS4V

6" Trash Pump | - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 33300 |$ 825.00 | $ 2,035.00 [$  100.00 | s 10000 | $ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |s 28000 |$ 755.00 |$ 2215.00 |$ 100.00 |$ 10000 | $  195.00 |s 999.00 |$ 125.00 |s 125.00
3.29

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID 6" Trash Pump 40/50'h's NO BID MSPDD6

Hammer Drill - 2" & Larger | - $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - |s - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |s 5096 |s 179.9z|s 379.60 |$ 115.00 |$ 115.00 | $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 75.00 |$ 458.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
330

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID HILTI TE70-ATC/AVR or equivalent NO BID

Rotary Hammer Moil Point | - $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 832 |$ 23.92 | $ 72.80 |$ 25.00 |$ 25.00 | $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 9.00 |s 62.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
331

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Rotary Hammer Chisel ‘ - s - ‘ $ - ‘s - ‘ $ - ‘ $ - - - s - ‘s - |s - ‘s - ‘ $ - ‘s - ‘s - |s 832 (S 2392 | $ 72.80 | $ 25.00 ‘s 25.00 | $ - ‘ $ - ‘s - ‘ $ - ‘s - s 9.00 | § 21.00 ‘ 62.00 ‘s 125.00 ‘ $ 125.00
332

MFG / Model #/ or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dehumidifier | - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - - - s - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s s9a28 (s 278.72 | $ 557.44 (S 115.00 |$ 115.00 | 8 - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 66.00 |s 207.00 | 561.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
333

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 25GPD DEHU

AFD (Air Filtration Device) | - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s so.uu|s 174.00| 416.uu|$ 125.00|$ 125.00
334

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 500CFM AIR SRUBBER

NAM (Negative Air Machine) | E -|$ -|$ -|$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ -|$ - s -|$ - |$ -|$ - |$ - s - |$ -|$ -
335

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Riding Carpet Cleaner | - s ,|$ ,|5 —|$ - |$ - - - |$ - |$ - |8 —|$ —|$ - |$ - |$ - |8 —|$ —|$ - |$ ,|$ - |8 —|$ - |$ —|$ - |$ - s - |$ —|$ -
336

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




Lee County Procurement Management

BID TABULATION FORM - B220065LLP - Equipment Rental, Countywide

AHERN RENTALS, INC ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIP! HERC RENTAL, INC. H&E EQUIPMENT SERVICES SUNBELT RENTALS, INC.

Item Equipment Description/Specifications Min HP D‘"‘"‘Kjﬁ:"‘"' Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | ™ ""';V‘z:""" Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | ""’;V(z:""” Weekly Rental Rate | Monthly Rental Rate | Delivery Fee | Pick-up Fee | Daily Rental Rate W"’"l:{‘ :;"’"" M"""g’f"""" Delivery Fee Pick-up Fee | Daily Rental Rate W""‘,’;‘;z""‘"’ £ "”"2’:::"’"" Delivery Fee Pick-up Fee

Truck Mounted Carpet Extractor/Cleaner - $ - s -8 - s - |8 - s -1 - |8 - |8 - s -8 -1 - |8 - |8 - s -8 -1 - |8 - |8 - s - s - |8 - s - |8 - s - |8 - s - |8 - s -
337

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Truck Mounted Desiccant Dehumidification - s ,|$ ,|5 @ |$ @ |$ -8 @ = |$ = |$ - |8 —|$ —|$ = |$ = |$ - |8 —|$ —|$ £ |$ S |$ - |8 @ |$ = |$ @ |$ = |$ - s = |$ @ | = |$ @ |$ =
338

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Blower - Gasoline Powered - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - ls -|$ - |$ - |$ - s -|$ -|$ - |$ - |$ - s 46.80|s 164.3z|s 347.36 | S 115.00|$ 115.00 | 8 - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ -
339

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID BILLY GOAT F1302H or equivalent NO BID NO BID

Blower - Back-Pack - s = |$ = |$ = |$ - |$ - s - - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 3016 |s 105.04 | $ 22048 [$  115.00 |$ 115.00 | $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 39.00 |$ 135.00 | 339.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
340

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID STIHL BR600 or equivalent NO BID STIHL BR430

Blower - Walk-Behind - s - |8 - |$ - s - |$ - ls - - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 4680 |s 164.32 | $ 347.36 [$  115.00 |$ 115.00 | $ - - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 66.00 |$ 189.00 | 404.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
341

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID BILLY GOAT F1302H or equivalent NO BID BILLYGOAT F3102

HEPA Vacuum - s = |$ = |$ - |$ - |$ - s - - |$ - |$ - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |s 4056 |s 154.96|S 35568 [$  115.00 |$ 115.00 | $ - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ - s 53.00 |$ 199.00 | 505.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
342

MFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID EDCO VORTEX-200 or equivalent NO BID 8 GAL

Compressor - 185 CFM - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ -1 - - |$ - |$ - s 15500 |$ 585.00 | $ 630.00 |$ 50.00 | $ 5000 [s 12688 |s 24336 | $ 624.00 (S 115.00 |$ 115.00 | $ 146.00 |$ 325.00 |$ 891.00 |$ 75.00 |$ 75.00 | $ 128.00 |$ 338.00 | 611.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
343

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID 185CFM 50hose DOOSAN C185WDO-T4F or equivalent SULLIVAN DI8SP3ID DOOSANC 185

Welder - Minimum 300AMP - s - |$ - |$ - |$ - |$ -1 - - |$ - |$ - |8 ss00 |$ 200.00 | $ 400.00 [$  50.00 | $ 5000 [s 7800 |s 191.36 | $ 52000 | 115.00 |$ 115.00 | $ 155.00 |$ 425.00 |$ 695.00 |$ 75.00 |$ 75.00 | $ 111.00 |$ 321.00 | 574.00 |$ 125.00 |$ 125.00
344

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID Miller 260 Gas 50750' or equivalent MILLER TRAILBLAZER325D or equivalent Miller Bid Blue 300 LINCOLN 300
sas Water Quality Instrument/Multiparameter Sonde N $ , | $ - |$ - | $ - | $ - s - - |8 - |$ - s - |$ - | $ - |8 - |$ - s - |$ - | $ - |8 - |$ - s - | $ - |$ - | $ - |$ - s - | $ -

MEFG / Model # / or Equivalent quoted: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Percent Off Equipment Not Listed on Bid Form 0% | 0% | 0% | $ - | $ = 10% | 10% | $ 600.00| $  600.00 0% | 0% | 0% | $ = | $ = 15% | 15% | 15% | $ 150v00| $ 15000 5% | 10% | 15% | $ 100.00| $ 100.00 0% - | $ -
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