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Temporary Personnel Services 
Amcndmcn1 No. I - Tampa Service Company, Inc. dba Pacesetter Personnel Services 

FIRST AMENDMENT OF AGREEMENT FOR TEMPORARY PERSONNEL SERVICES 

THIS FIRST AMENDMENT OF THE AGREEMENT FOR TEMPORARY PERSONNEL 

SER VICES, made and entered into by and between the Lee County Board of County Commissioners, 

a political subdivision of the State of Florida ("County") and Tampa Service Company, Inc. dba 

Pacesetter Personnel Services, ("Vendor"), collectively, the "Parties." 

WHEREAS, the County entered into an Agreement for the purchase of temporary personnel 

services on an as needed basis through Solicitation B220 I 82CM R with Vendor on the 3 I" day of May, 

2022 ("Agreement"); and, 

WHEREAS, after the execution of the Agreement it was determined that the Mark-Up amount 

listed in Option A of the Exhibit B Fee Schedule was listed incorrectly; and, 

WHEREAS, after the execution of the Agreement it was determined that it wou ld be in the 

best interest of the County to include proposed pricing for the purchase of temporary personnel services 

from the Vendor, in the Exhibit B Fee Schedule of the Agreement, for the potential remaining renewal 

contract years; and, 

WHEREAS, after the execution of the Agreement it was determined that it would be in the 

best interest o f the County to add a "Day Laborer for DOT" position to the Exhibit A. Scope of Work 

and Specificat ions section of the Agreement and corresponding pricing for the "Day Laborer for DOT" 

position, in the Exhibit B. Fee Schedule of the Agreement; and, 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Article XIV. MISCELLANEOUS of the Agreement, the Parties 

desire to modify the Agreement to add the additional pricing, for the remaining contract years, to the 

Exhibit B. Fee Schedule of the Agreement, to correct the Mark-Up amount listed in Option A of the 

Exhibit B Fee Schedule, and to add the "Day Laborer for DOT" pos ition to the Exhibit A. Scope of 

Work and Specifications section of the Agreement and corresponding pricing for the "Day Laborer for 

DOT" position, in the Exhibit B. Fee Schedule of the Agreement. 

NOW, T HEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION OF TIIE FOREGOING AND THE MUTUAL 

COVENANTS CONTA INED HEREIN, IT IS AGREED AS FOLLOWS: 
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I. The Part ies agree that the following position and description shall supplement section 5. 
DAY LABOR oflhe Exhibit A. Scope of Work and Specifications section of the 
Agreement. 

2. 
5. 7 FOR DOT OPERATIONS -Ability to take directio11fro111 l ee County Sta/J: Ability to do filler 
p ickup on l ee County Roadways. litter pickup and maintaining of canal banks to include weed 
whacking and mowing Loading and unloadi11g of filter truck to the appropriate land fill area. 
Sweeping a11d general c/ea11i11g of buildings, as necessa,y. 

3. The Parties also agree that effective upon the execution of this amendment, the Exhibit B. Fee 
Schedule of the Agreement shall be superseded by the following: 

Temporary Personnel Service • Annual 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

Joh Catcc,ortes 
I Ad11111isllali\'..: Assistnut 

2 Exccutin~ Assis1ruu 

.I Lil,rn1y A.ssisrnu1 

4 Office Suppo11 Bnsic: 

s OOicc Su111>01 I ~lid-Lc\'e) 

6 Office Suppo11 Hi1h•Lcvtl 

7 Accounti11~ Clc1k 

s Customu Scn•ice Rt1ncsC"111a1h·c 

9 C11s1omer Sen·ice St1ppo11 Tcchnicinn 

10 P:uks ."\11d Rccrtntio11 S11ppo11 Bn~ic 

II Parks aml R!!crention Sup11011 Mid•Lc~,·cl 

12 Cn1111, Counselor/ Special Ennt Suppo11/ D:ty C.uup Site Director 

13 Park~ Mnintcnrmce 

1-1 Lifcgrnud I 

15 Lifeguard II 

16 Lifcgumd Ill 

17 Research Annl)'SI 

18 Envirorn11c111nl Lab Aide 

19 Pan~ Room Worker/ ReJll'cSCtlli\lh•e 

20 FJect Ser\'icc Worker 

21 Fleet Mechanic 

22 Day Lnborcr for Larnlfill 1md Com1Josl Operations 

23 O.iy Laborer for E•Wn.stc Recycling Collections 
2,1 Day Lnborcr for Pnrks and Recreation 

25 O,,y L:\borcr for Tmnsfcr Stntion 

26 Day Lnborcr for Enerp:y Transfer Station 

27 Da)' Lnborer for Household Chemical \V:,ste 

28 Day Laborer for DOT 

!.!EM 
OPT/ON A 

DESCRIPTION 

Tampa Service Company 
Inc. DBA Pacesetter 
Personnel Services 

UNIT UNIT PRICE 

io22-2023 2023-2!!24 il,024-202li 

Hour'ly No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Hourly NoB1d No Bid No Bid 
Hourly No Bid No Did No Bid 

Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid 

llouily No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Homly No Biel No Bid No Diel 

l-lonrly No Did No Biel No Bid 

f-lourly No Bid No Bid NoB,cl 

Homly SIS.00 Sl9.50 $21.00 

Hourly SIS.00 Sl9.50 S21.00 

Jlourly No Bid No Did No Bid 

Houily SIS.00 Sl950 $21.00 

Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bui 

Hourly No Biel No Bid ::-lo Bid 

Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Homly No Bid No Bid NoBitl 

llourly No Bid No Bid NoBirl 

Hourly No Did No Did No81cl 

Hourly No B id No Bid No Bid 

Hourly No Did No Bid NoBi,l 

Hourly 522.50 $2,1.00 S2$.50 

Hourly S18.00 S19.50 s:? 1.00 

Hourly SIS.00 Sl9.50 $21.00 

Hourly $'.!2.~0 S'.!4.00 S~S.50 

Hourly S22.S0 S2•1.00 S25.50 

llourly S.'.?2.~0 S2•1.00 S25.SO 

Hourly SIS.00 $19.50 521.00 

UNIT 

OTHER POSITION PERCENT AGE OF MARK-UP OVER NEGOTIADED RA TE .. 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, this First Amendment of the Agreement has been signed and sealed, 

in duplicate, by thf z spective parties heret~i,PT -!1114 
DATED this L/-= day of~ ~ , 2022 by ihe Lee 

Commissioners. 

Director 
behalf 
Commissioners 

County Board of County 

nagement, on 
the Board of County 

DATED this 4th day of _ _ A_u_g_u_st __ , 2022 by Tampa Service Company, Inc. dba 

Pacesetter Personnel Services 

ATTEST: 

Authorized Signature Printed Name 

CORPORATE SEAL: 
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