B220182CMR.
Temporary Personnel Service
Amendment No. | - Cambay Consulting, LLC'

FIRST AMENDMENT OF AGREEMENT FOR TEMPORARY PERSONNEL SERVICES

THIS FIRST AMENDMENT OF THE AGREEMENT FOR TEMPORARY PERSONNEL
SERVICES, made and entered into by and between the Lee County Board of County Commissioners,
a political subdivision of the State of Florida ("County") and Cambay Consulting, LLC, (“Vendor™),

collectively, the “Parties.”

WHEREAS, the County entered into an Agreement for the purchase of temporary personnel
services on an as needed basis through Solicitation B220182CMR with Vendor on the 31" day of May,

2022 (“Agreement”); and,

WHEREAS, after the execution of the Agreement it was determined that it would be in the
best interest of the County to include proposed pricing for the purchase of temporary personnel services
from the Vendor, in the Exhibit B Fee Schedule of the Agreement, for the potential remaining renewal

contract years; and,

WHEREAS, pursuant to Article XIV. MISCELLANEOUS of the Agreement, the Parties
desire to modity the Agreement to add the additional pricing, for the remaining contract years, to the

Exhibit B. Fee Schedule of the Agreement.

NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION OF THE FOREGOING AND THE MUTUAL
COVENANTS CONTAINED HEREIN, IT IS AGREED AS FOLLOWS:

1. The Parties also agree that the Exhibit B. Fee Schedule of the Agreement shall be superseded
by the following:
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Temporary Personnel Service - Annual Cambay Consulting, LLC

Job Categories
1 |Admanistrative Assistant o Hourly $44.10 $44.10 $46.10
2 |Executive Assistant Hourly $42.65 $42.65 $44.65
3 |Library Assistant Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 |Office Support Basic Hourly $16.02 $16.02 $18.02
5 |Office Support Mid-Level Hourly $28.47 $28.47 53047
6 |OfficeSupport HighLevl | Hourly | $48.00 $48.09 $50.00
7 |Accounting Clerk Hourly |  $39.44 $39.44 $41.44
§  [Customer Service Representative Howly $40.75 54075 $42.75
9 [Customer Service Support Technician Houwly $28.08 $28.08 $30.08
10 |Parks and Recreation Support Basic Houwrly No Bid No Bid No Bid
11  |Parks and Recreation Suppost Mid-Level - Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 |Camp Counselor/ Sip;eciai Event Support/ ba:.' Camp Site Director Hourly No Bid No Bid NoBid
13 |Parks Maintenance _ - Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 |Lifeguard Hourly No Bid No Biud No Bid
15 |Lifeguard Il Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid
16  |Lifeguard I Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 |Research Analyst Hourly $45.56 $45.56 $47.56
" 18 |Environmental Lab Aide - -l-Iou-rlry_ No Bid No Bid No Bid
19  |Parts Room Worker/ Representative Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid
20  |Fleet Service Worker Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 |Fleet Mechanic Hourlv No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 |Day Laborer for Landfill and Compost Operations | Hourly No Bid No Bid NoBid
*23 Day Laborer for E-Waste Recycling C 0!55@7 - 7]:10{11']3‘ . Np B:d_ - No Bid_ No Bid
24 |Day Laborer for Parks and Recreation Houly |  NoBid No Bid No Bid
25 |Day Laborer for Transfer Station Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid
26 |Day Laborer for Energy Transfer Station Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 |Day Laborer for Houschold Chemical Waste Hourly No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 |Day Laborer for DOT . | Hourly | NoBid ~ NoBid No Bid
N i DESCRIPTION | UNIT AMOUNT
QPTION A R el D e T o nh o e o
1 IOTHER POSITION PERCENTAGE OF MARK-UP OVER NEGOTIADED RATE | % 35%
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, this First Amendment of the Agreement has been signed and sealed,
in duplicate, by the respective parties hereto.

DATED this “22 day of MM 2022 by the Lee Counly Board of County
Commissioners.

A }ORIDA

BY: Fa ;gég
¥ ucker
Director of anagement, on
behalf of the Board of County
Commissioners

County Attorney's Office

DATED this QF day of Ao

. 2022 by Cambay Consulting, LLC
ATTEST:

BY: £ S -SandWe
Authorized Signahgrc

¥ 40 Sawdnwa
(Witness) Authorized Signature Printed Name
Wit ey, ‘
NG, Lo, TR exvetadive
YA P % Authorized Signature Title
“”'-. ':
2
‘."L: g
|'0§
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