
B220088WCD 
Annual Purchase of Pesticides, Fungicides & Herbicides 
Mar Green Resources, LLC 

El Contract# ---~----
Board Approval Date: __ _ 

AGREEMENT FOR ANNUAL PURCHASE OF 
PESTICIDES, FUNGICIDES & HERBICIDES 

THIS AGREEMENT ("Agreement") ls made and entered into by and between Lee 
County, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, hereinafter referred to as the 
11 County 11 and Mar Green Resources, LLC, a Florida company, whose address is 570 
Cypress Crossing, Wellington, FL 33414, and whose federal tax identification number 
is 4 7-1444868, hereinafter referred to as "Vendor. 11 

WITNESSETH 

WHEREAS, the County intends to purchase pesticides, fungicides & herbicides from 
the Vendor in connection with ''Annual Purchase of Pesticides, Fungicides & 
Herbicides" (the "Purchase"); and, 

WHEREAS, the County issued Solicitation No. B220088WCD on January 25, 2022 
(the "Solicitation"); and, 

WHEREAS, the County evaluated the responses received and found the Vendor 
qualified to provide the necessary products and services; and, 

WHEREAS, the County posted a Notice of Intended Decision on April 19, 2022; and, 

WHEREAS, the Vendor has reviewed the products and services to be supplied 
pursuant to this Agreement and is qualified, willing and able to provide all such 
products and services in accordance with its terms. 

NOW, THEREFORE, the County and the Vendor, in consideration of the mutual 
covenants contained herein, do agree as follows: 

I. PRODUCTS AND SERVICES 

The Vendor agrees to diligently provide all products and services for the 
Purchase, a more specific description of the Project Scope of Services is set 
forth in Sections 1 through 5 of the Scope of Work and Specifications section 
of B220088WCD, a photocopy of said sections being attached hereto and 
incorporated by reference as Exhibit A. Vendor shall comply strictly with all of 
the terms and conditions of the Solidtation No. B220088WCD as modified by 
its addendum, copies of which are on file with the County's Department of 
Procurement Management and are deemed incorporated into this Agreement. 

II. TERM AND DELIVERY 

A. This Agreement shall commence immediately upon the effective date and 
shall continue through the delivery of the Purchase and the associated 
warranty period as further described in this Agreement, on an as needed 
basis, for one (1) year period. Upon mutual written agreement of both 
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parties, the parties may renew the Agreement, in whole or in part, for up 
to three (3), additional, one (1) year periods. The Increments of the 
renewal shall be at the sole discretion of the County as deemed in its best 
interest. The effective date shall be the date the Lee County Board of 
County Commissioners awarded the Solicitation to the Vendor. 

8. A purchase order must be issued by the County before commencement of 
any work or purchase of any goods related to this Agreement. 

UL COMPENSATION AND PAYMENT 

A. The County shall pay the Vendor in accordance with the terms and 
conditions of this Agreement for providing all products and services as set 
forth in Exhibit A, and further described in Exhibit Fee Schedule, attached 
hereto and incorporated herein. Said total amount to be all inclusive of 
costs necessary to provide all products and services as outlined in this 
Agreement, and as supported by the Vendor's submittal in response to the 
Solicitation, a copy of which is on file with the County's Department of 
Procurement Management and is deemed incorporated into this Agreement. 

8. Notwithstanding the preceding, Vendor shall not make any deliveries or 
perform any services under this Agreement until receipt of written 
authorization from the County. Vendor acknowledges and agrees that no 
minimum order or amount of product or service is guaranteed under this 
Agreement and County may elect to request no products or services. If the 
County authorizes delivery of products or performance of services, the 
County reserves the right to amend, reduce, or cancel the authorization in 
its sole discretion. 

C. All funds for payment by the County under this Agreement are subject to 
the availability of an annual appropriation for this purpose by the County. 
In the event of non-appropriation of funds by the County for the services 
provided under this Agreement, the County will terminate the contract, 
without termination charge or other liability, on the last day of the then 
current fiscal year or when the appropriation made for the then-current 
year for the services covered by this Agreement is spent, whichever event 
occurs first. If at any time funds are not appropriated for the continuance 
of this Agreement, cancellation shall be accepted by the Vendor on thirty 
(30) days' prior written notice, but failure to give such notice shall be of no 
effect and the County shall not be obligated under this Agreement beyond 
the date of termination. 

IV. METHOD OF PAYMENT 
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A. The County shall pay the Vendor ln accordance with the Local Government 
Prompt Payment Act, Section 218. 70, Florida Statutes, upon receipt of the 
Vendor's invoice and written approval of same by the County indicating that 
the products and services have been provided in conformity with this 
Agreement. 

B. The Vendor shall submit an invoice for payment to the County on a monthly 
basis for those specific products and services as described in Exhibit A (and 
the corresponding fees as described in Exhibit B) that were provided during 
that invoicing period. 

C. For partial shipments or deliveries, progress payments shall be paid 
monthly in proportion to the percentage of products and services delivered 
on those specific line items as approved in writing by the County. 

V. ADDITIONAL PURCHASES 

A. No changes to this Agreement or the performance contemplated hereunder 
shall be made unless the same are in writing and signed by both the Vendor 
and the County. 

B. If the County requires the Vendor to perform additional services or provide 
additional product(s) related to this Agreement, then the Vendor shall be 
entitled to additional compensation based on the Fee Schedule as amended 
to the extent necessary to accommodate such additional work or 
product(s). The additional compensation shall agreed upon before 
commencement of any additional services or provision of additional 
product( s) and shall incorporated into this Agreement by written 
amendment. The County shall not pay for any additional service, work 
performed or product provided before a written amendment to this 
Agreement. 

Notwithstanding the preceding, in the event additional services are required 
as a result of error, omission or negligence of the Vendor, the Vendor shall 
not be entitled to additional compensation. 

VI. LIABILITY OF VENDOR 

A. The Vendor shall save, defend, indemnify and hold harmless the County 
from and against any and all claims, actions, damages, fines, 
penalties1 defense costs, suits or liabilities which may arise out of any act, 
neglect, error, omission or default of the Vendor arising out of or in any 
way connected with the Vendor or subcontractor's performance or failure 
to perform under the terms of this Agreement. 

B, This section shall survive the termination or expiration of this Agreement. 
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VU. VENDOR'S INSURANCE 

A. Vendor shall procure and maintain insurance as specified in Exhibit C 
Insurance Requirements{ attached hereto and made a part of this 
Agreement. 

B. Vendor shall{ on a primary basis and at its sole expense, maintain in full 
force and at all times during the life of this Agreement, insurance 
coverage (including endorsements) and limits as described in Exhibit C. 
These requirements, as well as the County's review or acceptance of 
insurance maintained by Vendor1 are not intended to and shall not in 
any manner limit or qualify the liabilities or obligations assumed by 
Vendor under this Agreement Insurance carriers providing coverage 
required herein must be licensed to conduct business in the State of 
Florida and must possess a current A. M. Financial Strength Rating 
of "B or better." No changes are to made to these specifications 
without prior written specific approval by County Risk Management. To 
the extent multiple insurance coverages and/or County's self-insured 
retention may apply, any and all insurance coverage purchased by 
Vendor and its subcontractors identifying the County as an additional 
named insured shall be primary. 

VIII. RESPONSIBILITIES OF THE VENDOR 

A. The Vendor shall be responsible for the quality and functionality of all 
products supplied and services performed by or at the behest of the Vendor 
under this Agreement. The Vendor shall, without additional compensation, 
correct any errors or deficiencies in its products, or if directed by County, 
supply a comparable replacement product or service. 

B. The Vendor warrants that it has not employed or retained any company or 
person ( other than a bona fide employee working solely for the Vendor), to 
solicit or secure this Agreement and that it has not paid or agreed to pay 
any person, company, corporation, individual, or firm other than a bona 
fide employee working solely for the Vendor, any fee, commission, 
percentage, gift, or any other consideration, contingent upon or resulting 
from the award of this Agreement. 

C. The Vendor shall comply with all federal, state, and local laws, regulations 
and ordinances applicable to the work or payment for work thereof, and 
shall not discriminate on the grounds of race, color, religion, sex, or national 
origin in the performance of work under this Agreement, 

D. Vendor specifically acknowledges its obligations to comply with Section 
119.0701, Florida Statutes, with regard to public records, and shall: 
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1) keep and maintain public records that ordinarily and necessarily 
would be required by the County in order to perform the services 
required under this Agreement; 

2) upon request from the County, provide the County with a copy of the 
requested records or allow the records to be inspected or copied 
within a reasonable time at a cost that does not exceed the cost 
provided in Chapter 119, Florida Statutes, or as otherwise provided 
by law; 

3) ensure that public records that are exempt or confidential and 
exempt from public records disclosure requirements are not 
disclosed 1 except as authorized by law; and 

4) meet all requirements for retaining public records and transfer, at no 
cost to the County, all public records in possession of Vendor upon 
termination of this Agreement and destroy any duplicate public 
records that are exempt or confidential and exempt from public 
records disclosure requirements. All records stored electronically 
must be provided to the County in a format that is compatible with 
the information technology system of the County. 

IF THE VENDOR HAS QUESTIONS REGARDING THE 
APPLICATION OF CHAPTER 1 FLORIDA STATUT 
TO THE VENDOR'S DUTY TO PROVIDE PUBLIC 
RECORDS RELATING TO THE CONTRACT, CONTACT 
THE CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC RECORDS AT 239-533-
2221, 2115 SECOND STREET, FORT MYERS, FL 33901, 
PRRCustodian@leegov mcom; 
http:/ /wwwJeegov.com/publicrecords. 

E. The Vendor is, and shall be, in the performance of all work, services and 
activities under this Agreement, an independent contractor. Vendor is not 
an employee 1 agent or servant of the County and shall not represent itself 
as such. All persons engaged in any work or services performed pursuant 
to this Agreement shall at all times, and in all places, be subject to the 
Vendor's sole direction, supervision and control. The Vendor shall exercise 
control over the means and manner in which it and its employees perform 
the work, and in all respects the Vendor's relationship and the relationship 
of its employees to the County shall be that of an independent contractor 
and not as employees of the County. The Vendor shall be solely responsible 
for providing benefits and insurance to its employees. 

F, The Vendor shall comply with the Vendor Background Screening Affidavit 
attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit E. 
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IX. OWNERSHIP Of PRODUCTS 

It is understood and agreed that all products provided under this Agreement 
shall become the property of the County upon acceptance by the County. 

TIMELY DELIVERY OF PRODUCTS AND PERFORMANCE Of SERVICES 

A. The Vendor shall ensure that all of its staff, contractors and suppliers 
involved in the production or delivery of the products are fully qualified and 
capable to perform their assigned tasks. 

B. The personnel assigned by the Vendor to perform the services pursuant to 
this Agreement shall comply with the terms set forth in this Agreement If 
the services provided require use of specific key personnel, the personnel 
shall be agreed to by the County and Vendor. If the Vendor 1s key personnel 
have been predetermined and approved, through the !citation process 
or otherwise, any subsequent change or substitution to the personnel must 
receive the Countis written approval before said changes or substitution 
can become effective. 

C. The Vendor specifically agrees that all products shall delivered within 
the time limits as set forth in this Agreement, subject only to delays caused 
by force majeure, or as otherwise defined herein. 11 Force majeure 11 shall be 
deemed to be any unforeseeable and unavoidable cause affecting the 
performance of this Agreement arising from or attributable to acts, events, 
omissions or accidents beyond the control of the parties. 

XI. COMPLIANCE WITH APPLICABLE LAW 

This Agreement shall be governed by the laws of the State of Florida. Vendor 
shall promptly comply with all applicable federal, state, county and municipal 
laws, ordinances, regulations, and rules relating to the services to be 
performed hereunder and in effect at the time of performance. Vendor shall 
conduct no activity or provide any service that is unlawful or offensive. 

XII. TERMINATION 

A. The County shall have the right at any time upon thirty (30) days' written 
notice to the Vendor to terminate this Agreement in whole or in part for 
any reason whatsoever. In the event of such termination, the County shall 
be responsible to Vendor only for and compensation earned by the 
Vendor, in accordance with Section III, prior to the effective date of said 
termination. In no event shall the County be responsible for lost profits of 
Vendor or any other elements of breach of contract. 

B. After receipt of a notice of termination, except as otherwise directed, the 
Vendor shall stop work on the date of receipt of the notice of termination 
or other date specified in the notice; place no further orders or sub-
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contracts for materials, services 1 or facilities except as necessary for 
completion of such portion of the work not terminated; terminate all 
vendors and subcontracts; and all outstanding liabilities and claims. 

DISPUTE RESOLUTION 

A. In the event of a dispute or claim arising out of this Agreement, the parties 
agree first to try in good faith to the dispute by direct discussion, If 
this is unsuccessful, the parties may enter into mediation in Lee County, 
Florida, with the parties sharing equally in the cost of such mediation. 

B. In the event mediation, if attempted, is unsuccessful in resolving a dispute, 
the parties may proceed to litigation as set forth below. 

C. Any dispute, action or proceeding a rising out of or related to this Agreement 
will be exclusively commenced in the state courts of Lee County 1 Florida, or 
where proper subject matter jurisdiction exists, in the United States District 
Court for the Middle District of Florida. Each party irrevocably submits and 
waives any objections to the exclusive personal jurisdiction and venue of 
such courts, including any objection based on forum non conveniens. 

D. This Agreement and the rights and obligations of the parties shall be 
governed by the laws of the State of Florida without regard to its conflict of 
laws principles. 

E. Unless otherwise agreed in writing, the Vendor shall be required to continue 
all obligations under this Agreement during the pendency of a claim or 
dispute including, but not limited to, actual periods of mediation or judicial 
proceedings. 

VENDOR WARRANTY 

A. All products provided under this Agreement shall be new ( unless specifically 
identified otherwise in Exhibit C) and of the most suitable grade for the 
purpose intended. 

B. If any product delivered does not meet performance representations or 
other quality assurance representations as published by manufacturers, 
producers or distributors of the products or the specifications listed in this 
Agreement, the Vendor shall pick up the product from the County at no 
expense to the County. The County reserves the right to any or all 
materials if, in its judgment, the item reflects unsatisfactory workmanship 
or manufacturing or shipping damage. In such case 1 the Vendor shall 
refund to the County any money which has paid for same. 
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XV. MISCELLANEOUS 

A. This Agreement constitutes the sole and complete understanding between 
the rties and supersedes all other contracts between them, whether oral 
or written, with respect to the subject matter. No amendment, change or 
addendum to this Agreement is enforceable unless agreed to in writing by 
both parties and incorporated into this Agreement. 

B. The provisions of this Agreement shall inure to the benefit of and be binding 
upon the respective successors and assignees of the parties hereto. A party 
to this Agreement shall not sell, transfer, assign, license, franchise, 
restructure, alter, or change its corporate structure or otherwise part with 
possession or mortgage, charge or encumber any right or obligation under 
this Agreement without the proposed assignee and/or party restructuring, 
altering or changing its corporate structure agreeing in writing with the 
non-assigning party to observe and perform the terms, conditions and 
restrictions on the part of the assigning party to this Agreementr whether 
express or implied, as if the proposed assignee and/or party restructuring, 
altering or changing its corporate structure was an original contracting 
party to this Agreement. Notwithstanding the foregoing provision, the 
Vendor may assign its rights if given written authorization by the County 
and claims for the money due or to become due to the Vendor from the 
County under this Agreement may be assigned to a financial institution or 
to a trustee in bankruptcy without such approval from the County. Notice 
of any such transfer or assignment due to bankruptcy shall be promptly 
given to the County. 

C. The exercise by either party of any rights or remedies provided herein shall 
not constitute a waiver of any other rights or remedies available under this 
Agreement or any applicable law. 

D. The failure of the County to enforce one or more of the provisions of the 
Agreement shall not be construed to be and shall not be a waiver of any 
such provision or provisions or of its right thereafter to enforce each and 
every such provision. 

E. The parties covenant and agree that each is duly authorized to enter into 
and perform this Agreement and those executing this Agreement have all 
requisite power and authority to bind the parties. 

F. Neither the County's review, approval or acceptance of, nor payment for, 
the products and services required under this Agreement shall construed 
to operate as a waiver any rights under this Agreement or of any cause 
of action arising out of the performance of this Agreement. 

G. If the Vendor is comprised of more than one legal entity, each entity shall 
be jointly and severally liable hereunder. 
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Name: 

Title: 

Address: 

Telephone: 

Facsimile: 

Email: 

H. When any period of time is referred to by days herein, it shall be computed 
to exclude the first day and include the last day of such period. When the 
period of time is fewer than three (3) days, it shall mean business days as 
defined by Lee County. If the period of time is greater than three (3) days 1 

then it shall mean calendar days. For any period of time greater than seven 
(7) days, where the deadline falls on a Saturday, Sunday, or Lee County 
recognized holiday, the deadline will then fall to the next Monday or non­
Lee County recognized holiday 

L Any notices of default or termination shall be sufficient if sent by the parties 
via United States certified mail, postage paid 1 or via a nationally recognized 
delivery service, to the addresses listed below: 

Kriss J. Ramroop Names: Roger Desjarlais Mary Tucker 

Authorized Member Titles: County Manager Procurement 
Management Director 

570 Cypress Crossing Address: P.O. Box 398 
Wellington, FL 33414 Fort Myers, FL 33902 
(561) 791-6298 Telephone: (239) 533-2221 (239) 533-8881 

N/A Facsimile: (239) 485-2262 (239) 485-8383 

sales@margreenresources.com Email: rdesjarlais(aJleegov. corn mtucker(a)leegov .com 

J. Any change in the County's or the Vendor's Representative will be promptly 
communicated by the party making the change. 

K. Paragraph headings are for the convenience of the parties and for reference 
purposes only and shall be given no legal effect. 

L. In the event of conflicts or inconsistencies, the documents shall be given 
precedence in the following order: 

1. Agreement 
2. County's Purchase Order 
3. Solicitation 
4. Vendor's Submittal in Response to the Solicitation 

[The remainder of this page intentionally left blank.] 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this Agreement as of the date 
last below written. 

WITNESS: 

Deputy Ce.rt 

APPROVED AS TO FORM FOR THE 
RELIANCE OF LEE COUNTY ONLY : 

Mar GreenErces, LLC 

Signed By :__..,~---------­

Print Name: U-{S$' ~f-ooP 

Title : /'t-o,1-tc,t.{ &-V Mth ~t;-.fL. 

Date : G{ l1> (1..:z_ 

LEE COUNTY 

BOARD OF 
OF LEE C 

DATE : __,.7_ ,,--_j _.,. .,2_;_~ - ---

...:omm1ss1oncr Ccc1I L Pendergrass, Chainnan 
Lee County Board of County Commissioners 
District 2 

~,,,\\\\\\IIIIIIUIMIII.... 

~\\ t~~!!tr.,--~ ~ ~~ ~ 
§f'_l ~ 
~l ~ 
= ' SEAL c: S : I =: 
~ \ I S -:::::.:,,,,,,, . . ~ 

~,~.. ,l ~ 
~~~": '• •'.r·~ ~-~~o:;:._ .... ...... ~~~ 

/4/jfr--
BY :_O_F-FI_C_E_O_ F --llf"--'H,_E_C_O_U_N_TY _ _ A TT_O_R_N-EY 

"///11~~ ~~~ 
111111111 nii\\\\\\\~ 
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1. 

EXHIBIT A 
SCOPE OF WORK AND SPECIFICATIONS 

SCOPE 
1 : . 7he Lei::, C.::m~ry Board of C.:'.lu.uty C-.:-11l:i.1:..:1•13tt:,:ner,; ,.eel:·, ,,:, s:,:.nb:i:::, v;.rnt (tl:-3~1.ficd '•v'e1:d.:>n: .. ) r,:, purchase 

Pesb:1:des. Fungicide-~ & H~:tJic1d.e,,. o:n .:i.J.'.. · ,:'l',-c.ee,~d · '.,:::;,-,t~; The p1,:1,:i1_4:•c. t.:.,,:e,d ,:-L" th-t Bid F.:·-ia:. ::lu,11 be 
del:i:,·ei,ed. t<> Coun::-•.: foc:iJit:ie,, by th,e :t<t1,e<:,tu:.g dep:111me11t :.-:, diser.:ted. 

DELI\ TRY R.I:Ql:IREL\!El"l""TS 
_ • Shlpn:eut-:;; :_;ball be Free o:n Bc,a1·d (FOB;, De, tu1a~:c-i:::. ::!..elivet'ed :,.nd u.clc,ai:led by 7l:i!: \."e11ck::f ~~L,.·e:v d:i~_·ei· 

bet\Ve€"'"...1 the 1:,:,ur,:.. ofS:00 P.:•~f to 4:::,o p~.,.r Ea:;te111 T:ir.ne. ~•.f•'.:'11.d.ay tluoug.t Fr:::l.ay. "":~tb.ir:. three 1_31 i:r1le111:i.11· cl1y,, 
13.ftet verbaL electrocic. os fax re<·eipt ,:,: ,ljl ord.e: pl~;ced by ~w "uth,:,nz.ed me-mi:;;-ei ,)f the C c,·,mty. 

:~;~~:~~

1tXe~::;··:: 1:~:1:~r~j~t,:::~J.~~/~;~:·~l:;1~;,':ic~~~;i~:~::·;~~.:/!~;:~t:t~~,fl:~1:1°1~;~:7,~l~~;:i1J:,~~~/~ 
'.:Lt.eel in tl:.e- , .. ,:,,:,pe :.11 1,e:,.,, tl1,:1.11 .2-! b.,:!ur:~. Tl:e C(,i;.i..:.:v 1,1:ill en.:k~1Vof t,::: ai.iillll-UZo;- :Le u;unhe-: of e-..1:e1gl::'l1c-v" 
deli~ .. ·ei1E-(, .. 

:11e C::uc.ry re,<:'t-,es tt.e :·1gl1t r.;;:, :·,efni,E- {iel:•..:e:y if th:i.t deli~.·e·ry i-:. cot u: th.t' p"\)p~· 71zt:.er'r;,n:e the Vend,::r :1t,', 

m:p1·,.:·pEr .eqmpi:n,eut h:: ,:;::r1,.:,;,,d tbe ,1.:-ti•:erv th,:- \te-,;.1d1)= :', :a:..:-i11g i.L:Up,vper :.;aferv p:~;-\l',b:su•, . .1nd.:,x rhe ·vencfor 
1.:.::,-:: maift:.uc:-ti,::nmg e.;1nipment 

~.5 7he Product t·k-;1ne, ;Ju.it Pr:ce b:d t:;y the \7f."'J.,;i,:,r 'TJrute of fvfe.0.~,·,1rc. and (Iii"J.:.,:ty ciehve:ed ~h.-tl; be de2.J.'ly 

::i~~:::\::~~:.~::-::;·;~~l~~~\~~,~~::~:~i~~a~r::1,:~0

::~e~~:-·=::i
1~s:~,~i~~·=,~~~-l~::i~:~.:~\~~;~;;c;•;:\~~1'.'r~1/::~~:~t:~;·t:~;:t:. 

ct:r11-prryrne11t 

2 6. 7he C.;:·:l:ntv re•:,e-1-;;e-, ~t.i:: =-igh7 ~,:.:--,:Hid::,: delete d"='b.·s:-:y ·::te:, ,1! tt•:; d:~•:ret:iot: ... r ::u::y t1me t~1:rc,1.:_~ho~it tl:i::- -:-~:-::i:. ,:,f 
tn<:':' Agre~1e11t 

711e Ve111:k:f" ,~li•:eiy d:i-iver ·:chaE p1·e:::e11t .~ ph.:·•t(: ID. :11x,r: i:ki.i~.·ery 71ie LD '-h,1'..1 :/:1-.:,',v ,Lit t~e d.r:Ye; :', :'tll 
e-::nplcyee ,:if either the t11.1.C~ing c,,:si.:npa.ny ,x :bi= \-'-e:c.d,:>r. All per•;o!l11"1 u~-u.:.::ng del:ve:1e', ;hat ·,,ve,·1:r tl:e 
rippr.::pn . .'\tc- fH:•,1;,::11i'!l prore,:ti·v·e equipt:neut (PPE! a, ... r<:"C::iiJe-d by tl:e Sa:~r:~• D.;-,ti\ S~et 1.\.11v :·•n:iet ,:t.:-1.i~:e-ry h 

·,t,bject tc:-, :.=.1~,pec-tfou prior w ;;<::,.:-e-pt.11:c~ bv :-,.r:. :'.nt!:01:..z.ed 1:neu:ber c: the (onuty. 

:.: 8 -Yhe V€'1:.:'kn "hat il:t'I:' re;.poa;;ible foe· r1ny ·:cp:oU', fr.c,m :1:e fa.:.1·.irce of it-; or ,t~ ",;1bc0mf,\t:h:ir · ~ :Lel.i• .. •er:,· equ:ptn~: 
:x ::rein-:. frdm·e i::i .:me:.idant ,~l.:.1:-t"ry p•':'nC•l'.llld :n rh,e pr.:·-per p-.!'t·for01:;\11C€ c,f the-:.:r dnt1e'~ 

..: >· Pr,:iper p<cd0nnruice :,;h;i;ll n:-ffcl.U-i:- :--.tte-n-,J.au: :ieL'Jt-::V penc::,ru:1el( ,;:, con',t,".r:/ in··.,p.;-oion ,1Ld o:.;r';,e:"'.':".:i,:,n ::,f 

1-:uloadiug 1:::penui,:,n', .;.nd k:n-:ri,vle-dger1ble te-.spe<!.l';,e to pr,.::,t .. leu:i: .. <>r eme:rgencie,,. ,,vh.1,.:·t 1.v-::-,u:d i:n:::-,-:t c-.::>mi:n-::si.:;.;y 
be e:xp'"ct~d to ..::·-c,:i~ The C.:,,1.:.u:-::/ re,,er-:•e:" 7C• n§'ht t,:, re:fu.~,e ;;W.Y :u:.d nll d~;1•,e-:i :e•,. 1ru1de- ·1v"th e,]U~pme:1t tb.:H ~-, 
p,:: (',t ; y l.l'l..aillt..:'.l!it1ed . 

.2 : (I 7he tnnkc; ,:;r tr2<.:.lei··: ,,ball be d,eru1 cii.:.d :::r,ee of r,e·:,id.1:.e ri.1z,t 1)1.tl:," ..::,::utarrun,:it,a- the Vien-::tor- -produc• o: u.:npe,d.e thE-
1.:cl,:,ading p:·•:i-.:e•,~- :11-e V'='u::t,:,:- =;;l::,,;~H verify fa'=" clt-i"t::llke-0,:, -::-f -be- tr:u:.,:,p<:,rting e-.:1n~pr.:11.,,:.>l:lt h<:'fofe b::i&.11~ 

-. ~ 1 if the .':pill :i,:, uot de:J.11ed up. the C'mLU·,y w1ll 6,e ~ ,.:·eitified hau,rd..:::-,1.:.'., U'.LY:)e?:ial hr1.u:i~1ag •.:-om.p,,.i:}' •,.:·• ,:·'.ecm '..lf' 
rhe :;pill. .;-,i:.d die co:;t of i-l~i:h c,,::-rvice ::.t3H he cha:r§!ed tc, th<:> '•/em:k:r a11d deducted fn::1:::1. 'ilR ,illh:•1:.:r due t<;, the 
\i e11dc1· for 111,;,.tedal ·,. 

J.. S.liET'f DATA SHEET~ 1SI>S) 
3 •. :11e Ve11d-::r sl:atl illHy,.:crtnply 1:1ntb. all :~,::l.,er3L ',ta-i::'. J.nd ku:.;11 :eg-c1latis:--n.', rega:ding produc7 l,:1J)~~in_g:. pz~d:aglil;§:. 

a.ud ~;afety i::1,::tudiog prnviding Ul.."itiet,~1 sc1:~ty ,.1..Y:i"!, c:;b.eel-; v:ith each ',t.ipu-;;-e-m hl':'l·euuder 
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-I, cm,IP . .:\.R.A.BLI C\"IT'S 
4 •,M1ere Brand >fame ,:u1d 

co11tr;;:ct 

-4 'Ve11di::r .~haH ::;e,eii: rmt.b:xized tf.1.'.!fe•~E-c.:t,,U:e 
;:m:iclia:,;e-. Ve-c.1.:iof shall be,u re-.':1t;,Cii1',1r::U1t'.t•)f m.:u1:ed f(,;c me of 

na.111e rill.-:i the 

4 2.1 : . aheratio:i ,:,,f the E),:t:d Bid ~:C'::ledu:e. oth4='r tb;:i1:; ~te 

pr:i::r 
,.:-;1.::ry 

:..i~ted ,;,r1,b1 'V~d:~.r·,, 
,_,_,;,u~.''"'"'·''·<C nmt '>t:..11? 

u,,:m-pay;i~em ,:·,f ic.;/.::-,:ce:, 

110:l· 

Uu:.! 
,1,xnmeuted iL 1 t; pn::pe:r ieem *he V r.11dor i::.011re';pom1~/e -11:d :..111~1c2ti'.::le 

~. :1.DDITIO:\"'.-U..: PRODUCTS 
1:.1€ d.ele,e. a11y !:.me. and -:"t 
tb.i··.; A.g1e~meat:1 .• i:it1trn 111 tht bbt in°-ere~r of the 

Er;d 
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:~PI:CL.li.L CO'.\"DITIO:'\"~ 
Tl:ese ;,:re c,:i11dit10u1 tl::,at :ue w ,efobc:,.c. th:.'.' ",Ol:CttaH,),i: i1:ld have n,:,t i:J~n mch:,~d in the 
:md (ondi::.,:,,c.:: the 

1. CO)tTRl.(T ITRM 
1 : . The 'V ffidc,r ~:lu11 I 

,,v,::,rk \V11l 1;ie :iutl1:o: 12r.<i. ·Ki1ecmt,e{t 

1ec1u1:c::;t1.n1'. dep:111mec~. expnf.~1?1:i or 
under r.111, I:n~•itario!l ti:: Bid (ITB}: 

:u:d mee 0 tl:e ,::um,: 
:;c. :be Bid Sclledule :b.17 

E~l·, 

..: :, Th::, \VcL 31lOVi indfftdnal dep:-.:::-rm,ent•:; 
:te ,-;..,,,,.,,, .. ,,,,,.,,,.t u.:e<L The 

w,e !he '\'euckr that ha1 ,he needed pfc,du.:: ttat br:::: 
•o ptird:i;:•~e thE: p,.,:i<it:ct ,:,r ';,:-,''1c.e li.:,red ill th.L::, 

e1,.e1;r:u,ec"e in :m .exne:rge11-:y 

the 

remain tixed for tte tt1u1 of the co11tr:-ct n1li.es ,,, 
•,vrm,::11aec:l::'t:-.l1.ent i;i.;-tweei: tht C(n~:.:tt:':' and the \'ec.(k•r. 

illCf€';'B€' 

,efiur.,,t f:::n 
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Add1=t:.du.rn Nr;i::nber l 

addittorn. 
p~i ('•f foe h''·''-L<,>,l'V.W., 

L A.TIA(HMINT: UPD . ..\.ITD BID FOR\1 

floc,1 , P flc,01 

Fort Myer~. FL 3J9(ll 
:-.fain Lini:: 1139,1 ~33-S8Sl 

f ,n: Lino:- (:239) 485-8383 

n:od1fic:;;:11.::!l'J the : efetenc:,td 
l',Ct rei,:-r,ew:ed hertill 1'e'.l:aJ.!l \Jt'IJ:·i1ru:i,ged. u.,.,u ... a.u<:C 

the 

BIDDI:RPROPOSER IS AD\1SED. YOC .\RE TO A(D'0'1YLEDC,T RECEIPT OF nns 
A.DDI:\Til~l \,\filN 'S'FK\UTIING _..\. FAILFRE TO CO:\-[PLY 'i'HTH nns 
REQtTIRI:'.\[EST ~u y RESFLT IN TIIT BIDDERJPROPO:SER BE[\'(.; CONSIDERED NON-RESPo:,srYI:, 

ALL OTHER rrru.1s _..\_;,'\"T) ( 01\TIITIO:'.'T:s; OF THI :SOLICIT..\ TIO::\" D0Cl');[[7',7TS, A.RE A:,..T) :;HALL 
REI\1.-UN THE .SA .. \IT. 

P:,:.cure-.l:.ei:t Dire.:: Lure 239-533-8831 
Lee Procur emE':nt .'d,dJ..l•.l\;eu.~1.r; 

1 1 
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EXHIBIT B 
FEE SCHEDULE 

Purchasf!:I ofFungicides, Herbicides &.Pesticides 
.· .. . .· . . . 

Fwwicides 

Item Description 
Unit of 

Measure 
I Cleary's 3336 For Surface Fungis Gallon 
2 Heritage Pound 
') 

Horticultural Oil Gallon _) 

Herbicides 

Item Description 
Unit of 

Measure 
I 2.4-D Amine Gallon 
2 Accord Gallon 
3 Aqua Star Gallon 
4 Aquathol Super K Pound 
5 Arsenal Gallon 
6 Celsius Ounce 
7 Clearcast Gallon 
8 Clipper Pound 
9 Clipper SC Gallon 
10 Comet Gallon 
11 Diquat 2L Gallon 
12 Dismiss South Pint 
13 Drive XLR 8 Gallon 
14 Element 3A Gallon 
15 Element 4 C1;:lllon 
16 Escort XP (granular) Pound 
17 Esplanade '.200 SC Quart 
18 Esplanade 200 SC Ciallon 
19 Garlon 4 Ultra Gallon 
20 Glyphosate 4 Plus Gallon 
21 Habitat (Wetland lmazypyr) Gallon 
22 Honcho Gallon 
23 Kerb Gallon 
24 Krovar OF Pound 
25 LI 700 Gallon 
26 Manor Ounce 

27 Method 240S L Gallon 
28 Milestone Gallon 
29 Monument Box 

30 Oust Extra (granule) Pound 
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Unit Price 

$65.00 

$140.00 

$19.00 

lJnit Price 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
$12.00 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

No Bid 
$110.00 

$116.00 

No Bid 
No Bid 
$80.00 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Biel 
No Bid 

No Biel 

$265.00 

No Bid 
No Bid 
$6.00 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 



31 Pathfinder ll Gallon No Bid 
32 Poast Gallon No Biel 
33 Polaris (Upland lmazpyr) Gallon No Biel 
34 Polaris (Arsenal) Gallon No Bid 
35 Procel la Cor SC Gallon No Bid 
36 Procella COR SC I 2PDU/Unit Case $3,500.00 

37 Ranger Pro ( Upland Glyphosate) Gallon No Bid 
38 Razor Pro Gallon No Bid 
39 Renovate 3 Gallon No Bid 
40 Resolute 65 W Pound $20.00 
41 Revolver Ounce $8.00 
42 Reward (Aquatic) Gallon No Bid 
43 Rodeo (Wetland Glyphosate) Gallon No Bid 
44 Round Up Gallon No Bid 
45 Round Up Custom Gallon No Biel 
46 Round Up Pro Gallon No Bid 
47 Round Up Quick Pro Pound No Bid 
48 Sahara Pound $15.00 
49 Solicam DF Pound No Bid 
50 Sonar AS Gallon No Bid 
51 Sonar One Pound No Bid 
,,.,.., 
),:_, Sonar SRP Pound No Bid 
53 Sonar Q Pound No Bid 
54 Surflan (Pre-Emergent) Gallon No Bid 
55 Tigr Gallon No Bid 
56 Trycera Gallon No Bid 

57 Ve Iossa Gallon No Bid 
58 Velpar L Gallon No Bid 
59 Vista Quart No Bid 
60 Vista Gallon No Bid 

61 Weedar 64 Gallon No Bid 

Pesticide--lnsecticfrle 

Item Description 
Unit of 

Unit Price 
Measure 

1 Acephate Pound No Bid 
2 Arena 50 Gallon $16.00 
3 Bandit Pound $1.20 
4 Merit WSP 75 Ounce $5.00 
5 TalStar (Concentrate) Gallon $58.00 
6 Ta!Star (Granular) Pound $0.80 
7 Top Choice Pound $1.41 
8 Ultra Fine Oil Gallon $19.00 

Other Products 
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Item Description 
Unit of 

Unit Price 
Measure 

l Antifoamer/defoamer Gallon No Biel 
') Blue Dye Spray Indicator Dye Qua1t No Biel L, 

-, Buffer Extra Strength Gallon No Bid J 

4 Cohere Gallon No Biel 

5 Cutrine (Kills Algae) Gallon No Bid 

6 Cutrine Plus GR Pound No Bid 

7 Daconil Gallon No Bid 

8 Diluent Blue Oil Galion No Bid 
9 DLZ Gallon No Biel 

10 Hydrothal 19 l Gallon No Bid 

11 Impel Reel Oil C1allon No Bid 
12 Indicator (Marking Dye) Quart No Bid 

13 Indicator (Marking Dye) Gallon No Bid 

14 l'Vocl Gallon No Bid 

15 JLB Oil Gallon No Bid 

16 Kmmno-We Agent Gallon No Bid 

17 Kammo Plus Gallon No Bid 

18 Kinetic Quart No Bid 

19 Performance Wetter Gallon No Bid 

20 Sinker-Drift Agent Gallon No Bid 

21 Stenner (Injection) Each No Bid 

22 TopFilrn Gallon No Bid 

23 Wipeout XS ( cleaner) Gallon No Bid 

Comparable Unit 

Item Description 
Unit of 

Unit Price 
Measure 

I Fungicide item # 1 Transom 2x 2.5g 2.Sgal $162.50 
2 Fungicide item #2 Strobe 50WG 1 lb Pound $140.00 
3 Funcicide item #3 Drexel Damoil 2x2.5g Sgal case $95.00 

4 Herbicide item # 12 Sul fen Southern 64oz 64oz $440.00 

5 Herbicide item # 13 Quinclorac 1.5 4x64oz 
4x64oz 

$232.00 
Case 

6 Herbicide item # 16 Patriot 60DF 16oz I lb $80.00 
7 Herbicide item #23 Pronamide 3.3SC 2x I gal 2gal case $530.00 
8 Herbicide item #26 Patriot 8oz 8oz $48.00 

9 Herbicide item #48 Mojave 70eg Sib $75.00 
10 Insecticide item #3 Merit .5 G 301b 301b $36,00 

11 Insecticide item #5 Bifen 7.9 Select I gal !gal $58.00 
12 Insecticide item #6 Biten Lp 251b 251b $20.00 
13 Insecticide item #7 Fipronil .0143G 301b 301b $42.30 

14 Insecticide item #8 Drexel Darnoil 2x2.5G 5gal case $95.00 
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EXHIBIT C 
INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS 

Lee County Ins.urn nee Requfremeut;; 
indudini Pollution Lin bility 

:\liuimum Imm'all(e R.€-quiremems: Risk Jfa1t<1ge111e11t i1r 110 11or tc'}Jrt''•f'W', 1huf the 
inrnrance 1cqnired h. H{ffitit'm or tuleqnmi:.' ro protect the 1'c'ndor~' inft'reH <)r lwbilifU:'<-. Tin' 
fol/on ing ,1re rhc' reqniretl mimr,wms !ht• n'ndor IM/ r,f l!UdJlfr1in thro11ghour rile d11nJtio11 of 
this co.mrao. The Coumr rneh•e<. the right i'ti i-ecp1e11 il'dditio.1Ml doo11t1t'mari01r regm·ding 
inrnnwc1;• prodded 

a,. Commei d,1l C.;..e.nfft1l Uabilit1: - Co\'t'L'.g:e ~.lv-.11 3pply to pre:r:n.:ses ::i.ncVor operJtions. 
prodtu:r::. and completed oper:iti<)n•;,. i.ndepe-rdent con:r::i:::tor:.. contn::tu:d h3bLliry 
<""Xpo;urec; 1,v1th nunirnum limits of: 

$1. 0r}O. OGO per ,x carrence 
$2.()1}1}.0(IO gen~al aggregJte 
'i: 1.000./XH) products :u1d (omplot'td operation·~ 
$1.0(Hl()(H) persl)nal and ~dvc-rn:;,ing: :nJury 

b. Bu,;ine.;;,; Auto LiabHitr - :l:1e foHowing /n1tor::1obtle Li::tbihty \Vtll he requ:red JJld 
::;;:n:erage ::;ball .:i.pply ,Ct all o,,-.,,ned. htre•:l :md 11..:)11-c,,.vn.ed 1.1ehidt,, :i-:.e \,.r1th ni:run:um 
li.r:1irs of 

$ 100{, 000 (on1hi.11ed s.i.ngle 1i.t111t (C'SU 

,: , \Yorkers' C ompens.;Uion - St:.1t..itnrv benefits J.',, clefi.ned by F:S 440 c-n,:.:om1x1::::i.i1~ ::ill 
operaricins c,:,w:empfrtteci bv tli.;,, ,::ontniu cc agreemem to apply to aH o'.1!ner,;. office-rs. 
:-md c-n:ployees regardles; of the number ,)f en:pl0yee~. '\\.'ixker,; C,)mpens:a.tlcn 
exemption·~ may be accepted 1,1:tH1 ,vrir,en ?roo: of ille StJte ot flon.ia · s :~ppn::v:il ,::,f ::,u::h 
-exemption. Employers· ti:).bility 1.vill h?1Ve mi.1111'lmn1 Enut:; of: 

$50~).1)00 per accidenr 
$50·0 t}OO di;ease km.it 
$500.000 di;e;1se - policy limit 

d. Pollution Lfabihtv - Covering pr,)rier-c;' lo,,, :wd bbltty :i.r: 0:.ing from pol1ut1on-rel:~kd 
:::tu1:,1ge:,,. :i}r sites (hat have been m.:;,i:ico:ed .J.nd found ,.1.nccn1tamina1ed Transporter 
1r:i:~ving h3Z:u·dous products or \v;-i<:.te a~ ::cirg.:; ,'.'iboard the rr::i1Ep1,)rter•~ tnJd~· 

,.Tlte ti:!(JUited miuimum limil (~l liabi!i~1· $/iOH'lJ in a, or !J, ma_,, bt? pn;,•ided hr rlle /t1tm 1.~( 
E,ce~.:i 111 ~flrance" or ··c ommerda.1 Fmbrfila Policies," In 11·ldch tOH', a "FolltN•ing Form 

Endt,nemem ··· r1·ill be requlred on ihe 'Exce~s Jurnrauce Pohry" (ft "Co11mu.'ffiai Crnbrdia 
Pohc,L" 

Solicitation No. B220088WCD Page 18 of 20 



L CovefJ,ge s.hJ.11 be in pla:::e pri::1r r::i the ::::in:.1He11(emem .:)t ;my 1.,.-ork and tbs,.:,ugho·Jt rhe 
durarion Df the contrne. A ,:emficare of msurame 1,v:H be provided to rhe R.:::.k :vfa.11:.1gc-r 
for rev1e',;; and 1pprov;;,l. The certifo:·;."l;te ·~ha.H pr::ivtde ~t)f i:he foHowing: 

Lt(' County Bom d r:1f ( onntv C ommi'::;•)fone-r·s 
P.O. Bo::r ~98 
Fon Mnn, FlorkL, 33902 

b. "Lee Coun~1•, a political mbdfrNon awl Cfrnrft•r C}1m~;· l~( rh..: Stme ofFfotfrfa, m 
,1gews, mq1!oree~, 1mdJHtbhr (~.((idal~ vdll he trnmed a~ tm ' Addirion,11 Iu,;ure-d' 
on the (..;.e.nend Lfrlbilit:, polkv, induding Produi::r,, and C (im1>leh:.d Opfl·rtrio11·5 
fOY1ff.lgE>. 

c Lee County ,..,nll be given notice prior t(\ c:u1edl:Hion or modi fie ;:ition of :u1y 
~;ttpnlJ.red in;urance Such ncitifi<:Jtion w:ll be m i}!ntuig by registered mail. return 
receipt requc"'ted zmd addre~se(t :::, the :3'....isk f,,.:a11ager (P 0. BOX 398 ft. ~:1vers, ?L 
33f1D:?}. 

Spedal Requirt>mem•;: 

t Ir. i =· the re;ponsibihty of the gencr:il ~Dn1r::u:tor ~o m<:,ure tht1t :::;11 :,Ub<:::onrractors c:::i1:1ply 
v:tth all i.11surJ11ce requiremetW,. 
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EXHIBIT D 

VENDOR BACKGROUND SCREENING AFFIDAVIT 

Lee County 
.S~•,t!':4(4.·~::t f.;;(~;:/~ 

VENDOR BACKGROUND 
SCREENING AFFIDAVIT 

Florida Statutes Chapter 435 governs required background screenings for any employees, 
contractors, subcontractors, or agents of the Vendor who wi II have contact with any vulnerable 
person, as defined by statute. or who otherwise are required to undergo a Level I or Level 2 
background screening in accordance with Florida law. 

The Vendor is responsible for ensuring that such required background screenings are conducted 
in accordance with Florida Statutes Chapter 435. Documentation of such completed background 
screenings must be maintained for a period of no less than five (5) years and are subject to audit 
by Lee County at any time during such five (5) year period. 

Under penalty of perjury, I declare that I have read and understand the requirements stated 
above, and that all required background screenings shall be conducted in accordance with 
this affidavit. l further understand that there may be additional locaL state, and federal 
regulations that may require background screening, and that the Vendor vvi II be solely 
responsible for complying vvith such legal requirements. Furthermore~ the Vendor shall 
indemnify and hold Lee County harmless from any and all claims or actions resulting from failure 
to comply with this affidavit. 

Date: :) I l ti I 2 2 

STATEOF FL . 
COUNTY oFPa\M &ru:h 

Signature 

ltiU-> 5 ~µDP /t-u~t.tz. .. e: !J M-tM. 6 f!/L­
Name/Title 

The foregoing instrument was sworn to (or affirmed) and subscribed before me by means of ~ysical 
presence or □ online notarization, this _JQ_ day of Me\'-1 , ;;;/)2 , by the above-named person 
and in their stated capacity, and is either p~rsonally known fu me or who has produced the following as 
identification: ______________________ _ 

[Stamp/seal required] 

c"~!.~~ MELISSA V. ROWELL 
~.. • CommlsslontGG3Ca066 

* * 
~ fl Expires June 29, 2023 
">,-o, , ... o~ Bonckldlltll Bu6.1ttNolary81nioM 

Solicitation No. B220088WCD Page 20 of 20 




