



Lee County
Southwest Florida

Lee County Procurement Management Division
2115 Second Street, 1st Floor
Fort Myers, FL 33901
Main Line: (239) 533-8881
Fax Line: (239) 485-8383
www.lee.gov.com/procurement

Bid Opening Tabulation

Bid Number: B210268LLP

Bid Title: Lubricant Products - Countywide

Opening Date: Monday, August 02, 2021

Opening Time: 2:30 PM

Opened By: Laura Purks

Title: Procurement Analyst

Verified By: *Christy VanAllen*

Attended Opening: See Sign-In Sheet

FIRM	COST	
1 <i>Mighty Auto Parts of Southwest Florida</i>	Category 1: <i>\$81,553.60</i> Category 2: <i>NO BID</i> Category 3: <i>\$1,995.00</i> Category 4: <i>NO BID</i> Category 5: <i>\$81,858.42</i> Category 6: <i>NO BID</i>	Category 7: <i>\$407.00</i> Category 8: <i>NO BID</i> Category 9: <i>\$78,706.88</i> Category 10: <i>NO BID</i> Category 11: <i>NO BID</i> Category 12: <i>26%</i>
2 <i>Palmdale Oil Company</i>	Category 1: <i>\$96,540.02</i> Category 2: <i>\$115,686.35</i> Category 3: <i>\$16,848.45</i> Category 4: <i>\$35,940.00</i> Category 5: <i>\$78,337.08</i> Category 6: <i>\$14,519.65</i>	Category 7: <i>\$665.00</i> Category 8: <i>NO BID</i> Category 9: <i>\$40,563.15</i> Category 10: <i>\$98,384.55</i> Category 11: <i>\$247,996.68</i> Category 12: <i>0%</i>

** AWARD TO BE MADE AFTER STAFF RECOMMENDATION AND COUNTY COMMISSION APPROVAL AT A LATER DATE**