
B200333AEJ 
Minor Paving, Drainage and Concrete Improvements - Countywide 
Community Asphalt Corp. - Amendment No. I 

FIRST AMENDMENT OF THE MASTER CONSTRUCTION AGREEMENT FOR MINOR 

• PAVING, DRAINAGE AND CONCRETE IMPROVEMENTS - COUNTYWIDE 

THIS FIRST AMENDMENT OF THE MASTER CONSTRUCTION AGREEMENT FOR 

MINOR PA YING, DRAINAGE AND CONCRETE IMPROVEMENTS - COUNTYWIDE, made 

and entered into by and between the Lee County Board of County Commissioners, a political 

subdivision of the State of Florida ("County") and Community Asphalt Corp., ("Contractor"), 

collectively, the "Parties." 

WHEREAS, the County executed a Master Construction Agreement for the purchase of 

minor paving, drainage, and concrete improvement services, through Solicitation B200333AEJ 

with Contractor on the 18th day of December, 2020 ("Agreement"); 

WHEREAS, it was discovered after the execution of the Agreement that the MOT/MOB 

line items in Exhibit E. Bid Form and Required Documents, were incorrectly labeled as an 

'Estimated Quantity' ; and, 

WHEREAS, the County and Contractor desire to enter into this First Amendment to revise 

the Exhibit E. Bid Form and Required Documents to fix the label of the MOT/MOB item 

percentage cost; and, 

WHEREAS, the Parties desire to modify the Agreement pursuant to Section 13. 

MODIFICATION of the Agreement. 

NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION OF THE FOREGOING AND THE MUTUAL 

COVENANTS CONTAINED HEREIN, IT IS AGREED AS FOLLOWS: 

I. The Parties agree that the following table shall supersede the Contractor's bid 

submission included in the Agreement as part of the Exhibit E. Bid Form and 

Required Documents: 

[The remainder of this page intentionally left blank.] 
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Countywlde Minor Paving, Drainage, and Concrete Improvements 

Site and Civil Items 

Item Description 
Estimated Unit of 

Unit Price 
Quanltlty Measure 

104-1 Inlet Protection System 1-25 EA No Bid 
104-1 Inlet Protection Svstem 26-50 EA No Bid 

I 104-1 Inlet Protection Svstem 51-100+ EA No Bid 
104-11 Floating Turbidity Barrier 1-200 LF No Bid 
104-11 Floatina Turbidity Barrier 201-500 LF No Bid 
104-11 Floating Turbidity Barrier 501-1000+ LF No Bid 
104-13 Sediment Barrier 1-200 LF No Bid 
104-13 Sediment Barrier 201-500 LF No Bid 

104-13 Sediment Barrier 501-1000+ LF No Bid 
110-4 Removal of Existing Concrete 1-200 SY No Bid 
110-4 Removal of Existina Concrete 201 -500 SY No Bid 
110-4 Removal of Existing Concrete 501 -1000+ SY No Bid 
110-1-1 Clearing and Grubbing 1 AC No Bid 
120-1 Regular Excavation 1-200 CY No Bid 
120-1 Regular Excavation 201 -500 CY No Bid 
120-1 Regular Excavation 501-1000+ CY No Bid 
120-2 Swale Grading 1-200 CY No Bid 
120-2 Swale Grading 201-500 CY No Bid 

I 120-2 Swale Grading 501-1000+ CY No Bid 
120-6 Embankment (Truckload) 1-200 CY No Bid 
120-6 Embankment (Truckload) 201-500 CY No Bid 
120-6 Embankment (Truckload) 501-1000+ CY No Bid 

121-70 Flowable Fill 1-9 CY No Bid 
121-70 Flowable Fill 10-18 CY No Bid 
121-70 Flowable Fill 19-27+ CY No Bid 
160-4 Tvce "B" Stabilization 1-200 SY No Bid 
160-4 Type "B" Stabilizaiton 201-500 SY No Bid 
160-4 TvPe "B" Stabilization 501-1000+ SY No Bid 
210-1-1 Reworking Limerock Base (6") 1-1000+ SY No Bid 
210-1-8 Reworking Limerock Base (4") 1-1000+ SY No Bid 
210-1-9 Reworkina Limerock Base (3") 1-1000+ SY No Bid 
280-2 Asphaltic Base Course 1-500+ TN $150.00 
285-701 Optional Base Group 1 1-200 SY No Bid 
285-701 Optional Base Group 1 201-500 SY No Bid 
285-701 Optional Base Group 1 501-1000+ SY No Bid 
285-704 Optional Base Group 4 1-200 SY No Bid 
285-704 Optional Base Group 4 201 -500 SY No Bid 
285-704 Ootional Base Group 4 501-1000+ SY No Bid 
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1285-706 Optional Base Group 6 
285-706 Optional Base Group 6 
285-706 Optional Base Group 6 
285-709 Optional Base Group 9 
285-709 Optional Base Group 9 
285-709 Optional Base Group 9 
285-711 Optional Base Group 11 
285-711 Optional Base Group 11 
285-711 Optional Base Group 11 
327-70-1 Millina (1") 

327-70-1 Millina (1") 
327-70-1 Milling (1") 
327-70-6 Millina (1.5") 
327-70-6 Millina (1.5") 
327-70-6 Milling (1.5") 
327-70-5 Milling (2") 
327-70-5 Millina (2") 

J327.70.5 Millina (2") 
327-70-4 Milling (3") 

J327.70-4 Millina (3") 
327-70-4 Millina (3") 
327-70-7 Milling (4") 
327-70-7 Millina (4") 
327-70-7 Millina (4") 
327-70-10 Milling (5") 

1327-70-10 Millina (5") 

1327-70-10 Millina (5") 
327-70-23 Milling (6") 
327-70-23 Millina (6") 

l327-70-23 Millina (6") 
1331-1 Asphaltic Concrete Type "S-1" 
331-1 Asphaltic Concrete Tvpe "S-1" 
331-1 Asphaltic Concrete Type "S-1" 
331-2 Asphaltic Concrete Type "S-3" 
331-2 Asphaltic Concrete Tvpe "S-3" 

1331-2 Asphaltic Concrete Type "S-3" 
l334-1-13A Super Pave Asphaltic Concrete 12.5 Traffic C 
334-1-13A Super Pave Asphaltic Concrete 12.5 Traffic C 

l334-1-13A Super Pave Asphaltic Concrete 12.5 Traffic C 
334-1-138 Super Pave Asphaltic Concrete 9.5 Traffic C 
334-1-138 Super Pave Asphaltic Concrete 9.5 Traffic C 
334-1-138 Super Pave Asphaltic Concrete 9.5 Traffic C 
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1-200 SY No Bid 
201-500 SY No Bid 

501-1000+ SY No Bid 
1-200 SY No Bid 

201-500 SY No Bid 
501-1000+ SY No Bid 

1-200 SY No Bid 
201-500 SY No Bid 

501-1000+ SY No Bid 
1-200 SY $25.00 

201-500 SY $20.00 
501-1000+ SY $15.00 

1-200 SY $25.00 
201-500 SY $20.00 

501-1000+ SY $15.00 
1-200 SY $25.00 

201-500 SY $20.00 
501-1000+ SY $15.00 

1-200 SY $25.00 
201-500 SY $20.00 

501-1000+ SY $15.00 
1-200 SY $25.00 

201-500 SY $20.00 
501-1000+ SY $15.00 

1-200 SY $25.00 
201-500 SY $20.00 

501-1000+ SY $15.00 
1-200 SY $25.00 

201-500 SY $20.00 
501-1000+ SY $15.00 

1-200 TN $175.00 
201-500 TN $150.00 

501-1000+ TN $125.00 
1-200 TN $175.00 

201-500 TN $150.00 
501-1000+ TN $125.00 

1-200 TN $175.00 
201-500 TN $150.00 

501-1000+ TN $125.00 
1-200 TN $175.00 

201-500 TN $150.00 
501-1000+ TN $125.00 
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[339-1 Miscellaneous Asphalt Pavement 
339-1 Miscellaneous Asphalt Pavement 

1339-1 Miscellaneous Asphalt Pavement 
400-1-2 Misc. Concrete (Endwalls) - Class I 
400-1-2 Misc. Concrete (Endwalls) - Class I 
400-1-2 Misc. Concrete (Endwalls)- Class I 
400-1-11 Misc. Concrete (Retaining walls)- Class I 
400-1-11 Misc. Concrete (Retainina walls)- Class I 
400-1 -11 Misc. Concrete (Retainina walls)- Class I 
400-2-1 Misc. Concrete (Culverts)- Class 
J400-2-1 Misc. Concrete (Culverts)- Class 
1400-2-1 Misc. Concrete (Culverts)- Class 
400-2-2 Misc. Concrete (Endwalls)-Class 
400-2-2 Misc. Concrete (Endwalls)-Class 
400-2-2 Misc. Concrete (Endwalls)-Class 

1425-5 Adiustina Manholes 
425-5 Adjusting Manholes 

1425-5 Adjusting Manholes 
425-10 Install Yard Drains 
425-6 Adiustina Valve Boxes 

,425-6 Adjusting Valve Boxes 
425-6 Adiustina Valve Boxes 
425-4 Adiustina Inlets 
425-4 Adiustina Inlets 
425-4 Adjusting Inlets 

1425-1331 Inlets - (Curb) (Type P-3) 
,425-1331 Inlets - (Curb) (Type P-3) 
,425-1331 Inlets - (Curb) (Type P-3) 
425-1352 Inlets - (Curb) (Type P-5) 
425-1352 Inlets - (Curb) (Type P-5) 
425-1352 Inlets - (Curb) (Type P-5) 
425-1362 Inlets· (Curb) (Type P-6) 
1425-1362 Inlets - (Curb) (Type P-6) 
425-1362 Inlets• (Curb) (Type P-6) 
425-1522 Inlets - (DT BOT) (Type C) 
425-1522 Inlets - (DT BOT) (Type C) 
425-1522 Inlets - (DT BOT) (Type C) 
1425-1549 Inlets - <DT BOT) (Type D) 
425-1549 Inlets - (DT BOT) (Type D) 
425-1549 Inlets - (DT BOT) (Type D) 
425-1552 Inlets - <DT BOT) (Type E) 
425-1552 Inlets - (DT BOT) (Type E) 

425-1552 Inlets - (DT BOT) (Type E) 
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1-200 TN $500.00 
201-500 TN $250.00 

501-1000+ TN $150.00 
1-9 CY No Bid 

10-18 CY No Bid 
19-27+ CY No Bid 

1-9 CY No Bid 
10-18 CY No Bid 

19-27+ CY No Bid 
1-20 CY No Bid 

21-40 CY No Bid 
41-80+ CY No Bid 

1-9 CY No Bid 
10-18 CY No Bid 

19-27+ CY No Bid 
1-5 EA No Bid 

6-10 EA No Bid 
11-20+ EA No Bid 

1 EA No Bid 
1-5 EA No Bid 

6-10 EA No Bid 
11-20+ EA No Bid 

1-5 EA No Bid 
6-10 EA No Bid 

11-20+ EA No Bid 
1-5 EA No Bid 

6-10 EA No Bid 
11-20+ EA No Bid 

1-5 EA No Bid 
6-10 EA No Bid 

11-20+ EA No Bid 
1-5 EA No Bid 

6-10 EA No Bid 
11-20+ EA No Bid 

1-5 EA No Bid 
6-10 EA No Bid 

11-20+ EA No Bid 
1-5 EA No Bid 

6-10 EA No Bid 
11-20+ EA No Bid 

1-5 EA No Bid 
6-10 EA No Bid 

11-20+ EA No Bid 
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430-175-115 15" RCP CD-CLASS Ill 
430-175-115 15" RCP CD-CLASS Ill 
1430-175-115 15" RCP CD-CLASS Ill 
430-175-118 18" RCP CD-CLASS Ill 
430-175-118 18" RCP CD-CLASS Ill 
430-175-118 18" RCP CD-CLASS Ill 
430-175-124 24" RCP CD - CLASS 111 
1430-175-124 24" RCP CD - CLASS 111 
l430-115-124 24" RCP CD - CLASS 111 
1430-175-130 30" RCP CD-CLASS Ill 
430-175-130 30" RCP CD- CLASS Ill 
430-175-130 30" RCP CD-CLASS Ill 
430-175-136 36" RCP CD-CLASS Ill 
430-175-136 36" RCP CD-CLASS Ill 
430-175-136 36" RCP CD - CLASS 111 
430-175-148 48" RCP CD - CLASS Ill 
430-175-148 48" RCP CD - CLASS 111 
430-175-148 48" RCP CD - CLASS 111 
430-175-160 60" RCP CD - CLASS 111 
430-175-160 60" RCP CD - CLASS 111 
1430-175-160 60" RCP CD - CLASS 111 
430-175-215 12" X 18" RCP - CD 
430-175-215 12" X 18" RCP - CD 
430-17 5-215 12" X 18" RCP - CD 
430-17 5-218 14" X 23" RCP - CD 
430-175-218 14" X 23" RCP- CD 
430-175-218 14" X 23" RCP - CD 
1430-175-224 19" X 30" RCP - CD 
430-17 5-224 19" X 30" RCP - CD 
430-17 5-224 19" X 30" RCP - CD 
430-175-230 24" X 38" RCP - CD 
430-17 5-230 24" X 38" RCP - CD 
430-17 5-230 24" X 38" RCP - CD 
430-175-236 29" X 45" RCP - CD 
430-175-236 29"X 45" RCP - CD 
430-175-236 29" X 45" RCP - CD 
430-175-248 38" X 60" RCP - CD 
430-175-248 38" X 60" RCP - CD 
430-175-248 38" X 60" RCP - CD 
I 430-17 5-266 48" X 76" RCP - CD 
430-17 5-266 48" X 76" RCP - CD 
430-17 5-266 48" X 76" RCP - CD 
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1-200 LF No Bid 
201-500 LF No Bid 

501-1000+ LF No Bid 
1-200 LF No Bid 

201-500 LF No Bid 
501-1000+ LF No Bid 

1-200 LF No Bid 
201-500 LF No Bid 

501-1000+ LF No Bid 
1-200 LF No Bid 

201-500 LF No Bid 
501-1000+ LF No Bid 

1-200 LF No Bid 
201-500 LF No Bid 

501-1000+ LF No Bid 
1-200 LF No Bid 

201-500 LF No Bid 
501-1000+ LF No Bid 

1-200 LF No Bid 
201-500 LF No Bid 

501-1000+ LF No Bid 
1-200 LF No Bid 

201-500 LF No Bid 
501-1000+ LF No Bid 

1-200 LF No Bid 
201-500 LF No Bid 

501-1000+ LF No Bid 
1-200 LF No Bid 

201-500 LF No Bid 
501-1000+ LF No Bid 
201-500 LF No Bid 

501-1000+ LF No Bid 
1-200 LF No Bid 
1-200 LF No Bid 

201-500 LF No Bid 
501-1000+ LF No Bid 

1-200 LF No Bid 
201-500 LF No Bid 

501-1000+ LF No Bid 
1-200 LF No Bid 

201-500 LF No Bid 
501-1000+ LF No Bid 
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430-982-123 15" MES 
430-982-125 18" MES 
430-982-129 24"MES 
430-982-133 30"MES 
430-982-138 36"MES 
430-982-141 48"MES 
430-982-143 60"MES 
430-984-623 12" X 18" MES 
430-984-625 14"X23" MES 
430-982-641 19" X 30" MES 
430-982-633 24"X38" MES 
430-982-138 29"X45" MES 
430-984-631 38"X60" MES 
430-982-643 48"X 76" MES 
430-94-1 Desiltina Pipe, 0-24" 
430-94-1 Desiltina Pipe, 0-24" 
430-94-2 Desiltina Pipe, 25" - 36' 
430-94-2 Desiltina Pipe, 25" - 36" 
430-94-3 Desiltina Pipe, 37" - 48" 
430-94-3 Desiltina Pipe, 37" - 48" 
430-94-4 Desilting Pipe, 49" - 60" 
430-94-4 Desilting Pipe, 49" - 60" 
430-94-5 Desilting Pipe, 61" or greater 
430-94-5 Desilting Pipe, 61" or greater 
515-1-1 Pipe Handrail (Galvinized) 
515-1-1 Pipe Handrail (Galvinized) 
515-1-1 Pipe Handrail (Galvinized) 
515-2 Pipe Handrail (Aluminum) 
515-2 Pipe Handrail (Aluminum) 
515-2 Pipe Handrail (Aluminum) 
515-2-211 Ped Railinci (42") (Steel) 
515-2-211 Ped Railinci (42") (Steel) 
515-2-211 Ped Railino (42") (Steel) 
515-2-311 Ped Railing (42") (Aluminum) 
515-2-311 Ped Railing (42") (Aluminum) 
515-2-311 Ped Railing (42") (Aluminum) 
515-2-221 Ped Railina (54") (Steel) 
515-2-221 Ped Railina (54") (Steel) 
515-2-221 Ped Railina (54") (Steel) 
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1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 

1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50+ LF No Bid 

1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50+ LF No Bid 

1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50+ LF No Bid 

1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50+ LF No Bid 

1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50+ LF No Bid 

1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50 LF No Bid 

51-100+ LF No Bid 
1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50 LF No Bid 

51-100+ LF No Bid 
1-20 LF No Bid 

21-50 LF No Bid 
51-100+ LF No Bid 

1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50 LF No Bid 

51 -100+ LF No Bid 
1-20 LF No Bid 

21-50 LF No Bid 
51-100+ LF No Bid 
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515-2-321 Ped Railing (54") (Aluminum) 
515-2-321 Ped Railing (54") (Aluminum) 
515-2-321 Ped Railing (54") (Aluminum) 
520-2-1 Tvoe "A" Curb 
520-2-1 Tvoe "A" Curb 
520-2-1 Tvoe "A" Curb 
520-2-2 Type 118" Curb 
520-2-2 Tvoe "8" Curb 
520-2-2 Tvoe "8" Curb 
520-2-4 Tvoe "D" Curb 
520-2-4 Tvoe "D" Curb 
520-2-4 Tvoe "D" Curb 

1520-1-7 Tvoe "E" Curb 
1520-1-7 Tvoe "E" Curb 
520-1-7 Tvoe "E" Curb 
520-1-10 TvPe "F" Curb 
520-1-10 Tvoe "F" Curb 
520-1-10 Tvoe "F" Curb 
520-3 Vallev Gutter 
520-3 Valley Gutter 
520-3 Valley Gutter 
520-5-11 Traffic Separator - (4') 
520-5-11 Traffic Separator - (4') 
520-5-11 Traffic Separator - (4') 
520-5-12 Traffic Separator - (6') 
520-5-12 Traffic Separator - (6') 
520-5-12 Traffic Separator - (6') 
520-70 Traffic Separator - (width varies) 
520-70 Traffic Separator - (width varies) 
520-70 Traffic Separator - (width varies) 
522-1 Concrete Sidewalk - (4" thickness) 
522-1 Concrete Sidewalk - (4" thickness) 
522-1 Concrete Sidewalk - (4" thickness) 
522-2 Concrete Sidewalk - (6" thickness) 
522-2 Concrete Sidewalk - (6" thickness) 
522-2 Concrete Sidewalk - (6" thickness) 
542-70 Concrete Bumper Guard 
527-2 Detectable Warnina Surfaces (Inset)* 
527-2 Detectable Warninci Surfaces (Inset)* 
527-2 Detectable Warning Surfaces (Inset)* 
527-2 Det. Warning Surf. (Screwdown) 
527-2 Det. Warninci Surf. (Screwdown) 
527-2 Det. Warning Surf. (Screwdown) 
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1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50 LF No Bid 

51-100+ LF No Bid 
1-25 LF No Bid 

26-50 LF No Bid 
51-100+ LF No Bid 

1-20 LF No Bid 
26-50 LF No Bid 

51-100+ LF No Bid 
1-25 LF No Bid 

26-50 LF No Bid 
51-100+ LF No Bid 

1-25 LF No Bid 
26-50 LF No Bid 

51-100+ LF No Bid 
1-25 LF No Bid 

26-50 LF No Bid 
51-100+ LF No Bid 

1-25 LF No Bid 
26-50 LF No Bid 

51-100+ LF No Bid 
1-25 LF No Bid 

26-50 LF No Bid 
51 -100+ LF No Bid 

1-25 LF No Bid 
26-50 LF No Bid 

51-100+ LF No Bid 
1-25 SY No Bid 

26-50 SY No Bid 
51-100+ SY No Bid 

1-100 SY No Bid 
101-250 SY No Bid 

251-500+ SY No Bid 
1-100 SY No Bid 

101-250 SY No Bid 
251-500+ SY No Bid 

1 EA No Bid 
1-50 SF No Bid 

51-100 SF No Bid 
101+ SF No Bid 
1-50 SF No Bid 

50-100 SF No Bid 
101+ SF No Bid 
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530-3 Rip Rap 
530-3 Rip Rap 

530-3 Rip Rap 

536-1-1 Guardrail 
536-1-1 Guardrail 
536-1-1 Guardrail 

[536-1-3 Guardrail - Double sided 
536-1-3 Guardrail - Double Sided 
536-1-3 Guardrail - Double Sided 
536-73 Guardrail Removal 
536-73 Guardrail Removal 
536-73 Guardrail Removal 
538-1 Guardrail Resetting 
538-1 Guardrail Resettina 
538-1 Guardrail Resettina 
E573-1 Hvdro-seedina 
E573-1 Hvdro-seeding 
E573-1 Hvdro-seedina 
570-1-1 Soddino (Bahia) 

570-1-1 Soddino (Bahia) 

570-1-1 Soddina (Bahia) 
E575-1-4 Soddina (Floratam) 

E575-1-4 Soddino (Floratam) 
E575-1-4 Soddino (Floratam) 
700-1-50 Relocate Existino Sion (sinale post) 
700-1-50 Relocate Existina Sign (sinale post) 
700-1-50 Relocate Existing Sign (single post) 
700-2-50 Relocate Existing Sign (multi- post) 
700-2-50 Relocate Existing Sign (multi-post) 
700-2-50 Relocate Existing Sign (multi-post) 
700-1-60 Remove Existina Sian (sinale post) 
700-1-60 Remove Existina Sian (sinale post) 
700-1-60 Remove Existina Sian (sinale post) 
700-2-60 Remove Existino Sion (multi-post) 
700-2-60 Remove Existino Sion (multi- post) 
700-2-60 Remove Existino Sion (multi- post) 
700-1-40 Install Sign (single post) 
700-1-40 Install Sign (single post) 
700-1-40 Install Sign (single post) 
700-2-40 Install Sign (multi-post) 
700-2-40 Install Sian (multi-post) 
700-2-40 Install Sion (multi- post) 

Page 8 of 12 

1-15 TN No Bid 
16-30 TN No Bid 

31-45+ TN No Bid 
1-20 LF No Bid 

21-50 LF No Bid 
51-100+ LF No Bid 

1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50 LF No Bid 

51-100+ LF No Bid 
1-20 LF No Bid 

21-50 LF No Bid 
51-100+ LF No Bid 

1-20 LF No Bid 
21-50 LF No Bid 

51-100+ LF No Bid 
1-200 SY NoBid 

201-500 SY No Bid 
501-1000+ SY No Bid 

1-200 SY No Bid 
201-500 SY No8id 

501 -1000+ SY NoBid 
1-200 SY No Bid 

201-500 SY No Bid 
501-1000+ SY No Bid 

1-5 EA No8id 
6-15 EA No Bid 

16-30+ EA No Bid 
1-5 EA No Bid 

6-15 EA No Bid 
16-30+ EA No Bid 

1-5 EA No Bid 
6-15 EA No Bid 

16-30+ EA No Bid 
1-5 EA No Bid 

6-15 EA No Bid 
16-30+ EA No Bid 

1-5 EA No Bid 
6-15 EA No Bid 

16-30+ EA No Bid 
1-5 EA No Bid 

6-15 EA No Bid 
16-30+ EA No Bid 
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1706-3 Reflective Pavement Markers (RPM's) 
1706-3 Reflective Pavement MarkinQs (RPM's) 
706-3 Reflective Pavement Markers (RPM's) 
709-11-101 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) (white) 
709-11-101 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) (white) 
709-11-101 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) (white) 
I 109-11-201 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) (yellow) 
709-11-201 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) (yellow) 

709-11-201 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) (yellow) 
710-11-123 12" Solid Traffic Stripe (oaint) 
710-11-123 12" Solid Traffic Stripe (oaint) 
710-11-123 12" Solid Traffic Stripe (oaint) 
710-11-124 18" Solid Traffic Stripe (oaint) 
710-11-124 18" Solid Traffic Stripe (oaint) 

710-11-124 18" Solid Traffic Stripe (oaint) 

710-11-125 24" Solid Traffic Stripe (oaint) 
710-11-125 24" Solid Traffic Stripe (Paint) 

1110-11-125 24" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 
709-11-141 6" Skip Traffic Stripe (paint) 

709-11-141 6" Skip Traffic Stripe (paint) 
709-11-141 6" Skip Traffic Stripe (paint) 
710-11-131 6" Dotted Guide Lines (paint) 
710-11-131 6" Dotted Guide Lines (paint) 
710-11-131 6" Dotted Guide Lines (paint) 

1710-11-170 Directional Arrows (Paint) 
710-1 1-160 Pavement MessaQes (Paint} 
710-11-102 8" Solid Traffic Stripe (Paint) 

1110-11-102 8" Solid Traffic Stripe (Paint) 
l110-11-102 8" Solid Traffic Stripe (Paint) 
711-16-101 6" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo (white) 
711-16-101 6" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo (white) 
711-16-101 6" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo (white) 
711-16-201 6" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo (yellow) 
711-16-201 6" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo (yellow) 
711-16-201 6" Solid Strioe/Extru. Thermo (yellow) 
711-11-123 12" Solid Traffic Strioe/Extru. Thermo 
711-11-123 12" Solid Traffic Strioe/Extru. Thermo 

1711-11-123 12" Solid Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 
,711-11-124 18" Solid Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 
71 1-11-124 18" Solid Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 
711-11-124 18" Solid Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 
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1-20 EA $100.00 
21-60 EA $50.00 

61-100+ EA $5.00 
1-200 LF $5.00 

201-500 LF $2.50 
501-1000+ LF $1 .25 

1-200 LF $5.00 
201-500 LF $2.50 

501-1000+ LF $1 .25 
1-25 LF $10.00 

26-50 LF $5.00 
51-100+ LF $2.50 

1-25 LF $15.00 
26-50 LF $10.00 

51-100+ LF $5.00 
1-25 LF $25.00 

26-50 LF $ 15.00 
51-100+ LF $7.00 

1-200 LF $5.00 
201-500 LF $2.50 

501-1000+ LF $1.25 
1-50 LF $5.00 

51-100 LF $2.50 
101-150+ LF $ 1.25 

1 EA $100.00 
1 EA $150.00 

1-200 LF $6.00 
201-500 LF $4.00 

501-1000+ LF $2.00 
1-200 LF $10.00 

201-500 LF $5.00 
501-1000+ LF $2.50 

1-200 LF $10.00 
201-500 LF $5.00 

501-1000+ LF $2.50 
1-25 LF $20.00 

26-50 LF $10.00 
51-100+ LF $5.00 

1-25 LF $30.00 
26-50 LF $15.00 

51-100+ LF $7.00 
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1711-11-125 24" Solid Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 
1711-11-125 24" Solid Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 
711-11-125 24" Solid Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 
711-5 6" Skip Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 
711-5 6" Skip Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 
711-5 6" Skip Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 
711-11-141 6" Dotted Guide Lines/Extru. Thermo 
711-11-141 6" Dotted Guide Lines/Extru. Thermo. 
711-11-141 6" Dotted Guide Lines/Extru. Thermo. 
711-11-170 Directional Arrows / Extru. Thermo. 
711-11-160 Preformed Symbol 
711-14-160 Pavement Messaaes / Extru. Thermo. 
711 -16-102 8" Solid Traffic Stripe / Extru. Thermo 
711-16-102 8" Solid Traffic Stripe / Extru. Thermo 
711-16-102 8" Solid Traffic Strioe / Extru. Thermo 
711-10 Remove Ex. Pavement Markinas(oaint) 
711-10 Remove Ex. Pavement Markinas(paint) 
711-10 Remove Ex. Pavement Markings(paint) 
711-17 Rem. Ex. Pavement Markinas(thermo) 
711-17 Rem. Ex. Pavement Markinas(thermo) 
711 -17 Rem. Ex. Pavement Markings(thermo) 

Signalization Items 

Item Description 

630-2-11 Condiut,Fumish & Install, Coen Trench 
1630-2-12 Conduit, Furnish & Install, Dir. Bore 
1632-7-1 Sig. Cable New or Recon. Inter., F&I 
1635-2-11 Pull/Splice Box, F&I, 17"x30" Cover Size 
1635-2-12 Pull/Splice Box, F&I , 24"x36" Cover Size 
1635-2-13 Pull/Splice Box,F&l,30"x60"Rect./30"Rd 
646-1-1 1 Alum. Sianals Pole, Pedestal 

1646-1-12 Alum. Sianals Pole,F&l,Ped Det. Post 
1646-1-30 Alum. Signals Pole, Install 
j646-1-40 Alum. Signals pole, Relocate 
1653-1-1 1 Ped. Sia., F&I LED Countdown, 1 Way 
1653-1-12 Ped. Sig., F&I LED Countdown, 2 Ways 
653-1-30 Ped. Sia. Install Onlv 
653-1-60 Ped Sia.,remove Ped Sia./Pole&Ped TR 
665-1-1 1 Ped. Det., F&I Standard 
,665-1-12 Ped. Del F&I Accessible 
1665-1-30 Ped. Det., Install Only 
1665-1-40 Ped. Det., Relocate 
[665-1-60 Ped. Det., Remove-Pole to remain 
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1-25 LF $40.00 
26-50 LF $20.00 

51-100+ LF $20.00 
1-200 LF $10.00 

201-500 LF $5.00 
501-1000+ LF $2.50 

1-50 LF $1 2.00 
51-100 LF $6.00 

101-150+ LF $3.00 
1 EA $200.00 
1 EA $500.00 
1 EA $275.00 

1-200 LF $13.00 
201-500 LF $7.50 

501-1000+ LF $3.75 
1-100 SF $100.00 

101-300 SF $50.00 
301 -500+ SF $10.00 

1-100 SF $200.00 
101-300 SF $100.00 

301-500+ SF $20.00 

Unit of Unit of 
Unit Price 

Measure Measure 
1 LF No Bid 
1 LF No Bid 
1 Pl No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 AS No Bid 
1 AS No Bid 
1 AS No Bid 
1 AS No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
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Materials Testing 

Item Description 

IMT-1 T-99 ( Standard Proctor) 
IMT-2 T-180 ( Modified Proctor) 
IMT-3 In Place Density Test 
IMT-4 Concrete Cylinders (Set of 4) 

~ T-5 Asphalt Extraction/Gradation 

MOT/MOB 

I Item Description 

I Maintenance of Traffic (MOT) 

I Mobilization (MOB) 

I 
Night Work Maintenance of Traffic (MOT) 
(additional %) 

I Niaht Work Mobilization (MOB, (additional%) 

11 

Unit of Unit of 
Unit Price 

Measure Measure 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 
1 EA No Bid 

Unit of 
Percent of project cost 

Measure 
Percent of project 

cost 15% 
Percent of project 

cost 25% 
Percent of project 

cost 10% 
Percent of project 

cost 10% 

[The remainder of this page intentionally left blank.] 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF this First Amendment of the Agreement has been signed and sealed, in 

duplicate, by the respective Parties hereto. 

DA TED this I'-{ day of Feb ru..~f" '( , 2022 by the Lee County Board of County 

Commissioners. 

,,,,,ii 
DATED this_,-__ day of _~F~e=b~ru=a=r..,_y_ 

ATTEST: 

~~/~ .....-,.. (Witness) 
Sandra Elizondo 

') ' .,, . .... ... . 

. .... ... 
·· .. ( ., ' ' 

' .. , ... 

Director 
behalf 

Q';f-1--l~ct;r 

rocurement Management, on 
the Board of County 

Commissioners 

County Attorney's Office 

A ignature 

Manuel Aguiar 
Authorized Signature Printed Name 

Corporate Vice President 
Authorized Signature Title 
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