B170265ANB
Alternative Paving Methods
Amendment No. 2

SECOND AMENDMENT OF AGREEMENT
FOR ALTERNATIVE PAVING METHODS

THIS SECOND AMENDMENT OF THE AGREEMENT FOR ALTERNATIVE PAVING
METHODS made and entered into by and between the Lee County Board of County
Commissioners, a political subdivision of the State of Florida ("County") and Cutler Repaving,

Inc. (“Vendor™), collectively, the “Parties.”

WHEREAS, the County entered into an Agreement for the purchase of alternative paving
methods for Lee County, Contract Number 7806, through Solicitation Number B170265ANB with
Vendor on the 5% day of September, 2017 (“Agreement”); and,

WHEREAS, the Parties mutually agree to increase the price for alternative paving services;

and,

WHEREAS, the Parties mutually agree that the price increase will begin on the 5" day of
September, 2019; and,

WHEREAS, the Parties desire to modify the Agreement pursuant to Article XVII.
MISCELLANEOUS of the Agreement.

NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION OF THE FOREGOING AND THE MUTUAL
COVENANTS CONTAINED HEREIN, IT IS AGREED AS FOLLOWS:

1. The Parties agree that the following Fee Schedule shall supersede the existing Fee Schedule
in Exhibit B of the Agreement:

Cutler Repaving,
Inc.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT Quantity Price
101-1 Mobilization % 1 2.00%
102-1 Maintenance of Traffic % 1 4.50%
104-12 Staked Silt Fence 50-500 LF No Bid
104-12 Staked Silt Fence 501-1000+ LF No Bid
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110-1-1 Clearing and Grubbing 1 AC No Bid
110-1 Curb and Gutter Removal 25-250 LE No Bid
110-1 Curb and Gutter Removal 251-500+ LF No Bid
110-2 Miscellaneous Concrete Removal 50-500 SY No Bid
110-2 Miscellaneous Concrete Removal 501-1000+ SY No Bid
110-3 Existing Pipe Removal 10-200 LF No Bid
110-3 Existing Pipe Removal 201-500+ LF No Bid
110-4 Removal of Existing Pavement 20-500 SY No Bid
110-4 Removal of Existing Pavement 501-1000+ SY No Bid
120-1 Roadway Excavation 201-500 CY No Bid
120-1 Roadway Excavation 501-1000+ i No Bid
120-4 Swale Grading 20-200 LF No Bid
120-4 Swale Grading 201-500+ LE No Bid
120-6 Embankment (Truckload) 1-200 CY No Bid
120-6 Embankment (Truckload) 201-500+ CY No Bid
280-2 Asphaltic Base Course 20-200 TN No Bid
280-2 Asphaltic Base Course 201-500 TN No Bid
280-2 Asphaltic Base Course 501-1000+ TN No Bid
327-1 Milling of Existing Asphalt (2" +/-) 50,000 + SY $2.50
327-2 Milling of Existing Asphalt (2" +/-) 10,000 to SY $3.12
50,000
331-1 Type I1I Asphaltic Concrete 20-200 TN No Bid
331-1 Type 11 Asphaltic Concrete 201-500 TN No Bid
331-1 Type III Asphaltic Concrete 501-1000+ TN $86.33
333-1 Asphaltic Concrete Type "S-1" 20-200 TN No Bid
333-1 Asphaltic Concrete Type "S-1" 201-500 TN No Bid
333-1 Asphaltic Concrete Type "S-1" 501-1000+ TN $83.02
333-2 Asphaltic Concrete Type "S-3" 20-200 TN No Bid
333-2 Asphaltic Concrete Type "S-3" 201-500 TN No Bid
333-2 Asphaltic Concrete Type "S-3" 501-1000+ TN $83.57
425-1 Adjusting Manholes (Metal Riser 1-5 EA $312.10
Rings)
425-1 Adjusting Manholes (Metal Riser 6-10 EA $312.10
Rings)
425-1 Adjusting Manholes (Metal Riser 11-20+ EA $312.10
Rings)
425-2 Adjusting Valve Boxes (Metal Riser 1-5 EA $208.07
Rings)
425-2 Adjusting Valve Boxes (Metal Riser 6-10 EA $208.07
Rings)
425-2 Adjusting Valve Boxes (Metal Riser 11-20+ EA $208.07
Rings)
430-2 18" RCP CD - CLASS III 1-200 LF No Bid
430-2 18" RCP CD - CLASS III 201-500+ LF No Bid
520-1 Type "A" Curb 10-25 LF No Bid
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520-1 Type "A" Curb 26-50+ LE No Bid
520-2 Type "B" Curb 10-25 LF No Bid
520-2 Type "B" Curb 26-50+ LF No Bid
520-3 Type "D" Curb 10-25 LF No Bid
520-3 Type "D" Curb 26-50+ LF No Bid
520-4 Type "E" Curb 10-25 LF No Bid
520-4 Type "E" Curb 26-50+ LF No Bid
520-5 Type "F" Curb 10-25 LF No Bid
520-5 Type "F" Curb 26-50+ LF No Bid
522-2 Concrete Sidewalk - (6" thickness) 20-100 SY No Bid
522-2 Concrete Sidewalk - (6" thickness) 101-250+ SY No Bid
527-2 Detectable Warning Surfaces (Inset) * 10-50 SF No Bid
527-2 Detectable Warning Surfaces (Inset) * 51-100+ SF No Bid
527-3 Det. Warning Surf. (Screwdown Retro- 10-50 SF No Bid
Fit
527-3 De?[. Warning Surf. (Screwdown Retro- 51-100 SF No Bid
Fit
575-1 SoZlding (Bahia) 100-500 SY No Bid
575-1 Sodding (Bahia) 501-1000+ SV No Bid
575-2 Sodding (Floratam) 100-500 SY No Bid
575-2 Sodding (Floratam) 501-1000+ SY No Bid
660-2102 Loop Assembly, F&I - Type B 1 AS No Bid
706-1 Reflective Pavement Markings 20-60 EA No Bid
(RPM's)
706-1 Reflective Pavement Markers (RPM's) 61-100+ EA No Bid
710-1 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 1-200 LE No Bid
710-1 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 201-500 LF No Bid
710-1 6" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 501-1000+ LF No Bid
710-2 12" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 1-25 LF No Bid
710-2 12" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 26-50 LE No Bid
710-2 12" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 51-100+ LF No Bid
710-3 18" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 1-25 LF No Bid
710-3 18" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 26-50 LF No Bid
710-3 18" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 51-100+ LE No Bid
710-4 24" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 1-25 LF No Bid
710-4 24" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 26-50 LE No Bid
710-4 24" Solid Traffic Stripe (paint) 51-100+ LF No Bid
710-5 6" Skip Traffic Stripe (paint) 1-200 LF No Bid
710-5 6" Skip Traffic Stripe (paint) 201-500 ILIE No Bid
710-5 6" Skip Traffic Stripe (paint) 501-1000+ LF No Bid
710-6 6" Dotted Guide Lines (paint) 1-50 LF No Bid
710-6 6" Dotted Guide Lines (paint) 51-100 LF No Bid
710-6 6" Dotted Guide Lines (paint) 101-150+ LF No Bid
710-7 Directional Arrows (Paint) 1 EA No Bid
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710-8 Pavement Messages (Paint) 1 EA No Bid
710-9 8" Solid Traffic Stripe (Paint) 1-200 LF No Bid
710-9 8" Solid Traffic Stripe (Paint) 201-500 LF No Bid
710-9 8" Solid Traffic Stripe (Paint) 501-1000+ LB No Bid
711-1 6" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo 1-200 LF No Bid
711-1 6" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo. 201-500 LF No Bid
711-1 6" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo. 501-1000+ LF No Bid
711-2 12" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo 1-25 LF No Bid
711-2 12" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo. 26-50 LF No Bid
711-2 12" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo. 51-100+ LF No Bid
711-3 18" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo 1-25 LF No Bid
711-3 18" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo. 26-50 LF No Bid
711-3 18" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo. 51-100+ LF No Bid
711-4 24" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo 1-25 LF No Bid
711-4 24" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo. 26-50 LF No Bid
711-4 24" Solid Stripe/Extru. Thermo. 51-100+ LF No Bid
711-5 6" Skip Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo 1-200 LF No Bid
711-5 6" Skip Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo. 201-500 LF No Bid
711-5 6" Skip Traffic Stripe/Extru. Thermo. 501+ LF No Bid
711-6 6" Dotted Guide Lines/Extru. Thermo 20-50 LF No Bid
711-6 6" Dotted Guide Lines/Extru. Thermo. 51-100 LF No Bid
711-6 6" Dotted Guide Lines/Extru. Thermo. 101+ LF No Bid
711-7 Directional Arrows / Extru. Thermo. 1 EA No Bid
711-7A Preformed Arrow 1 EA No Bid
711-7B Preformed Symbol (Bike) 1 EA No Bid
711-8 Pavement Messages / Extru. Thermo. EA No Bid
711-9 8" Solid Traffic Stripe / Extru. Thermo 20-200 LF No Bid
711-9 8" Solid Traffic Stripe / Extru. Thermo 201-500 L No Bid
711-9 8" Solid Traffic Stripe / Extru. Thermo 501+ LF No Bid
711-10 Remove Existing Pavement Markings 20-300 SF No Bid
711-10 Remove Existing Pavement Markings 300+ SF No Bid
APM-001 Single Micro Surface 18-22 1bs. 10,000 to SY No Bid
50,000
APM-001 Single Micro Surface 18-22 Ibs. 50,001 + SY No Bid
APM-002 Double Micro Surface 28-32 1bs. 10,000 to SY No Bid
50,000
APM-002 Double Micro Surface 28-32 1bs. 50,001 + SY No Bid
APM-003 Single Chip Seal -#89 Granite 10,000 to SY No Bid
50,000
APM-003 Single Chip Seal -#89 Granite 50,001 + SY No Bid
APM-004 Double Chip Seal - #57 w/#89 Granite 10,000 to SY No Bid
50,000
APM-004 Double Chip Seal - #57 w/#89 Granite 50,001 + SY No Bid
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APM-005 Full Depth Reclamation / 6"-9" 10,000 to SY No Bid
50,000
APM-005 Full Depth Reclamation /6"-9" 50,001 + SY No Bid
APM-006 Full Depth Reclamation /9-12 10,000 to SY No Bid
50,000
APM-006 Full Depth Reclamation /9-12 50,001 + SY No Bid
APM-006a Cement for Reclamation 1 TN No Bid
APM-006b Emulsion for Reclamation 1 Gal No Bid
APM-007 RAP PLACEMENT 10,000 to SY No Bid
50,000
APM-007 RAP PLACEMENT 50,001 + SY No Bid
APT-001 Crack Filling / Sealing 1-1000 Gal No Bid
APT-001 Crack Filling / Sealing 1001-3000 Gal No Bid
APT-001 Crack Filling / Sealing 3001+ Gal No Bid
SLUR-001 Slurry Seal 10,000 to SY No Bid
50,000
SLUR-001 Slurry Seal 50,001 + SY No Bid
HOT-IN-PLACE (With Virgin Top
Course) Asphalt Recycling
HIPR- Recy | Asphalt Recycling 10,000 to SY $4.16
50,000
HIPR- Recycling Agent 10,000 to Gal $3.90
AGENT 50,000
HIPR- Recy | Asphalt Recycling 50,001 + SY $2.86
HIPR- Recycling Agent 50,001 + Gal $3.90
AGENT
324 HOT-IN-PLACE (100%) Asphalt
Recycling
HIPR Base Base Course HIPR 10,000 to SY No Bid
50,000
HIPR Base Base Course HIPR 50,001 + SY No Bid
HIPR 2" Complete HIPR 10,000 to SY No Bid
Complete 50,000
HIPR 2" Complete HIPR 50,001 + SY. No Bid
Complete
HIPR- Asphalt Recycling Agent 10,000 to Gal No Bid
AGENT-100% 50,000
HIPR- Asphalt Recycling Agent 50,001 + Gal No Bid
AGENT-100%
MOT/MOB % 1 No Bid
Night Work MOT/MOB % 1 No Bid
(additional %)

[The remainder of this page intentionally left blank.]
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IN WITNESS WHEREQOF, this Second Amendment of the Agreement has been signed and sealed,

in duplicate, by the respective parties hereto.

DATED this 40 day of A&M, 2019 by the Lee County Board of County

Commissioners.

‘,’é"
Director of*Procufement Management, on
behalf of the Board of County
Commissioners

APPROVED as to Form for the Reliance of
Lee Countfy Only

~ Clhetec

Cofmty Attorney's Office

DATED this (7 day of &A/ 1 Lutz‘é , 2019 by Cutler Repaving, Inc.

J
ATTEST: BY: é/”‘j“ %L{W’(—)

Authorized Signature

ot Vk @4" Charles R. Veskerna

Witness) s Authorized Signature Printed Name

.

President

Authorized Signature Title

CORPORATE SEAL:
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