Bid Request Number

Q2012107/UNI-APPAREL/1213

Bid Close Date: January 11, 2013 @ 3:00 PM

Specification Responses Matteo International SP Designs & Mfg, Inc Westview Corporation Pride Enterprises
Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Rejected: Non-responsive -
unable to determine actual
Submittal Components value of bid response.
On-Line / Hardcopy On-line On-Line On-Line Hardcopy
Bidder Response Form/NonCol Rec'd Yes Rec'd Yes
Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
JERZEES — MEN’S POLOS AND TEES
“Z” Cotton Heavy Weight Tee = | neuTRALs |55 $2.59 $18.13$2.29 $16.03$3.45 $62.55$2.05 $14.35]
5.6 0z — 100% pre-shrunk with 2XL $4.59 $32.13]$3.29 $23.03]$5.20 $94.28]$3.55 $24.85
ribbed crew neck collar &
S-XL . 23.52]$3. 21.77|$4. 77.05]$2. 18.06
1 363M |coverseamed front, set-in HEATHERS 7 $3.36 $ $3.11 $ $4.25 $ $2.58 9
sleeves, taped shoulder to 2XL $5.36 $37.52]$4.11 $28.77|$6.10 $42.70|$4.26 $29.82
shoulder and two-needle colors 1= $3.68 $25.76[$3.31 $23.17|$4.55 $31.85|$2.80 $19.60)
hemmed sleeves and bottom
2XL $5.68 $39.76[$4.31 $30.17|$6.80 $47.60[$5.03 $35.21
S-XL $3.54 $106.20[$2.51 $75.30[$3.60 $108.00[$2.05 $61.50
“z Blend” Heavyweight Tee (no | NEUTRALS
pocket) — 5.6 0z, pre-shrunk 50% 2XL-3XL $5.56 $166.80[$3.51 $105.30[$5.50 $165.00[$3.62 $108.60
cotton/50% polyester with a HEATHERS S-XL $3.92 $117.60[$3.41 $102.30[$4.40 $132.00[$2.70 $81.00
2 29M  ribbed crew neck collar, set-in 2XL-3XL 30 |¢5.92 $177.60|$4.41 $132.30$6.40 $192.00|$4.34 $130.20|
sleeves, taped shoulder to
shoulder and two-needle S-XL $3.92 $117.60[$3.66 $109.80[$4.70 $141.00[$2.97 $89.10
hemmed sleeves & bottom COLORS
2XL-3XL $5.92 $177.60|34.66 $139.80]$7.20 $216.00]$5.00 $150.00
S-XL $5.11 $383.25[$5.14 $385.50[$5.60 $420.00[$3.82 $286.50
“Z Blend” Heavyweight Tee (with | NEUTRALS
pocket) — 5.6 oz, pre-shrunk 50% 2XL-3XL $7.11 $533.25|$6.14 $460.50]$8.05 $603.75$5.76 $432.00]
cotton/50% polyester with a S-XL $5.75 $431.25[$6.35 $476.25[$6.55 $491.25($4.48 $336.00
ribbed crew neck collar, set-in HEATHERS
3 29MP 2XL-3XL 75 |57.75 $581.25|$7.35 $551.25|$8.80 $660.00]$6.31 $473.25
sleeves, taped shoulder to
shoulder and two-needle S-XL $5.73 $429.75[$6.99 $524.25$7.10 $532.50[$4.95 $371.25
hemmed sleeves & bottom and a COLORS
left chest pocket.
2XL-3XL $7.76 $582.00[$7.98 $598.50[$9.50 $712.50[$6.95 $521.25
S-XL $5.90 $171.10[$5.91 $171.39]$8.90 $258.10[$6.42 $186.18
Long Sleeve Tee — 100% Cotton NEUTRALS 229.1 ) 14 234.61
H5596 |with a ribbed crew neck collar, XL 57.90 $229.10]56.91 $200.39]510.85 $314.65]58.09 $234.6
HANES |set-in sleeves, taped shoulder to S-XL 6.98 $202.42]$7.08 $205.32]$9.70 $281.30[$7.18 $208.22
4 P HEATHERS 29 5 5 5 5
shoulder and two-needie aXL3XL $260.42 $234.32 $340.17 $255.20)
hemmed sleeves & bottom and a - 58.98 42]58.08 3251173 175880 :
left chest pocket. COLORs  [S- $7.10 $205.90]$7.80 $226.20$10.23 $296.67|$7.61 $220.69
2XL-3XL $9.10 $263.90]$8.80 $255.20]$12.20 $353.80]$9.15 $265.35




Specification Responses

Matteo International

SP Designs & Mfg, Inc

Westview Corporation

Pride Enterprises

Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Jersey Golf w/Pocket — 5.6 oz — NEUTRALS S-XL $6.10 $213.50[$7.50 $262.50[$7.85 $274.75[$5.95 $208.25
o o -
SOA. cotton(SOA polyester full 2XL-3XL $8.10 $283.50[$8.50 $297.50[$9.85 $344.75($7.68 $268.80
cut jersey with a two pearl
i S-XL X 238.00]$7. 274.05]$8. 309.75]$6. 220.85
5 436MP Eu_ttton”conltlr;ten;al flackit,twelt HEATHERS 35 $6.80 $ $7.83 $ $8.85 $ $6.31 $
nit coflar, 'ett chest pocket, 2XL-3XL $8.80 $308.00]$8.83 $300.05[$10.95 $383.25[$8.06 $282.10
tubular body and two-needle
hemmed sleeves & round COLORS S-XL $6.80 $238.00]$8.50 $297.50]$9.40 $329.00]$6.76 $236.60
bottom. 2XL-3XL $8.80 $308.00|$9.50 $332.50{$11.55 $404.25[$8.52 $298.20
JERZEES - WOMEN'S POLOS
e $7.10 $35.50[$9.05 $45.25|$7.40 $37.00[$5.26 $26.30|
Jerzee ladies johnny collar jersey XL $9.10 $45.50|$10.05 $50.25|$9.35 $46.75|%6.92 $34.60|
sport shirt, , two-needle
S-XL 7. $36.75[$10. $52.75|57.7 $38.75|S5. $27.90
6 337WR |hemmed bottom, V-Neck styling | HEATHERS 5 $7.35 51055 $7.75 $5.58
with welt knit Jonny collor, 1x1 = $9.35 $46.75|$11.55 $57.75[$9.55 $47.75[$7.31 $36.55
rib sleeve bands COLORS S-XL $7.75 $38.75|511.24 $56.20[$8.15 $40.75|$5.97 $29.85
2XL $9.75 $48.75|$12.24 $61.20{$10.15 $50.75[$7.61 $38.05]
HANES — MEN’ POLOS AND TEES
Stedman Blended Jersey with NEUTRALS B2 $7.85 $125.60{$7.68 $122.88]$9.70 $155.20{$6.50 $104.00
Pocket - 5.5 oz, 50/50 2XL-3XL $9.85 $157.60]$8.68 $138.88]$11.65 $186.40]$8.43 $134.88
cotton/polyester, pre-shrunk,
S-XL 8.85 $141.60[$8.47 $135.52]$11.05 $176.80[$7.14 $114.24
7 0504 [five point pocket with double- HEATHERS 16 s s s s
needle hem, clean-finished 2XL-3XL $9.85 $157.60]$9.47 $151.52$12.35 $197.60]$9.02 $144.32
placket with pearl buttons, welt S-XL $8.95 $143.20[$9.27 $148.32|$11.60 $185.60[$7.57 $121.12
collar & ribbed knit cuffs COLORS
. 2XL-3XL $9.85 $157.60]$10.27 $164.32]$13.05 $208.80[$9.61 $153.76
ANVIL - MEN’ POLOS AND TEES
Anvil - 5.6 0z, 50/50 cotton NEUTRALS 122 $7.20 $57.60|$6.85 $54.80$10.60 $84.80|$7.68 $61.44
jersey with stain repel and 2XL-5XL $10.75 $86.00[$7.85 $62.80]$13.25 $106.00]$9.85 $78.80)
release, soft fashion knit
contoured collar & welt sleeve HEATHER S-XL $7.75 $62.00]$7.43 $59.44]$11.30 $90.40[$8.33 $66.64
8 4603 |bands, three wood tone buttons, S 8
double-needle bottom hem, 2XL-5XL $10.75 $86.00]$8.43 $67.44]$14.20 $113.60{$10.51 $84.08
single-needle neck, shoulder, SXL $7.75 $62.00]$7.93 $63.44]$11.85 $94.80|$8.75 $70.00
armhole & sleeve - side-seamed COLORS
with 2 1/2" side vents
2XL-5XL $10.75 $86.00]$8.93 $71.44]$15.05 $120.40[$11.44 $91.52
NEUTRALS S-XL $7.75 $93.00]$7.77 $93.24]$9.20 $110.40[$7.02 $84.24
Anvil - 6.5 0z 100 % ring spun 2XL-3XL $9.75 $117.00$8.77 $105.24)$11.95 $143.40[$9.21 $110.52
cotton pique, soft fashion knit
S-XL 8.10 $97.20[$8.33 $99.96]$10.05 $120.60[$7.40 $88.80
9 6002 [contoured collar & welt sleeve HEATHERS 12 3 3 3 3
bands, three wood tone buttons, 2XL-3XL $10.10 $121.20$9.33 $111.96/$12.90 $154.80|$9.75 $117.00|
double-needle bottom hem COLORS S-XL $8.10 $97.20]58.93 $107.16|$10.45 $125.40]$8.08 $96.96
2XL-3XL $10.10 $121.20[$9.93 $119.16]$13.55 $162.60]$10.60 $127.20




Specification Responses

Line

Matteo International

SP Designs & Mfg, Inc

Westview Corporation

Pride Enterprises

STYLE # |Description

COLOR

SIZES

QTY

Unit

Extended

Unit

Extended

Unit

Extended

Unit

Extended

WOVEN SHIRTS — MEN’S

10

1C623

Short Sleeve Performance
Brushed Twill by Jonathan Corey
— 4.6 0z - 60% cotton/40%
polyester, brushed twill with a
button down collar, center full
button front, woodtone buttons,
left chest pocket, single needle
hemmed sleeves, single needle
top stitching throughout, two ply
back yoke with box pleat and a
short tail clean finished hemmed
bottom.

ALL COLORS

XS-XL

$19.00

$133.00

$16.26

$113.82

$17.50

$122.50

$15.95

$111.65

2XL-6XL

$21.95

$153.65

$17.26

$120.82

$21.70

$151.90

$21.60

$151.20

11

1C622

Long Sleeve Performance
Brushed Twill by Jonathan Corey
— 4.6 0z —60% cotton/40%
polyester, brushed twill with a
button down collar, center full
button front, woodtone buttons,
left chest pocket, single needle
hemmed sleeves, single needle
top stitching throughout, two ply
back yoke with box pleat and a
short tail clean finished hemmed
bottom.

ALL COLORS

XS-XL

$16.75

$117.25

$16.49

$115.43

$17.80

$124.60

$16.20

$113.40

2XL-6XL

$22.75

$159.25

$17.49

$122.43

$22.00

$154.00

$21.75

$152.25

12

S508

Port Authority - Short Sleeve -
Easy Care Shirt - 4.5 oz, 55
cotton/45 poly - Button-down
collar - Dyed to match buttons -
patch pocket - box back pleat

ALL COLORS

XS-XL

$16.75

$117.25

$15.06

$105.42

$16.45

$115.15

$13.75

$96.25

2XL-6XL

$22.75

$159.25

$20.54

$143.78

$22.05

$154.35

$18.75

$131.25

13

S608

Port Authority - Long Sleeve -
Easy Care Shirt - 4.5 oz, 55
cotton/45 poly - Button-down
collar - Dyed to match buttons -
patch pocket - box back pleat

ALL COLORS

XS-XL

$16.75

$117.25

$15.06

$105.42

$16.45

$115.15

$13.75

$96.25

2XL-6XL

$22.75

$159.25

$20.54

$143.78

$22.05

$154.35

$18.75

$131.25




Specification Responses

Matteo International

SP Designs & Mfg, Inc

Westview Corporation

Pride Enterprises

Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
HATS Hats to be order in dozens
only
HEAD TO TOE - low profile >
garment washed twill cap, 100% ALL g
14 171H |cotton, 6-panel with sewn AVAILABLE 4] 58 [$4.10 $237.80 $4.41 $255.78 $4.80 $1,141.44 |$46.80 $234.00
eyelets, brass buckle with COLLORS E
adjustable cloth strap m
OTTO (Flex Style) Brushed Cotton
Twill Low Profile Pro Style Caps,
97% Cotton-3% Spandex
Constructed Firm Front Panel ALL P
Flexible Fit Low-Fitting, 6-panel, c
15 | 11-413 | o0 HELOWTITNG, 5B AVAILABLE g 45 |$5.05 $227.25 534 $240.30  |$5.40 $1,227.15 |$48.00 $192.00
seamed front panel with full >
. COLLORS @
buckram, 6 embroidered eyelets, o
pro stitch on crown, matching
color undervisor, matching color
sweatband
OTTO - Brushed Cotton Twill
Polo Low Profile Pro Style Caps,
95% Polyester-35% Cotton,
unconstructed soft crown low- $30.00
fitting, 6-panel cap, seamed front >
panel without buckram, 6 ALL g Suggest OTTO
16 25-023 [embroidered eyelets matching AVAILABLE 4 36 |$3.90 $140.40 |$3.26 $117.36  |$3.60 $505.44  |99-598 (for $ 90.00
visor color, pro stitch on crown, 8  COLLORS E embroidery
rows stitching on visor, matching m $30.00/doz)
fabric undervisor, matching color
sweatband, matching fabric
adjustable strap with plastic
buckle, insert in sweatband
>
ALL =
OTTO Washed Pigment Dyed [
17 60-283 . . AVAILABLE 4] 24 |$4.20 $100.80 $3.84 $92.16 $4.15 $418.32 $34.50 $69.00
Cotton Twill Sun Visors >
COLLORS @©
m
>
OTTO Brushed Bull Denim Sun ALL g
u u im Su
18 60-263 Visors AVAILABLE ] 24 $3.90 $93.60 $3.17 $76.08 $3.60 $336.96 $28.75 $69.00
COLLORS &
m
19 MINIMUM Percentage off Retail for all other 10% 0% 230% 10%
Manufacturers.
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR SHIRTS & HATS $11,040.41 $10,823.41 $16,141.13 $9,747.86




Specification Responses

Matteo International

SP Designs & Mfg, Inc

Westview Corporation

Pride Enterprises

Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
CITY LOGO - SCREEN PRINT AND EMBROIDERY
SCREEN PRINT / LOCAT| PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER
ITEM DESCRIPTION
EMBROIDERY ION LOGO LOGO LOGO LOGO
S Print Logo, 1 FRONT
20 [SHIRTS creen Frint Logo $0.50 $0.50 $0.90 $0.90 $2.50 $2.50 $0.65 $0.65
color SMALL|
BACK $1.00 $1.00| $0.90 $0.90| $2.50 $2.50 $0.75 $0.75]
LARGE . . . . . . . E
S Print Depart t |FRONT
creen Frint bepartmen $0.25 $0.25 $0.90 $0.90 $2.00 $2.00] n/c with logo| n/c with logo
Name BELO
BACK ] ]
BELO $0.25 $0.25 $0.90 $0.90| $2.00 $2.00] n/c with logo| n/c with logo|
.25/1000 .25/1000]
Embroidery Logo, 1 color | 0N $2.00 $2.00) $2.00 $2.00 $8.00 sgop|  Stitches-j - stitches -
SMALL| minimum minimum
$3.00 $3.00|
.25/1000 .25/1000]
Embroid L , Full FRONT titches - titches -|
mbroidery Logo, Fu $2.50 $2.50 $2.00 $2.00 $13.35 $13.35]  SHNes stirenes
Color SMALL| minimum minimum
$3.00 $3.00|
Embroidery Dept name, |FRONT]
1 color SMALL $1.00 $1.00| $1.50 $1.50] $2.00 $2.00| $2.00 $2.00|
S Print Logo, 1 FRONT . .
21 |HATS creen Frint Logo $2.00 $2.00 $0.90 $0.90 $2.50 $2.50 no bid no bid
color SMALL
N Print Depart t |FRONT
creen Frint Departmen $1.00 $1.00 $0.90 $0.90 $2.00 $2.00 no bid no bid
Name BELO
. FRONT
Embroidery Logo, 1 color SMALL $2.00 $2.00| $2.00 $2.00| $8.00 $8.00) $3.00 $3.00]
Embroidery Logo, Full FRONT,
mbroidery Logo, Fu $2.50 $2.50 $2.00 $2.00 $13.35 $13.35 $3.00 $3.00
Color SMALL|
Embroidery Dept name, |FRONT if space if space
1.00 1.00} 1.50 1.50] 2.00 2.00)
1 color SMALL s s s s s s allows $1.00{ allows $1.00|
TOTAL UNIT COST FOR SCREEN PRINTING $16.00) $16.40) $60.20) $13.40
One time set One time set One time set One time set
up fee for up fee for up fee for up fee for
contract per contract per contract per contract per |All $5.00 per
each logo each logo each logo each logo logo - No
and and and and Charge to
department department department department |Change Dept
TYPESET AND ARTWORK COST: Please state you applicable cost for set up. |name name name name Name
Screen Print Logo — Small $ 3 - 13 090[$ 0.90]$ 20.00 | $ 20.00]$ 5.00[$ 5.00
Screen Print Logo — Large $ - 18 K 090|$%$ 090]% 20.00 | $ 20.00] $ 500|% 5.00
Embroidery Logo — 1 Color — Small $ - |$ - |8 200|% 2.00 $ 500|% 5.00
Embroidery Logo — 1 Color — Large . . 2.00 2.00 5.00 5.00
Embroidery Logo — Full Color — Small - - 2.00 2.00 | nc nc 5.00 5.00
Embroidery Logo — Full Color — Large - - 2.00 2001 % 78.00 | $ 78.00 5.00 5.00
Screen Print Department Name — Small $ - |$ - |8 090|%$ 090]$ 10.00 | $ 10.00] $ 500|% 5.00
Screen Print Department Name — Large $ - 18 - 13 090 % 090 $ 10.00 | $ 10.00] $ 500|% 5.00
TOTAL FOR TYPESET AND ARTWORK $ k3 - $ 11.60 $ 138.00 $ 40.00




Specification Responses

Matteo International

SP Designs & Mfg, Inc

Westview Corporation

Pride Enterprises

Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
TOTAL FOR SHIRTS & HATS $11,040.41] $10,823.41] $16,141.13] $9,747.86
TOTAL FOR SCREEN PRINT
AND TYPESET CHARGES $16.00 $28.00 $198.20 $53.40
TOTAL
SHIRTS/HATS/SCREENPRING/

TYPESET $11,056.41] $10,851.41] $16,339.33] $9,801.26
Maximum % Increase 2nd Yr 5% 0% 3% 4%
Unit/Extended $ w/2nd Yr $11,609.23] $10,823.41] $16,625.36| $10,137.77|
Maximum % Increase 3rd Yr 8% 0% 3% 4%
Unit/Extended $ w/3rd Yr $12,537.97| $10,823.41] $17,124.12) $10,543.29
TOTAL MAX EXT PRICE - 3
YRS $35,203.61, $32,470.23] $49,890.61 $30,428.92,
SAVINGS - 3 YR INTIAL
PERIOD
Payment Terms: Net 45 Net 45 2%10 Net 45 Net 45
Accept CC Yes Yes yes Yes
Offer CC Discount No No no No
Sample Mfg Retail w/discount  Style Retail Matteo SP Designs Westview
CornerStone
CS402P 21.98 $19.78 $21.98 $15.39
CornerStone
Cs412 25.98 $23.38 $25.98 $18.19
Port Authority
K431 25.98 $23.38 $25.98 $18.19
Port Authority
K455 25.98 $23.38 $25.98 $18.19
Port Authority
K800LS 27.98 $25.18 $27.98 $19.59
$115.11 $127.90 $89.53
$2,302.20 $2,558.00 $1,790.60



Bid Request Number Q2012107/UNI-APPAREL/1213

Specification Responses ARAMARK LK Graphic Design
Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended
Rejected: Non-Responsive -
Did not Acknowledge Rejected - Non-responsive -
Submittal Components Addendum 3. Incomplete bid response.
On-Line / Hardcopy HARDCOPY HARDCOPY
Bidder Response Form/NonCol REC'D REC'D
Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended
JERZEES — MEN’S POLOS AND TEES
wgn : S-XL i
7" Cotton Heavy Weight Tee — NEUTRALS no bid $5.85
5.6 0z — 100% pre-shrunk with 2XL no bid $7.85
ribbed crew neck collar &
S-XL i
1 363M |coverseamed front, set-in HEATHERS 7 no bid 5685
sleeves, taped shoulder to 2XL no bid $8.85
shoulder and two-needle S-XL no bid $7.85
hemmed sleeves and bottom COLORS .
2XL no bid $9.85
S-XL no bid $5.85
“z Blend” Heavyweight Tee (no | NEUTRALS -
pocket) — 5.6 oz, pre-shrunk 50% X no bid 7.85-8385
tton/50% polyest ith S-XL bid 6.85
2 29M C‘cl))bo(rj]/ e ykes Tlr " ta‘ HEATHERS 30 = >
ribbed crew neck collar, set-in IXL-3XL 1o bid .85 -9.95
sleeves, taped shoulder to -
shoulder and two-needle SxL no bid $7.85
hemmed sleeves & bottom COLORS
2XL-3XL no bid 9.85 - 10.85
S-XL no bid $7.85
“Z Blend” Heavyweight Tee (with | NEUTRALS
pocket) — 5.6 oz, pre-shrunk 50% 2XL-3XL no bid 9.85-10.85
cotton/50% polyester with a S-XL bid 3.85
: - HEATHERS fo ot s
ribbed crew neck collar, set-in
3 29MP 2XL-3XL 75 |no bid 10.85-11.85
sleeves, taped shoulder to
shoulder and two-needle S-XL no bid $9.85
hemmed sleeves & bottom and a COLORS
left chest pocket.
2XL-3XL no bid 11.85-12.85
S-XL no bid $8.85
Long Sleeve Tee — 100% Cotton NEUTRALS .
H5596 |with a ribbed crew neck collar, XL no bid 1085-1185
HANES |[set-in sleeves, taped shoulder to S-XL bid 9.85
4 P HEATHERS 29 |22 3
shoulder and two-needle XLAXL bid
hemmed sleeves & bottom and a - no ot 1185-12.85
left chest pocket. COLORS S-XL no bid $10.95
2XL-3XL no bid 12.95-13.95




Specification Responses

ARAMARK

LK Graphic Design

Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended
Jersey Golf w/Pocket — 5.6 0z — S-XL i X
Y w/l z NEUTRALS no bid $11.00
50% cotton/50% polyester full- i
. ; 2XL-3XL no bid 13.00 - 14.00
cut jersey with a two pearl
i | plack | S-XL i .
s | sy ot | e s o
' ' pockel, 2XL3XL no bid 13.00 - 14.00
tubular body and two-needle
S-XL i X
hemmed sleeves & round COLORS no bid $11.00
bottom. 2XL3XL no bid 13.00 - 14.00
JERZEES - WOMEN'S POLOS
S-XL id 11.
- . NEUTRALS no b $11.00
Jerzee ladies johnny collar jersey XL no bid $13.00
sport shirt, , two-needle SxL o bid $11.00
6 337WR |hemmed bottom, V-Neck styling | HEATHERS 5 - -
with welt knit Jonny collor, 1x1 XL no bid $13.00
i S-XL i
rib sleeve bands COLORS no bfd $11.00
2XL no bid $13.00
HANES — MEN’ POLOS AND TEES
Stedman Blended Jersey with NEUTRALS SXL no bid $13.00
Pocket — 5.5 oz, 50/50 2XL-3XL no bid 15.00 - 16.00
tt lyester, -shrunk, .
c_o on/po yester p_re shrun SxL 1o bid $13.00
7 0504 [five point pocket with double- HEATHERS 16
needle hem, clean-finished 2XL-3XL no bid 15.00 - 16.00
placket with pearl buttons, welt S-XL f .
collar & ribbed knit cuffs COLORS nobid 213,00
: 2XL-3XL no bid 15.00 - 16.00
ANVIL - MEN’ POLOS AND TEES
" S-XL i .
Anwl 516 oz, 5‘0/50 cotton NEUTRALS no bid $13.00
jersey with stain repel and IXLSXL no bid 15.00 - 18.00
release, soft fashion knit - -
contoured collar & welt sleeve S-XL no bid $13.00
8 4603 |bands, three wood tone buttons, HEATHERS 8 ]
double-needle bottom hem, 2XL-5XL no bid 15.00 - 18.00
single-needle neck, shoulder, SXL no bid $13.00
armhole & sleeve - side-seamed COLORS
with 2 1/2" side vents
2XL-5XL no bid 15.00 - 18.00
S-XL i
. . NEUTRALS no bid $12.00
Anvil - 6.5 0z 100 % ring spun 2XL-3XL no bid 14.00 - 15.00
cotton pique, soft fashion knit "
S-XL bid 12.00
9 6002 |contoured collar & welt sleeve HEATHERS 12 no I 5
bands, three wood tone buttons, 2XL-3XL no bid 14.00-15.00
" S-XL i
double-needle bottom hem COLORS no bid $12.00
2XL-3XL no bid 14.00 - 15.00




Specification Responses

Line

STYLE #

ARAMARK

LK Graphic Design

Description

COLOR

SIZES

QTY

Unit Extended

Unit

Extended

WOVEN SHIRTS — MEN’S

10

1C623

Short Sleeve Performance
Brushed Twill by Jonathan Corey
— 4.6 0z - 60% cotton/40%
polyester, brushed twill with a
button down collar, center full
button front, woodtone buttons,
left chest pocket, single needle
hemmed sleeves, single needle
top stitching throughout, two ply
back yoke with box pleat and a
short tail clean finished hemmed
bottom.

ALL COLORS

XS-XL

no bid

$23.00

2XL-6XL

no bid

25.00 - 29.00

11

1C622

Long Sleeve Performance
Brushed Twill by Jonathan Corey
— 4.6 0z —60% cotton/40%
polyester, brushed twill with a
button down collar, center full
button front, woodtone buttons,
left chest pocket, single needle
hemmed sleeves, single needle
top stitching throughout, two ply
back yoke with box pleat and a
short tail clean finished hemmed
bottom.

ALL COLORS

XS-XL

no bid

$23.00

2XL-6XL

no bid

25.00 - 29.00

12

S508

Port Authority - Short Sleeve -
Easy Care Shirt - 4.5 oz, 55
cotton/45 poly - Button-down
collar - Dyed to match buttons -
patch pocket - box back pleat

ALL COLORS

XS-XL

no bid

$21.00

2XL-6XL

no bid

23.00 - 27.00

13

S608

Port Authority - Long Sleeve -
Easy Care Shirt - 4.5 oz, 55
cotton/45 poly - Button-down
collar - Dyed to match buttons -
patch pocket - box back pleat

ALL COLORS

XS-XL

no bid

$21.00

2XL-6XL

no bid

23.00 - 27.00




Specification Responses

Line

STYLE #

ARAMARK

LK Graphic Design

Description

COLOR

SIZES

QTY

Unit

Extended

Unit

Extended

HATS

14

171H

HEAD TO TOE - low profile
garment washed twill cap, 100%
cotton, 6-panel with sewn
eyelets, brass buckle with
adjustable cloth strap

ALL
AVAILABLE
COLLORS

Jnavisnrav

58

no bid

$10.00

15

11-413

OTTO (Flex Style) Brushed Cotton
Twill Low Profile Pro Style Caps,
97% Cotton-3% Spandex
Constructed Firm Front Panel
Flexible Fit Low-Fitting, 6-panel,
seamed front panel with full
buckram, 6 embroidered eyelets,
pro stitch on crown, matching
color undervisor, matching color
sweatband

ALL
AVAILABLE
COLLORS

Javisnravy

45

no bid

$10.00

16

25-023

OTTO - Brushed Cotton Twill
Polo Low Profile Pro Style Caps,
95% Polyester-35% Cotton,
unconstructed soft crown low-
fitting, 6-panel cap, seamed front
panel without buckram, 6
embroidered eyelets matching
visor color, pro stitch on crown, 8
rows stitching on visor, matching
fabric undervisor, matching color
sweatband, matching fabric
adjustable strap with plastic
buckle, insert in sweatband

ALL
AVAILABLE
COLLORS

Jnavisnrav

36

no bid

$10.00

17

60-283

OTTO Washed Pigment Dyed
Cotton Twill Sun Visors

ALL
AVAILABLE
COLLORS

24

no bid

$10.00

18

60-263

OTTO Brushed Bull Denim Sun
Visors

ALL
AVAILABLE
COLLORS

31av.isnrav [3navisnrav

24

no bid

$10.00

19

MINIMUM Percentage off Retail for all other

Manufacturers.

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE FOR SHIRTS & HATS|

20%

no bid

$0.00




Specification Responses ARAMARK LK Graphic Design
Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended
qITY LOGO - SCREEN PRINT ANH EMBROIDERY
SCREEN PRINT / LOCAT| PRICE PER PRICE PER
ITEM DESCRIPTION
EMBROIDERY ION LOGO LOGO
20 |SHIRTS Screen Print Logo, 1 FRONT $3.50 more
color SMALL| information
BACK $3.50 needed to
LARGE provide
Screen Print Department |FRONT $3.50 quote
Name BELO )
BACK $3.50
BELO '
Embroidery Logo, 1 color FRONT $4.00
SMALL|
Embroidery Logo, Full FRONT
v o8 $4.00
Color SMALL|
Embroidery Dept name, |FRONT] $4.00
1 color SMALL )
Screen Print Logo, 1 FRONT
HATS .
21 color SMALL $3.50
Screen Print Department [FRONT
Name BELO $3.50
FRONT
Embroidery Logo, 1 color X
Vo8 SMALL $4.00
Embroidery Logo, Full FRONT
aery Logo, Fu $4.00
Color SMALL|
Embroidery Dept name, |FRONT
1 color SMALL $4.00
TOTAL UNIT COST FOR SCREEN PRINTING
One time set One time set
up fee for up fee for
contract per contract per
each logo each logo
and and
department department
TYPESET AND ARTWORK COST: Please state you applicable cost for set up. |name name
Screen Print Logo — Small n/c more
Screen Print Logo — Large n/c information
Embroidery Logo — 1 Color — Small n/c needed
Embroidery Logo — 1 Color — Large n/c to provide
Embroidery Logo — Full Color — Small n/c quote
Embroidery Logo — Full Color — Large n/c
Screen Print Department Name — Small n/c
Screen Print Department Name — Large n/c
TOTAL FOR TYPESET AND ARTWORK $ - $ -




Specification Responses ARAMARK LK Graphic Design
Line  STYLE # |Description COLOR SIZES QTY |Unit Extended Unit Extended
TOTAL FOR SHIRTS & HATS
TOTAL FOR SCREEN PRINT
AND TYPESET CHARGES
TOTAL
SHIRTS/HATS/SCREENPRING/
TYPESET #REF! #REF!
Maximum % Increase 2nd Yr 3% 0%
Unit/Extended $ w/2nd Yr #REF! #REF! #REF!
Maximum % Increase 3rd Yr 3% 0%
Unit/Extended $ w/3rd Yr #REF! #REF! #REF!
TOTAL MAX EXT PRICE - 3
YRS #REF! #REF!
SAVINGS - 3 YR INTIAL
PERIOD
Payment Terms: Net 45
Accept CC no
Offer CC Discount no
Sample Mfg Retail w/discount Style Retail
CornerStone
CS402P 21.98
CornerStone
Cs412 25.98
Port Authority
K431 25.98
Port Authority
K455 25.98
Port Authority
K800LS 27.98




