FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-080511

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

QPENING DATE: December 2, 2008

FOR

BUYER: Bob Franceschini

ANNUAL PURCHASE OF RFID EQUIPMENT FOR THE LEE COUNTY LIBRARY SYSTEM

M
VENDORS LIBRARY DEMCO, INC. |
e Whe s SYSTEMS
Addenda Acknowedged YES YES
GRAND TOTAL (SECTIONS I THRU 158) 5 2,597.,822.00 3 909,770.25 | W/ FIREWALL
i ) 3 915,159.90 | W/QUT FIREWALL
Section 1 - Bonita Springs Public Library -
1. 3M 895 Staff Workstations - Cost.Each 3 3,517.09 $ 319985,
Cost Each X 4 = 3 14,068.00 | § - 3 15,199.86 | § -
2. 3M C-Series RFID Smart Chute - Cost Each 3 10,683.00 3 13,350.93
CostEach X 1= 5 10,683.00 | § - § 1335095 1 § -
3. 3M DTN RFID Tags - Cost Each 3 0.49 $ 0.55
Cost Each X 86,000 = 42,140.00 : § - 3 47,300.00 | -
4. 3M 8902 Dual Aisle Detection System - Cost Each $ 12,873.00 11,853.00
CostEach X 1= $ 12873.00 1 8 - $ 11,853.00 1 8 -
. "
Total for Section 1 (Xtems 1 thru 4) / $ 79,764.00 )S - $ §7.703.75 | % -
Section 2 - Bookmobile
1. 3M 895 Staff Workstations - Cost Each 3 3,517.00 $ 3,799.95
CostEach X 2= 3 70340013 - 3 7.599.90 1 § -
Total for Section 2 (Item 1) C $ 7,034.00 DS - 3 7509901 % -
Section 3A - Cape Coral Public Library
1. 3M Digital Library Assistant - Cost Each $ 7,077.60 3 8.473.40
CostBach X 1= 3 7,077.06 1 § - 8 84734013 -
2. 3M 895 Staff Workstation - Cost Each 3,517.00 $ 3,799.95
Cost BEach X 5= $ 17,585.00 1 $ “ $ 18,999.75 | & .




M
VENDORS LIBRARY DEMCQ, INC. R
S e SYSTEMS
3. IMDINRFIDTags-CostBach |5 0.49 5 055 o
Cost Each X 253,000 = $ 123,970.00 | § $ 139,150.00 B
4. 3M 8902 Dual Aisle Detection System - Cost Each i2,873.00 3 11,853.00 . o
CostEachX 1= $ 12.873.00 | § $ 11,853.00 -
Total for Section 3A (Items 1 thru 4) ( $ 161,505.6{)‘)&5 $ 178,476.15 -
—— -
Section 3B - Cape Coral Public Library
1. FKI AMH Internal - Cost Each k) 428,808.00 NOBID -
CostFBach X 1= $ 428,808.00 | $ NO BID -
Total for Section 3B (Item 1) ik 428,808.00 13 NO BID -
e ——
Section 4 - Captiva Memorial Library
T. 3M 895 Staff Workstations - Cost Each 3 3,517.00 3 3,799.95
CostEach X 2= $ 7,034.00 1 §- 3 7,599.90 -
2. 3M BCS Self Check System - Cost Each $ 8,952.00 $ ) 983500,
CostEach X 1= $ §,952.00 | 3 $ 9.835.00 -
il ]
Total for Section 4 (ltems 1 thru 2) 3 15,986.00 )$ 3 17,434.90 -
Section 5 - Dunbar Public Library A
1. 3M 895 Staff Workstations - Cost Each 3 3,517.00 5 379985y 4
Cost Each X 3 = $ 10,551.00 | 5 $ 11,399.85 . -
2. 3M DTN RFID Tags - Cost Each $ 0.49 $ 0.55
Cost Bach X 57.000=_ g 27930001 % $ 31,350.00 -
3. 3M 8902 Dual Aisle Detection System - Cost Each $ 12,873.00 3 11,853.00
Cost Each X 1= 3 12,873.00 1 § 11,853.00 -
____—-——-—_"——*nn\
Total Section 5 (Items 1 thru 3) 3 51,354.00 3 % 3 54,602.85 -




M
YENDORS LIBRARY DEMCO, INC.
- ! » = SYSTEMS
Section 6 ~ East County Regional Library
1. 3M C-Series RFID Smart Chute - Cost Each ] 10,683.00 3 13,350,95
Cost Bach X 1= $ 10,683.00 | § - 13 13,350.95 -
2. 3M Digital Library Assistant - Cost Each 3 7,8077.60 3 8,473.40
Cost Bach X 1 = $ 7,077.00 1 - s 8,473.40 -
ommnen am e /— —-—u—_\
Total Section 6 (Items 1 thru 2) (s 17,760.00 B $ - |3 21,824.35 .
o hherass et e — -
Section 7 - Fort Myers Public Library (Current Location)
1. 3M Digital Library Assistant - Cost Each 3 7,077.00 $ 8,473.40
CostEach X 1= B ; 3 7,077.00 1 % - 3 347340 -
2. 3M 895 Staff Workstations - Cost Each 3 3,517.00 3,799.95
Cost Each X 5 = 3 17,585.0¢ | $ - 3 18,999,75 -
3. 30 DTN RFID Tags - Cost Each $ 0.49 $ 0.55 -
Cost Bach X 187,000 = 3 9163000 1 § . $ 102,850.00 -
4. 3M 8902 Dual Aisle Detection System - Cost Each % 12,873.00 $ 11,853.00
CostBach X 1= 3 12,873.00 1 8 - ) 11,853.00 -
p——
"Total Seetion 7 {Ftetns 1 thru 4) $ 129.165.00) $ - 13 142,176.15 .
Section 8§ - Fort Myers Public Library (New Building
Project)
1. FK! AMH Internal - Cost Each $ 393,078.00 NO BID
CostBachX 1=~~~ 3 393078.00 ' 3 - NO BID -
Total Section § (Item 1) /TS 393,078.00 }$ - NO BID -
Ko
Section 9A - Lakes Regional Library o o
1. 3M Digital Library Assistant - Cost Each 3 7.077.00 5 8473.40 L ~ L
[CostBach X 1= - JE. 707700 | $ R L] 8,473.40 o




M

VENDORS LIBRARY DEMCO, INC.

e " Hmaan o L SYSTEMS
2. 3M 8902 Dual Alisle Detection System - Cost Each 3 12,873.00 $ 11,853.60
Cost Bach X 1= - L 3 12,873.00 | § 3 11,853.00 | § - 3 R -
3. 3M 8935 Staff Workstation - Cost Each 3 3,517.00 $ 3,799.95 3 .
CostEachX 1= b 3,517.00 | § 3 3099851 % RS N
_ . e : o e .
Total for Section 9A (Items 1 thru 3} (s 23,4—6-’;.%\ $ 3 24,12635 1 $ - 13 -
Section 9B - Lakes Regional Library
1. FKI AMH Internal - Cost Each 393,078.00 NO BID _
CostEach X 1= b 39307300 | § NOBID $ - 3 -
2. FKI1 AMH External - Cost Each 3 136,068.0¢ NG BID
CostEach X 1= 3 136,068.00 | 3 NOBID $ - ) -
Totai for Section 9B (Items 1 thra 2) C b 525,146.00 % NO BID $ - 3 -
Section 10 - Library Administration I P RV SR N N o
1. 3M Digital Library Assistant - Cost Each i3 __7,077.00 N 8,473.40 1o
CostBach X 1= B} R 7077001 % $ 847340 | § - 18 -
Total for Section 10 (ftem 1) (3 7,077.00 38 $ 847340 1 % . -
Section 11A - Library Processing Center B ] ) o e
1. 3M 895 Staff Workstations - Cost Each 5 3517600 3 3,79995 1 I
CostBach X2~ - $ 7,034.00 1 3 . b} 7,599.90 | § O 2SO
2. 3M D7N RFID Tags - Cost Each o (.49 3 0.55
Cost Each X 225,000= 5110250008 $ 123,750.00 | $ g -
Total for Section 11A (ltems § thru 2) ( N 117.284.00 \3 $ . 131,34990 1 % - $ -
Section 11B - Library Processing Center
1. FKI AMH Internal - Cost Each $ 288,222.00 NO BID
Cost Bach X 1 = 3 288222001 % NO BID $ - b -




M

VENDORS LIBRARY DEMCO, INC.

L - SYSTEMS
Total for Section 11B (Item 1) s 288,222.00 [)$ NO BID $ - -
Scction 12 - North Fort Myers Public Library
1. 3M 8902 Dual Aisle Detection System - Cost Fach 1§ 12,873.00 11,853.00 -
CostBach X 1= el 5. 12,873.00 | § . 11,853.60 1 § - ]
2, 3M C-Series RFID Smart Chute - Cost Each $ 10683001 13,350.95 ~
CostBach X 1= |8 l0s8300}S ..1335095 18 - -
3. 3M 895 Staff Workstation - Cost Each _ $ 3,517.00 o 3,799.95 o
CostEach X 1= $ 35170018 . 379995 |8 - T
O P — 7"‘-"— ‘_\ [R— — — i
Total for Section 12 (ltems 1 thru3) |s ool 2900390 |8 - :
Section 13 - Pine Istand Public Library ) -
1. 3M 895 Staff Workstations - Cost Each $ 3,517.00 3,799.95
Cost Bach X 3 = $ 10,551.00 | $ 11,399.85 | $ - I
2. 3M BCS Self Check System - Cost Each $ §,952.00 9,835.00
Cost Each X 1= 3 89520013 0.83500 1 % - -

je “"\

Total for Section 13 (Items 1 thru 2) ( 3 19,503.00 }$ 212348513 - -
Section 14 - South County Regional Library ___
1. 3M Digital Library Assistant - Cost Each ] 7.077.00 8.473.40
Cost Bach X 1= 3 7,077.00 | 3 247340 1 3 - -
2, 3M 895 Staff Workstations - Cost Each $ 3,517.00 3,799.95
CostBach X5= 3 17,585.00 : $ 18,999.75 | § - -
3. 3M D7N RFID Tags - Cost Each (.49 0.55
Cost Bach X 193,000 = } 3 9457000 | § 10615000 | § - -




m
VENDORS LIBRARY B DEMCO, INC. B _ )
e SYSTEMS
4, 3M 8902 Dual Aisle Detection System - Cost Each $ 12,873.00 3 11,853.00 _
Cost Bach X | = 3 12,873.00 3 11,853.00 | § - $ ) -
S, 3M C-Series RFID Smart Chute - Cost Each § 10,683.00 $ 13,350.95 . e
CostFach X 1= o $ 10,683.00 $ 1335095:%8 - 3% ..
Total for Section 14 (Items 1 thru 5) Vi 142,783.00 $ 158.827.10 1 § - 3 ] -
£ .
" T T—
Section 15A - Annual Maintenance 3M / ¥ 31,123.00 $ 26,936.70 | (W/OUT FIREWALL)
$ 32,326.35 | (WITH FIREWALL}
e T ——
Section 15B - Annual Maintenance FKI e 127,785.00 1y NO BID
Option A - Price List 3M
oy
List Less % C 30% .> 7%
.
Qption B-Price ListFKIT
List Less % - o NO BID NO BID o
Onption C - 3m 8800 Detection System o I
Model 8801 Single Aisle 3 9,374.00 $ 8,752.00 (W/OUTSERVICE) :
Model 8802 Dual Aisle 43 11,023.00 . 3 10,488.00 {W/QUT SERVICE) | ]
Ogption D - 3M 8900 Detection System o ) L
Model 8901 Singje Aisle __ NOBID g 9,667.00 |(W/OUT SERVICE)
Model 8902 Dual Aisle _ NO BID $ 11,853.00 ((W/OUT SERVICE) : N L
Option E - 3M Staff Workstation - Model 8935 e i o
N T
Cost Each o /$ 3,517.00 3 3,949.0¢ {(W/OUT SERVICE)
Option F - 3M Conversion Station e
L e
Mode! 811 3 13,288.00¢ NQO BID
Model 812 3 13,288.00 3 12,388.00 ({W/QUT SERVICE)-




IM
VENDORS LIBRARY DEMCQ, INC.
- L L SYSTEMS
Option G - 3M Seifcheck & Options
BCS Seif Check / 3 8,952.60 3 9,835.00 |(W/QUT SERVICE)
R - Series: Kiosk or Parts Only - List Less % 28% NOBID ]
V - Series: V3 or V4: Kiosk, Table Top or Parts Only - Ligt
{Less % o 24% NOQ BID o
C - Series: RFID Book Chute B 3 10,683.00 3 13.350.95 [(W/QUT SERVICE)
3M Self Check Scifpay Fines & Fees Opticns 3. 1,729.00 $ 2,417.00 {(W/OUT SERVICE)
Option H - 3M Hand-Held RFID Reader - R
Digital Library Assistant $ 7,077.00 $ 7,011.65 |(W/OUT SERVICE} R
Digital Data Manager o . $ 1,520.00 ; 3 1,461.75 [(W/OUT SERVICE) o
Option I - ISO RFID Tags ]
3M D4 or Equal Basic - Specify Brand M NO BID
Cost Bach { .39 NOQ BID
AP _ S | . e -
3M D7 or Equal Enhanced - Specify Brand 3M M )
CostEach 0.49 (.63 PLAIN-1000 MIN.
- — 0.74: CUSTOM-1000 MIN. -~
3M D8 or Equat Premium - Specify Brand 3 3M
Cost Each (/ (.53 ) 0.76{PLAIN-1000 MIN.
N
= T— 80 CENTS|CUSTOM-1000 MIN.
Option J - Disemate (NO EQUALS) and Related Items SOLD IN 100/CASE - 11 CASE MINIMUM
Discmate Cases -~ CD; e —
v m—

Single Cost Each $ 1.20 s 117 \;
Dual Cost Each $ 1.50 3 1,24
ual L . -
Disemate Cases - DVD: )
Lhscmaie Lases - VL L. D o —] .
Single CostBach (B 1100
Dual CostEach $ 150 - . e -
Discmate Snap-in Tray for Single DVD Case | _ 1% 9.50 : ) R _
Discmate Snap-In Tray for Single CD Case 135 050 oD .

——
Discmate 4-Disc Case $ 2.53 i




M

VENDORS | LIBRARY DEMCO, INC. ,.—

: L A SYSTEMS

Discmate §-Disc Case - $ 3.10 m> N

Discmate Intelligent Lnlocker - Cost Each ) 5 4,665.00 o 3 4.296.060 {W/QUTSERVICE) |

CostBachX35= 5 163,275.00 | $ - G 150,360.00 s

Discmate CD Replacement Locks - Cost Each $ 0.50 s - {}39 » .

Cost Bach X 64,000= $ 3200000 | § - (3 249600083 . ls -

Discmate DVD Replacement Locks - Cost Each 3 Q.50 g8 0.39

Cost Each X 104,000 = $ 52,000.00 | $ s 40,560.00 )'$ - 18 -

Discmate Manual Unlocker { $ 75.00 3 3 76.00 B

Option K - Future Projects IM .

$3,000,000.00 X % / 300/:\ 1%

$3,000,000.00 X % Discount = f $. 900,000.00 fs - 13 30,000.00 | $ N -

Option L - Future Projects FKI I T A S R W

$3,000000.00 X % 1;;/:\ NO BID )

$3,000,0600.00 X % Discount= . .. (_ $ 306,000.00 .}$ . NO BID 3 -5 -

Deliver with own vehicle as opposed to common carrier | NO 4 _YES - -

Started within ____ calendar days 30DAYS - 26 WEEKS N _ A3 DAYS } I

Location in Lee County” o NO JNO

Modifications § S, 5 _._NO O N
e DA N/A R N

immigration Affidavit ) o YES . YES o |

Meets Specifications S . YES YES N R .

NOBIDS - 1

INFOPRO CONCEPTS, INC.

- *MODIFICATIONS: ERGQ CART (ALL SYSTEMS ARE DESIGNED TO USE ERGO TROLLEYS)

e ERGO VOLUME (ERGO VOLUMES ARE NOT AVAILABLE UNLES SYSTEM USES ERGO CARTS)

POSTING TIME/DATE I

FROM: [

UNTIL: !




