FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120338

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 18, 2012

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

MOWING & LANDSCAPE, MAINTENANCE FOR LEE COUNTY LIBRARIES(STEP 2-PRICTNG)

ESTATE
LANDSCAFING &
P&TLAWN & LAWN
TRUGREEN TRACTOR CLA MANAGEMENT,
LANDCARE AMERA-TECH INC, [LANDSCAPING LIC

SERVICE, INC.

R,

e —

Addenda Acknowedged
AREA ONE
CAPE CORAL 11,972.00 10,575.00] 17,100.60 NO BID NO BID
MULCH 5.579.00 2,025.00 1,110.00 NO BID NO BID
MULCH LABOR 1,900.00 2,000.00 405.00 NO BID NO BID
PINE NUGGETS 5,779.00 2,025.00 1,330.00 NO BID NO BID
LABOR 1,900.80 2,000.00 445.00 NOBID|  NOBID
GRAND TOTAL AREA ONE s27.130.00) % 518,625.00 ) $20,390.00 NO BID NO BID
AREA TWO B
NORTH FORT MYERS 3,384.00 1,788.00 5,195.00 NOBID| NO BID
MULCH 475.00 1,080.00 280.00 NO BID NO BID
MULCH LABOR 175.00 975.00 101.00 NO BID NO BID
PINE NUGGETS 575.00 1,000.00 332.00 NO BID NO BID
LABOR 175.00 975.00 11100 NO BID NO BID
DUNBAR JUPITER HAMMON PUBLIC |
LIBRARY 3,300.00 1,320.00 5,195.00 NO BID
MULCT 475.00 67500 41500 NOBID|
MULCH LABOR 175.00 600.00 150.00 NO BID
PINE NUGGETS 575.00 675.00 500.00 NO BID
LABOR 17500 600.00 16600 NO BID

COMBINED WITH

FI' MYERS

LIBRARY ADMINISTRATION 400.00 S00.00 LIBRARY NOBID|
MULCH 62.00 100.00 138.00 NO BID
MULCH LABOR 30.00 50.00 50.00 NO BID
PINE NUGGETS 162.00 100.00| 166.00 NO BID
LABOR 30.00 50.00 5500 NO BID
FORT MYERS LIBRARY 4£,000.00 10,800.00 16,390.00 NO BID
MULCH 700.00 742.80 145.00 NO BID -
MULCH LABOR 200.00 700.00 152.00| NO BID
PINE NUGGETS 700.00 742,00 498.00 NO BID
LABOR 230,00 700.00 166.00 NO BID
GRAND TOTAL AREA TWO £ 815998001  $24272.00 $24,475.00] NO BID



FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120335

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SIEET

OFPENING DATE: DECEMBER 18, 2012

FOR

BUYLR: KATHY CICCARELLI

ESTATE
LANDSCAPING &
P& TLAWN & LAWN
TRUGREEN  |[TRACTOR CLA MANAGEMENT,
VENDORS LANDCARE  [SERVICE,INC.  |AMERA-TECH INC, [LANDSCAPING  |LLC
e _ e

AREA THREE )
EAST COUNTY REGIONAL LIBRARY 19,250.00 14,990.00 18,190.00 NO BID NO BID
MULCH 6.467.00 1,890.00 1,110.60 NO BID NO BID
MULCH LABOR 2,556.00 1,800.00 404.90 NGO BID NO BID
PINE NUGGETS 6.767.00 1,890.00 NO BID NG BID
LABOR . 2,586.80  1,800.00 NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL AREA THREE, $37,656.80 52237000 £ $21479.00] NO BID NO BID
AREA FOUR .
BONITA SPRINGS PUBLIC LIBRARY 4,000.00 6,325.00 810,00 NO BID 23,998.00
MULCH 1,200.00 650.00 415.00 NOBID| 136.00
MULCH LABOR 480.00 60000 151.00 NO BID 90.00
PINE NUGGETS 1,300.00) 650.00 500.00 NO BID 144.00
LAROR 480.00 600.00 167.00 NO BID 96.90
BONITA SPRINGS PARK & POOL AREA 8,757.00 1699000 13,263.00 NO BID 13,997.00
SOUTH COUNTY REGIONAL LIBRARY 8,886.00 9,100.00 12,165.00 NO BID 9,998.00
MULCE 5,539.00 2,700.00 970.00 NO BID 204.00
MULCH LABOR 2,336.00 2,50000) 35400 NO BID 136.00
PINE NUGGETS 6,000.00 2,700.00 1,164.00 NO BID 216.00
LABOR o 2,336.00 2,500.00| __389.00 NO BID 144.00
GRAND TOTAL AREA FOUR $41,614.00 $45,315.00 £ 37,6480 NO BID $47,993.00
PINE ISLAND PURLIC LIBRARY 6.300.00 16,460.00 NO BID NO BID
MULCH 1,950.00 1,108.00 _ NORID NO BID
MULCH LABOR 1,900.00! 405.00 NO BID NO BID
PINE NUGGETS 1,950.00 1,330.00 NO BID _ NOBID
LABOR 1,90.00 445.00 NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL AREA FIVE o ﬁm,zsm_“_,ecc.c?u $19,748.00 NO BID NO BID
AREA SIX . -
NORTHWEST REGIONAL LIBRARY 9,450.00 13,990.00 _____NODBID
MULCH 2,430.00 1,665.00) NO BID
MULCH LABOR 2,000.00 506.00 NO BID
PINE NUGGETS 2,430.00 1,995.00 NO BID




FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120335

LEF. COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 18, 2012

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

" MOWING & LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR LEE COUNTY LIBRARIES(STEP 2-PRICING)

ESTATE
LANDSCAPING &
P&ETELAWN & LAWN
TRUGREEN  |TRACTOR CLA MANAGEMENT,
VENDORS LANDCARE  |SERVICE, INC. AMERA-TECH INC. [LANDSCAPING LLC
LABOR 2,000.00 667.00 NO BID
|GRAND TOTAL AREA SIX L 818,310.00 Uw $18,923.00 NO BID
AREA SEVEN
LAKES REGIONAL LIBRARY 16,700.00 16,175.00 NO BID
MULCTT 4,725.00 2,220.00 NO BID
MULCH LABOR 4.000.00 §10.00 NGO BID
PINE NUGGETS 4,725.00 2,660.00 NO BID
LABOR 4, 041,00 §9¢.00 NO BID
GRAND TOTAL AREA SEVEN $34,150.00 522,755,000 | NoBm
GRAND TOTAL $122,398.00| $177,042.00 ~ $165,418.00 NO BID
OPLION "A"- HOURLY RATE PER PERSON, _ ”
TOR WORK NOT COVERED IN THIS
CONTRACT - $35.00 $45.00 $45.00  $35.00 NONE LISTED
OPIION "B"- HOURLY RATE FOR THE
ARBORIST $45.00 $75.00 $75.00 _ $56.60 NONF LISTED
TO BE STARTED WITHIN _ CALENDER DAYS 7 7 14 30
LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE NO YES YES NO YES
MODIFICATIONS NO NO NO . NO NO
SIGNED YES YES YES|  YES YES
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 9704426 DH0S016| 110617 0401621 0703306
DEBE NO YES NO NO NO
MEETS SPECIFICATIONS YES YES ~ YES YES YES
POSTING TIME/DATE,
FROM: /
UNTIL: / o o
BY:




FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120335 .. L1t COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET
OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 18, 2012 . TOR -
BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI MOWING & LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR LEE COUNTY LIBRARIES(STEP 2-FRICING)
STUPERIOR
LANDSCAPING &
TAWN SERVICES,
INC.
Addenda Acknoewedged YIS .
AREA ONE . )
CAPL CORAL ) 16,772.00
MELCH o 8$75.00!
MULCH LABOR 550.00
PINE NUGGETS - 1,125.00
LABOR 550.00
GRAND TOTAL AREA ONE $1987200
AREA TWO
NORTH FORT MYERS _ 6,760.00
MULCH 875.00)
MULCH LABOIR ‘ 600.00
PINE NUGGETS o 112500 ]
LABOR . 600.00
DUNBAR JUPITER HAMMON PUBLIC
LIBRARY s 6,870.00
MULCH o 930,00
MULCH LABOR - 600.00
PINE NUGGETS B 1,260.00
LABOR ~ 600.00
LIBRARY ADMINISTRATION 11,720.00
MULCH 3 1,225.00
MULCH LABOR - 300.60
PINE NUGGETS . 1,575.00
LABOR ) ) 800.00
TORT MYERS LIBRARY 12,600.00
MULCH 98000
MULCH LABOR 500400
PINE NUGGETS 1,260.00
T.ABOR 500.00
GRAND TOTAL AREA TWO - $52,230.00




TORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120335

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

(OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 18, 2612

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

MOWING & LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR LEE COUNTY LIBRARIES(STEP 2-PRICING)

SUPERIOR

LANDSCAPING &

LAWN SERVICES,
VENDORS INC.
§h§kﬁ§§mﬁ%sh .
AREA THRER
EAST COUNTY REGIONAL LIBRARY 25,640.00
MULCH 1,575.00
MULCH LABOR 90000
PINI NUGGETS 2,025.00
LABOR _900.00
GRAND TOTAL AREA THREE - $31,040.00
AREAFOUR
BONITA SPRINGS PUBLIC LIBRARY
_?:Fnu
MULCH LABOR
PINE NUGGETS
JLanor -

BONITA SPRINGS PARK & POOL AREA

SOUTH COUNTY REGIONAL LIBRARY

MULCH

MULCH LABOR

IPINE NUGGETS

LABOR

GRAND TOTAI AREA FOUR

ARFEA FIVE

PINE ISLAND PUBLIC LIBRARY

MULCH

MULCH LABOR

PINL NUGGITS

LABOR

GRAND TOTAL AREA FIVE

REA SIX

NORTHWEST REGIONAL LIBRARY

MULCH
MULCH LABOR

PINE NUGGETS
LABOR




FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120335

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 18, 2012

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

MOWING & LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE FOR LEE COUNTY LIBRARIES(STEP 2_PRICING)

VENDORS

SUPERIOR
LANDSCAPING &
LAWN SERVICES,

INC.

GRAND TOTAL AREA SIX
AREA SEVEN

LAKES REGIONALLIBRARY |

MULCH ]

MULCH LABOR

PINT, NUGGETS

LABOR

GRAND TOTAL AREA SEVEN

GRAND TOTAL $270,922.08

OPTION "A"- HOURLY RATE PER PERSON,

FOR WORK NOT COVERED IN THTS

CONTRACT $30.00]

OPTION "B"- HOURLY RATE FOR THE

ARBORIST $65.00

TO BE STARTED WITHIN __ CALENDER DAYS 30 |
LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE YoS|

MODIFICATIONS NO

SIGNED YES n
LOCAI BUSINESS TAX ACCOUNT NUMBER 0803984

DBE NO

MEETS SPECIFICATIONS YES

POSTING TTMEAATE

FROM: /

UNTIL: /




