FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120095

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: MARCH 27, 2012

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

CONTRACT PRINTING

STRATEGY
CAPE CORAL MARKETING

MARTIN LITHO, |PRIDE MINUTEMAN DIRECT GROUP,INC.dba/PA
VENDORS INC. ENTERPRISES PRESS IMPRESSIONS NTHER PRINTING
Addenda Acknowedged YES YES YES YES YES
COPIES YES YES YES YES YES
GRAND TOTAL: SECTIONS 1,2 AND 3 $12,429.00 $13,292.20 $8,585.00 $7,475.75 $8,505.55
SECTION 1: BUSINESS CARDS
ONE SIDED, ONE COLOR BOX OF 100 $45.00 $30.50 $13.50 $4.00 $8.95
ONE SIDED, ONE COLOR BOX OF 500 $48.00 $26.50 $23.00 $9.00 $12.95
ONE SIDED, MULTICOLOR BOX OF 100 $68.00 $54.00 $13.50 $4.00 $9.95
ONE SIDED, MULTICOLOR BOX OF 500 $75.00 $46.00 $23.00 $9.00 $16.95
SECTION 1: TOTAL $236.00 $157.00 $73.00 $26.00 $48.80
SECTION 2: LETTERHEAD AND ENVELOPES
A.NATURAL ROYAL RESOURCE WRITING
PAPER
QUANTITY OF 500 $110.00 $83.30 $38.00 $55.00 $49.95
QUANTITY OF 1000 $125.00 $111.28 $64.00 $85.00 $79.95
QUANTITY OF 2000 $155.00 $165.05 $118.00 $125.00 $99.95
QUANTITY OF 3000 $198.00 $214.96 $167.00 $162.00 $149.95
QUANTITY OF 4000 $235.00 $266.42 $215.00 $197.00 $199.95
QUANTITY OF 5000 $270.00 $318.86 $260.00 $233.00 $239.95
QUANTITY OF 10,000 $475.00 $578.61 $475.00 $414.00 $339.95
B.NATURAL ROYAL RESOURCE WRITING
ENVELOPES
QUANTITY OF 500 $98.00 $69.48 $60.00 $70.00 $69.95
QUANTITY OF 1000 $140.00 $113.52 $110.00 $116.00 $99.95
QUANTITY OF 2000 $230.00 $113.52 $206.00 $186.00 $199.95
QUANTITY OF 3000 $320.00 $245.62 $297.00 $253.00 $299.95
QUANTITY OF 4000 $396.00 $465.81 $386.00 $319.00 $349.95
QUANTITY OF 5000 $485.00 $465.81 $472.00 $385.00 $389.95
QUANTITY OF 10,000 $898.00 $925.43 $887.00 $718.00 $699.95




FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120095

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: MARCH 27, 2012

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

CONTRACT PRINTING

STRATEGY
CAPE CORAL MARKETING

MARTIN LITHO, |PRIDE MINUTEMAN DIRECT GROUP,INC.dba/PA
VENDORS INC. ENTERPRISES PRESS IMPRESSIONS NTHER PRINTING
C. WHITE WOVE ENVELOPES
QUANTITY OF 500 $80.00 $27.50 $28.00 $48.00 $39.95
QUANTITY OF 1000 $95.00 $38.70 $42.00 $72.75 $69.95
QUANTITY OF 2000 $130.00 $55.20 $80.00 $99.50 $89.95
QUANTITY OF 3000 $168.00 $72.90 $114.00 $123.25 $129.95
QUANTITY OF 4000 $198.00 $97.20 $145.00 $146.00 $169.95
QUANTITY OF 5000 $237.00 $121.50 $174.00 $168.75 $199.95
QUANTITY OF 10,000 $408.00 $227.00 $300.00 $285.50 $349.95
SECTION 2: TOTAL $5,451.00 $4,777.67 $4,638.00 $4,261.75 $4,318.95
SECTION 3: BROCHURE
250 ONE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $125.00 $237.22 $25.00 $43.00 $66.95
500 ONE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $138.00 $248.76 $39.00 $48.00 $99.95
1000 ONE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $145.00 $266.41 $66.00 $69.00 $179.95
2000 ONE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $175.00 $309.76 $123.00 $90.00 $229.95
5000 ONE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $290.00 $431.03 $309.00 $150.00 $299.95
EACH ADDITIONAL 1,000 ONE COLOR,
SINGLE FOLD $45.50 $80.57 $51.00 $24.00 $29.95
250 TWO COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $169.00 $303.01 $94.00 $52.00 $66.95
500 TWO COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $178.00 $315.54 $131.00 $58.00 $99.95
1000 TWO COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $190.00 $334.62 $177.00 $83.00 $179.95
2000 TWO COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $218.00 $373.54 $255.00 $108.00 $269.95
5000 TWO COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $340.00 $496.82 $525.00 $180.00 $349.95
EACH ADDITIONAL 1,000 TWO COLOR,
SINGLE FOLD $49.50 $92.86 $105.00 $27.00 $34.95
250 THREE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $175.00 $368.79 $95.00 $61.00 $66.95
500 THREE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $197.00 $382.73 $132.00 $115.00 $99.95
1000 THREE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $279.00 $400.40 $145.00 $222.00 $179.95
2000 THREE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $475.00 $439.33 $233.00 $305.00 $299.95
5000 THREE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $989.00 $565.02 $317.00 $375.00 $399.95
EACH ADDITIONAL 1000 THREE COLOR,
SINGLE FOLD $194.00 $105.61 $65.00 $50.00 $39.95




FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120095

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: MARCH 27, 2012

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

CONTRACT PRINTING

STRATEGY
CAPE CORAL MARKETING

MARTIN LITHO, MINUTEMAN DIRECT GROUP,INC.dba/PA
VENDORS INC. ENTERPRISES PRESS IMPRESSIONS NTHER PRINTING
250 FOUR COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $190.00 $436.99 $95.00 $61.00 $69.95
500 FOUR COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $208.00 $448.52 $132.00 $115.00 $99.95
1000 FOUR COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $289.00 $466.18 $145.00 $222.00 $179.95
2000 FOUR COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $480.00 $505.11 $233.00 $305.00 $319.95
5000 FOUR COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $998.00 $630.80 $317.00 $375.00 $429.95
EACH ADDITIONAL 1000 FOUR COLOR,
SINGLE FOLD $205.00 $117.91 $65.00 $50.00 $42.95
SECTION 3: TOTAL $6,742.00 $8,357.53 $3,874.00 $3,188.00 $4,137.80
GRAND TOTAL: SECTIONS 1,2 AND 3 $12,429.00 $13,292.20 $8,585.00 $7,475.75 $8,505.55
DELIVERY
STOCK 7 10 3 5 3to7
NON-STOCK 10 10 5 6 5to14
DELIVER WITH OWN VEHICLE NO NO YES YES YES
TO BE STARTED WITHIN 20 10 1| O(IMMEDIATELY) 1TO5
MODIFICATIONS NO NO NO NO YES*
LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE NO NO NO YES NO
SIGNED YES YES YES YES YES
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX NUMBER NA NA 0506110 9300938 1002692
AFFIDAVIT CERTIFICATION IMMIGRATION
LAWS NO YES YES YES YES
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE NO YES YES YES YES
RECYCLED PAPER CONTENT
REQUIREMENT NO YES YES YES YES
MEETS SPECIFICATIONS NO YES YES YES YES
POSTING TIME/DATE
*ADDENDUM 1 - DATED 03/15/2012
FROM: /
UNTIL: /
BY:




FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120095 LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: MARCH 27, 2012 FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI CONTRACT PRINTING

NEW YORK PRESS |SWIFT PRINT

VENDORS INC. SERVICE, INC.
Addenda Acknowedged YES YES
COPIES YES YES
GRAND TOTAL: SECTIONS 1,2 AND 3 $7,218.00
SECTION 1: BUSINESS CARDS

ONE SIDED, ONE COLOR BOX OF 100 $15.00 $11.00
ONE SIDED, ONE COLOR BOX OF 500 $25.00 $13.00
ONE SIDED, MULTICOLOR BOX OF 100 $13.00
ONE SIDED, MULTICOLOR BOX OF 500 $50.00 $16.00
SECTION 1: TOTAL $90.00 $53.00

SECTION 2: LETTERHEAD AND ENVELOPES

A.NATURAL ROYAL RESOURCE WRITING

PAPER

QUANTITY OF 500 $51.70 $31.00
QUANTITY OF 1000 $67.40 $49.00
QUANTITY OF 2000 $96.80 $85.00
QUANTITY OF 3000 $135.20 $120.00
QUANTITY OF 4000 $203.60 $156.00
QUANTITY OF 5000 $256.00 $190.00
QUANTITY OF 10,000 $484.00 $325.00
B.NATURAL ROYAL RESOURCE WRITING

ENVELOPES

QUANTITY OF 500 $57.00 $56.00
QUANTITY OF 1000 $88.00 $85.00
QUANTITY OF 2000 $176.00 $155.00
QUANTITY OF 3000 $264.00 $230.00
QUANTITY OF 4000 $352.00 $302.00
QUANTITY OF 5000 $425.00 $375.00

QUANTITY OF 10,000 $800.00 $745.00




FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120095

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: MARCH 27, 2012

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

CONTRACT PRINTING

NEW YORK PRESS |SWIFT PRINT
VENDORS INC. SERVICE, INC.
C. WHITE WOVE ENVELOPES
QUANTITY OF 500 $27.00 $36.00
QUANTITY OF 1000 $43.00 $45.00
QUANTITY OF 2000 $86.00 $77.00
QUANTITY OF 3000 $129.00 $114.00
QUANTITY OF 4000 $172.00 $147.00
QUANTITY OF 5000 $215.00 $181.00
QUANTITY OF 10,000 $400.00 $355.00
SECTION 2: TOTAL $4,528.70 $3,859.00
SECTION 3: BROCHURE
250 ONE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $76.00 $35.00
500 ONE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $106.00 $37.00
1000 ONE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $190.00 $50.00
2000 ONE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $298.00 $80.00
5000 ONE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $552.00 $145.00
EACH ADDITIONAL 1,000 ONE COLOR,
SINGLE FOLD $101.00 $28.00
250 TWO COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $140.00 $45.00
500 TWO COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $192.00 $45.00
1000 TWO COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $342.00 $60.00
2000 TWO COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $596.00 $95.00
5000 TWO COLOR, SINGLE FOLD $970.00 $160.00
EACH ADDITIONAL 1,000 TWO COLOR,
SINGLE FOLD $95.00 $31.00
250 THREE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD NO BID $120.00
500 THREE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD NO BID $125.00
1000 THREE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD NO BID $165.00
2000 THREE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD NO BID $240.00
5000 THREE COLOR, SINGLE FOLD NO BID $375.00
EACH ADDITIONAL 1000 THREE COLOR,
SINGLE FOLD NO BID $75.00




FORMAL QUOTATION #Q-120095

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: MARCH 27, 2012

FOR

BUYER: KATHY CICCARELLI

CONTRACT PRINTING

NEW YORK PRESS |SWIFT PRINT
VENDORS INC. SERVICE, INC.
250 FOUR COLOR, SINGLE FOLD NO BID $160.00
500 FOUR COLOR, SINGLE FOLD NO BID $165.00
1000 FOUR COLOR, SINGLE FOLD NO BID $215.00
2000 FOUR COLOR, SINGLE FOLD NO BID $315.00
5000 FOUR COLOR, SINGLE FOLD NO BID $450.00
EACH ADDITIONAL 1000 FOUR COLOR,
SINGLE FOLD NO BID $90.00
SECTION 3: TOTAL $3,658.00 $3,306.00
GRAND TOTAL: SECTIONS 1, 2 AND 3 $8,276.70 $7,218.00
DELIVERY
STOCK 10 3TO5
NON-STOCK 15 77010
DELIVER WITH OWN VEHICLE YES YES
TO BE STARTED WITHIN 10 1
MODIFICATIONS NO
LOCAL VENDOR PREFERENCE YES YES
SIGNED YES YES
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX NUMBER 9801518 8501001
AFFIDAVIT CERTIFICATION IMMIGRATION
LAWS YES YES
INSURANCE CERTIFICATE YES YES
RECYCLED PAPER CONTENT
REQUIREMENT YES YES
MEETS SPECIFICATIONS YES YES

POSTING TIME/DATE

FROM: /

UNTIL: /

BY:




