FORMAL QUOTATION #B-140052

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: December 20, 2013

FOR

BUYER: Patrick T. Lewis Sr.

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF CHEMICALS FOR UTILITIES WATER AND WASTEWATER PLANTS

SNF Polydyne, Inc.

Carmuse Lime & Stone

Airga$, Inc.

Shannon Chemical Corp|

Southwest Engineers

Thatcher Chemical

VENDORS

of

Addenda Acknowedged

Florida, Inc.

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

Grand Total (All Sections)

$129,190.00

$1,505,146.50

$143,000.00

$38,775.00

$74,220.00

$67,124.80

SECTION la: HYDROCLORIC ACID 31% (Muriatic Acid)

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost per 55 Gallon Drum

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Manufacturer

SECTION 1b: HYDROCLORIC ACID 31% (Muriatic Acid)

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost per 1 gallon jug, four (4) jugs per case

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Manufacturer

SECTION 2: ZINC ORTHO-PHOSPHATE

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost per pound (Ib)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Minimum Order Quantity

SLI-939

$0.517
1,000 Gal

TI-2907A

No Bid

0.634 - 1,000 gallons or|
0.5428 - 3,000 gallons

SECTION 3: ANHYDROUS AMMONIA

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost Each X 100 tons =Total Cost

No Bid

No Bid

Manufacturer

Anhydrous Ammonia
$143,000.00

Various

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Min/Max 500-2,500lbs

SECTION 4: HYDRATED LIME

Specify Product Name

High Calcium Hydrated
Lime

Price/Cost Each X 50 tons=Total Cost

No Bid

$15,946.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Manufacturer

Carmeuse Lime & Stone

Min/Max 10 tons

*Based on a 24 ton min

SECTION 5a: POLYMER

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost Each X 11,000 Ibs=Total Cost

Manufacturer (BASF Corp, Magna floc LT25 or equal)

Clarifloc A-3320
$13,750.00
Polydyne Inc.

Magnafloc LT 25

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$18,150.00

No Bid

BASF

Min/Max 1,500-2,500 Ibs

SECTION 5b: POLYMER

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost Each X 12,000Ibs=Total Cost

Manufacturer (BASF Corp, Magna floc LT27 or equal)

Clarifloc A-3320
$15,000.00
Polydyne Inc.

Magnafloc LT 27

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$19,800.00

No Bid

BASF

Min/Max 1,500-2,500 Ibs

SECTION 6: QUICKLIME, BULK (POWDER TO 3/8")

Specify Product Name

High Calcium Quicklime

Price/Cost Each X 5,000 tons=Total Cost

No Bid

$1,489,200.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Manufacturer

Carmeuse Lime & Stone

Min/Max 25tons

Based on a 24 ton min

SECTION 7a: TRICHLOROISOCYANURIC 3 inch
stabilized tablets




Trichloroisocyanuric 3"

Specify Product Name Tabs
Price/Cost per 50# pail No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $102.37
*1 Pallet (24 pails or
Minimum Order Quantity 1,080 Ibs)
SECTION 7b: TRICHLOROISOCYANURIC stabilized pool
sticks
Specify Product Name
Price/Cost per 50# pail No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Minimum Order Quantity
SECTION 8: CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE, GRANULAR
Calcium Hypochlorite
Specify Product Name Granular
Price/Cost Each X 12,000 Ibs (100#) pails=Total Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,480.00
Environmental
Manufacturer Compliance Resources
1 Pallet (18 pails or
Min/Max 1-20 pails 1,800 Ibs)
SECTION 9a: FLOCCULANT, CATIONIC
POLYACRYLAMIDE EMULSION
Specify Product Name Clarifloc SE-1079 Zetag 8848FS
Price/Cost Each X 31,0001bs (55 gal drums)=Total Cost $28,830.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $36,270.00 No Bid
Price/Cost Each X 21,0001Ibs (230/250 gal totes)=Total Cost $19,530.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,570.00 No Bid
Manufacturer (BASF Corp Zetag 8848 or approved equal) Polydyne Inc. BASF
SECTION 9b: FLOCCULANT, CATIONIC
POLYACRYLAMIDE EMULSION
Specify Product Name Clarifloc SE-1080
Price/Cost Each X 56,0001Ibs (230/250 gal totes)=Total Cost $52,080.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer (Polydine SE-1080 or approved equal) Polydyne Inc.
To be started within calendar days 3-8 3 3 7 7-10 30
To be delivered in own vehicle? No No Yes No No No
Location/office/facility in Lee County? No No No No No No
Maodifications No No No No No No
Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Local Business Tax Account Number N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Disadvantage Business Enterprise (DBE) No No No No No No
Local Vendor Preference Questionaire Completed/Submitted? Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes NA/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes
Affidavit Principal Place of Business Completed/Submitted? NA/Yes NA/Yes No/No NA/Yes NA/Yes No/Yes
Immigration Affidavit Completed/Submitted? Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes
Meets Specifications Yes **No Yes Yes Yes **No

*Bid doc calls fora
min/max of 10 tons

* Bid doc calls for min/max
1-5 pails per delivery

**Did not meet specs Min
Max for Section 4

**Did not meet specs Min/
Max for Section 7a

NO BIDS

POSTING TIME/DATE

FROM: /

UNTIL: /

BY:




Dact.ll

FORMAL QUOTATION #B-140052

LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET

OPENING DATE: December 20, 2013

FOR

BUYER: Patrick T. Lewis Sr.

ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF CHEMICALS FOR UTILITIES WATER AND WASTEWATER PLANTS

Lhoist North America | Carus Chemical Comp|  American Water Chemrite, Inc. Davis Supply, Inc.

VENDORS Chemicals, Inc.

Addenda Acknowedged N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Grand Total (All Sections) $1,351,946.00 $41,250.00 $1,312,790.00 $515.40

SECTION la: HYDROCLORIC ACID 31% (Muriatic Acid)
Muriatic Acid 20 Deg

Specify Product Name Baume

Price/Cost per 55 Gallon Drum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $162.00

Manufacturer Vulcan Chemicals

SECTION 1b: HYDROCLORIC ACID 31% (Muriatic Acid)

Specify Product Name Muriatic Acid 20 Deg

Price/Cost per 1 gallon jug, four (4) jugs per case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.34

Manufacturer Vulcan Chemicals
= Hydrochioric Acid 31%
(Muriatic Acid) is packaged
ina 55 gallon open top
drum with 30 individual
gallon jugs stacked neatly
inside

SECTION 2: ZINC ORTHO-PHOSPHATE

Specify Product Name Carus 3180 AWC A-731

Price/Cost per pound (Ib) No Bid $0.55 $0.75 No Bid No Bid

Minimum Order Quantity 3,000 Gal 3,000 Gal

SECTION 3: ANHYDROUS AMMONIA

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost Each X 100 tons =Total Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer

Min/Max 500-2,500Ibs

SECTION 4: HYDRATED LIME

Specify Product Name Bulk Hydrated Lime Hydrated Lime

Price/Cost Each X 50 tons=Total Cost $16,196.00 No Bid No Bid $15,750.00 No Bid

Lhoist North America of
Manufacturer Alabama, LLC Cheney Lime
*This is for a Minimum of

Min/Max 10 tons 20 tons per Order

SECTION 5a: POLYMER

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost Each X 11,000 Ibs=Total Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer (BASF Corp, Magna floc LT25 or equal)

Min/Max 1,500-2,500 Ibs

SECTION 5b: POLYMER

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost Each X 12,000lbs=Total Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer (BASF Corp, Magna floc LT27 or equal)

Min/Max 1,500-2,500 Ibs

SECTION 6: QUICKLIME, BULK (POWDER TO 3/8")

Specify Product Name Quicklime Quicklime No Bid

Price/Cost Each X 5,000 tons=Total Cost $1,335,750.00 No Bid No Bid $1,281,800.00

Manufacturer

Lhoist North America of
Alabama, LLC

Cheney Quicklime

Min/Max 25tons
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Part 11

SECTION 7a: TRICHLOROISOCYANURIC 3 inch
stabilized tablets

Specify Product Name Pro Guard Stick

Price/Cost per 50# pail No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $113.30

Minimum Order Quantity BioLab

SECTION 7b: TRICHLOROISOCYANURIC stabilized pool

sticks

Specify Product Name Pro Guard 3" Tablets

Price/Cost per 50# pail No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $115.26

Minimum Order Quantity BioLab

SECTION 8: CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE, GRANULAR

Specify Product Name PrimeCLo2 or SuperChlor Super Chlor

Price/Cost Each X 12,000 Ibs (100#) pails=Total Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,240.00 $14,580.00
Jianghan Salt and Chemical | Chemrite for Jianghan Salt

Manufacturer Complex & Chemical Complex

Min/Max 1-20 pails

SECTION 9a: FLOCCULANT, CATIONIC

POLYACRYLAMIDE EMULSION

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost Each X 31,0001bs (55 gal drums)=Total Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price/Cost Each X 21,0001bs (230/250 gal totes)=Total Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer (BASF Corp Zetag 8848 or approved equal)

SECTION 9b: FLOCCULANT, CATIONIC

POLYACRYLAMIDE EMULSION

Specify Product Name

Price/Cost Each X 56,0001bs (230/250 gal totes)=Total Cost No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Manufacturer (Polydine SE-1080 or approved equal)

To be started within ____ calendar days 2 1 3-5 5-10 3

To be delivered in own vehicle? No *No No No Yes

Location/office/facility in Lee County? No No No No Yes

Modifications No No No Yes No

Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Local Business Tax Account Number N/A N/A N/A N/A 201903

Disadvantage Business Enterprise (DBE) No No No No No

Local Vendor Preference Questionaire Completed/Submitted? Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes

Affidavit Principal Place of Business Completed/Submitted? /No NA/Yes NA/Yes /No Yes/Yes

Immigration Affidavit Completed/Submitted? Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes Yes/Yes

Meets Specifications Yes Yes Yes **No **No

*We are contracted with a
dedicated carrier to deliver
our products

*Bid doc calls for a
min/max of 10 tons

* Bid Do calls for Four one
gal jugs per case

**Did not meet specs Min/
Max for Section 4

**Did not meet packaging
requirements for Section 1b

NO BIDS

POSTING TIME/DATE

FROM: /
UNTIL: /
BY:
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