

WALK ON #3

DNR

Lee County Board Of County Commissioners

Blue Sheet No. 20051301

Agenda Item Summary

1. ACTION REQUESTED/PURPOSE: Award B-05-21 HURRICANE CHARLEY DEBRIS REMOVAL, for the Division of Natural Resources, to the two (2) lowest responsive, responsible bidders meeting all bidding requirements; Mettauer Environmental Inc (Task 3 - \$1,760.00, Task 5 - \$15,740.00 = total \$17,500.00), TSI Disaster Services (Task 1 - \$13,900.00, Task 2 - \$29,000.00, Task 4 - \$20,200.00, Task 6 - \$70,000.00, Task 7 - \$19,600.00, Task 8 - \$45,000.00, Task 9 - \$24,000.00, Task 10 - \$240,000.00 = total \$461,700.00) for the unit costs stipulated on the bid tabulation sheet. This contract is for a period of seventy-five (75) days for final completion. Authorize Chairman to execute the Service Provider Agreement upon completion.

2. WHAT ACTION ACCOMPLISHES: Contractor will be required to clean up storm induced debris in the designated streams(channel, canal, waterway, etc. areas) by the removal and disposal of trees, logs, stumps, brush, tops, blockages, rubbish, and debris deposited in and adjacent to the channel and other items as specified.

3. MANAGEMENT RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends approval.

4. Departmental Category: 08-

5. Meeting Date: 09-20-2005

6. Agenda:
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Consent
<input type="checkbox"/> Administrative
<input type="checkbox"/> Appeals
<input type="checkbox"/> Public
<input type="checkbox"/> Walk-On

7. Requirement/Purpose: (specify)
<input type="checkbox"/> Statute
<input type="checkbox"/> Ordinance
<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Admin. Code AC-4-4
<input type="checkbox"/> Other

8. Request Initiated:
Commissioner
Department Public Works
Division Natural Resources
By: Roland Ottolini, P.E., Director

9. BACKGROUND:

The Division of Natural Resources submitted a request to Contracts Management to obtain bids for Hurricane Charley Debris Removal. The anticipated cost of the project required the use of the formal advertised sealed bid procedure.

On the bidding deadline of September 7, 2005, Contracts Management received four (4) bids. Contracts Management determined Greenwerx Groundskeeping, Inc. to be non-responsive; no bid bond was submitted with their bid. We received a letter from WE Blackmon stating that in light of recent events, it would not be cost-effective to mobilize for the amount of work they would receive from this contract at this time.

The remaining bids have been reviewed by the Division of Natural Resources and it is being recommended that award be made to the two (2) lowest responsive, responsible bidders meeting all bidding requirements; Mettauer Environmental Inc (Task 3 - \$1,760.00, Task 5 - \$15,740.00 = total \$17,500.00), TSI Disaster Services (Task 1 - \$13,900.00, Task 2 - \$29,000.00, Task 4 - \$20,200.00, Task 6 - \$70,000.00, Task 7 - \$19,600.00, Task 8 - \$45,000.00, Task 9 - \$24,000.00, Task 10 - \$240,000.00 = total \$461,700.00) for the unit costs stipulated on the bid tabulation sheet. This contract is for a period of seventy-five (75) days for final completion.

-CONTINUED ON PAGE 2----

10. Review for Scheduling:

Department Director	Purchasing or Contracts	Human Resources	Other	County Attorney	Budget Services				County Manager/P.W. Director
<i>J. J. J.</i>	<i>J. J. J.</i>	N/A		<i>J. J. J.</i>	Analyst	Risk	Grants	Mgr.	<i>J. J. J.</i>
9-14-05				9/15/05	9/15/05	9/15/05	9/15/05	9/15/05	9.14.05

11. Commission Action:

- Approved
- Deferred
- Denied
- Other

RECEIVED BY COUNTY ADMIN: *M*
 9-15-05
 COUNTY ADMIN FORWARDED TO: *PL*
 9-15-05
 9/15/05

RECVD 9/15/05 by CO. ATTY.
 8:15 AM
 CO. ATTY. FORWARDED TO: Co. Mgr.
 9-15-05

Background 9. (Continued).....

In accordance with the bidding documents, the two (2) lowest responsive, responsible bids will be accepted. The County will issue a notice to proceed on individual projects with any or all of the two (2) bidders. Lee County will issue purchase orders for each job. The anticipated amount for this contract is \$461,700.00.

Funds will be available in account: 11076700100.503490

Attachments: Bid Tabulation Sheet
Withdrawal Email
Award Recommendation

M E M O R A N D U M
FROM
THE DIVISION OF
NATURAL RESOURCES

DATE: September 13, 2005

TO: Patricia Geren
Public Resources

FROM: Roland Ottolini, P.E. 

SUBJECT: Request for Walk-On for September 20, 2005
Blue Sheet No. 20051301
Bid Award B-05-21, Hurricane Debris Removal

We respectfully request the attached blue sheet be presented for approval by the Board of County Commissioners at their regular meeting of September 20, 2005. We have received funding for this project from the United States Department of Agriculture, Natural Resources Conservation Service under Agreement No. 65-4209-4-1630. The agreement expires on November 30, 2005. Debris remains due to Hurricane Charley and needs to be removed. Due to the expiration of funding, degradation of water quality and restrictions to navigation, time is of the essence regarding award and commencement of work.

Thank you for your consideration.

LEE COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
for
HURRICANE CHARLEY DEBRIS REMOVAL

September 7, 2005

BID NO: B-05-21

		Task 1	Task 2	Task 3	Task 4	Task 5	Task 6	Task 7	Task 8	Task 9	Task 10
CONTRACTOR	BID BOND	Shelby Lane	Popash Creek	Genessee Pkwy	Eagles Nest	Meadowlark Lane	Deep Lagoon	Lakes Park	Pine Creek	Estero River	Mulloch Creek
	\$37,500	\$ 6,500.00	\$22,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$14,000.00	\$25,300.00	\$16,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$15,500.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$414,700.00
WE Blackmon Construction Co Inc PO Drawer 2318 724 S Third St Smithfield, NC 27577 Ardie Lupton Ph: 919.934.5176 Fax: 919.934.9832	Add #1	\$ 6,500.00	\$22,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$14,000.00	\$25,300.00	\$16,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$15,500.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$414,700.00
TSI Disaster Services PO Box 39 Linden, NC 28356 Brian Gurkin Ph: 910.892.6133 Fax: 910.892.6219	\$37,500 cashier's check	\$13,900.00	\$29,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$20,200.00	\$18,400.00	\$70,000.00	\$19,600.00	\$45,000.00	\$24,000.00	\$240,000.00
*Greenwerx Groundskeeping Inc PO Box 3281 North Fort Myers, FL 33918 Chad Nesselhauf Ph: 239.482.8277 Fax: 239.482.8227	Add #1	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 8,900.00	\$48,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$34,500.00	NO BID	NO BID
Mettauer Environmental Inc 19741 N River Rd Alva, FL 33920 Elaine Mettauer Ph: 239.728.1814 Fax: 239.728.6111	\$37,500 cashier's check	\$15,900.00	NO BID	\$ 1,760.00	\$28,900.00	\$15,740.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$577,500.00
	Add #1	\$15,900.00	NO BID	\$ 1,760.00	\$28,900.00	\$15,740.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$577,500.00

*NON-RESPONSIVE (NO BID BOND)

**W. E. BLACKMON CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.**

724 S. THIRD STREET P.O. DRAWER 2310 SMITHFIELD, NC 27577 PHONE (919) 934-5176 FAX (919) 934-9832

FAX TRANSMITTAL

DATE: September 13, 2005

FAX TO: Mr. Allen Davies
Lee County, Florida
Phone 239/479-8124
Fax 239/479-8108FROM: Ardieth Lupton
W. E. Blackmon Construction Co., Inc.
Phone 919/934-5176
Fax 919/934-9832SUBJECT: Hurricane Charley Debris Removal
Solicitation No. B-05-21

Mr. Davies:

Thank you for the opportunity to bid the above referenced project. In light of recent developments on our coast, we will pass as it is economically not feasible for us to mobilize for \$85,000. In as much as we'd like to assist you in your clean up efforts, we feel it would be best for you to award to the low bidder of the entire project.

Again, thank you for this opportunity. We look forward to bidding future work with you.

Ardie Lupton

Natalie Burgess - Hurricane Charley Debris Removal

From: Allen Davies
To: Burgess, Natalie
Date: 9/13/2005 12:28 PM
Subject: Hurricane Charley Debris Removal
CC: Anura Karuna-Muni; Brad Vance; Logan, Cindy; Roland Ottolini

Natalie,

I expect a letter from Blackmon Construction today requesting to withdraw their bid. The bid award is hereby amended to the following:

Award TSI Disaster
Tasks 1,2,4,6,7,8,9,10
\$461,700

Award Mettauer Environmental
Tasks 3,5
\$17,500

Regards,

Allen L. Davies, Jr.
Division of Natural Resources
daviesal@leegov.com
239.479.8124 (Voice)
239.479.8108 (Fax)
239.850.2636 (Mobile)